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C ardiovascular disease (CVD) and cancer are
leading causes of death worldwide, with a
disproportionate burden of illness among

minority groups. The complex interactions of
social determinants of health, including social, eco-
nomic, geographic, and cultural factors that influence
the underlying biology and health-related behaviors
are a significant cause of disparities in cancer and
CVD.1

Unfortunately, many investigations reflect the
invisibility of the agender, asexual, bisexual, gay,
gender diverse, genderqueer, genderfluid, intersex,
lesbian, nonbinary, pansexual, queer, and trans-
gender (LGBTQIþ) population in the available data
analyzed. The LGBTQIþ population faces unique
barriers when accessing the health care system when
compared with their heterosexual counterparts.
There may be differences in interactions with the
medical community and differences in societal re-
lationships that have the potential to affect both
preventive and essential care, contributing to dis-
parities in CVD and cancer risk and treatment.

At least 7% of U.S. adults self-identify as a sex and
gender minority (SGM), and 16% of Generation Z
adults, who were born from the mid-1990s to the
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early 2010s, report that they are SGMs.2 However, in
considering these statistics on the LGBTQIþ popula-
tion, the prevalence of SGMs is likely underreported,
given a perceived risk of stigma and discrimination.
Furthermore, an additional reporting bias exists in
considering the LGBTQIþ population as a single, ho-
mogeneous social category. As the LGBTQIþ popula-
tion is variegated with specific characteristics, we
must consider and understand that each member of
this community has their own subgroups, which may
be assumed to be separate (eg, transgender people are
heterosexual, lesbians are cisgender). For any given
person, gender identity, sexual attraction, behavior,
and identity are distinct. For example, some trans-
gender women are lesbians and some queer men are
transgender.

No established biological or physiological differ-
ences exist between LGBTQIþ people and their het-
erosexual counterparts; several indications suggest
that health disparities in the LGBTQIþ community
may stem from a combination of social/economic
factors and behaviors,3 many of which can be traced
to the stress of living as an SGM.

LGBTQID DISPARITIES IN

CARDIOVASCULAR HEALTH

The traditional cardiovascular risk factors shaping
cardiovascular health of SGM populations include
tobacco use, physical activity, diet/nutrition, weight
management, lipid profile, glycemic status, and blood
pressure. There is some evidence that traditional
cardiovascular risk factors, such as tobacco use, are
increased in SGMs, but there are limited data for
blood pressure, lipids, glycemic status, and body
mass index. Human immunodeficiency virus infec-
tion, vascular health and function, sleep distur-
bances, and alcohol intake may be unique risk factors
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to be considered among LGBTQIþ populations; their
impact on the cardiovascular health of LGBTQIþ
populations specifically remain to be comprehen-
sively examined.4

According to the American Heart Association,
LGBTQIþ people compared with their heterosexual
counterparts are 36% less likely to have normal car-
diovascular health. LGBTQIþ people experience distal
(eg, discrimination) and proximal (eg, expectations of
rejection, internalized homophobia, and conceal-
ment) stressors that may contribute to health dis-
parities. These stressors may result in adverse
cardiovascular health behaviors and increase the
likelihood of poor cardiovascular health outcomes.

Recent research reported a >2- and 4-fold
increased prevalence of myocardial infarction in
men who are transgender compared with cisgender
men and cisgender women, respectively. Conversely,
the prevalence of myocardial infarction in women
who are transgender compared with women who are
cisgender is increased >2-fold but not in comparison
with men who are cisgender.5 The basis for these
differences is unknown, but it has been postulated
that masculinizing and feminizing hormone therapy
could be responsible. For example, venous thrombo-
embolism and ischemic stroke are more frequently
observed in transfeminine people on hormone ther-
apy than in cisgender women and men.6

Multiple stressors including discrimination, social
stigma, the fear of violence, and hypervigilance are
also suspected of worsening the cardiovascular health
of LGBTQIþ adults. However, specific data relating to
these populations are limited. The precise epidemi-
ology of cardiovascular disease in the LGBTQIþ
population remains unknown. To date, the limited
collection of data on sexual orientation and gender
identity in population-based and clinical datasets
hinders the development of research on SGM cardio-
vascular health.7

As a result, the evidence in LGBTQIþ populations is
limited and sometimes conflicting. Most of the
available data refer to the transgender population,
studies are sporadic and often based on self-
assessment questionnaires, and no national health
surveys comprehensively and routinely collect sexual
orientation and gender identity data.

LGBTQID DISPARITIES IN CANCER

The incidence and prevalence of cancer in LGBTQIþ
population remain unknown because no national
health surveys or cancer registries comprehensively
collect sexual orientation and gender identity data.8

Unfortunately, LGBTQIþ people are still rarely
included in cancer research so that there are signifi-
cant limitations to the amount of robust data avail-
able on LGBTQIþ population with cancer. The quality
of sexual orientation recording in routinely collected
health data, if available, is poor, and this raises con-
cerns around completeness and accuracy of analysis
when using existing data. Health care barriers and
discomfort with screening procedures may influence
cancer diagnosis, progression, and outcomes in
LGBTQIþ population.

Despite these limitations, we know that at least 7
types of cancer disproportionately affect LGBTQIþ
populations, including anal, breast, cervical, colo-
rectal, lung, prostate, and uterine cancer.9 The
LGBTQIþ population is more likely to have a cluster
of risk factors such as delayed cancer screening,
alcohol use, smoking, obesity, human immunodefi-
ciency virus infection, and human papillomavirus
infection contributing to increased cancer incidence
and late-stage diagnosis.10 Most of these risks affect
subgroups of the population identifying as LGBTQIþ;
however, each sexual orientation and gender identity
has its own cancer risks. Awareness of personal risk
factors is important, and there is limited guidance on
routine cancer screening for LGBTQIþ. Lesbian and
bisexual women may be at a higher risk for breast
cancer, colorectal, skin, cervical, endometrial, and
ovarian cancer than heterosexual women. This may
be due to higher rates of tobacco and alcohol use and
obesity, as well as due to nulliparity. Higher rates of
anal, prostate, testicular, and colon cancers are
observed in gay and bisexual men. Transgender
people have unique cancer risks: they are more likely
to forgo cancer screenings and care, putting them at a
higher risk of late-stage cancer diagnosis and cancer
death.10 Furthermore, a much more sensitive topic
exists: transgender individuals may experience
gender dysphoria and distress during screening, as it
may challenge one’s trans identity11 and may result in
a return to a “pretransition ‘existential crisis.’”

As with CVD, an association exists between long-
term hormone therapy and cancer risk, but further
research is needed to evaluate its impact to under-
stand how masculinizing and femininizing hormones
influence cancer risk in sex-specific organs and other
organs. Lower risk of prostate cancer is reported
among trans women, potentially due to hormone
therapy.12

DISPARITIES IN CARDIOVASCULAR AND

ONCOLOGIC CARE AND POTENTIAL SOLUTIONS

Health outcomes for the LGBTQIþ populations
remain worse than for their non-LGBTQIþ peers.



FIGURE 1 Disparities in Cardio-Oncology for the LGBTQIþ Populations and Actionable Strategies to Reduce Them

Agender, asexual, bisexual, gay, gender diverse, genderqueer, genderfluid, intersex, lesbian, nonbinary, pansexual, queer, and transgender (LGBTQIþ) people have a

higher incidence of cardiovascular diseases (CVDs) and cancer due to biological, behavioral, social, economic, cultural, and geographical factors. The complex het-

erogeneity of this population makes it even more difficult to analyze and implement measures to reduce disparities. These strategies must be implemented by involving

communities and soliciting the commitment of researchers and clinicians. SGM ¼ sex and gender minority; SO/GI ¼ sexual orientation/gender identity.
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In Europe, the European Society for Medical Oncology
has underlined the lack of scientific evidence on how
to tailor cancer prevention and treatment to the
LGBTQIþ community. Leading scientific societies
around the world are aware of these issues and have
made proposals to the scientific community and
health policy makers to bridge this gap. Recently the
Sexual and Gender Minority Office of the National
Institutes of Health provided a roadmap aimed to
develop operational goals to meet the health needs of
SGM.13,14 Overcoming all these obstacles requires
broad participation of the entire health system, and in
particular both health care providers and the
“excluded” or discriminated population. Several
proposed actions may help overcome discriminations
and address the needs of the SGM populations.15
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These general recommendations should be imple-
mented in each specific clinical specialty and in
cardio-oncology, specifically, where there is a dearth
of scientific evidence. To reduce disparities in
cardio-oncology, actionable strategies are needed
within cardio-oncology research, clinical practice,
and community engagement (Figure 1).

In conclusion, despite increased awareness about
LGBTQIþ health disparities and known causes of
these disparities,16 limited actions are being imple-
mented all over the world. The presence of these in-
equalities indicates that much still needs to be done
to achieve an equitable society. Across the world,
there is growing interest for the same goal, but there
is still much to be done worldwide. This calls us all to
action in cardiovascular and oncologic medicine, 2
leading causes of morbidity and mortality worldwide.
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