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Among the first tasks in

a collaboration between Tufts

University and community or-

ganizations in Somerville,

MA, was designing an inter-

view instrument to assess

occupational health needs

among immigrant workers.

Human subjects protections

was a critical issue, but com-

munity partners were not well

informed about the need for

such protections or the role of

the institutional review board

(IRB).

During research meetings,

members of the team from

Tufts trained community col-

laborators to work with

research participants and or-

ganized a presentation by

a key university IRB adminis-

trator.

We present findings from

the process evaluation of this

project and suggest ways to

(1) assess community partners’

understanding about working

with research volunteers, (2)

train collaborators, and (3)

involve IRBs. (Am J Public

Health. 2009;99:S526–S531.

doi: 10.2105/AJPH.2008.155390)

THE IMPORTANCE OF THE

community-based participatory
research (CBPR) model has been
well demonstrated, as have the
benefits for both researchers and
community partners. In addition

to their many skills and talents in
creating, maintaining, and evalu-
ating community programs, com-
munity partners may enable re-
searchers to gain access to
communities where there are
known or perceived barriers to the
recruitment of participants. Col-
laboration in research with aca-
demic partners may provide com-
munity organizations and leaders
access to university resources, in-
crease their own presence and
position within their community,
and add to their legitimacy with
community members.1,2 Working
together, both partners become in-
volved in identifying social prob-
lems, understanding the importance
of such problems to community
members, and generating inter-
ventions and new research hy-
potheses. Examples of successful
CBPR approaches include the
study of the health of young
children, behaviors of drug users
and dealers, and attitudes of
members of close-knit religious
communities.3–8

One question often addressed in
CBPR is how to conduct ethical and
participatory research in a commu-
nity where there are strong com-
munity organizations with leaders
who do not have extensive research
training. In such cases, academic
researchers may undervalue the
role of the community partners,

and community members without
advanced formal education may be
taken for granted and have their
opinions dismissed, particularly
when research findings are inter-
preted and disseminated. Univer-
sity researchers may feel that they
have worked hard to establish their
own credibility in an area of ex-
pertise and find it difficult to accept
the expertise that community
leaders have gained through expe-
rience.

These attitudes can make part-
nerships uneasy and can lead to
difficulties when planning future
research endeavors.9–11 The par-
ticipatory component of CBPR
may then be reduced to the use of
the community leaders to gain
access to participants or to peri-
odic meetings of a community ad-
visory committee to hear a prog-
ress report from the research
team. Academic researchers and
community partners need each
other to address complex social
and health issues, even though
trust can be difficult to establish
and maintain. An important di-
mension in this relationship is
the degree of authority over the
research plan, program execution,
and interpretation of results exer-
cised by the community.12–14

For their part, community
leaders are sometimes apprehen-
sive that university researchers

will simply use their community
as a research laboratory and then
abruptly disappear when the study
is completed. Community-based
organizations are often concerned
about control of research findings
that may cast a negative light on
their community when findings
are published and may be covered
in the popular press. Examples
include studies that have focused
on gang crime, prostitution, and
environmental waste.15

In addition, community organi-
zations that work directly with
community members who be-
come human research participants
often do not have access to an
institutional review board (IRB).
Because their mission is program-
ming rather than research, an
IRB is not required and oversight
may be accomplished by an advi-
sory board or board of directors.
By contrast, university research
protocols are reviewed and ap-
proved by an IRB whose charge is
to monitor human subjects pro-
tections and risks to human par-
ticipants in university research.
When university IRBs are
charged to review and approve
protocols for which community
organizations are full partners in
the research, misunderstandings
can arise and can lead to mistrust
and eventually to the demise of
the partnership.
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During a CBPR project between
Tufts University and organizations
in Somerville, MA, we discovered
gaps in knowledge and accumu-
lated mistrust. We sought to de-
termine whether an education and
training intervention involving
both our community partners and
IRB leadership could resolve these
issues.

METHODS

The context of our intervention
was a CBPR project aimed at iden-
tifying and controlling occupational
health and safety risks among im-
migrant workers in Somerville, MA.
Somerville is often characterized as
a gateway community for new im-
migrants to the United States. It is
a midsized city with approximately
80000 residents and has consid-
erable cultural and ethnic diversity
in a relatively compact 4-square-
mile area. We sought to establish
true participation at the community
level by involving community
leaders, organizations, and a group
of teen educators16–22 in gaining
access to immigrant workers, de-
signing a survey of immigrant
workers, reviewing the process of
data collection, and participating in
data analysis. We discovered that
these goals brought with them
challenges and opportunities in
transferring research capability to
the Somerville community leaders
and teen educators that were not
contemplated in our original study
design.

Tufts is a research-intensive
university with 3 campuses in the
United States. The Tufts social,
behavioral, and educational IRB
was responsible for approving the
research protocols for Assessing

and Controlling Occupational
Health Risks to Immigrants in
Somerville, MA, a 4-year study
funded by the National Institute
for Occupational Health and
Safety. This board reviews re-
search conducted at the schools of
arts and sciences and engineering
and the Fletcher School of Diplo-
macy. In line with federal man-
dates, the IRB has 14 members,
drawn from the university faculty
and staff and representatives of
the community.

Members of the Collaboration

Our study’s program an-
nouncement called for 3 principal
participating organizations. Tufts
University was the academic part-
ner, the Immigrant Service Pro-
viders Group/Health was the
community organization, and the
Cambridge Health Alliance was
the health care provider.

Despite substantial collective
experience with partnerships in
the city of Somerville, the aca-
demic researchers could not have
established credible access to the
community without partnering
with viable and well-known local
organizations. Along with the
many skills and talents of their
leaders and members, these com-
munity organizations provided not
only access to the study popula-
tion but also the ability to tran-
scend barriers between the feder-
ally funded project and the
immigrants, some of whom may
have been working and living in
the United States without docu-
mentation.

In addition to the 3 principal
members of the collaboration,
several Somerville-based organi-
zations became involved in the

study: the Community Action
Agency of Somerville, the Jovenes
Latino program, the Haitian Co-
alition, and the Brazilian Women’s
Group, all of which had strong
connections to important local
constituencies. In addition, techni-
cal expertise on design and imple-
mentation of occupational health
and safety interventions was pro-
vided by the Massachusetts Co-
alition for Occupational Safety and
Health. All of these groups were
involved in survey design and data
collection.

The community leaders had
previous, though not extensive,
research experience. For example,
the coordinator of the Immigrant
Service Providers Group/Health
had a bachelor’s degree, extensive
science curriculum development
experience, and previous CBPR
experience working with Tufts
University (notably the Shape-Up
Somerville childhood obesity in-
tervention23) and was a member of
the steering committee of the Tufts
Community Research Center. The
leaders from Cambridge Health
Alliance and Massachusetts Coali-
tion for Occupational Safety and
Health had formal advanced edu-
cation, including a medical degree
and a master’s degree, and rela-
tively extensive research experi-
ence.

One goal for the project was to
create a participatory environment
within the CBPR model.24–27

During the project design phase,
we built in tasks to involve com-
munity leaders in the preparation
and implementation of surveys,
discussion of the analysis plans, and
interpretation of results.

These tasks were designed to
help the academic researchers

transfer research capability to
community-based organizations.
The goal was to give community
leaders, particularly in our partner
organizations, additional experi-
ence and training in survey de-
velopment, implementation, and
analysis, with assistance provided
by coinvestigators at Tufts Uni-
versity. In early meetings with
community partners after the
study was funded, we began to
outline the strategy for preparing
and implementing the survey of
immigrant workers in Somerville.
We sought to include the com-
munity leaders and to respect the
participant base they represented.
We quickly introduced the concept
of the Tufts IRB and informed
consent.

Teen Educators

Because of the difficulty of
identifying, establishing dialogue
with, and developing trust with
immigrant populations, as well as
the nature of the population we
were trying to reach, which in-
cluded both documented and
undocumented workers and em-
ployers, we proposed to use bi-
lingual youths as teen educators,
acting under the supervision of
experienced adult youth leaders,
to reach out to immigrant
workers in Somerville. Our grant
proposal noted the language and
cultural differences within the
study populations and the role
adolescents have traditionally
played both in peer education
and in immigrant communities, as
an interface between older immi-
grants and native citizens.19 Two
of our partners, the Community
Action Agency of Somerville and
the Haitian Coalition, often
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employed adolescents to help es-
tablish and maintain community
networks. We believed that the
youths would be able to overcome
the obstacles in approaching and
connecting with our target popula-
tion and that experience with an
academic research project would be
of substantial benefit to the adoles-
cent collaborators.

The resulting occupational sur-
vey was largely developed by the
teen educators, who received
training from Boston-area occu-
pational safety and health experts
and Tufts faculty associated
with our grant. Questions about
immigration status were not in-
cluded in this survey or in any
of the other data-gathering activi-
ties pursued under this grant,
a decision affirmed by all of the
project partners (academic, clini-
cal, and community). Teen educa-
tors solicited respondents’ oral
consent under the supervision of
IRB-certified adult leaders (in
a few instances Tufts University
students administered the
surveys).

The survey involved a short
(average time 10 minutes) dia-
logue between an teen educator
and a respondent. The survey’s 23
questions were grouped into 3
sections: background (for exam-
ple, country of origin, age cate-
gory, gender), occupation (‘‘What
kind of work do you do at your
primary job?’’ ‘‘If you have a pro-
fession that you cannot currently
practice, what is it?’’), and health
and safety (‘‘Did you receive
training that was specifically
about health and safety?’’). The
survey was later modified to in-
clude additional health ques-
tions for use at an immigrant

occupational health fair in No-
vember 2008.

RESULTS

Some potential risks to human
participants were identified from
the start by the Tufts research
team:

d Worker participation might be-
come known to employers, who
could retaliate by terminating
employment, restricting promo-
tion, or reducing salary in-
creases.

d Employees might reveal that
they did not hold a required
Massachusetts license to per-
form residential or business-re-
lated services, thus putting both
themselves and their employer
at risk for possible legal action.

d Employees and employers
might not be in compliance with
Massachusetts tax laws and
withholding requirements or
participate in mandatory Mas-
sachusetts worker compensa-
tion insurance, also putting
them at risk for legal or crimi-
nal action.

d Employers might not carry re-
quired liability insurance or
provide required health and
safety training and equipment.

d Some workers, and possibly
employers, might be undocu-
mented immigrants, who could
have their status identified via
the project and be arrested and
possibly deported.

We further identified risks to
the participating teen educators
who would be conducting the
surveys with immigrant workers.
The primary risk was being

identified in their communities as
acting on behalf of authorities and
in opposition to the interests of
community employers and
workers. Also some risks could
possibly extend to the families of
the teen educator and related
adult workers. Finally, we identi-
fied risks to participating commu-
nity organizations, such as the risk
of being perceived as acting in
consort with federal and state
agencies in opposition to commu-
nity and immigrant interests.

As we began the process of
designing the first survey docu-
ment and implementation plan,
some unanticipated questions
came from the community part-
ners. We expected that they would
be somewhat protective of their
community members and might
raise objections to methods that
appeared too intrusive. However,
we found that often community
leaders questioned the level of
caution we proposed to exercise in
the data collection process as well
as the importance and relevance
of policies and procedures
designed to protect confidentiality
and human participants in general.
For example, the discussions
about how to obtain informed
consent for the survey of immi-
grant workers inspired these and
similar inquiries:

d ‘‘Why does Tufts require all of
this bureaucracy? We survey
our communities all the time
and no one worries about this.’’

d ‘‘If they answer the questions
then they are giving their con-
sent; if they don’t want to an-
swer, they won’t.’’

d ‘‘I can identify the people in my
organization who will want to do

this survey; the consent form
will just scare them away.’’

d ‘‘We will hold a health fair and
then just ask for the informa-
tion.’’

d ‘‘Why do we need Tufts to ap-
prove what we are doing in our
own community?’’

As a result of these conversa-
tions, the Tufts research team
identified 3 ways to address gaps
in human participant policy expe-
rience in the community: (1) edu-
cation—we provided a working
knowledge of the role and opera-
tion of an IRB for all community-
based partners, both those with
and those without ongoing re-
search activities, that included
a brief history of the development
of human participant protections
and motivation for IRB existence;
(2) training—we provided training
on research design, informed
consent, and survey administra-
tion, with a discussion of potential
abuses and costs to study partic-
ipants; (3) dialogue—we ad-
dressed questions, within both
the community and the univer-
sity, about each other’s capabil-
ities and motives and sought to
increase the level of trust be-
tween community advocates and
university staff.

Education and Training

We related anecdotes from the
past that graphically illustrated
the need for IRBs, such as the
Tuskegee syphilis experiment, the
crimes committed by Nazi doctors
in the name of research, and the
more recent Johns Hopkins lead
paint experiment.28–31 We also
gave examples from our own re-
search experience in which the IRB
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process had helped us identify risks
unforeseen by researchers and de-
velop protections for participants.
We extended this training beyond
the key leaders of our community
partner groups to include the teen
educators who would be going into
the community to implement the
surveys.

We met with the teen educa-
tors and talked about our own
research projects and what we
had learned firsthand about
confidentiality and protection of
human participants. These dis-
cussions brought the subject to
life and made the instruction
a shared dialogue that involved
the adolescents in our own
learning process. We also used
role playing to demonstrate how
informed consent is obtained
and to identify possible problems
and misunderstandings. This ef-
fort was invaluable because it
not only educated the adolescent
but also helped us identify words
in our consent script that had not
translated well, words that our
adolescent collaborators did not
fully understand, and places in
the script that made them feel
awkward or uncomfortable. We
were able to make small changes
that qualified for expedited IRB
review and have our consent
form ready for the first data
collection event.

Dialogue

We opened a dialogue with the
community partners and the teen
educators, who helped us identify
additional risks to participants.
For example, both the partners
and the adolescents pointed out
that the adolescents might also
find their part-time jobs at risk if

their employers learned of their
participation in the project. Fur-
ther, they pointed out that ado-
lescents could lose friendships or
even risk being bullied by peers
who perceived them as acting in
consort with unfriendly authori-
ties, particularly if peers’ families
believed that the wage earner or
the family had been harmed by
the project.

We decided to bring the Tufts
University IRB administrator to
a face-to-face meeting with our
community partners. This meeting
was a success. Key outcomes were
the demystification of the Tufts
IRB process and recognition of our
shared intent to prevent harm to
the immigrant community in
Somerville. Our commonality of
purpose became a dominant
theme for both researchers and
community leaders.

The recognition that academics
and community collaborators
had much to learn from each
other about the safe implementa-
tion of this project strengthened
the sense of partnership in both
groups. Importantly, 5 of the
community leaders who were
partners in this research com-
pleted the Tufts University IRB
training requirements to qualify as
individual investigators for pro-
jects and proposals at Tufts Uni-
versity.

During the course of this pro-
ject, our research team, which in-
cluded the leader of the Immigrant
Service Providers Group/Health
as a coinvestigator, submitted
a new R01 proposal to the Na-
tional Institutes of Health, which
was funded in November 2008.
We believe that the inclusion of
a community member as

a coinvestigator was key to the
success of this grant proposal.

DISCUSSION

Academy-based CBPR re-
searchers must recognize the need
for a transfer of experience and
formal training on IRB issues to
community members when plan-
ning a CBPR project and must
include time, expertise, and cost
for this in the research proposal. It
cannot be overstated how effec-
tively this endeavor can raise the
level of community expertise in
research, facilitate and deepen the
research process, connect the
community to the researchers and
the university, and, most impor-
tantly, provide a community ca-
pability that will long outlast the
project. This empowerment of
community leaders opens the door
to further collaborations with the
host university as well as with
other research centers.

Academic researchers cannot
assume that community partners
are highly knowledgeable about
human subjects protections and
risks to participants, or about the
particular requirements for the cre-
ation of valid data, even when the
partners have frontline interaction
with the community. The examples
of research in the past that failed to
protect the rights and safety of
human research participants illus-
trate the complex nature of these
protections and their interpretation.
Because community organizations
do not conduct large-scale research
on their own and because the sur-
veys and questionnaires they
sometimes field are aimed at their
own membership and not at pub-
lication, there is no reason to

expect they have had IRB train-
ing. When university researchers
are involved and peer-reviewed
publication is a desired outcome
in addition to popular media
coverage, issues of human par-
ticipant protections and the
quality of data become much
more salient.

An important community ben-
efit to bringing in the IRB is the
extension of this knowledge and
expertise to the activities of com-
munity organizations. This exten-
sion has already affected the grant-
writing activities of our commu-
nity-based partners. Although
small community organizations
have long written grants, they are
increasingly in need of outside
funding and are learning that their
proposals must include adequate
consideration of human partici-
pant protection. IRB training and
certification represent a concrete
example of the transfer of research
capability from the academy to the
community as a direct result of
CBPR. Successful participation in
IRB-certified activities with uni-
versity and medical partners adds
considerable depth and validity to
a broad spectrum of grant appli-
cations made by community part-
ners.

Recommendations for

University Researchers

It is critical for academic re-
searchers to involve their com-
munity partners with the IRB as
early in the research process as
possible. Mistrust of science and
research is widespread in the
general population,32–34 but
meeting with an IRB administrator
or representative can lessen the
mystique of IRB oversight for the
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community partners, elucidate the
goals and process of the IRB, and
help to establish trust on both
sides. Face-to-face open discussion
of intentions and goals shows all
parties that they share the aim of
both protecting community mem-
bers and giving them voice. We
found that a remarkable amount
of social capital for the university
and for the community partners
was created in the face-to-face
meeting and subsequent interac-
tion.

We also recommend that re-
searchers provide examples from
their own research experience to
reinforce the traditional human
participant protection examples
found in the literature. Re-
searchers who explain how their
own survey had unintended ef-
fects and what it took to take
corrective action may present
a more motivating example to
community partners, particularly
when these examples are com-
bined with a discussion of the
historical events that contributed
to contemporary IRB rules.

Finally, we learned to commu-
nicate about IRB issues as often
and as clearly as possible, with
both our community partners and
our own IRB, to minimize last-
minute surprises. When a study
involves human participants and is
carried out by collaborators with
a wide range of backgrounds, all
verbal communications should be
followed up with a written memo
to both community partners and
the IRB. Once everyone under-
stands the importance of commu-
nication when making changes
and revising documents, the me-
chanics are relatively straight-
forward.j
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The Role for Community-Based Participatory Research
in Formulating Policy Initiatives: Promoting Safety
and Health for In-Home Care Workers
and Their Consumers
Fang Gong, PhD, Sherry Baron, MD, MPH, Linda Ayala, MPH, Laura Stock, MPH, Susannah McDevitt, BA, and Cathy Heaney, PhD

Although community-based

participatory research (CBPR)

can be effective in influencing

policy, the process of formulat-

ing policy initiatives through

CBPR is understudied. We de-

scribe a case study to illustrate

how alliances among various

community partners could be

united to formulate policy di-

rections.

In collaboration with part-

ners, the National Institute for

Occupational Safety and Health

initiated a project aimed at im-

proving health and safety for

low-income elderly and dis-

abled persons and their in-

home care workers. Commu-

nity partners and stakeholders

participated in focus groups,

stakeholder interviews, and

meetings; they played multiple

roles including identifying or-

ganizational policy changes the

partners could initiate immedi-

ately, as well as broader public

policy goals.

Results indicated that a

strong community partner-

ship, participation, and shared

values contributed to suc-

cessful formulation of pol-

icy initiatives. (Am J Public

Health. 2009;99:S531–S538.

doi:10.2105/AJPH.2008.152405)

COMMUNITY-BASED PARTICI-

patory research (CBPR) has gained
support as an effective approach to
addressing environmental justice
issues.1–3 It emphasizes community

involvement in applying scientific
knowledge to reduce adverse
health outcomes, sometimes
through changes in health policy.
To date, the process of developing
and implementing policy change
through CBPR is understudied.4 An

evaluation of policy initiatives in
four environmental justice projects
underscored the importance of

strong community leadership, par-
ticipation, organizational skills, and
shared values among partners.1

Themba and Minkler proposed
a multistage process for imple-
menting policy change through

CBPR beginning with careful for-
mulation of policy directions. When

community partnerships identify
and refine common policy objec-
tives, advocating those strategies

may be more successful.3

We describe a case study of
the policy formulation process in
a unique intervention project tar-

geting the intersection of the
home and work environment for
two economically marginalized

populations—low-income elderly
and disabled persons and the low-

wage in-home care workers who

help them live independently. The

on-going study, Partnership for

Safety: Making Homecare Safe for

All, aims to identify health risks

and develop intervention pro-

grams to improve health and

safety through partnerships be-

tween in-home care workers and

their clients (consumers) in Ala-

meda County, California. This

project demonstrates how alli-

ances among various (and some-

times conflicting) partners within

the community could be used to

formulate policy directions to im-

prove this challenging home or

work environment.

BACKGROUND

Currently 1.5 million in-home

care workers in the United States
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