
An Aberrant Thymus in CCR5−/− Mice Is Coupled with an
Enhanced Adaptive Immune Response in Fungal Infection

Danielle N. Kroetz*,† and George S. Deepe Jr.*,†,‡

* Department of Molecular Genetics, Biochemistry, and Microbiology, University of Cincinnati
College of Medicine, Cincinnati, OH 45267
† Division of Infectious Diseases, University of Cincinnati College of Medicine, Cincinnati, OH
45267
‡ Veterans Affairs Hospital, Cincinnati, OH 45220

Abstract
CCR5 is a potent mediator of regulatory T cell (Treg) chemotaxis. In murine histoplasmosis, mice
lacking CCR5 or endogenous CCL4 have a reduced number of Tregs in the lungs, which results in
accelerated resolution of infection. In this study, we demonstrate that CCR5 controls the outcome
of Histoplasma capsulatum infection by dictating thymic and lymph node egress of Tregs. Mice
lacking CCR5 or treated with a mAb to CCL4 had more Tregs in the thymus prior to and during
infection. Thymic accumulation was associated with diminished transcription of the sphingosine
1-phosphate 1 receptor and Krüppel-like factor 2, both of which regulate thymic and lymph node
emigration of T cells. The significance of CCR5 in Treg egress was demonstrated by generating
mixed bone marrow chimeras. Chimeric mice had an increased proportion of CCR5−/− Tregs in
the thymus and lymph nodes and a decreased proportion of Tregs in the lungs prior to and during
H. capsulatum infection. Hence, CCR5 signaling regulates pathogen persistence in murine
histoplasmosis by regulating Tregs exiting from the thymus and lymph nodes and, consequently,
their subsequent homing in the periphery.

The transcription factor Foxp3 is the master regulator for the development and function of
regulatory T cells (Tregs) (1–3). Two general subsets of Tregs have been identified: natural
Tregs, which mature in the thymus, and induced Tregs, which develop from CD4+ cells in
the periphery in the presence of Ag and TGF-β. In several models of infection, the
accumulation of Tregs, likely a combination of natural and induced, regulate cytokine
production and protective immunity. Homing of Tregs to inflamed tissue is influenced by
chemokines, a superfamily of chemotactic cytokines that signal through G protein-coupled
receptors. Notably, CCR5 and CXCR3 have been identified as potent mediators of Treg
chemotaxis. In murine histoplasmosis, as well as in dermal leishmaniasis and
paracoccidioidomycosis, CCR5-dependent homing of Tregs regulates the magnitude of the
proinflammatory response to favor pathogen persistence (4–6). Additionally, the
proinflammatory cytokine TNF-α exerts an immunoregulatory function in Histoplasma
capsulatum infection. TNF-α antagonism causes mice to succumb to infection as a result of
the emergence of a population of Ag-specific suppressor CD4+ CD25+ T cells (7).
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The factors that drive Tregs to exit the thymus remain unresolved. In this study, we reveal a
role for CCR5 in thymic emigration under normal and inflammatory conditions. The paucity
of Tregs in CCR5−/− and CCL4-neutralized lungs is associated with thymic and lymph node
accumulation. Stimulation of CCR5 by CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5 regulated expression of the
transcription factor Krüppel-like factor 2 (KLF2) and sphingosine 1-phosphate receptor 1
(S1P1) in vitro, and expression of both were diminished in thymocytes from CCR5−/− and
CCL4-neutralized mice prior to and during infection. CCR5−/− Tregs homed to the lungs as
efficiently as wild-type (WT) when transferred into RAG1−/− mice, suggesting CCR5
mediates thymic egress but is dispensable for Treg migration in the periphery. Collectively,
this study demonstrates the importance of CCR5-regulated thymic egress in dictating the
outcome of infection with the intracellular pathogen H. capsulatum.

Materials and Methods
Mice

C57BL/6 (WT), CCR5−/−, CXCR3−/−, RAG1−/−, and B6.PL-Thy1a/CyJ (Thy1.1 congenic
C57BL/6) mice were purchased from The Jackson Laboratory and maintained by the
Department of Laboratory Animal Medicine, University of Cincinnati, which is accredited
by the American Association for Accreditation of Laboratory Animal Medicine. All animal
experiments were done in accordance with the Animal Welfare Act guidelines of the
National Institutes of Health.

Generation of mixed bone marrow chimeras
Bone marrow was harvested from femurs and tibias of B6.PL-Thy1a/CyJ and CCR5−/− mice
and transferred i.v. into lethally irradiated RAG1−/− mice at a 1:1 ratio. Mice received a total
of 8 × 106 cells. After 8–10 wk, mice were infected intranasally with 2 × 106 H. capsulatum.

In vivo neutralization of CCL4 and simvastatin treatment
For neutralization of CCL4, mice were treated with an mAb to CCL4 (R&D Systems,
Minneapolis, MN). Mice received 100 μg anti-CCL4 or rat IgG three times a week. Mice
were given 40 μg simvastatin or vehicle control i.p. daily for 2 wk.

H. capsulatum infection and organ culture
Mice 5 to 6 wk in age were intranasally inoculated with 30–50 μl 2 × 106 H. capsulatum
yeasts (strain G217B) diluted in HBSS. To assess fungal burden, lungs were homogenized
and serially diluted onto mycosel blood agar plates and incubated for 1 wk at 28°C. Fungal
burden was expressed as the mean CFU per whole organ ± SEM. The limit of detection is 1
× 102 CFU.

Isolation of leukocytes
Thymi and lymph nodes were teased apart in HBSS using the ends of two frosted glass
slides. Lungs were homogenized in HBSS using a gentleMACS Dissociator (Miltenyi
Biotec, Auburn CA), and Lympholyte M (Cedarlane Laboratories, Hornby, ON, Canada)
was used to isolate leukocytes. All cell solutions were filtered through 60-μm nylon mesh
(Spectrum Laboratories, Rancho Dominguez, CA).

Flow cytometry
The following mAbs were purchased from BD Biosciences: PE-conjugated streptavidin and
CD69, allophycocyanin-conjugated CD25, CD8α, and CD62L, peridin-chlorophyll protein-
conjugated CD4, and FITC-conjugated CD3ε, CD24, and β7 integrin. Allophycocyanin- and
biotin-conjugated CD90.1 (Thy1.1) and FITC-conjugated CD90.2 (Thy1.2) were purchased
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from eBioscience (San Diego, CA). For surface staining, cells were washed with 1% BSA in
HBSS (pH 7.4) and were stained at 4°C for 15 min. To characterize Foxp3 expression, cells
were incubated with Cytofix/Cytoperm (BD Biosciences, San Diego, CA), washed in
Permeabilization buffer (BD Biosciences), and stained for 1 h with PE-conjugated Foxp3
(eBioscience). To characterize apoptosis in the thymus, the In Situ Cell Death Detection Kit
(Roche Diagnostics, Indianapolis, IN) was used to characterize TUNEL+ cells as previously
described (8). Cells were characterized using an FACSCalibur Flow Cytometer (BD
Biosciences) and FCS Express Software.

BrdU labeling and detection
To measure Treg proliferation in the thymus, a FITC Flow kit was purchased from BD
Biosciences. BrdU (1 mg/ml) was administered i.p. for two consecutive days before being
sacrificed. Cells were stained following the manufacturer’s recommendations.

Purification and transfer of CD4+CD25+ T cells
The T regulatory isolation kit from Miltenyi Biotec was used for magnetic separation of
CD4+CD25− cells and CD4+CD25+ (Treg) cells from un-infected spleens. Purity of each
population was >90%. RAG1−/− mice were reconstituted with 8 × 106 WT CD4+ cells and 5
× 105 WT or CCR5−/− CD4+CD25+ cells 1 d prior to infection.

Quantitative real-time PCR
TRIzol reagent (Invitrogen) was used to extract RNA from the thymus and mediastinal
lymph nodes. A Reverse Transcription Systems kit (Promega, Madison, WI) was used to
synthesize cDNA. KLF2 and S1P1 transcription was characterized by quantitative real-time
PCR using TaqMan Fast Universal Master Mix and primer/probe sets from Applied
Biosystems (Carlsbad, CA). Samples were normalized to hypoxanthine-guanine
phosphoribosyltransferase (HPRT) (Applied Biosystems) and analyzed on an ABI Prism
7500 instrument (Applied Biosystems).

In vitro stimulation of thymocytes with chemokines
Thymocytes were plated at 1 × 106 cells/ml in RPMI 1640 supplemented with 5% FBS and
treated with 1 ng/ml CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5 (PeproTech, Rocky Hill, NJ) for 24 h.

Measurement of Akt phosphorylation
To measure phosphorylation of Akt, WT and CCR5−/− thymocytes were plated in a 96-well
plate and stimulated with media alone, 1, 10, or 100 ng/ml IL-2, or 10 ng/ml CCL3, CCL4,
or CCL5 for 30 min (PeproTech). The Akt In-Cell ELISA kit from Thermo Scientific
(Waltham, MA) was used to measure total Akt and phosphorylated Akt.

Statistical analysis
Student t test was used for the comparison of two groups, and ANOVA was used to compare
multiple groups. Statistical significance was characterized by a p value ≤0.05.

Results
T cells accumulate in the thymus in the absence of CCR5

In the course of our studies, we unexpectedly observed that CCR5−/− mice had visually
larger thymi than WT (Fig. 1A). Mice lacking CCR5 had a significant increase in the
number of thymocytes compared with controls (0.77 ± 0.08 × 108 versus 1.57 ± 0.12 × 108;
p < 0.001; Fig. 1B). We assessed the phenotype and absolute number of cells in the thymus.
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WT and CCR5−/− thymi had an equal proportion of CD4−CD8− double-negative (DN) (4.7
± 0.2% versus 4.2 ± 0.2%), CD8+ single-positive (SP) (3.9 ± 0.3% versus 3.3 ± 0.2%), and
CD4+CD8+ double-positive (DP) cells (82.9 ± 0.7% versus 82.7 ± 0.6%). A slight yet
statistically significant increase in CD4+ SP thymocytes (6.3 ± 0.16% versus 7.7 ± 0.29%; p
< 0.001) was observed in CCR5−/− thymi. Because CCR5−/− mice had 2-fold more
thymocytes, the absolute number of each of these populations was increased (Fig. 1C).

One explanation for the accumulation of cells within the thymi of CCR5−/− mice is that cells
from these animals experience less apoptosis than those from WT. We assessed the
proportion of apoptotic cells in the thymi of age-matched WT and CCR5−/− mice using
TUNEL staining. The mean percentage (± SEM) of TUNEL+ thymocytes was similar (p >
0.05) in WT and CCR5−/− mice (0.63 ± 0.05% versus 0.51 ± 0.04%; n = 8–10).

We also considered that differences in cellularity might be accompanied by altered
proliferation of thymocytes. To probe this possibility, we analyzed the proliferative activity
of various thymic cell populations from WT and CCR5−/− mice using BrdU. In the thymi of
the latter, a higher proportion of DP, CD8+ SP, and CD4+ Foxp3+ cells incorporated BrdU
than in the respective populations from WT (Table I).

We next investigated the expression of several cell-surface markers throughout the course of
T cell development. Of particular interest were CD69 and CD24, which are both
downregulated as medullary thymocytes mature (9, 10). Total CD69 expression was
comparable among CD4+ and CD8+ SP thymocytes in WT and CCR5−/− mice. However,
although variable, we observed differences in the proportion of CD69hi and CD69int

thymocytes between the two groups. In several experiments, CCR5−/− mice manifested a
reduced proportion of CD69hi cells and increased proportion of CD69int compared with
controls (data not shown). CD24 was also differentially expressed on WT and CCR5−/−

thymocytes. Notably, CD24 was not as efficiently downregulated on mature CCR5−/−

CD69−CD8+ SP thymocytes. CD69−CD24hi constituted 10.1 ± 1% of the CD8+ SP
population in WT and 17.5 ± 1.1% in CCR5−/− (p < 0.01).

CCR5 and its ligands influence S1P1 and KLF2 expression in the thymus
The receptor S1P1 is pivotal for T cell egress from the thymus and peripheral lymph nodes
(11, 12). S1P1 expression is regulated by the zinc-finger transcription factor KLF2, and the
absence of KLF2 results in defective peripheral migration of T cells as a result of
unrestrained expression of chemokine receptors such as CCR3 and CCR5 (13). The factors
that control KLF2 expression in T cells are unknown. Thus, one possible explanation for the
accumulation of T cells in the thymus is that signaling through CCR5 controls the
expression of KLF2 and. consequently, S1P1. Thymi were isolated from WT and CCR5−/−

mice, and expression of KLF2 and S1P1 was measured by quantitative real-time PCR. KLF2
and S1P1 transcript was reduced by a log in thymocytes from CCR5−/− mice when
normalized to age-matched WT controls (Fig. 2A). A similar decrement in KLF2 and S1P1
transcript was observed in thymi harvested from mice given an mAb to CCL4 (Fig. 2A).

To determine if signaling through CCR5 directly regulated expression of these molecules,
thymocytes were treated with CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5, and KLF2 and S1P1 transcription was
quantified. Relative expression of KLF2 and S1P1 in thymocytes was elevated upon addition
of any CCR5 ligand when normalized to the vehicle control (Fig. 2B). These results provide
evidence that CCR5 signaling and the expression of KLF2 and S1P1 are linked and together
likely influence thymic exiting.

Treatment with statins induces KLF2 expression in T cells (14). To determine if thymic
accumulation was caused by diminished KLF2 expression in CCR5−/− mice, WT and
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CCR5−/− mice were administered simvastatin or vehicle control daily to induce KLF2
expression. After 2 wk, the number of thymocytes in CCR5−/− mice was reduced and
comparable to controls (Fig. 2C).

Enhanced activation of Akt in CCR5−/− thymocytes
PI3K influences thymic egress (15). Constitutive activation of PI3K, measured by Akt
activity, in the thymus results in accumulation of mature SP T cells in the thymus and
delayed appearance in the periphery. We next characterized Akt activity in WT and
CCR5−/− thymocytes isolated from uninfected mice. Thymocytes were stimulated with
various concentrations of IL-2 to measure phosphorylation of Akt. When treated with media
alone, Akt phosphorylation was comparable in WT and CCR5−/− thymocytes (56.3 ± 5.0%
versus 62.3 ± 8.1%). Addition of IL-2 induced phosphorylation of Akt in WT and, to a
greater extent, CCR5−/− thymocytes (Fig. 3A). To determine if CCR5 signaling directly
activated Akt, WT and CCR5−/− thymocytes were stimulated with CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5.
Each CCR5 ligand induced phosphorylation of Akt in WT, but not CCR5−/− thymocytes
(Fig. 3B). These data suggest that CCR5 influences activation of this signaling pathway.

CCR5 influences thymic and lymph node egress during H. capsulatum infection
Infection with H. capsulatum results in thymic involution (16). We sought to determine if
CCR5 was involved in this process. WT and CCR5−/− mice were infected, and thymic
cellularity was monitored at various time points postinfection (Fig. 4A). Thymi from
CCR5−/− mice were visually larger than controls throughout the course of infection.
However, the difference in the number of thymocytes in WT and CCR5−/− mice narrowed
upon infection. Consistent with thymi from uninfected CCR5−/− mice, KLF2 and S1P1
transcription was diminished compared with WT at day 14 postinfection (Fig. 4B).

In addition to the thymus, leukocytes also accumulated in the mediastinal lymph nodes of
CCR5−/− mice during H. capsulatum infection (Fig. 4A). At day 14 postinfection, CD4+ T
cells accounted for 16.4 ± 1.1% and 24.5 ± 0.8% of cells in WT and CCR5−/− lymph nodes,
respectively (p < 0.001). The proportion of CD8+ T cells was comparable in both groups.
Because CCR5−/− mice have 2-fold more cells than controls (0.44 ± 0.13 × 107 versus 1.0 ±
0.19 × 107; p < 0.01), the absolute number of both CD4+ and CD8+ T cells in the
mediastinal lymph nodes was elevated. In contrast to the thymus, KLF2 and S1P1 expression
was comparable in leukocytes isolated from WT and CCR5−/− mediastinal lymph nodes at
day 14 postinfection (Fig. 4B).

The paucity of Tregs in the lungs correlates with accumulation in the thymus and lymph
nodes during H. capsulatum infection

Natural Tregs mature in the thymus and are characterized by stable expression of Foxp3
(17). The signals required for thymic emigration of Tregs remain unclear. The receptor S1P1
is expressed on Tregs and was recently shown to influence Treg development, maintenance,
and suppressor function (18, 19). CCR5 is highly expressed on Tregs and has been shown to
dictate Treg trafficking in several models of infection and in tumor immunity (4, 5, 20).
Mice lacking CCR5 or endogenous CCL4 resolve H. capsulatum infection more efficiently
than controls due to a decrement in the proportion (Fig. 5A) and number of Tregs in the
lungs (6). Hence, we hypothesized that the reduction of Tregs in infected lungs was a result
of failed thymic egress in the absence of CCR5 activity.

The proportion of CD4+ SP cells expressing Foxp3 was comparable in WT and CCR5−/−

mice prior to (1.3 ± 0.11% versus 1.4 ± 0.12%; p > 0.05) and at day 14 postinfection (5.8 ±
1.2% versus 4.6 ± 0.7%; p > 0.05). However, the absolute number of CD4+Foxp3+ cells in
CCR5−/− thymi was elevated compared with controls at both time points (data not shown
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and Fig. 5B). Although Treg proliferation was augmented in the thymus of uninfected
CCR5−/− mice (Table I), the percent of CD4+ Foxp3+ cells that incorporated BrdU in
control and mutant animals was similar at day 14 postinfection (46.5 ± 5.5% versus 42.3 ±
4.7%; p > 0.05). Thus, during infection, more Tregs was more likely due to impaired thymic
emigration rather than augmented expansion.

CCL4 is a potent chemotactic mediator for Tregs (21) as well as human thymocytes (22).
Neutralization of CCL4 causes a similar reduction in Tregs in CCR5−/− lungs in infection
(6). This prompted us to investigate the role of the CCL4–CCR5 signaling axis in Treg
egress from the thymus. Thymocytes were isolated from mice treated with rat IgG or a mAb
to CCL4 at days 0 and 14 postinfection. Similar to CCR5−/− mice, the absence of
endogenous CCL4 was associated with more cells in the thymus. Although the proportion of
CD4+ SP cells expressing Foxp3 was comparable, the absolute of Tregs was significantly
elevated compared with IgG controls (p < 0.01; Fig. 5B).

Tregs also accumulated in the mediastinal lymph nodes of CCL4-neutralized and CCR5−/−

mice during H. capsulatum infection. Although Foxp3+ cells constituted 8% of the CD4+ T
cells in all groups, the absolute number was significantly higher in CCL4-neutralized and
CCR5−/− lymph nodes days 7 and 14 postinfection (p < 0.001) (data not shown and Fig.
5B).

Generation of mixed bone marrow chimeras
To confirm that CCR5 influenced emigration of Tregs from the thymus and lymph nodes,
lethally irradiated RAG1−/− mice were transplanted with a 1:1 ratio of WT (Thy1.1+) and
CCR5−/− (Thy1.2+) bone marrow cells. At 8–10 wk posttransplant, chimeric mice were
infected with H. capsulatum to determine the proportion of Thy1.1+ and Thy1.2+ Tregs in
the thymus, mediastinal lymph nodes, lungs, and bone marrow. An increased proportion of
Tregs in the thymus and lymph nodes of chimeric mice were Thy1.2+. In contrast, lungs
from chimeric mice manifested an increased proportion of Thy1.1+Foxp3+ cells. An equal
proportion of Thy1.1+ and Thy1.2+ Tregs were detected in the bone marrow (Fig. 5C).
Mixed bone marrow chimeras were also infected in parallel with WT and CCR5−/− mice to
characterize fungal burden. At day 14, the number of CFUs in the lungs of chimeric mice
was intermediate to that of WT and CCR5−/− mice (Fig. 5C).

CCR5 is dispensable for Treg migration once in the periphery
The importance of CCR5 in thymic egress of Tregs was extended by adoptive transfer
experiments. RAG1−/− mice were reconstituted with WT CD4+ T effector cells and WT or
CCR5−/− CD4+CD25+ cells 1 d prior to infection. At day 14 postinfection, mice had a
similar number of Foxp3+ T cells and fungal burden in the lungs whether given WT or
CCR5−/− CD4+CD25+ cells (Fig. 6). Both groups contained an equal percent of CD4+

Foxp3+ cells in the spleen (0.39 ± 0.06% versus 0.56 ± 0.12%) and lymph nodes (2.3 ± 0.3%
versus 2.1 ± 0.4%). These results demonstrate that WT and CCR5−/− Tregs manifest the
same migratory capacity as WT once in circulation.

Chemokine-driven thymic egress is specific to CCR5
Other chemokines including CXCR3 and CCR4 also influence Treg migration. CXCR3 is
upregulated in a unique population of Tregs that coexpress the Th1-specifying transcription
T-bet and Foxp3 to facilitate Treg homing in Mycobacterium tuberculosis infection (23). To
establish if impaired thymic egress and subsequent homing of Tregs was specific to a
deficiency in CCR5 signaling, mice lacking CXCR3 were infected because this chemokine
receptor has been implicated in Treg trafficking during Th1 responses (23). At days 0 and 7
postinfection, CXCR3−/− mice had a similar number of Foxp3+ cells in the thymus as WT.
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Furthermore, Tregs lacking CXCR3 homed to the lungs as efficiently as WT both prior to
and during infection (Fig. 7A). Interestingly, S1P1 and KLF2 were dramatically upregulated
in thymi and lymph nodes harvested from uninfected CXCR3−/− mice (Fig. 7B).

Discussion
CCR5 is expressed on Tregs and has been shown to dictate Treg trafficking in models of
infection and tumor immunity (4, 5, 20). H. capsulatum infection in CCR5−/− mice
manifests an accelerated clearance of the fungus beginning on day 14 coincident with the
activation of the cellular immune response. The heightened elimination of H. capsulatum
was associated with a marked reduction in the number of Tregs in lungs and an amplified
Th17 response. The latter was critically important for enhanced fungal clearance (6). In this
study, we discovered that the paucity of Tregs in CCR5−/− lungs was coincident with an
accumulation of Tregs in the thymus and mediastinal lymph nodes. The involvement of
CCR5 in thymic and lymph node emigration was demonstrated by the generation of mixed
bone marrow chimeras. Chimeric mice exhibited a greater proportion of CCR5−/− Tregs in
the thymus and mediastinal lymph nodes and a reduced proportion in the lungs. Thus, by
influencing Treg homing to the lungs, CCR5 regulates the outcome of H. capsulatum
infection.

The exiting of T cells from the thymus is dependent on S1P1 (12, 24). Expression of this
receptor is regulated by the transcription factor KLF2 (25). Chemokine receptors have also
been shown to influence thymic egress. CCR7 and CXCR4 direct thymic egress and lymph
node accumulation of T cells in homeostatic states (26, 27). In contrast, CCR5 influences
S1P1-dependent thymic egress (28). In vivo activation of S1P1 with the sphingosine analog
FTY720 reduces the number of thymocytes in CCR5−/−, but not WT mice. Consistent with
these observations, we found a correlation between thymocyte number and S1P1 expression
in CCR5−/− mice. The absence of CCR5 was accompanied by diminished transcription of
KLF2 and S1P1. However, this finding was not merely correlative because in vitro
stimulation of thymocytes from WT mice with CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5 induced expression
of KLF2 and S1P1. These results argue for a direct relationship between CCR5 signaling and
expression of these molecules.

The cholesterol-lowering drug simvastatin has been shown to upregulate KLF2 and,
therefore, S1P1 expression in T cells (14). Simvastatin-induced upregulation of KLF2
reduced the total number of thymocytes in CCR5−/− mice, suggesting that CCR5-driven
exiting occurs in a KLF2- and S1P1-dependent manner. However, because simvastatin has
been shown to have multiple anti-inflammatory effects (29–31), we are unable to exclude
the possibility that the reduction of thymocytes in CCR5−/− mice upon administration of
simvastatin is solely dependent on upregulation of KLF2. Furthermore, because T cell
migration is largely influenced by chemokine receptor expression, the inability to sense a
chemokine gradient in the absence of CCR5 is also plausible.

Maturation of medullary thymocytes is associated with upregulation of molecules that
facilitate T cell entry into the periphery such as CD62L and β7 integrin (9, 10, 32, 33).
Similar to S1P1, CD62L expression is regulated by KLF2 and has been implicated in thymic
emigration (34). For unknown reason, CD62L expression like CD69 was highly variable on
CCR5−/− SP thymocytes. In multiple, but not all, experiments, the proportion of CD4+ and
CD8+ SP thymocytes that were CD62Lhi was diminished in the absence of CCR5. Thus,
diminished KLF2 in CCR5−/− mice may hinder upregulation of CD62L and, consequently,
thymic exiting. Additionally, expression of β7 integrin was altered in the absence of CCR5.
The expression of β7 integrin was diminished on CCR5−/− CD8+ SP thymocytes compared
with WT controls (48.5 ± 1.4% versus 36.1 ± 0.9%; p < 0.001).
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PI3K/Akt appears to contribute to thymic emigration (15). Constitutive activation of this
pathway is associated with more mature T cells in the thymus and delayed appearance in the
periphery. Stimulation of thymocytes with IL-2 enhanced phosphorylation of Akt in
CCR5−/− thymocytes compared with the control. Thus, hyperactivation of Akt in the
absence of CCR5 may influence thymic accumulation. Additionally, treatment of WT
thymocytes with CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5 resulted in phosphorylation of Akt, which was
significantly diminished in the absence of CCR5. These results demonstrate that CCR5
signaling directly activates Akt. Because the Akt–mammalian target of rapamycin pathway
regulates Foxp3 expression and Treg development in the thymus (35, 36), studies are
planned to explore the role of CCR5 in this signaling pathway.

If CCR5 was absolutely required for thymic egress, we would expect accumulation of
mature SP thymocytes due to failed egress and, consequently, a reduced proportion of DN
and DP cells. Although CCR5−/− mice displayed a slight yet statistically significant increase
in CD4+ SP thymocytes (6.3 ± 0.16% versus 7.7 ± 0.29%; p < 0.001), its biological
relevance is unresolved. Thus, other additional factors likely contribute to CCR5−/− mice
having a more capacious thymus. Microarray analysis has revealed several families of genes
that were differentially expressed in CCR5−/− thymi. Notably, >40 genes associated with the
cell cycle process were upregulated. A large proportion of these cell cycle genes were
specifically linked to M phase. Thus, dysregulation of the cell cycle may contribute to
thymus enlargement in CCR5−/− mice. Genes associated with apoptosis and abnormal T cell
development and function were also upregulated in CCR5−/− thymi. Downregulated genes
included those associated with TGF-β signaling, arachidonic acid metabolism, regulation of
the inflammatory response, biological adhesion, and epithelial cell development (data not
shown).

The influence of CCR5 signaling on intrathymic trafficking has not been explored. CCR7
and CCR9 are involved in thymic entry of bone marrow progenitor cells (37). CCR7 has
been recognized has the predominant chemokine receptor in intrathymic trafficking of
thymocytes (38–40). However, it was recently demonstrated that CCR7 directs migration of
CD4+ SP cells toward the medulla, but is dispensable for entry and accumulation. Treatment
of CD4+ SP cells with pertussis toxin inhibits directional trafficking of CD4+ SP cells from
the cortex to the medulla, as well as accumulation in the medulla (41). These results suggest
that other chemokine receptors likely influence the entry of CD4+ SP cells into the medulla.
CCL4 has been shown to potently stimulate migration and activation of CD4+ SP, CD8+ SP,
and CD4+CD8+ DP human thymocytes (22). CCL3, CCL4, and CCL5 are highly expressed
by CD90− cells in thymus (data not shown). Thus, it is possible that CCR5 influences
intrathymic trafficking of thymocytes in addition to thymic emigration.

Although our findings support the assertion that CCR5 influences thymic exiting, CCR5−/−

mice exhibit an equal proportion of CD8+ and an elevated proportion of CD4+ T cells in
peripheral organs (6). The increased proportion of CD4+ cells in H. capsulatum infection is
not a result of augmented proliferation in the periphery. CCR5 is required for optimal IL-2
production and CD4+ T cell proliferation. In fact, T cells isolated from CCR5−/− mice or
CCR5Δ32 homozygotes display a diminished proliferative capacity (6, 42). A deficiency in
Tregs and accumulation of effector T cells has been described in mice and humans that have
mutations in the genes encoding IL-2 or its receptor (43). The development of severe
autoimmune disease in IL-2−/− mice is associated with reduced proportion of Tregs and an
increased proportion and number of Th1 and Th17 cells in multiple organs (44).
Furthermore, in experimental tuberculosis, Ag-specific Tregs prevent accumulation of
effector CD4+ T cells in the lungs (45). Based on these findings, a decrement in Tregs in
CCR5−/− lungs could allow accumulation of effector CD4+ T cells in histoplasmosis. Unlike
the scenario in experimental tuberculosis, a portion of the effector CD4+ T cells in H.
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capsulatum-infected mice differentiate into Th17, which are central in the accelerated
clearance.

In summary, we demonstrate that CCR5 signaling influences thymic egress, likely in a
KLF2- and S1P1-dependent manner. Further studies focusing on how the CCR5, KLF2, and
S1P1 signaling pathways overlap will likely clarify the mechanism in which T cells exit the
thymus. Of considerable importance is the influence of the thymus in coordinating the
protective immune response during infection, as CCR5-dependent trafficking of Tregs
dictates the outcome to the fungal pathogen H. capsulatum.
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Treg regulatory T cell

WT wild-type
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FIGURE 1.
T cells accumulate in the thymus in the absence of CCR5. Thymi were harvested from WT
and CCR5−/− mice 5 to 6 wk in age and visualized using a compound microscope (A). Total
number of thymocytes was enumerated (B), and the absolute number of CD4−CD8− DN,
CD4+ SP, CD8+ SP, and CD4+CD8+ DP cells (C) was characterized by flow cytometry.
Data represent the mean ± SEM (n = 8–12) from two to three experiments. ##p < 0.001.
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FIGURE 2.
Thymic accumulation is associated with diminished expression of S1P1 and KLF2 in
CCR5−/− and CCL4-neutralized mice. Thymi were isolated from WT, CCL4-neutralized,
and CCR5−/− mice. Mice were given rat IgG or anti-CCL4 daily for 1 wk days prior to
being sacrificed. RNA was extracted from thymi, and expression of KLF2 and S1P1 was
measured by quantitative real-time PCR. HPRT was used as an endogenous control, and
values represent log decrease compared with WT day 0 thymi (A). WT and CCR5−/−

thymocytes were treated with 1 ng/ml CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5 overnight, and KLF2 and
S1P1 expression was measured by quantitative real-time PCR. Values represent log change
relative to the vehicle control (B). Mice were given 40 μg simvastatin or vehicle control i.p.
daily. After 2 wk of treatment, the total number of thymocytes was enumerated (C). Data
represent the mean ± SEM (n = 8–12) from two to three experiments. *p < 0.05, **p <
0.01, ##p < 0.001. RQ, relative quantification.
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FIGURE 3.
Akt is hyperphosphorylated in CCR5−/− thymocytes. WT and CCR5−/− thymocytes were
isolated to measure phosphorylation of Akt. Thymocytes were treated with media alone, 1,
10, or 100 ng/ml IL-2 (A) or 10 ng/ml CCL3, CCL4, or CCL5 (B) for 30 min. Graphs
represent the percent increase of total Akt that was phosphorylated after stimulation. Data
are representative of two individual experiments.
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FIGURE 4.
CCR5 influences thymic and lymph node egress during H. capsulatum infection. WT and
CCR5−/− mice were infected intranasally with 2 × 106 H. capsulatum and sacrificed at days
7, 14, and 21 post-infection to determine the absolute number of leukocytes in the thymus
and mediastinal lymph nodes (A). RNA was extracted from the thymus and mediastinal
lymph nodes at day 14 postinfection to measure KLF2 and S1P1 transcription by
quantitative real-time PCR. HPRT was used as an endogenous control, and values represent
log decrease normalized to WT controls (B). Data represent the mean ± SEM (n = 8–12)
from two to three experiments. *p < 0.05, **p < 0.01, ##p < 0.001.
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FIGURE 5.
The paucity of Tregs in the lungs correlates with accumulation in the thymus and lymph
nodes during H. capsulatum infection. Mice were infected with 2 × 106 yeasts intranasally.
For neutralization of CCL4, mice were i.p. given an mAb to CCL4 at the time of infection
and every other day thereafter. Tregs were characterized as CD4+ Foxp3+ cells. The
proportion of Tregs in the lungs (A) and absolute number of Tregs in the lungs, thymus, and
mediastinal lymph nodes were determined at day 14 postinfection (B). For the generation of
mixed bone marrow chimeras, RAG1−/− mice were lethally irradiated and transplanted with
a 1:1 ratio of Thy1.1+ (WT) and Thy1.2+ (CCR5−/−) bone marrow cells. After 8–10 wk,
mice were infected with 2 × 106 H. capsulatum intranasally. Cells isolated from infected
lungs, thymi, mediastinal lymph nodes (mLN), and bone marrow (BM) were stained and
analyzed by flow cytometry. The graph represents the proportion of CD4+ Foxp3+ cells that
were Thy1.1+ or Thy1.2+ at day 14 postinfection. WT and CCR5−/− mice were infected in
parallel with mixed bone marrow chimeras to quantify fungal burden in the lungs at day 14
postinfection (C). Data represent the mean ± SEM (n = 6–12) from two to three experiments.
*p < 0.05, **p < 0.01, ##p < 0.001.
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FIGURE 6.
CCR5 is dispensable for Treg migration once in the periphery. RAG1−/− mice were
reconstituted with WT CD4+ T cells and WT or CCR5−/− CD4+ CD25+ cells purified from
the spleen and infected with 2 × 106 yeasts 1 d later. Number of CD4+ CD25+ Foxp3+ cells
(A) and fungal burden (B) in the lungs of RAG1−/− mice reconstituted with WT or CCR5−/−

CD4+CD25+ cells at day 14 postinfection. Fungal burden is presented as the mean number
of CFUs. Data represent the mean ± SEM (n = 8–12) from two to three experiments. **p <
0.01.
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FIGURE 7.
Chemokine-driven thymic egress is specific to CCR5. WT and CXCR3−/− mice were
sacrificed at days 0 and 7 postinfection to quantify the number of CD4+ Foxp3+ cells in the
lungs, thymus, and mediastinal lymph nodes (A). RNA was extracted from the thymus and
lymph nodes of uninfected mice to measure expression of KLF2 and S1P1 by quantitative
real-time PCR. HPRT was used as an endogenous control, and values represent log increase
compared with WT controls (B). Data represent the mean ± SEM (n = 6–8) from two to
three experiments. *p < 0.05, **p < 0.01, ##p < 0.001.

Kroetz and Deepe Page 18

J Immunol. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2012 May 15.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

Kroetz and Deepe Page 19

Table I

Proliferation of thymic populations

Phenotype

% Proliferating (BrdU+)

WT CCR5−/−

DN (CD4−CD8−) 32.0 ± 1.0 34.2 ± 0.9

DP (CD4+CD8+) 31.7 ± 3.0 37.1 ± 2.5a

CD4+ SP (CD4+CD8−) 5.9 ± 0.2 6.6 ± 0.3

CD8+ SP (CD4−CD8+) 31.2 ± 1.1 37.4 ± 1.8a

CD4+CD25+ 8.3 ± 1.2 7.7 ± 1.2

CD4+Foxp3+ 29.6 ± 2.4 42.3 ± 3.1a

Data represent the mean ± SEM of two to three experiments (n = 6–12). Proliferation was measured by BrdU incorporation and expressed as
percent of total thymic population.

a
p < 0.05 versus WT.
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