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Abstract
Telephone-delivered psychotherapy has increased utility as a method of service delivery in the
current world, where a number of barriers, including economic hardships and limited access to
care, may prevent people from receiving the treatment they need. This method of service provision
is practical and has the potential to reach large numbers of underserved people in a cost-effective
manner. The aim of this paper is to review the state-of-the-art of telephone-delivered
psychotherapy and to identify improvements and possible solutions to challenges. Results of
randomized controlled trials indicate high client acceptance and positive outcomes with this
method of delivering psychotherapy. Nonetheless, psychotherapists wishing to deliver
psychotherapy by telephone face a number of challenges, including a lack of control over the
environment, potential compromises of privacy and confidentiality, developing therapeutic
alliance without face-to-face contact, ethical and legal issues in providing psychotherapy by
telephone, handling crisis situations at a distance, and psychotherapist adjustment to conducting
psychotherapy in an alternative manner. There remains a need for further research, including
direct comparisons of face-to-face psychotherapy with telephone-delivered psychotherapy and
feasibility of telephone delivery of psychotherapies other than cognitive behavioral therapy.
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Overview of Telehealth
Telehealth refers to “the use of telecommunications and information technologies to provide
access to health information and services across a geographical distance” (Glueckauf,
Picket, Ketterson, Loomis, & Rozensky, 2003, p. 160). Use of telehealth, especially for
mental health care, has increased rapidly because of the desire to provide health care to
underserved populations, reduce health care costs, and meet consumers’ desires (Glueckauf
et al., 2003). A number of barriers to traditional face-to-face psychotherapy may prevent
people from obtaining the help they need, including transportation issues, need for childcare,
perceived stigma, and difficulty leaving work (Bee, Lovell, Lidbetter, Easton, & Gask,
2010; Mohr et al., 2005). Over two thirds of depressed patients in a primary care setting
reported at least one practical barrier (e.g., transportation difficulties) that hampered their
ability to attend psychotherapy regularly (Mohr et al. 2006). Telephone-delivered
psychotherapy can minimize such barriers, either as the primary method of delivering
psychotherapy or as an adjunct to face-to-face psychotherapy.

Telephone-delivered psychotherapy offers increased client convenience with respect to
location and flexible timing of appointments (Simon, Ludman, Tutty, Operskalski, & Von
Korff, 2004; Tutty, Ludman, & Simon, 2005; Tutty, Spangler, Poppleton, Ludman, &
Simon, 2010). Clients can complete sessions at home in privacy, which may reduce
concerns about stigma related to mental health treatment (Mozer, Franklin, & Rose, 2008;
Simon et al., 2004) and potentially be less threatening than face-to-face sessions for some
clients.

Clients who could benefit from improved access to psychotherapy include older adults,
individuals who lack local service providers (especially rural residents), homebound
individuals or those with chronic medical illnesses, active military personnel who may
prefer care from military providers, and incarcerated clients (Glueckauf et al., 2003). In
essence, psychotherapy by telephone makes treatment available to people who may not
otherwise receive mental health care (Mohr et al., 2010; Simon et al., 2004).

Despite recent advances in video and computer technology, the telephone may still be a
preferred method of providing psychotherapy compared with more technologically advanced
communication approaches. First, virtually all U.S. households (96%) have a telephone land
line or cell phone (Federal Communications Commission, 2010) compared with only 62%
with internet access (U.S. Census Bureau, 2007). Furthermore, rural residents, who are
likely targets of telehealth approaches, have even less internet access than more urban
residents (U.S. Department of Commerce, 2010). Second, using the telephone to deliver
psychotherapy requires no special and potentially costly equipment. The only added cost is
long-distance charges. Third, videoconferencing often involves travel to a centralized
location with a video hookup, which is problematic for homebound individuals and those
who cannot or are unwilling to drive. Fourth, conducting psychotherapy by telephone has
fewer potential technical difficulties than videoconferencing, e.g. poor picture quality or
frozen frames. Finally, neither psychotherapists nor clients need instructions on how to use a
telephone.

Randomized Controlled Trials of Telephone-delivered Psychotherapy
Research to date on telephone-delivered psychotherapy has yielded encouraging findings. In
this section, we review randomized controlled trials (RCTs) employing telephone-delivered
cognitive behavioral therapy (CBT) for participants with depression or anxiety disorders,
mainly because the vast majority of studies examining telephone psychotherapy have
focused on CBT.

Brenes et al. Page 2

Prof Psychol Res Pr. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2012 December 1.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Lovell and colleagues (Lovell et al., 2006) conducted the only randomized clinical trial to
date comparing face-to-face and telephone-delivered psychotherapy. Participants were 72
adults diagnosed with Obsessive Compulsive Disorder recruited from outpatient psychology
clinics in the United Kingdom. They received 10 weeks of exposure and response
prevention delivered by 2 “trained” psychotherapists who received regular supervision. The
first session was conducted face-to-face for all participants. The attrition rate was low
(5.5%); 3 participants dropped out of face-to-face treatment and 1 dropped out of telephone
treatment. Results indicated significant declines in both Yale Brown Obsessive Compulsive
Checklist (YBOCS) scores and depressive symptom scores from pre to post-intervention,
with no significant between-group differences. Further, 77% of clients in the telephone
group, versus 67% of clients in the face-to-face group, had evidence of clinically significant
results (defined as a ≥ 2 standard deviation reduction in YBOCS score). Thus, this RCT
found comparable statistically and clinically significant changes in symptoms and minimal
attrition for both face-to-face and telephone psychotherapy.

Other studies have compared telephone-delivered psychotherapy with treatment as usual or
information-only conditions. Brenes and colleagues (Brenes et al., in press) recruited 60
adults 60 years and older with Generalized Anxiety Disorder, Panic Disorder, or Anxiety
Disorder Not Otherwise Specified based on the Structured Clinical Interview for DSM-IV
(SCID). Participants were randomized to 8-10 sessions of telephone-delivered CBT or an
information-only condition. Psychotherapists were a doctoral-level clinical psychology
trainee and a master's-level social worker. The attrition rate was low (8.3%), with 4
participants dropping out of the telephone CBT condition and 1 dropping out of the
information-only condition. Recipients of telephone-delivered CBT had significantly
reduced worry, general anxiety, anxiety sensitivity, and insomnia symptoms compared with
participants receiving information only. Reductions in worry were maintained over a 6-
month period for the CBT group.

Swinson and colleagues (Swinson, Fergus, Cox, & Wickwire, 1995) compared telephone-
delivered CBT with a wait-list control condition. Participants with Panic Disorder with
Agoraphobia (N = 42) were recruited through letters to physicians and newspaper
advertisements targeting rural Canadians. The CBT group received 8 sessions of exposure
therapy, coping strategies, and discussion of catastrophic thinking. The study
psychotherapist had 2 years of experience. Attrition was 9.5% (n = 4). Compared with the
wait-list comparison group, participants who received CBT evidenced greater improvements
in depressive symptoms, anxiety, distress, fear, and avoidance.

Mohr et al. (Mohr et al., 2005) conducted the only study comparing 2 types of telephone-
delivered psychotherapies, CBT and emotion-focused therapy, for treating high depressive
symptoms in patients with multiple sclerosis. Overall, 89% of participants had a diagnosis of
Major Depressive Disorder or Dysthymia based on the SCID. Participants randomly
received either 16 weeks of CBT or emotion-focused therapy. Psychotherapists were
doctoral-level psychologists who received weekly supervision; randomly selected
audiotapes of sessions were rated for competency. Attrition rates were comparable (3 from
CBT and 4 from emotion-focused therapy). The CBT group experienced significantly
greater improvements in depressive symptoms and positive affect than the emotion-focused
therapy group.

Most recently, Mohr and colleagues (Mohr, Carmody, Erickson, Jin, & Leader, 2011)
compared telephone-delivered CBT with treatment as usual for veterans diagnosed with
depression based on the Mini International Neuropsychiatric Interview. Eighty-five
participants received either 16 sessions of telephone-delivered CBT or treatment as usual
through Veterans Affairs. Psychotherapists were 3 licensed psychologists, and 10% of
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psychotherapy sessions were rated for competency in delivering the treatment. Most
participants completed at least 4 sessions (97.6%), with 78% completing all 16 sessions.
Although depressive symptoms improved over time, outcomes did not differ significantly
according to treatment group. The authors suggest that veterans may have been more
refractory to treatment than other patients.

Telephone-delivered psychotherapy has also been incorporated into collaborative care
models. Simon, Ludman and colleagues (Ludman, Simon, Tutty, & Von Korff, 2007; Simon
et al., 2004) conducted a large RCT of telephone-delivered psychotherapy within a health
maintenance organization (HMO). Participants were 600 HMO members who had recently
(< 30 days) begun antidepressant treatment prescribed by their primary care physician.
Participants were randomized to telephone-delivered CBT with care management for
medication adherence, or usual care. CBT consisted of 8 sessions followed by 2-4 booster
sessions. Psychotherapists were master's-level psychotherapists with approximately 20 hours
of training and weekly supervision; 15 sessions were reviewed for competence and
adherence. Attrition was low, with 79% of the sample completing 8 or more sessions.
Compared with usual care, participants receiving telephone-delivered CBT had significantly
greater improvement in depressive symptoms, a change which persisted up to 18 months
after treatment. Further, participants who received telephone-delivered CBT were
significantly more likely to experience a 50% improvement in depression scores than
participants who received usual care.

Finally, a meta-analysis conducted by Mohr and colleagues (Mohr, Vella, Hart, Heckman, &
Simon, 2008) identified 10 studies that compared telephone-delivered psychotherapy with
treatment as usual to treat depressive symptoms. These studies have diverse patient
populations and medical comorbidities and different outcome measures. Nonetheless, they
found a small but significant effect (d = .26) for telephone-delivered treatment compared
with control groups and a large effect (d = .82) for pre-post analyses of telephone treatment
on reducing depressive symptoms. Although this manuscript focuses on RCTs with persons
with a clinical diagnosis of anxiety or depression, telephone-delivered psychotherapy also
has been used with nontraditional populations, such as those with chronic illnesses (Mohr et
al. 2005) and in a group setting (Heckman et al., 2006).

Client Acceptance of Telephone-delivered Psychotherapy
Client satisfaction with telephone-delivered treatment is high (Bee et al., 2008). Before
receiving psychotherapy, potential clients often report interest and willingness to participate
in sessions by telephone. In one study of telephone psychotherapy for depression,
approximately 66% of adults beginning treatment for depression were interested in
telephone sessions (Tutty et al., 2010). Although some clients initially may be neutral or
even skeptical about psychotherapy by telephone, they typically report high satisfaction
upon completion of treatment (Bee et al., 2010; Mohr, Hart, & Marmar, 2006). Lovell
(Lovell et al., 2006) assessed client satisfaction on a scale ranging from 0 to 32. Differences
between participants who received telephone psychotherapy (M = 28.74, S.D. = 3.6) and
face-to-face psychotherapy (M = 29.84, S.D. = 2.9) were not statistically significant. In fact,
both were quite high. Simon et al. (2004) found that only 29% of clients who received usual
primary care were “very satisfied” with treatment compared with 59% who received
telephone care management and psychotherapy. Brenes et al. (in press) used the Client
Satisfaction Scale with participants who received telephone psychotherapy. They reported
high levels of satisfaction, comparable to earlier findings by Stanley et al. (2009) who used
face-to-face CBT in a very similar sample of participants with late-life GAD.
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Participants in research studies of telephone psychotherapy often demonstrate lower rates of
attrition than in studies of face-to-face psychotherapy (Ludman et al., 2007; Mohr et al.,
2005; Simon et al., 2004; Tutty et al., 2010). In a recent meta-analysis (Mohr et al., 2008),
the mean attrition rate for RCTs of telephone-delivered psychotherapy for depression was
nearly 8%, markedly lower than the mean attrition rate of 47% in an earlier meta-analysis of
face-to-face psychotherapy (Wierzbicki & Pekarik, 1993). In short, while high client
satisfaction and low attrition alone are not reasons to conduct psychotherapy by telephone,
these factors – combined with an emerging literature demonstrating consistent and strong
outcome data -- warrant further consideration of the utility and benefits of conducting
psychotherapy in this manner.

Challenges of Psychotherapy by Telephone
Despite these advantages, psychologists must consider a number of issues before
undertaking telephone psychotherapy. In this section, we discuss some potential challenges.
(See Table 1 for a summary.)

Lack of Control over the Environment
In traditional face-to-face psychotherapy sessions, the psychotherapist has a considerable
amount of control over the environment (i.e., office layout, angle of chairs and distance
between them, ability to minimize interruptions and what others can hear during sessions,
etc.). However, when psychotherapy is conducted via the telephone, psychotherapists can
lose a substantial amount of this control. In fact, psychotherapy by telephone may provide a
greater balance between interpersonal power and control over the interaction (Haas,
Benedict, & Kobos, 1996). Situations that can compromise participant privacy include the
potential for others to eavesdrop on their psychotherapy sessions (Haas et al., 1996).
Psychotherapists should set firm boundaries with clients at the outset, to emphasize that
sessions conducted by telephone warrant the same consideration (e.g., lack of interruptions,
starting sessions on time) from both therapist and client as those conducted in a therapist's
office.

Privacy and Confidentiality
Concerns about client privacy and confidentiality loom larger when employing current
digital and mobile technologies than face-to-face psychotherapy. Confidentiality may be
threatened via unintended transmission of information through unsecured telephone
connections (i.e., mobile telephones; Mozer et al., 2008). One potentially significant issue is
unknowingly speaking with someone other than the intended client on the telephone. One
solution is to use a password or another way to verify that the person on the telephone line
is, in fact, the client (Heron & Smyth, 2010). Koocher (2007) presents other scenarios worth
considering, including the potential for clients to post excerpts of their recorded
psychotherapy sessions online and the possibility that virtually any telephone call could be
traced and recorded if a client poses a security threat. While these scenarios may be
infrequent, it is imperative to consider their consequences as we embark further into the
realm of conducting psychotherapy by telephone.

Just as in face-to-face sessions, psychotherapists and clients should fully discuss all planned
services and complete a written contract to confirm their mutual agreement to the terms
discussed (e.g., access to the psychotherapist, billing/payment, plan for handling
emergencies, etc.). It is critical to fully disclose potential limits of confidentiality with
clients for therapies that involve use of wireless telephones, telephones with wireless
extensions, and cell phones (Koocher, 2007). Psychotherapists should consider using land
lines to ensure greater client privacy and confidentiality.
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Development of Therapeutic Alliance
Therapeutic alliance is important to the success of psychotherapy. It has been conceptualized
as the bond between the psychotherapist and client as they work on the mutually agreed-
upon tasks and goals of psychotherapy (Bordin, 1979). Some have argued that therapeutic
alliance may be difficult to develop in a telephone-based relationship. Haas noted a number
of limitations with telephone-delivered psychotherapy (Haas et al., 1996). First, therapeutic
alliance may be compromised because the psychotherapist may have difficulty
understanding the client's experiences without access to nonauditory cues. Second, it may be
difficult for the psychotherapist to convey empathy without being seen. Clients may be
nonattentive and feel less in control because they cannot see their psychotherapist, or they
may perceive telephone psychotherapy as less important and thus become less invested than
in face-to-face psychotherapy (Mozer et al., 2008).

Recent evidence, however, suggests that an effective therapeutic alliance can be established
in telephone-delivered psychotherapy. As stated earlier, attrition rates for telephone
psychotherapy are low (Brenes et al., in press; Mohr et al., 2005) and client satisfaction with
telephone-delivered psychotherapy is high (Brenes et al., in press; Tutty et al., 2010),
appearing thus far equivalent to face-to-face psychotherapy (Lovell et al., 2006). Both of
these findings suggest the presence of therapeutic alliance.

A few studies have examined therapeutic alliance in telephone-delivered psychotherapy. In
the Brenes et al. study, both client and psychotherapist reports of therapeutic alliance as
measured by the Working Alliance Inventory were high (M therapist = 70.8, S.D. = 11.9; M
client = 67.7, S.D. = 17.6; WAI range 7-84; Brenes et al., in press). Similarly, Reese,
Conoley, and Broussart (2002) found that clients who received telephone-delivered
psychotherapy reported a strong bond with their psychotherapist (as measured by the
Working Alliance Inventory-Bond Scale; M = 72.14, S.D. = 9.79, range 12-84) and were
satisfied with treatment. In a qualitative study of telephone-delivered CBT, clients reported
developing a sense of psychological closeness with their psychotherapist (Bee et al., 2010).
Although differences in therapeutic alliance between face-to-face and telephone-delivered
psychotherapy have not been examined fully, evidence suggests that a good therapeutic
alliance can, in fact, be established in telephone-based psychotherapy.

Ethical and Legal Issues
The American Psychological Association (APA) does not yet have ethical guidelines for the
practice of telepsychology, resulting in great variability in its implementation (Koocher,
2007). The APA does encourage psychologists who practice telepsychology to do so within
the scope of the APA Code of Ethics and has indicated that concerns will be addressed on a
case-by-case basis (APA, 2002). The Ohio Psychological Association is the first state
association to provide specific telepsychology guidelines (Dielman et al., 2009) regarding
(1) appropriate use of technology, with the indication that telepsychology may not be
appropriate for every client; (2) legal and ethical requirements, particularly the necessity of
confirmation that telepsychology is legal in the state in which the psychotherapist practices;
(3) informed consent and disclosure, such that informed consent must be obtained,
psychotherapists must disclose their level of experience with telepsychology and the
limitations of telepsychology, and alternative means of contact should be discussed if
telepsychology is unavailable; (4) secure communications and electronic transfer of client
information, with an emphasis on secure means to communicate and avoiding personal
identifying information when using nonsecure means of communication; (5) access to and
storage of communications, with full disclosure of who has access to communications
between the psychotherapist and client and how this information will be stored; (6) fees and
financial arrangements specified before psychotherapy begins; (7) supervision provided in
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accordance with state licensing board requirements; and (8) assessment issues, such that
psychotherapists are knowledgeable of the psychometric properties of tests and inherent
limitations with online administration.

The APA conducted a recent review (2010) of state telehealth laws. Of the 22 states with
telehealth laws, only three have telehealth laws that apply to psychologists (California,
Kentucky, and Vermont), and California actually excludes telephone contact from these
laws. A potential legal issue for psychologists practicing telephone-delivered psychotherapy
is the location of both the psychotherapist and the client. Most states consider the provision
of psychotherapy to occur in the location of both the psychotherapist and the client. Thus, if
the psychotherapist is in one state and the client is in another state, the service occurs in two
states. As a result, the psychotherapist unknowingly may be practicing without a license.
Some states offer a temporary license that allows limited practice in a secondary state. An
alternative is to obtain a license in another state if the psychotherapist plans to do a
substantial amount of interstate work. Another legal issue is obtaining informed consent for
treatment. Just as in face-to-face psychotherapy, the traditional components of informed
consent, such as disclosure of how personal health information will be used, exceptions to
confidentiality, and the right to withdraw from treatment, must be explained to the client.
Additionally, risks specific to telephone-delivered psychotherapy must be discussed.

Crisis Situations
Some crises that a psychotherapist may face when conducting telephone psychotherapy are
suicidal intent, homicidal intent, and worsening symptoms. Although these crises are not
unique to telephone psychotherapy, they must be handled differently than in a typical face-
to-face therapeutic relationship. For example, a client in crisis may hang up during a session,
preventing the psychotherapist from thoroughly assessing risk. Thus, the development of a
safety plan from the start to reduce risk of crises, prevent adverse events, and respond
appropriately to adverse events is of the utmost importance in telephone psychotherapy. The
safety plan should include careful screening for risk of harm to self or others before
psychotherapy starts, monitoring for worsening of symptoms during treatment, and having a
safety protocol in place if a crisis occurs during treatment (Luxton, Sirotin, & Mishkind,
2010).

Psychotherapist Adjustment to Telephone Psychotherapy
Perhaps the largest issue in telephone psychotherapy is the psychotherapist's openness to
working in a manner that seems so untraditional (Bee et al., 2010; Richardson, Frueh,
Grubaugh, Egede, & Elhai, 2009). In fact, some resistance from psychotherapists may stem
from their “deeply embedded constructs of the therapeutic relationship” (Bee et al., 2008).
Some reasons that psychotherapists may perceive telephone psychotherapy as more difficult
include: (1) lack of nonauditory cues that can limit the psychotherapist's ability to interpret
client experiences, responses, and ambivalence (Haas et al., 1996; Roffman, 2006); (2)
distraction, difficulty maintaining attentiveness during the session, and potential for focusing
on extraneous tasks (Haas et al., 1996); (3) potential for sessions to become more social or
conversational rather than therapeutic (Haas et al., 1996); and (4) concerns about ability to
establish an effective therapeutic alliance with the client (Koocher, 2007; Reese & Stone,
2005; Richardson et al., 2009).

Interestingly, one study found that although psychotherapists employing telephone
psychotherapy were initially skeptical, they were quickly able to develop strong, therapeutic
relationships with clients and were generally satisfied with conducting psychotherapy in this
manner (Mohr et al., 2006). Bee et al. (2010) have reported that a close therapeutic
relationship is, in fact, possible even without physical proximity and suggested that face-to-
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face sessions may not necessarily be the “gold standard.” At least one researcher has
suggested that psychotherapists’ levels of focus may actually increase during telephone
sessions, when visual cues are removed from the therapeutic situation (Reese et al., 2002).
Similarly, although some may believe that audio plus video sessions are superior for
psychotherapy sessions than audio alone, prior research has demonstrated no differences in
perceptions of comfort and session distractions when comparing face-to-face, video, and
audio-only psychotherapy sessions (Hufford, Glueckauf, & Webb, 1999). In short, the
limited research to date suggests that some issues of concern to psychotherapists about
conducting psychotherapy by telephone are not as critical as initially believed.

Situations that May Not Be Optimal for Telephone-Delivered Psychotherapy
Telephone-delivered psychotherapy may not be appropriate for all clients. Clients whose
primary problems are relationship-based in nature may benefit more from face-to-face
psychotherapy, including clients who present with discordant relationships or difficulty with
maintaining high functioning relationships. Other clients may benefit from a combination of
face-to-face and telephone psychotherapy. For example, individuals with problems with
avoidance may use the telephone as a way to avoid fully confronting situations that provoke
strong emotions and resultant avoidance. These clients may benefit from a mixed approach
where telephone sessions can help the client develop coping skills and transition to face-to-
face psychotherapy. Similarly, telephone-delivered psychotherapy sessions may provide
psychotherapists with an opportunity to be present in in vivo exposure exercises that
otherwise would be impossible to complete in a traditional psychotherapy session. Clients
for whom motivation for psychotherapy is low (such as, clients undergoing court-mandated
treatment, clients seeking treatment upon pressure from family or friends) may receive
minimal benefit from telephone-delivered psychotherapy. More research is needed to
determine who might benefit the most from telephone-delivered psychotherapy.

Conclusions
Psychologists in the 21st century must address a number of issues regarding the provision of
mental health care, including barriers to care, greater emphasis on providing care to the
underserved, and lowering health care costs. In this paper, we have focused on one method
of doing so - providing psychotherapy by telephone. We have reviewed the evidence base
for how and why telephone-delivered psychotherapy can be effective and provided practical
suggestions for dealing with some of the difficulties that occur with delivering
psychotherapy by telephone.

Although more studies are clearly needed, a growing number of methodologically strong
studies demonstrate positive outcomes for telephone-delivered psychotherapy. Much of this
research was conducted by Mohr, who concluded that “enough positive trials exist for
telephone CBT to be considered an empirically supported treatment” (Mohr et al., 2011, p.
264). Nonetheless, we still lack comparisons of telephone-delivered psychotherapy versus
face-to-face psychotherapy and evidence-based determinations of which clients might derive
the most benefit from telephone-delivered psychotherapy. Furthermore, most published
RCTs compared telephone-delivered psychotherapy with information only, treatment as
usual, and wait-list comparison groups rather than more active comparison groups.
Moreover, the one study compared face-to-face and telephone deliveries of the same
treatment found no significant differences in outcomes (Lovell et al., 2006). Much more
work is needed to fully understand potential differential effects for psychotherapy delivery
methods (i.e., face-to-face versus telephone).

Another important issue is the dearth of research on telephone-delivered psychotherapy
other than CBT. One potential explanation is that CBT may be easier to deliver by telephone
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because it relies more on the development of specific skills and less on the therapeutic
relationship as the “principal agent of change” as in more emotion-focused types of
therapies (Beckner, Vella, Howard, & Mohr, 2007; Bee et al., 2010). This notion is partially
supported by Beckner et al. (2007), who found greater therapeutic alliance for telephone
CBT than telephone emotion-focused supportive therapy. They suggest that in emotion-
focused therapy, the lack of physical proximity and nonverbal communication may hamper
development of trust needed to explore and understand one's emotional experience.

Because little research has compared various types of psychotherapy conducted by
telephone, little can be said about the relative effectiveness of various methods. There are
two notable exceptions. One study compared telephone-delivered CBT with telephone-
delivered emotion focused therapy. While both types of psychotherapy produced significant
declines in depressive symptoms, CBT recipients experienced significantly greater benefits
(Mohr et al., 2005). Another study demonstrated that brief telephone-delivered interpersonal
therapy was superior to usual care in reducing depressive symptoms in HIV-AIDS patients
(Ransom et al., 2008). Thus, some evidence suggests that non-CBT approaches can be
efficacious when delivered by telephone. However, more work is needed to explore this
area, to determine how much these approaches may need to be adapted for telephone
delivery, and the effect of telephone delivery on therapeutic processes central to the
psychotherapy being studied.

Another potential reason for the extensive focus on CBT is that it requires relatively
minimal adaptations for telephone delivery. In CBT, most techniques traditionally taught
face-to-face can be extended to the telephone (except deep breathing and progressive muscle
relaxation techniques where visual observation is helpful). However, use of written
materials, DVDs, or online videos to demonstrate the exercises may minimize this concern.
Conversely, other techniques may be more feasible to conduct via the telephone. For
example, a psychotherapist can be fully present during an in vivo exposure experience
without being physically present.

Telephone-delivered psychotherapy is one component of telehealth. In addition to
psychotherapy delivered by telephone, video, internet, e-mail, and smart phone technology
have been incorporated into mental health treatment. Some applications are self-guided, in
which clients may have minimal contact with a psychotherapist. However, increased
psychotherapist presence has been associated with significantly better outcomes (Spek et al.,
2007), suggesting that psychotherapy delivered by telephone or in person may be preferable.
Then again, use of technology with minimal psychotherapist contact may be adequate for
very highly motivated clients or those with subthreshold symptoms, whereas increased
psychotherapist contact (whether by telephone or videoconference) may be preferred for
clients with more serious disorders (Newman et al. 2011). Studies of new modalities for
delivering telehealth and the degree of psychotherapist contact will help to develop the most
efficacious telehealth treatments.

Overall, research suggests that telephone-delivered psychotherapy has the potential to
deliver promising results. Psychotherapists must be aware of the challenges of conducting
telephone psychotherapy and develop a plan for dealing with these challenges in advance.
With the ever-growing reliance on technology, specific training in alternate methods of
delivering psychotherapy (e.g. the telephone) should be integrated into clinical training
programs to prepare trainees to be competent providers within the rapidly changing
landscape of available mental health services.
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Table 1

Addressing Challenges of Telephone-Delivered Psychotherapy

Challenge Suggested Ways to Address Challenge

Lack of control over
environment

Set boundaries and require privacy at the start of the relationship

Privacy/confidentiality Complete written informed consent for treatment reviewing service that will be provided and limits of
confidentiality when using electronic communications (e.g., wireless telephones, cell phones); verify that
person on phone is the client

Therapeutic alliance Set expectations for psychotherapy; inform clients that they will have the psychotherapist's undivided
attention; provide picture of psychotherapist; carefully attend to nonverbal cues

Ethical/legal issues Practice only in state in which licensed; review informed consent for treatment prior to the start of
treatment

Crisis situations Exclude patients who are actively suicidal at intake; have knowledge of resources available to clients
within their county/town

Psychotherapist adjustment to
telephone psychotherapy

Provide training that focuses on strengthening and modifying reflective listening skills, use of
psychotherapist's voice to convey warmth and emotion, and attentiveness to solely auditory cues from
clients
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