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The predictive validity of instruments commonly used to
measure the therapeutic alliance was evaluated, using
46 sessions drawn from a clinical trial comparing
manual-guided therapies for substance use. The
California Psychotherapy Alliance Scale, Penn Helping
Alliance Rating Scale, Vanderbilt Therapeutic Alliance
Scale, and Working Alliance Inventory (Observer,
Therapist, and Client versions) were rated for
participants receiving either cognitive-behavioral
therapy or twelve-step facilitation. All observer-rated
instruments were significantly correlated with outcome;
however, therapist-rated and client-rated instruments
did not predict outcome. Findings suggest that the
different observer-rated instruments are minimally
different with respect to predictive validity, whereas
patient- and therapist-rated measures may have a
weaker relationship to outcome when highly objective
outcome measures are used.

(The Journal of Psychotherapy Practice and
Research 2001; 10:262–268)

The relationship between therapeutic alliance and
clinical outcome has been demonstrated across

varied types of treatment.1 Clinical trials employing
cognitive, interpersonal, behavioral, and psychody-
namic therapies have demonstrated the robust nature
of this finding.2,3 A strong alliance has been associated
with an improved outcome in the treatment of a variety
of psychological problems, including depression,4 per-
sonality disorders,5 alcohol dependence,6 and cocaine
dependence.7

Although the alliance–outcome relationship is well
established, there is little agreement on the best way to
measure the therapeutic alliance. Currently, there are
at least 11 commonly used instruments available that
vary in perspective (observer, client, or therapist) and
in theoretical orientation.8 Although each of these ap-
pears to tap into several common core aspects of the
construct,1 including client–therapist agreement on the
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goals of treatment, strategies to achieve those goals, and
the quality of shared affective bond, few studies have
directly compared the psychometric properties of these
instruments.

In one of the first studies that did address this issue,
Tichenor and Hill9 compared six working alliance in-
struments: the California Psychotherapy Alliance
Scales (CALPAS), the Penn Helping Alliance Rating
Scale (Penn), the Vanderbilt Therapeutic Alliance Scale
(VTAS), and the Working Alliance Inventory–Ob-
server, Therapist, and Client forms (WAI-O, WAI-T,
WAI-C), using a sample of depressed outpatients. Re-
sults showed that all instruments had high internal con-
sistency and good interrater reliability. In addition, the
CALPAS, VTAS, and WAI-O were highly correlated,
and the Penn was correlated to the WAI-O. Interest-
ingly, client- and therapist-rated versions of the WAI
were not significantly related to each other or to any
other observer-rated instrument.

Cecero et al.10 expanded upon the Tichenor and
Hill study by evaluating the psychometric properties of
the same instruments with a larger, substance-depen-
dent sample. This study was one of the few in which
data were drawn from a controlled clinical trial and in-
volved discriminable, manual-guided treatments. Re-
sults suggested that all instruments were internally
consistent and had acceptable levels of interrater reli-
ability.

Although these data suggest that these commonly
used instruments are psychometrically sound and com-
parable, their relative predictive validity is still un-
known. In one of the few studies addressing this issue,
Safran and Wallner11 compared the predictive validity
of client-rated versions of the WAI and CALPAS. Re-
sults indicated that both were predictive of some out-
come measures in a short-term cognitive therapy for
depression. Although the study provides valuable in-
formation about the predictability of outcome from the
client’s perspective, results may not generalize to ob-
server-rated instruments or to other types of therapy. To
date, the comparative predictive validity of the more
commonly used observer-rated alliance instruments has
not been addressed.

In the current study, we evaluated the predictive
validity of six instruments commonly used to measure
the therapeutic alliance: the WAI-O, WAI-C, and WAI-
T;12 the Penn;13 the VTAS;14 and the CALPAS (C.R.
Marmar & L. Gaston, 1988, unpublished manual), using
data drawn from a randomized clinical trial of manu-

alized psychotherapies for cocaine dependence. The
following research questions were addressed: First, are
the instruments comparable with respect to correlations
with outcome? Second, does predictive validity of the
instruments vary across two types of treatment, particu-
larly types that differ greatly with respect to theoretical
foundation and technique? Third, does predictive valid-
ity vary across rating perspective (observer-, therapist-
and patient-rated versions) of alliance instruments?

METHODS

The data for this study were drawn from psychotherapy
sessions that were part of a randomized clinical trial
evaluating treatment for comorbid cocaine and alcohol
dependence.15 Cognitive-behavioral therapy (CBT) and
twelve-step facilitation (TSF) were compared with a psy-
chotherapy control condition (clinical management).
The treatments were delivered over 12 weeks in indi-
vidual sessions, and all sessions were videotaped for as-
sessment of therapist adherence and competence.
Independent evaluators who were blind to treatment
assignment rated 90% of all sessions and found that
treatments were highly discriminable and therapists
were highly adherent to manual guidelines.16 In addi-
tion, the psychometric properties of the alliance instru-
ments had been established in a previous study using
these data.10

For the present study, alliance–outcome relation-
ships were evaluated by using only CBT and TSF ses-
sions. This choice was made because 1) we wished to
evaluate the “active” rather than the supportive control
condition, which was found to be less effective than
CBT and TSF (and which would have therefore com-
plicated evaluation of alliance–outcome relationships
across instruments); 2) focusing on treatments widely
used in clinical practice would maximize the utility of
results; and 3) the smaller sample size of the psycho-
therapy control condition (n�14) would have pre-
cluded clear evaluation of the predictive validity of the
instruments across treatments.

Clients and therapists were asked to complete their
respective versions of the WAI after the third session.
We included only those sessions where both the client
and therapist completed the form on the same day. This
was done so that all perspectives could be compared for
the same session. Early session ratings were selected
both to avoid bias that might be associated with attrition
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and because early measures of alliance have been found
to be predictive of outcome.8

Of the 90 clients assigned to CBT and TSF, 44 were
excluded because of data missing for the following rea-
sons: 1) client dropped out prior to completing the sec-
ond week of treatment (n�19); 2) therapist and/or
client failed to complete the WAI on the same day
(n�16); 3) videotaping equipment had failed (n�6); or
4) staff inadvertently did not give instruments to the
therapist or client (n�3).

Of the 46 participants in the subset, 25 received
TSF and 21 received CBT.

Subjects

All clients participating in this study were treated
at the Clinical Research Unit of the APT Foundation, a
nonprofit substance abuse treatment center affiliated
with Yale University School of Medicine in New Haven,
CT, and met DSM-III-R criteria for cocaine and alcohol
dependence or abuse. Exclusion criteria included a his-
tory of psychotic or manic episodes, or current suicidal
or homicidal plans.

Therapists

The six therapists who delivered study treatments
were experienced in and committed to the type of treat-
ment they delivered in the trial. Level of training varied
by type of treatment: four Ph.D. psychologists con-
ducted CBT and two M.A.-level clinicians conducted
TSF.

Raters and Training

Six clinicians (one male, five female; three at Ph.D.,
two at M.A., and one at B.A. level) served as raters for
the study. Raters were divided into three pairs and each
pair was assigned to a different instrument (VTAS,
CALPAS, or Penn) to prevent contamination of ratings
across instruments. In addition, all raters were trained
to use the WAI to allow for a direct comparison of re-
liability across the three rater pairs. The WAI was cho-
sen as the “standard” because it was considered the
most commonly used instrument in this population and
previous reports indicated that relatively little training
was required to achieve interrater reliability on the in-
strument.9

Rater training was administered by the first two au-

thors and required approximately 16 hours for each
rater pair. After attending a didactic seminar that in-
cluded an introduction to the instruments and an item-
by-item review, the raters rated and discussed a single
session tape, using both the WAI and the measure as-
signed to their pair. Raters were then given two session
tapes to rate on their own. These ratings were used to
provide an informal estimate of interrater reliability.
This procedure was repeated until the raters achieved
satisfactory interrater reliability (intraclass correlation
coefficients of 0.60 or above). Recalibration sessions
were provided twice during the study to prevent and
correct rater drift.

Working Alliance Measures

The Working Alliance Inventory (WAI) is designed
to capture Bordin’s17 pantheoretical perspective of the
working alliance. The 36-item instrument consists of
three subscales: the Goal subscale addresses the extent
to which therapy goals are important, mutual, and ca-
pable of being accomplished; the Task subscale focuses
on the participant’s agreement about the steps taken to
help improve the client’s situation; and the Bond sub-
scale measures mutual liking and attachment by focus-
ing on tone of voice, empathy, and comfort in exploring
intimate issues.

The California Psychotherapy Alliance Scale
(CALPAS) draws from a variety of perspectives includ-
ing Freud’s18 concept of the patient’s affective bond
with the therapist, the patient’s ego capacity for a work-
ing alliance,19 mutual agreement on tasks and goals,17

and the therapist’s role as an empathic listener.20 The
CALPAS has 24 items grouped into four subscales: pa-
tient working capacity, patient commitment, patient–
therapist agreement on goals and strategies, and thera-
pist understanding and involvement.

The Penn Helping Alliance Rating Scale (Penn) fo-
cuses on two types of alliance. Type I reflects a psycho-
analytic focus on the client’s affective bond with the
therapist,18 and Type II appears more closely related to
Bordin’s concept of a mutual agreement on tasks and
goals.17 The Penn, with 10 items, is the shortest of the
scales.

The Vanderbilt Therapeutic Alliance Scale (VTAS)
represents a theoretical blend of dynamic and eclectic
frameworks.8 The instrument attributes a successful al-
liance to the presence or absence of six factors: positive
climate, therapist intrusiveness, client resistance or
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TABLE 2. Correlations between alliance and outcome by
instrument

All By Treatment

Instrument
Treatments

(n�46)
CBT

(n�21)
TSF

(n�25)

Penn 0.50** 0.63** 0.42*
CALPAS 0.37** 0.56** 0.28
VTAS 0.49** 0.46** 0.55**
WAI-O 0.39** 0.32 0.48*
WAI-Ca 0.03 0.07 0.00
WAI-Ta 0.27 0.27 0.30

✒ Note: Outcome�maximum consecutive days abstinent from
cocaine while in treatment. CBT�cognitive-behavioral therapy;
TSF�twelve-step facilitation. For other abbreviations, see
Table 1.

an�45 for all treatments, n�20 for CBT, and n�25 for TSF
because of partially completed forms.

*P�0.01; **P�0.001.

TABLE 1. Intercorrelations of six therapeutic alliance
instruments

Penn VTAS WAI-O WAI-C WAI-T

CALPAS 0.62** 0.38* 0.37 0.31 0.51**
Penn 0.49** 0.53** 0.36 0.44*
VTAS 0.87** 0.02 0.36
WAI-O 0.09 0.36
WAI-C 0.43*

✒ Note: Pearson correlations. n�47 for all scales, except n�46 for
WAI-C and WAI-T. CALPAS�California Psychotherapy
Alliance Scale; Penn�Pennsylvania Helping Alliance Rating
Scale; VTAS�Vanderbilt Therapeutic Alliance Scale;
WAI�Working Alliance Inventory; O�Observer, C�Client,
T�Therapist.

*P�0.01; **P�0.001.

anxiety,21 client motivation,22 and client responsibil-
ity.17 The VTAS consists of 44 items within three sub-
scales: therapist contribution to the alliance, client
contribution to the alliance, and client–therapist inter-
actions.

Outcome Assessment

Clients were assessed before treatment, weekly dur-
ing treatment, and at termination by an independent
clinical evaluator. The primary outcome measure was
maximum consecutive days abstinent from cocaine
while in treatment. This measure was selected because
it serves as a good compound measure of both retention
and substance use, and has shown to be highly predic-
tive of long-term outcome.23

Procedure

Following rater training, the study was conducted
in two stages. First, the three rater-pairs rated the same
8 sessions using both their assigned instrument and the
WAI-O. These data were used to establish reliability.
Second, the remaining 38 sessions were divided be-
tween members of each pair so that for each of these
sessions, the CALPAS, VTAS, and Penn were com-
pleted one time and the WAI-O was completed three
times. Thus, each member of a pair rated a total of 27
sessions (8 reliability tapes and half of the total remain-
ing tapes) by using their assigned instrument and the
WAI-O.

RESULTS AND DISCUSSION

Psychometric Properties

Intraclass correlation coefficients were used to as-
sess interrater reliability for each instrument. Estimates
were based on the mean of the ratings for each rater
pair. For the 8 sessions that were rated by all raters,
random-effect intraclass correlation estimates were as
follows: WAI-O�0.70; CALPAS�0.76; VTAS�0.60;
and Penn�0.71.

Means and standard deviations for alliance instru-
ments were as follows: Penn: 3.93�1.16; CALPAS:
5.20�0.89; VTAS: 4.39�0.78; WAI-O: 4.38�0.099;
WAI-T: 5.11�0.60; WAI-C: 5.76�0.88.

Pearson correlations of the six alliance instruments

are presented in Table 1. Higher correlations were gen-
erally found among observer measures; client and ther-
apist measures were less consistently intercorrelated at
a significant level.

Predictive Validity

As seen in Table 2, Pearson correlations between
all four observer instruments and outcome were statis-
tically significant, a stronger alliance being associated
with longer periods of abstinence during treatment.
However, correlations between the WAI-C and WAI-T
and outcome were not significant.

Predictive Validity by Treatment

Table 2 shows some variability among relationships
between outcome and alliance across scales when cor-
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relations are evaluated by treatment. In the CBT con-
dition, all observer instruments with the exception of
the WAI-O showed significant correlations between al-
liance and outcome. In the TSF condition, all observer
instruments except the CALPAS showed significant
correlations between alliance and outcome. Again, nei-
ther the WAI-C nor the WAI-T was significantly cor-
related with outcome for either CBT or TSF.

This evaluation of the predictive validity of six ther-
apeutic alliance instruments across two types of manual-
guided treatments indicated that there were significant
correlations between alliance and outcome for all ob-
server-rated instruments. Thus, our results were remi-
niscent of those of Luborsky et al.24 when they cited the
“dodo bird” verdict suggesting that “everyone has won
and all must have prizes.” In other words, these findings
suggest that investigators are free to select among ob-
server-rated alliance instruments on the basis of other
considerations, such as continuity with previous re-
search, theoretical consistency with treatment orienta-
tion, ease of administration, or the availability of
parallel patient, therapist, and observer versions when
needed.

We also evaluated the predictive validity of each
instrument across type of treatment and found some
variability in the results. The Penn and the VTAS pre-
dicted outcome across treatments; however, the CAL-
PAS predicted outcome only for CBT and the WAI
predicted outcome only for TSF. The CALPAS and the
WAI are both designed to be transtheoretical instru-
ments and have been found to be highly intercorrelated
in other studies, although they appear to measure
slightly different aspects of the alliance.11 Consequently,
there is no theoretical reason to conclude that either is
a superior measure of alliance in one particular type of
therapy. It should be noted that the smaller sample sizes
for the within-treatment comparison limit the strength
of these findings and suggest that the results should be
interpreted with caution.

The comparatively poor predictive validity of ther-
apist- and client-rated measures was an unexpected re-
sult of the study. The bulk of the literature in this area
suggests client ratings of the alliance tend to be strongly
related to outcome and therapist ratings are weaker pre-
dictors of outcome.1 There are several possible expla-
nations for this unexpected effect.

First, the outcome measure used was of a different
type from those in most prior studies. Much of the lit-
erature on alliance–outcome relationships has been in

the field of depression and anxiety, where outcomes
tend to be subjective assessments evaluated from the
patient perspective (e.g., Beck Depression Inventory
scores). In the present study, the outcome measure was
highly objective (e.g., retention and substance use con-
firmed by urinalysis), and outcome was measured not
by the clients or therapists, but by a clinical evaluator
who was blind to treatment assignment. When assess-
ments are more subjective as in the earlier studies, it is
possible that alliance–outcome relationships may be in-
fluenced by a “halo” effect where the alliance and out-
come are rated by the same source. (That is, if the
patient believes she or he has improved, it is also likely
she or he will rate the alliance as positive.) Indeed, Hor-
vath and Symonds1 noted that effect sizes were larger
when the data were derived from homogeneous sources
(e.g., patient ratings as predictors of outcome measured
from the patient’s perspective, versus from the thera-
pist’s or an independent evaluator’s perspective). These
authors suggest that the difference between heteroge-
neous and homogeneous sources “was probably not sys-
tematically related to the ‘source’ factor.” However,
Safran and Wallner11 found the strongest significant cor-
relations in their sample between client-rated alliance
and client-rated global success, with smaller correla-
tions between client-rated alliance and therapist-rated
outcomes.

Second, this was one of the few studies evaluating
alliance–outcome relationship from the client, therapist,
and observer perspectives, so there were limited prior
data suggesting how alliance ratings of the three were
likely to compare. It should be noted that the level of
the alliance differed by perspective. The WAI indicated
that alliance was rated most highly by the clients in our
sample (mean�SD�5.76�0.88), followed closely by
therapists (5.11�0.60), while the lowest ratings came
from the observers (4.38�0.99). Yet only observer rat-
ings predicted outcome. There are several reasons client
ratings of the alliance may have been relatively higher
in this sample. In particular, clients with substance
abuse problems often have financial constraints, and
our treatment was provided free of charge in a market
where treatment availability is often limited. Conse-
quently, a sense of indebtedness or fear of expressing
negative feelings about the therapist may have elevated
client ratings. In addition, many clients have little basis
for comparison in rating the alliance (most of our clients
had never been in psychotherapy before), in contrast to



Fenton et al.

J Psychother Pract Res, 10:4, Fall 2001 267

observers who view many dyads and might be able to
provide a more balanced assessment of the relationship.

On the other hand, the higher predictive validity
associated with observer-rated alliance measures may
simply suggest that observers are less susceptible to sit-
uational demands or transference and countertransfer-
ence issues that may influence an evaluation of the
alliance. Such influences on clients and therapists may
help to explain why, in the addiction literature where
objective measures of outcome are available (e.g., bio-
chemical measures), relationships of client and therapist
ratings of the alliance to outcome have been weaker in
comparison to the general psychotherapy literature,
which often evaluates outcome based on more subjec-
tive assessments from the client or therapist perspective.
For example, in the Project MATCH alcoholism study,
therapist ratings of the alliance were more strongly re-
lated to outcome than client ratings; however, the over-
all level of variance accounted for by either perspective
was quite modest6 and the observer’s perspective was
not rated. Similarly, in the National Institute on Drug
Abuse Cocaine Collaborative Study, where alliance was
measured only from the client perspective, no signifi-
cant alliance–outcome relationships were found.25

Several limitations of the present study should be
noted. First, interrater reliability estimates were based
on a sample of eight sessions. Although each of these
instruments have been shown to have good interrater
reliability1,9 and recalibration meetings were held
throughout the study to correct rater drift, nevertheless
it is possible that drift may have occurred. Second, the
small sample size for the within-treatment comparisons
limits confidence in the finding that there was some
variation in alliance–outcome relationships across in-
struments. Finally, these findings should be replicated
with other treatments, instruments, and populations to

evaluate the extent to which they can be generalized.
Nevertheless, this remains one of the few studies that
has examined process–outcome relationships across
treatment conditions and the only one that has done so
using several measures of the alliance.

Despite these limitations, this study contributes sev-
eral important findings regarding the therapeutic alli-
ance and the instruments with which it is measured.
First, researchers should be aware that when outcome
measures are highly objective, therapist- and client-
rated measures of the alliance may not be strong pre-
dictors of outcome, in contrast to studies that rely on
more subjective measures or in which process–outcome
relationships are evaluated using only homogeneous
perspectives (e.g., patient–patient, therapist–therapist).
Second, regarding the commonly used observer-rated
instruments, these data add to the growing body of lit-
erature showing relative psychometric comparability of
the scales9 by suggesting that different instruments used
to measure working alliance are minimally different
with respect to predicting outcome. With greater con-
fidence in the comparative psychometric properties of
these instruments, we can continue to explore how al-
liance affects treatment, how alliance interacts with
other key factors that may affect treatment, and how
therapists can influence some of these factors to im-
prove the overall outcome of psychotherapy.
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