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Abstract
Objective—Women who experience both depression and a history of childhood sexual abuse are
at substantially greater risk for suicide compared to those who experience depression alone.
Though psychiatric diagnoses, such as Major Depression and Borderline Personality Disorder, are
often considered in the assessment and management of suicide risk, understanding how enduring
characteristics interact with contextual factors to result in suicide-related thoughts and behaviors
may be more useful for identifying specific targets for intervention.

Design—The current study used cross-sectional survey methodology to examine the interaction
of attachment orientation and acute social maladjustment as risk factors for death ideation in a
sample of women with Major Depression and histories of childhood sexual abuse.

Results—Social maladjustment was associated with greater likelihood of endorsing death
ideation. Avoidant and anxious attachment orientations moderated the social maladjustment and
death ideation associations in some domains. Specifically, work-related social maladjustment was
associated with greater odds of death ideation for those with higher levels of attachment
avoidance. Parent-role related maladjustment was associated with greater odds of death ideation
for those with lower levels of attachment anxiety.

Conclusions—Findings demonstrate strong associations between death ideation and acute social
maladjustment, and suggest that death ideation may be specific to certain domains of adjustment
for anxious and avoidant attachment styles. Implications for the conceptualization and treatment of
patients who report death ideation are discussed.
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Introduction
Women with childhood sexual abuse histories are at particularly high risk for suicidal
thoughts and behaviors (Gladstone, et al., 2004). This heightened risk cannot be ascribed
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solely to the elevated rates of depression found among sexually abused women (Andover,
Zlotnick, & Miller, 2007; Joiner, et al., 2007). Psychiatric comorbidity, particularly
Borderline Personality Disorder (BPD)(Brown, Comtois, & Linehan, 2002; Soloff, Lynch,
Kelly, Malone, & Mann, 2000), is also a factor in abused women’s risk for suicide-related
thoughts and behaviors. Some have argued that treating underlying psychiatric disorders
may not reduce suicide risk (Linehan, 2008), and that an empirical identification of the
enduring characteristics and contextual factors that influence suicidal thoughts and
behaviors could better guide risk-reduction efforts.

In the current study, we examined how chronic difficulties in interpersonal need fulfillment
(or attachment orientation) and acute social maladjustment interact to influence thoughts of
death, or death ideation, among women with major depression and sexual abuse before age
18. Death ideation was examined as our dependent variable as it is a risk factor for suicide
that, occurring earlier in the suicide process, may be more amenable to intervention and
reduction of downstream suicide risk (Neeleman, de Graaf, & Vollebergh, 2004; Runeson,
Beskow, & Waern, 1996). Chronic and acute interpersonal difficulties may be especially
salient to the understanding of death ideation in this population. Women who have
experienced childhood sexual abuse are more likely to experience severe attachment
disturbances and acute episodes of social maladjustment (Alexander, 2009; DiLillo, 2001;
Gamble, Smith, Poleshuck, He, & Talbot, 2011; Mickelson, Kessler, & Shaver, 1997).
Additionally, there is a strong link between social factors and suicidal thoughts and
behaviors (Duberstein, Conwell, & Caine, 1993; Duberstein, et al., 2004; Van Orden, et al.,
2008). Although attachment difficulties have been shown to be associated with suicidal
thoughts and behaviors in child and adolescent populations (Adam, Sheldon-Keller, & West,
1996; Baca-Garcia, et al., 2007; de Jong, 1992; Violato & Arato, 2004; Wright, Briggs, &
Behringer, 2005), few studies have examined those relationships in adults (Grunebaum, et
al., 2010; Stepp, et al., 2008). Further, no known studies have examined how attachment
disturbance might function as a vulnerability to death ideation among depressed women
with childhood sexual abuse histories.

Attachment Theory
Attachment theory assumes that people have innate needs for social support and
interpersonal connection (Bowlby, 1988). Attachment behaviors are actions that are
motivated by and aim to satisfy those needs. Based on the quality of one’s early
interpersonal experiences, such as the responsiveness of caregivers, the child formulates
internal working models of important others, which involve expectations of whether support
will be available and how to most effectively obtain the needed support. Though heavily
influenced by caregiving provided during infancy, attachment orientation is continually
shaped throughout life (Fraley, 2007). Those working models are carried forward and
heavily influence adult behaviors in interpersonal relationships. Thus, individuals who grow
up with supportive and responsive parents develop secure attachments and positive working
models of relationships; they expect that support is available when needed and that directly
asking for support is likely to result in its provision.

In contrast, childhood sexual abuse involves such a profound failure to provide security,
safety, and support that the working models on which attachment is based are likely to be
adversely affected (Alexander, 2009). Such insecure attachments are characterized by
beliefs that support will not be available or will be inconsistently available, and by
ineffective need-fulfilling behaviors. Insecure attachment orientations are often described as
involving high levels of anxiety and/or avoidance (Brennan, Clark, & Shaver, 1998a); both
are driven by high levels of discomfort and mistrust of others as reliable attachment figures.
Individuals with anxious attachments highly stress, and even over-value, the importance of
relationships and engage in maladaptive behaviors to ensure that those relationships are
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maintained. Those with avoidant attachments de-value and distance from relationships to
minimize their interpersonal discomforts (Alexander, 1992; Gormley, 2004; Meyer &
Pilkonis, 2001). Consequently, avoidant persons may identify sources for need gratification
in work or academic achievements (Sibley & Overall, 2008), rather than interpersonal
relationships (Alexander, 2009; Meyer, Pilkonis, Proietti, Heape, & Egan, 2001; Mickelson,
et al., 1997). Thus, anxious and avoidantly attached individuals may be differentially
vulnerable to social versus achievement-related stressors.

The insecure attachment that results from childhood sexual abuse and associated
developmental circumstances serves as an enduring point of vulnerability for death ideation
(Alexander, 2009; Bowlby, 1989; Murphy & Bates, 1997). This vulnerability is expressed
acutely when a stressor triggers the attachment system, influencing the individual to seek
care and support to help manage distress (Dozier, Stovall, Albus, & Jude, 1999). Insecurely
attached persons are more likely to experience problematic outcomes because they are less
likely to obtain needed support. Such expression of attachment anxiety or avoidance would
be evidenced by social maladjustment or dysfunction. These episodes are more likely to
result in death ideation when experienced by individuals higher in insecure attachment styles
(Alexander, 1992; Mickelson, et al., 1997).

The vast majority of research on the relationship between attachment and suicide related
thoughts and behaviors has been conducted in child and adolescent samples populations
(Adam, et al., 1996; Baca-Garcia, et al., 2007; de Jong, 1992; Violato & Arato, 2004;
Wright, et al., 2005). In contrast, suicide-related thoughts and behaviors in adults have been
examined from an attachment theory perspective in a handful of studies. Grunebaum et al.
(2010) found that psychiatric outpatients diagnosed with a Major Depressive Episode who
reported higher baseline attachment avoidance were more likely to report suicide ideation
within the following three months and a suicide attempt in the following year. In a second
study of clinical outpatients, Stepp et al. (2008) found that greater attachment anxiety was
associated with all combinations of life-time self-harm and suicide attempts. Neither of these
studies, however, examined whether enduring attachment difficulties interacted with acute
social difficulties to result in suicide-related thoughts or behaviors. The current study aims
to test the applicability of attachment theory to the problem of death ideation in depressed
women with a history of childhood sexual abuse. Specifically, we examine the degree to
which an anxious or avoidant attachment style may create a vulnerability to death ideation
that is expressed during episodes of acute social maladjustment.

Aims & Hypotheses
The current study aimed to test the hypothesis that the relationship of social maladjustment
to death ideation would be moderated by attachment avoidance or anxiety. These
relationships were examined independent of the influence of depressive symptoms and BPD
diagnosis. We expected that death ideation would be most pronounced for women higher in
attachment anxiety and avoidance and experiencing greater acute social maladjustment
across several domains (overall/total maladjustment, work/school, social and leisure
activities, the extended family or family outside the home, the intimate relationship partner,
parent-role, and the family unit or family within the home). We also hypothesized that
individuals high in attachment anxiety or avoidance would be differentially vulnerable to
types of social maladjustment. Specifically, more highly avoidant women were predicted to
be vulnerable to death ideation in the context of greater work-role maladjustment. We
expected more anxiously attached women to be vulnerable to maladjustment death ideation
in the context of maladjustment in close relationships (i.e., intimate partners, immediate
family, and children).
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Method
Participants

Participants were recruited as part of one of two treatment studies for depression in women
with a history of childhood sexual abuse in a community mental health center: an
uncontrolled pilot study of Interpersonal Psychotherapy (IPT) (N = 36; (Talbot, et al., 2005;
Talbot & Gamble, 2008) and a randomized clinical trial comparing IPT to treatment as usual
(N = 70; (Talbot, et al., 2011). A total of 106 women (age range 19 to 57 years; M = 35.0,
SD = 9.8) experiencing current Major Depression and reporting a history of childhood
sexual abuse were included.

Childhood sexual abuse was defined as any unwanted sexual contact, ranging from fondling
to sexual intercourse, or any sexual contact with a family member five or more years older
prior to age 18. Sexual abuse history was assessed through structured clinical interview
(Talbot, 2005). Major depression and BPD diagnoses were assessed with the Structured
Clinical Interview for DSM-IV (First, Gibbon, Spitzer, Williams, & Benjamin, 1997; First,
Spitzer, Gibbon, & Williams, 2005). Exclusion criteria were: current active psychosis and a
diagnosis of schizophrenia, bipolar disorder, mental retardation, or active substance abuse or
dependence. Self-reported racial identity was 50% Caucasian, 50% African-American, and
12% identified a Hispanic ethnic origin. Reported marital status was 34.9% single/never
married, 27.4% living with a spouse or partner, and the 37.7% separated, divorced, or
widowed. More than half (56.6%) of the sample received public financial assistance (e.g.,
welfare, disability, etc.).

Procedure & Materials
The Institutional Review Board approved all study procedures. All assessments were
conducted during the pre-treatment evaluation session from each of two therapy trials from
which these data were drawn. Evaluations were conducted in individual meetings by clinical
research staff trained in the administration of study assessments. Attachment anxiety and
attachment avoidance were assessed using the Experiences in Close Relationships scale
(ECR)(Brennan, Clark, & Shaver, 1998b). The ECR is a 36-item self-report measure of how
individuals generally respond in primary or romantic relationships and provides separate
scale for attachment anxiety and avoidance (e.g., “I worry a lot about my partner leaving
me”, “I prefer not to be too close to romantic partners”). The ECR scores range from one to
seven with higher scores indicating greater attachment anxiety and avoidance. The two
factor structure of the ECR has been replicated and the internal consistency and 6-week
temporal stability of the ECR have been shown to be excellent (Sibley & Liu, 2004).

Social maladjustment was measured using the Social Adjustment Scale (SAS)(Weissman &
Bothwell, 1976; Weissman, Olfson, Gameroff, Feder, & Fuentes, 2001). The SAS is a 54-
item self-report measure of social functioning in several domains over the previous two
weeks. These domains, as well as descriptive statistics from a sample of 139 individuals
with no psychiatric diagnosis (Weissman, et al., 2001), include: overall/total maladjustment
(M = 1.7, SD = 0.3), work/school (M = 1.4, SD = 0.4), social and leisure activities (M = 2.2,
SD = 0.6), the extended family or family outside the home (M = 1.4, SD = 0.4), the intimate
relationship partner (M = 1.8, SD = 0.6), parent-role (M = 1.1, SD = 0.3), and the family unit
or family within the home (M = 1.7, SD = 0.7). Level of functioning within each domain is
indicated by items such as: failure to attend to obligations, arguments and conflict, feelings
of affection towards others, quality of communication with others, frequency of contact and
feelings of connection. Scores on the SAS scales range from one to five with higher scores
on the SAS indicate greater maladjustment. The SAS demonstrates good internal
consistency, sensitivity to change, and correlates significantly with other measures of social
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adjustment and interpersonal problems (Vittengl, Clark, & Jarrett, 2003; Weissman &
Bothwell, 1976; Weissman, et al., 2001).

Depression severity was assessed using the Hamilton Rating Scale for Depression (HRSD)
(Hamilton, 1960). The HRSD is an interview-based assessment of depression symptoms
experienced during the previous week. Higher scores on the HRSD indicate greater
depressive symptom severity. Cut points have been developed to categorize depression
severity according to HRSD scores: normal/no depression (0–7), mild depression symptoms
(8–13), moderate (14–18), severe (19–22), and very severe (23+).

Death ideation was assessed using item-14 from the HRSD. Item-14 of the HRSD requires
the interviewer to determine the severity of the respondent’s suicide-related thoughts and
behaviors during the previous week: (0) absent, (1) feeling like life is not worth living, (2)
wishing for death, (3) suicidal thoughts or gestures, and (4) suicide attempts. Although the
HRSD uses a continuous scoring system, we dichotomized participants into two groups in
order to examine death ideation: 1) those denying death or suicidal ideation or behaviors
(score of 0) and 2) those who endorsed death ideation (score of 1 or 2 on item 14).
Individuals who reported suicidal thoughts or gestures or suicide attempts (score of 3 or 4)
were excluded from the current analysis (although the presence of suicidal thoughts and
behaviors was not an exclusion criterion for the parent study).

Data Analysis
Logistic regression analyses were used to examine the likelihood of endorsing death ideation
as predicted by the main effects of avoidant and anxious attachment, the seven domains of
social maladjustment, and the interactions between each of anxious and avoidant attachment
with the seven domains of social maladjustment. A total of seven models were tested, one
each corresponding to the seven domains of social maladjustment. Separate models were
required in order to examine each domain’s individual effect on death ideation. Within each
model, the dependent variable was endorsement of death ideation (yes/no). In hierarchical
models, the HRSD score (minus item-14) and BPD diagnosis were included at step-1 as
covariates. At step-2, the independent variables of avoidant and anxious attachment scales
and one of the social maladjustment domain scales (one each for the seven models) were
entered. At step-3, the interactions between anxious and avoidant attachment styles with the
social maladjustment domain were entered.

Results
Descriptive Statistics

The percentage of individuals endorsing death ideation was 48.6%. One participant was
excluded from the current analysis due to endorsement of active suicidal ideation. No
participants reported having made a suicide attempt in the previous week. The sample mean
of the HRSD was M=22.22 (SD=5.10), indicating that this sample demonstrated severe to
very severe depressive symptoms. A large proportion (34%) of participants qualified for a
diagnosis of BPD. The sample means (and standard deviations) for the independent
variables were: attachment anxiety 4.49 (1.16), avoidance 4.17 (1.35), overall social
maladjustment 2.78 (.51), work/school 2.52 (.81), social and leisure activities 3.25 (.58), the
extended family 2.46 (.71), intimate partner 2.67 (.70), parent-role 2.05 (.77), and family
unit 2.78 (.51).

Logistic Regression Predicting Endorsement of Death Ideation
The individual parameter estimates for each of the logistic regression models, including the
odds ratios and 95% confidence intervals, can be found in Table 1. Depression contributed
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significantly to the prediction of endorsement of death ideation across all models. BPD
diagnosis did not contribute to the prediction of death ideation. However, both depression
and BPD diagnosis were retained as covariates to examine effects over and above the
influence of depressive symptoms and BPD diagnosis.

Four of the seven the logistic regression models were significant: the models including
overall social maladjustment: χ2

(6) = 19.524, p = .007, Negelkerke R2 = .274, work-related
maladjustment: χ2

(6) = 15.614, p = .029, Negelkerke R2 = .230, social and leisure
maladjustment: χ2

(6) = 16.993, p = .017, Negelkerke R2 = .242, primary relationship
maladjustment: χ2

(6) = 13.783, p = .05 Negelkerke R2 = .415. The models including family
unit and extended family maladjustment were not significant: family unit maladjustment:
χ2

(6) = 11.438, p = .121; extended family maladjustment: χ2
(6) = 11.203, p = .130).

Although the total model for parent role maladjustment was not significant, χ2
(6) = 11.614,

p = .114, Negelkerke R2 = .322, this is likely due to loss of participants who were not
parents to estimate the χ2 (i.e., limited power to estimate the model). Despite this, the
inclusion of the interaction term resulted in significantly better model fit, χ2

(6) = 6.180, p = .
045, Negelkerke R2 = .322 (increased from .162), and the individual parameter estimate was
significant (Table 1).

Two significant interactions between attachment style and specific social maladjustment
domains predicting death ideation were found. Higher work-related social maladjustment
was associated with greater odds of death ideation for individuals experiencing higher levels
of attachment avoidance. Greater parent-role related social maladjustment was associated
with greater odds of death ideation for individuals experiencing lower levels of attachment
anxiety.

Discussion
The current study examined the relationship between attachment disturbances, current social
maladjustment, and death ideation in depressed women with sexual abuse histories--a
population shown to be at significant risk for suicide-related behaviors (Gladstone, et al.,
2004; Mickelson, et al., 1997). As hypothesized, greater difficulties in overall social
adjustment, and maladjustment in the domains of social and leisure, and intimate or primary
relationships, were associated with greater odds of endorsing death ideation. These
relationships were not moderated by degree of attachment security. Levels of attachment
anxiety and avoidance were not associated with the likelihood of endorsing death ideation.
However, attachment security was a potent factor in moderating the social maladjustment
and desire for death relationship in two specific domains. Consistent with our hypothesis,
women experiencing difficulties in social maladjustment related to work were more likely to
experience death ideation if they were higher in attachment avoidance. Contrary to
hypotheses, women experiencing difficulties in parent-role maladjustment were more likely
to experience death ideation if they were comparatively less anxiously attached. Notably,
neither work adjustment nor parent-role adjustment was associated with death ideation for
the group as a whole. Thus, attachment appears to be a decisive factor in women’s
vulnerability to death ideation in the context of work-role or parenting-role problems. All
results were independent of the influence of depressive symptoms (save suicide-related
thoughts and behaviors) and BPD diagnosis.

That death ideation was more likely under conditions of greater overall social maladjustment
and maladjustment in social and primary relationships is consistent with the literature
indicating that interpersonal stressors are proximally related to suicidal thoughts and
behaviors (Duberstein, et al., 1993; Duberstein, et al., 2004). Work-related maladjustment
was associated with greater odds of endorsing death ideation only in the context of
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concurrent avoidant attachment, suggesting that this combination of acute and chronic
maladjustment creates a particular vulnerability to experiencing death ideation. Individuals
who are highly avoidant experience discomfort with interpersonal closeness and report that
relationships are of little importance to them (Gormley, 2004; Mikulincer, Gillath, &
Shaver, 2002). Thus, work may serve as an alternative source of meaning in life for avoidant
women. Such prioritizing of domains of living is consistent with the sociotropy-autonomy
distinction wherein individuals exhibit orientations towards socializing with others versus
becoming engrossed in achievement (Robins & Luten, 1991). Consequently, a highly
avoidant individual who experiences disruption in her work life may be relatively more
prone to developing death ideation.

The unexpected finding that high parent-role related maladjustment was associated with
death ideation among comparatively less anxiously attached individuals is intriguing. Less
anxiously attached women may be particularly invested in being a good parent and in
enjoying satisfying relationships with their children, which in turn causes them to be more
vulnerable when functioning deteriorates in that domain. However, this explanation is hard
to reconcile with the high relationship investment of anxiously attached individuals. A
second and more plausible explanation is that women with less anxious attachment were, on
average, functioning better in their parent-role and enjoying more satisfying relationships,
and that deterioration in that domain was therefore more evident and acutely distressing. It is
important to note, however, that we cannot determine whether low attachment anxiety is
synonymous with a secure attachment due to the lack of published norms for the ECR.
Further, given that the sample was selected for current Major Depression, it is possible that
this relationship is specific to current Major Depression.

Although prior studies have demonstrated a relationship between attachment insecurity and
suicidal thoughts and behaviors in adults (Grunebaum, et al., 2010; Stepp, et al., 2008), the
current study found no main effect of attachment anxiety or avoidance. The greater severity
of attachment disturbances found in depressed women with childhood sexual abuse
(Alexander, 2009) may have limited our ability to detect such a relationship (a problem of
restricted range). More likely, differences in the time intervals in which the outcomes were
assessed may explain the discrepancy between our study’s findings and those of previous
reports (Grunebaum, et al., 2010; Stepp, et al., 2008). Both of the previous studies examined
the relationship between attachment and suicidal thoughts and behaviors over longer time
intervals (life-time and 3-months) compared to the current study (1-week). If attachment
insecurity creates a vulnerability to developing suicidal thoughts and behaviors, then
assessing this relationship over a brief time interval requires consideration of the
vulnerability expressing stressor (i.e., social maladjustment). When the assessment is over
longer intervals, it is more likely that vulnerability expressing events will have occurred in
the interim, thereby making apparent a relationship between attachment insecurity and
suicidal thoughts and behaviors. Our study’s findings highlight the importance of
considering attachment style in conjunction with current social maladjustment in the
development of suicide ideation in this population.

Clinical Implications
Approximately 20–25% of female patients in community mental health centers are
depressed and have childhood sexual abuse histories (Talbot et al., 2005). In this sample,
depressed women with childhood sexual abuse histories experienced, on average, pervasive
social maladjustment, and the severity of that maladjustment appears to be tied to their
experience of death ideation. Additionally, maladjustment in social and primary
relationships may be of greater importance than extended or even immediate family
adjustment. Thus, improving social function in these domains is a clear treatment target that
may reduce both death ideation and downstream suicide risk for this high-risk population.
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These findings also suggest that therapists should consider the possible intersection of
attachment avoidance and work role-related stressors in their clinical assessments of patients
exhibiting death ideation. When treating avoidant patients exhibiting death ideation, a
therapist might emphasize work-related targets of adjustment early in therapy to build on
patient strengths and to obtain more immediate benefit. Such a focus may facilitate rapport
and provide the symptom early relief necessary for further success. Although clinicians may
be more prone to attending to the suicide related thoughts and behaviors of individuals
exhibiting high levels of attachment anxiety, these results suggest that women with
relatively lower attachment anxiety may experience death ideation in the context of parent-
role related maladjustment. This finding highlights the need to be aware of how enduring
interpersonal patterns and characteristics interact with contextual factors to result in suicide-
related thoughts and behaviors.

Limitations & Future Directions
The current study had some important limitations. The participants varied greatly in age
(ranging from 19 to 57 years old). The role of attachment style and the influence of
maladjustment across domains may vary as a function of age. Future studies should examine
how these relationships change over time. Variability in the types and severity of childhood
sexual abuse experiences may have affected results or obscured important relationships.
Although the current sample was selected in order to gain better understanding of the
experience of death ideation in this at-risk population, the lack of comparison groups
precludes generalization of these results to non-depressed, non-sexually abused populations.
Furthermore, we did not measure current life stressors that might account for participants’
Major Depression, death ideation, social maladjustment, and/or attachment expression.

The measure of attachment relied on self-report. Some have challenged the assumption that
the measurement of attachment via self-report assesses a construct similar to observational
measures (Smith, Msetfi, & Golding, 2010). Furthermore, the ECR is a measure of romantic
attachment. The degree to which attachment processes involved in romantic relationships
generalize to other relationships and domains of social functioning is not established (Smith,
2005). The current study focused on the endorsement of death ideation. Although this is an
important early experience in the process that can lead to suicide (Neeleman, et al., 2004),
we did not examine suicidal ideation or suicide attempts. Although it was necessary to
conduct seven separate regression models to determine the individual relationships of
attachment and the seven domains of social maladjustment to death ideation, this does raise
the potential for type-1 error. Lastly, the current study relied on cross-sectional survey
methodology. The positive findings support the development of prospective studies to
examine how the intersection of attachment disturbances and social maladjustment domains
are associated with suicidal thoughts and behaviors over time.

Conclusion
In a sample of depressed women with sexual abuse histories, we found that greater
attachment avoidance concurrent with work-related maladjustment was associated with an
increased likelihood of reporting a desire for death. In contrast, greater parent-role
maladjustment was associated with a greater desire for death among women with lower
anxious attachment. Overall social maladjustment and maladjustment across several
domains were associated with greater likelihood of death ideation, regardless of attachment
style. To our knowledge, this study is the first to examine attachment anxiety and avoidance
as vulnerabilities to death ideation in the face of social and work maladjustments in a sample
of depressed women with childhood sexual abuse histories. Taken together, these findings
demonstrate strong associations between death ideation and social maladjustment, and
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suggest that death ideation may be specific to certain domains of adjustment for anxious and
avoidant attachment styles.
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Table 1

Odds ratios of endorsing death ideation as a function of social maladjustment, attachment style, and the
interaction between social maladjustment and attachment

Odds of Endorsing Death Ideation per unit
Increase in the Predictor Variable (95%CI)

Depression Symptoms 1.106 (1.015–1.206), p=.022

Borderline PD Diagnosis .640 (.252–1.629), p=.350

Social Maladjustment

     Overall 7.885 (2.096–29.657), p=.002

     Work 1.227 (.665–2.265), p=.512

     Social 4.077 (1.496–11.110), p=.006

     Extended Family 1.953 (.969–3.938), p=.061

     Parent 2.060 (.859–4.941), p=.105

     Family Unit 1.624 (.870–3.030), p=.128

     Primary Relationship 5.999 (1.254–28.698), p=.025

Attachment

     Avoidance 1.081 (.719–1.625), p=.709

     Anxiety .928 (.557–1.544), p=.772

Interactions

     Overall*Avoidance 1.249 (.488–3.194), p=.643

     Overall*Anxiety .891 (.340–2.338), p=.815

     Work*Avoidance 2.052 (1.118–3.763), p=.020

     Work*Anxiety 0.837 (.483–=1.450) , p=.525

     Social*Avoidance 0.836 (.413–1.692), p=.619

     Social*Anxiety 1.429 (.676–3.019), p=.350

     Extended Family*Avoidance 1.333 (.726–2.447), p=.353

     Extended Family*Anxiety 1.051 (.593–1.861), p=.865

     Parent*Avoidance 1.855 (.727–4.730), p=.196

     Parent*Anxiety .340 (.121–.957), p=.041

     Family Unit*Avoidance 1.096 (.689–1.743), p=.689

     Family Unit*Anxiety .637 (.369–1.100), p=.105

     Primary Relationship*Avoidance .736 (.268–2.019), p=.551

     Primary Relationship*Anxiety 1.386 (.457–4.208), p=.419

Note: HRSD=Hamilton Rating Scale for Depression, 95%CI=95% confidence interval; estimates for main effects of depressive symptoms, BPD
diagnosis, attachment anxiety, and attachment avoidance are the estimates from the overall social maladjustment model and are representative of
the results across all models; all analyses control for depression severity (minus HRSD item 14) and BPD diagnosis.
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