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M E D I C I N E

CORRESPONDENCE

Cannabis Therapy
The authors addressed a topic of increasing relevance. 
In this context we wish to mention a treatment option 
for posttraumatic stress disorder (PTSD) that is mostly 
not known in Germany: (self) medication with cannabis 
products. In North America, countries in the Balkans, 
and countries in the Middle East, this form of treatment 
is widespread. In Rhode Island (US), some 40% of all 
4300 state-registered patients consuming cannabis 
were recommended cannabis treatment for PTSD by 
their doctors. The supreme court of law in Croatia de-
cided in 2009 that war veterans were legally allowed to 
use cannabis. According to an observational study from 
Israel that was presented in 2011, cannabis has a 
 relevant therapeutic benefit in the treatment of PTSD. 
In a clinical study from Canada, the cannabinoid nabi-
lone reduced nightmares and flashbacks (1). A case 
 report from Germany (2) describes a patient in whom 
severe uncontrolled flashbacks, panic attacks, and self-
harm owing to severe PTSD notably improved as a 
 result of self-treatment with cannabis products. We can 
assume that very few patients with PTSD actually re-
port their self-medication to their treating physicians.

According to animal studies, the therapeutic effect of 
cannabinoids can be explained by the fact that the 
amygdala, which is responsible for storing memories 
and fear, is under the control of the endogenous 
 cannabinoid system. Flooding the amygdala with en-
docannabinoids therefore results in the elimination of 
disagreeable memories (3). In a controlled clinical 
study of extinction learning, the active substance in 
cannabis, tetrahydrocannabinol (THC), prevents the re-
appearance of fear, so that modulators of the cannabi-
noid system have been suggested for the treatment of 
anxiety disorders (4). DOI: 10.3238/arztebl.2013.0144a
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In Reply:
The German armed forces (Bundeswehr) follow the 
current guidelines from the Association of Scientific 
Medical Societies in Germany (Arbeitsgemeinschaft 
der Wissenschaftlichen Medizinischen Fachgesell -
schaften, AWMF) for their therapeutic approach to 
 psychological traumatization (1). Additional comple-
mentary therapeutic options for the treatment of 
 therapy-resistant forms of posttraumatic stress disorder 
or the treatment of comorbid disorders are already 
available in army hospitals in various forms—for 
example, acupuncture or meditation techniques. The 
therapeutic use of cannabis products contradicts exist-
ing rules and regulations of the armed forces’ service 
law, which prohibits the use of illicit drugs on principle. 
Experiences with individual cases of self-treatment 
with cannabis products in whom the consumption 
usually took on a life of its own, showed only short-
term alleviation of different symptoms (mostly from 
the agitation cluster) in our patients, and ultimately led 
to the development of tolerance and other addiction-
 related problems. Whether the targeted medical use of 
cannabinoids will, according to considerations from 
basic research, yield different experiences in clinical 
practice should be urgently investigated in controlled 
studies. DOI: 10.3238/arztebl.2013.0144b
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