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Now in its fourth generation, Healthy People
(HP) is a strategic framework for achieving
national goals for the health and well-being of
all Americans. Each decade, progress toward
these goals is monitored using evidence-based
objectives that establish targets for the next
10 years.1---3 The close of the previous decade
offered the opportunity to assess progress to-
ward the 467 objective targets4---6 of HP 2010
and the initiative’s 2 overarching goals: (1) to
increase quality and years of healthy life, and
(2) to eliminate health disparities. With the
release of HP 2020, this second goal reflects
a 3-decade commitment to addressing health
disparities, including those specific to individ-
uals living with disabilities such as children
with special health care needs (CSHCN).

The Federal Maternal and Child Health
Bureau (MCHB) defines CSHCN as those who
have or are at increased risk for a chronic
physical, developmental, behavioral, or emo-
tional condition, and who also require health
and related services of a type or amount
beyond that required for children generally.7

Three survey systems, the National Survey of
Children’s Health (NSCH), the National Survey
of Children with Special Health Care Needs
(NS-CSHCN), and the Medical Expenditure
Panel Survey, use this definition. This defini-
tion, operationalized in a 5-item screener, re-
flects children who experience both a wide
range of conditions and related consequences.
As such, the definition differs from measures
used to track some HP objectives, which focus
primarily on functional- and activity-related
limitations.8 This distinction is important be-
cause although all children living with a func-
tional limitation would be considered as having
a SHCN, not all CSHCN are functionally lim-
ited.9 The broader focus on both needs and
consequences of health conditions allows for a
more comprehensive analysis of this group
within the context of the general pediatric
population.

Historically, measuring progress across HP
2010 objectives for CSHCN has been chal-
lenging for 3 reasons. First, although disability
status was among the characteristics for which
population-based objectives could be tracked
for the purposes of monitoring progress toward
the elimination of health disparities, estimates
by disability status were only produced for
selected indicators. In some cases, data on
disability status were available but not ana-
lyzed or were determined by the sponsoring
agency as not meeting the criteria for statistical
reliability, quality, or confidentiality; HP esti-
mates are published in accordance with the
data protocols and analytic practices of the data
provider or sponsoring agency of each data
system. In others, data on disability status were
not collected. Second, for those objectives
where disability status was reported, separate
estimates for subgroups within this population
(e.g., children) were not systematically pro-
duced. As such, it was not possible to monitor
progress for children with disabilities across
all HP 2010 objectives. Third, estimates for

individuals with disabilities might vary consid-
erably by the definition of disability utilized.
Because HP objectives are tracked using mul-
tiple data systems, comparisons across indica-
tors for individuals with disabilities were not
always available or comparable for all indica-
tors.

Efforts to track HP objectives for CSHCN
and children with disabilities10 are illustrated in
the Appendix (data available as a supplement
to the online version of this article at http://
www.ajph.org). HP 2010 tracked 2 objectives
for CSHCN as defined by MCHB. These
objectives included medical home access (ob-
jectives 16---22) and receipt of care in family-
centered, comprehensive and coordinated
systems (objectives 16---23).11 Six additional
objectives were either tracked for children
with disabilities using other definitions of
disability or estimates for children with dis-
abilities were produced as a subpopulation of
interest. Because they were organized across
different HP focus areas and relied on differ-
ent data systems, these indicators provided
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a limited picture of the health and well-being of
children with chronic conditions and related
SHCN.

Previous research on health disparities be-
tween children with and without SHCN or
disabilities has focused predominantly on dif-
ferences in health care access, utilization, and
expenditures,12---16 and to a lesser extent on
selected heath status indicators.13,17 However,
comparisons relative to children without SHCN
are ultimately important to monitoring pro-
grammatic efforts to improve outcomes and
reduce the excess burden of ill health experi-
enced by CSHCN. National efforts, including
HP, are commonly used to support social policy
development, implementation, and monitoring
of efforts to address such public health chal-
lenges and disparities. Scholars examining pol-
icy processes and implementation through
governmental agencies and related organiza-
tional structures describe such agenda-setting
activities as important tools in the bureaucratic
process.18---20 In the maternal and child health
arena, Title V of the Social Security Act ex-
plicitly links the purpose of the national ma-
ternal and child health program to national
health objectives, including HP. The dearth of
comparable data for tracking CSHCN health
status within the HP framework places stew-
ards of public health programs for this pop-
ulation at a disadvantage. Furthermore, re-
search indicating that CSHCN includes both
a sizable21 and growing22 segment of the US
pediatric population underscores the impor-
tance of efforts to address the health of this
population within the larger framework of
population-based public health initiatives
like HP.

The goal of this study was to provide a
systematic assessment of key national health
objectives, traditionally tracked for the popu-
lation as a whole, but rarely reported or
summarized for CSHCN using data from the
NSCH. The NSCH is the only nationally rep-
resentative survey that provides comparable
data on the health and development of children
with and without SHCN. We compared esti-
mates for children with and without SHCN at 2
time periods for HP 2010 objectives selected
according to the 2010 leading health indica-
tors (LHIs). Disparities and temporal patterns
were highlighted, and implications for practice
and program planning were discussed.

METHODS

Data were obtained from the 2003 and
2007 NSCH. The surveys have been described
in detail elsewhere.23,24 In brief, the NSCH is
a random-digit-dial, population-based tele-
phone survey fielded through the State and
Local Area Integrated Telephone Survey
mechanism. The surveys were designed to
collect information on the physical and emo-
tional health of children younger than 18 years
with a special emphasis on family and com-
munity factors that impact children’s health.
Data were collected for 1 randomly selected
child in each household; a parent or caregiver
who was knowledgeable about the child’s
health served as the respondent. Both the
2003 and 2007 NSCH were funded and
directed by the Health Resources and Services
Administration’s MCHB and conducted by the
Centers for Disease Control and Prevention’s
National Center for Health Statistics.

Information on HP 2010 focus areas, ob-
jectives, and related LHIs was obtained from
publicly available sources.6,10,25 The 2010
LHIs were developed by the US Department of
Health and Human Services based on feedback
from stakeholders; indicators reflected the 10
primary factors associated with morbidity,
mortality, and disability within the United
States.3,26 Between1and 3 HP 2010 objectives
were selected for each of the10 LHIs for a total
of 22 objectives; over time, 6 supplemental
objectives were added, for a total of 28 objec-
tives. We reviewed these 28 objectives to
identify those that either targeted pediatric
populations or were applicable to individuals
younger than 18 years. We identified 14
objectives based on this criterion, which were
then compared with survey items available in
the 2003 and 2007 NSCH.

Variables

Children were defined with SHCN if they
experienced at least 1 of 5 consequences asso-
ciated with a chronic medical, behavioral, or
other health condition that lasted or was
expected to last at least 12 months. These
consequences fell generally into 2 categories: (1)
ongoing use of or need for medical, mental
health, educational, or other health-related ther-
apies, including prescription medications; and

(2) functional limitations that prevented the child
from engaging in age-appropriate activities.27,28

Indicators were selected from available sur-
vey items based on (1) relevance to HP 2010
LHIs and (2) availability of related items on
both the 2003 and 2007 NSCH question-
naires. Selected survey items are presented in
Table 1. Comparable items were available on
both surveys for 7 of the 10 LHIs: physical
activity, overweight and obesity, mental health,
injury and violence, environmental quality,
immunization, and access to health care. For
some LHIs, (e.g., physical activity), NSCH sur-
vey items were directly comparable to the HP
measure used to the track the LHI. In other
cases (e.g., mental health, where no directly
comparable survey item was available), a re-
lated item was selected based on etiological or
conceptual relevance by the authors. For 2
items, environmental tobacco exposure and
depressive symptomology, more specific mea-
sures were available in the 2007 survey; re-
sults for these items were presented where
appropriate. All items were parent-reported.

Statistical Analyses

We used a combination of absolute and
relative measures to examine changes between
2003 and 2007 in selected indicators by
SHCN status and to evaluate changes over time
in the disparity between children with and
without SHCN. An absolute measure of differ-
ence or disparity is a simple arithmetic differ-
ence between 2 rates (i.e., percentage point
difference, R1 – R2), whereas a relative mea-
sure of disparity expresses the ratio difference
of one rate relative to the other (i.e., percent
difference, R1/R2 – 1).29 Together, these mea-
sures provide complementary, albeit sometimes
contradictory, measures of the direction and
magnitude of a disparity and have been used
previously to assess progress toward HP targets
and the reduction of health disparities.29,30

Absolute and relative disparities by SHCN
status were evaluated in the following ways.
First, for each time period, absolute (percentage
point) and relative (percentage) differences
between children with and without SHCN were
calculated for each indicator. Second, absolute
and relative measures were calculated to
quantify the change over time in the proportion
of children reporting each indicator within
SHCN groups. Third, the change over time in
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absolute and relative disparities between chil-
dren with and without SHCN was examined.
Fourth, using absolute differences, the number
of excess cases among CSHCN that could have
potentially been averted if there was no dis-
parity between children with and without
SHCN was calculated for each indicator. The
statistical significance of absolute and relative
estimates of difference were tested using a Z
statistic ( Z ‡ 1.96).30

In contrast to other reports measuring dis-
parity in the achievement of HP objectives that
utilized the group with the “best” rate as the
referent group,3 we selected children without
SHCN (generally healthier) as the reference for
all indicators in keeping with the study’s goal
to highlight disparities for CSHCN. Weighted
point estimates and SEs that accounted for the
complex survey design were produced using
SAS-callable SUDAAN release 10.0.1 (RTI In-
ternational, Research Triangle Park, North
Carolina).

RESULTS

In both 2003 and 2007, CSHCN fared
worse than children without SHCN with re-
spect to physical activity, obesity, living with
someone who used tobacco, past-month de-
pressive symptoms, and past-year emergency
department visits for injuries, but fared better
on measures of current insurance and having
a personal health care provider. Selected re-
sults are presented by LHI in Table 2.

Physical Activity and Overweight and

Obesity

Compared with children without SHCN, a
smaller proportion of high school---aged CSHCN
were reported to engage in 20 minutes or more
of vigorous physical activity on at least 3 days
in the past week, and a larger proportion were
obese in both 2003 and 2007 (Table 2). In
relative terms, CSHCN were 14.4% (2003)
and 10.0% (2007) less likely to meet recom-
mended physical activity guidelines and 31.3%
and 26.7% more likely to be obese than were
children without SHCN in 2003 and 2007,
respectively (Table 2). Between 2003 and
2007, the proportion of high school---aged
CSHCN who engaged in recommended levels
of physical activity increased 9.9%, whereas
no statistically significant change was observed

in the proportion of CSHCN who were obese
between survey years. During the same period,
the proportion of children without SHCN who
were physically active also increased and the
proportion that was obese increased more than
10% (Table 3).

Although the relative disparity between
children with and without SHCN declined for
both physical activity and obesity, 4.4 and 4.6
percentage points, respectively, neither change
was statistically significant (Table 4). Elimination
of these disparities would have increased the
number of CSHCN who engaged in recommen-
ded levels of physical activity by more than 1
million in both survey years and decreased the
number of obese CSHCN by 500 000 at both
time points (data available upon request).

Mental Health

In both 2003 and 2007, a greater pro-
portion of CSHCN were reported by their
parents to have been sad, unhappy, or de-
pressed usually or always during the past
month compared with children without SHCN
(5.2% vs 1.2% in 2003; 4.5% vs 1.0% in
2007). This reflected an absolute difference of
approximately 4 percentage points but a rela-
tive difference of approximately 350% at both
points in time (Table 2). Among those children
with a diagnosis of depression in 2007, the
relative disparity between children when clas-
sified by SHCN status was somewhat attenu-
ated; CSHCN with diagnosed depression were
80% more likely to have parent-reported
moderate or severe depression compared with
those without SHCN but also currently diag-
nosed with depression (Table 2).

Observed declines in the proportion of
children with reported depressive symptoms
between survey years were not statistically
significant, nor did the absolute or relative
disparity between CSHCN and those without
SHCN change significantly over time (Tables 3
and 4). Elimination of this disparity would have
decreased the number of CSHCN experiencing
depressive symptomology by approximately
500 000 cases at each time period.

Injury-Related Emergency Department

Visits

In 2003 and 2007, CSHCN were signifi-
cantly more likely to have visited an emergency
department for a nonfatal injury in the past
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year than children without SHCN. In 2003 and
2007, 14.5% and 18.3% of CSHCN made
such a visit compared with 8.8% and 9.4% of
children without a SHCN (Table 2). Although
observed measures of both absolute and relative
differences over time both within and between
SHCN groups appeared to increase, none of
the changes were statistically significant (Tables
3 and 4). In 2007, 1.2 million injury-related
emergency department visits by CSHCN could
have been potentially avoided if the disparity
between children by SHCN status was not
present.

Environmental Quality

Nearly one third of CSHCN lived in
a household with someone who used tobacco

products in both survey years compared with
one quarter of children without SHCN (Table
2). CSHCN were 35% and 23% more likely
to live in a household with someone who used
tobacco products in 2003 and 2007, respec-
tively. A more specific measure added in 2007
(which captured use of tobacco products, in-
cluding cigarettes, cigars, or pipes in the home),
showed that although only 7.7% of CSHCN
lived in households where tobacco use took
place, they were 66% more likely to do so than
children without SHCN (Table 2).

Although the proportion of children in both
groups living with someone who used tobacco
products declined between survey years, these
changes were not statistically significant (Table
3). Similarly, declines in both absolute and

relative measures of disparity between children
by SHCN status between 2003 and 2007 were
not statistically significant (3.0 and 11.6 per-
centage points, respectively; Table 4).

Access to Health Care

More than 90% of children, regardless of
SHCN status, were currently insured during
both surveys, although the rate for CSHCN was
slightly higher at both times (94.8% and 93.9%
in 2003 vs 90.5% and 90.2% in 2007; Table
2). Point estimates of insurance coverage de-
clined less than 1% between survey years for
both groups, yielding no statistically significant
change in observed disparity (Tables 3 and 4).
However, both CSHCN and those without
SHCN experienced significant increases in the

TABLE 2—Prevalence of Selected Health Indicators Among Children, by Presence of Special Health Care Needs: National Survey of

Children’s Health, 2003 and 2007

Special Health Care Needs No Special Health Care Needs Absolute Difference

(95% CI)a
Relative Difference

(95% CI)bHealthy People 2010 LHI (Age Range) Weighted No. % (SE) Weighted No. % (SE)

2003

Total sample 12 820 481 59 916 484

Vigorous physical activity ‡ 3 d/wk for 20 min (14–17 y) 3 508 483 58.3 (1.16) 12 555 793 68.1 (0.60) –9.8 (–12.38, –7.25) –14.4 (–18.0, –10.7)

Obese; BMI at or above the gender- and age-specific 95th percentile (10–17 y) 6 757 852 18.2 (0.69) 24 303 619 13.9 (0.33) 4.3 (2.84, 5.85) 31.3 (20.2, 43.3)

Usually/always unhappy, sad, or depressed during the past mo (6–17 y) 10 135 702 5.2 (0.36) 38 615 315 1.2 (0.08) 4.1 (3.35, 4.81) 350.2 (270.6, 447.0)

ED visits for nonfatal injuries during the past 12 mo (0–5 y) 2 643 929 14.5 (1.04) 21 156 758 8.8 (0.27) 5.8 (3.64, 7.85) 65.6 (42.1, 93.0)

Anyone in household use of cigarettes, cigars, or pipe tobacco (0–6 y)c 2 363 838 33.7 (1.52) 17 022 045 25.0 (0.48) 8.7 (5.56, 11.81) 34.7 (22.4, 48.3)

Current insurance (0–17 y) 12 806 715 94.8 (0.30) 59 766 209 90.5 (0.20) 4.3 (3.64, 5.05) 4.80 (4.0, 5.6)

Personal doctor or nurse (0–17 y) 12 798 586 90.0 (0.42) 59 677 282 81.9 (0.26) 8.0 (7.06, 9.01) 9.81 (8.6, 11.0)

2007

Total sample 14 136 454 59 622 162

Vigorous physical activity ‡ 3 d/wk for 20 min (14–17 y) 3 971 843 64.1 (1.64) 12 870 211 71.2 (0.94) –7.1 (–10.83, –3.42) –10.0 (–15.0, –4.8)

Obese; BMI at or above the gender- and age-specific 95th percentile (10–17 y) 7 444 763 19.5 (0.98) 24 166 139 15.4 (0.56) 4.1 (1.90, 6.33) 26.7 (12.2, 43.1)

Usually/always unhappy, sad, or depressed during the past mo (6–17 y) 11 221 607 4.5 (0.44) 37 913 893 1.0 (0.13) 3.5 (2.56, 4.36) 346.3 (222.9, 516.8)

Moderate/severe depression (2–17)e,f 1 110 333 52.8 (3.31) 171 834 29.4 (6.82) 23.5 (8.60, 38.32) 79.9 (12.2, 188.3)

ED visits for nonfatal injuries during the past 12 mo (0–5 y) 2 854 051 18.3 (1.82) 21 600 899 9.4 (0.44) 8.9 (5.22, 12.55) 94.7 (57.0, 141.5)

Anyone in household use of cigarettes, cigars, or pipe tobacco (0–6 y) 3 642 925 30.5 (1.63) 24 532 528 24.8 (0.66) 5.7 (2.29, 9.16) 23.1 (9.5, 38.3)

Use of cigarettes, cigars, or pipe tobacco in home (0–6 y)e 3 642 925 7.7 (0.92) 24 531 607 4.7 (0.27) 3.1 (1.18, 4.92) 65.5 (27.6, 114.6)

Current insurance (0–17 y) 14 131 207 93.9 (0.48) 59 449 404 90.2 (0.31) 3.8 (2.63, 4.86) 4.2 (2.9, 5.4)

Personal doctor or nurse (0–17 y) 14 093 965 94.7 (0.41) 59 322 031 91.6 (0.27) 3.2 (2.19, 4.12) 3.4 (2.4, 4.5)

Received a tetanus booster or Td/Tdap shot or up-to-date on all shots (12–17 y)e,g 5 612 286 88.1 (0.85) 18 133 993 84.2 (0.57) 3.9 (1.91, 5.91) 4.7 (2.3, 7.1)

Note. BMI = body mass index; CI = confidence interval; CSHCN = children with special health care needs; ED = emergency department; LHI = leading health indicators; Td/Tdap = Tetanus-
Diphtheria or Tetanus-Diphtheria-Pertussis.
aPercentage point difference, CSHCN – non-CSHCN.
bPercent difference, (CSHCN/non-CSHCN) – 1.
cQuestion added midway through survey; 12.3% of the sample were missing as a result and were dropped from these analyses.
dAmong children who currently have asthma (parent has been told by a doctor or other health care provider that child has asthma).
eAdded to Survey in 2007.
fAmong children who currently have depression (parent has been told by a doctor or other health care provider that child has depression).
g5.9% of the sample were missing and were dropped from the analyses.
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proportion with a personal doctor or nurse be-
tween 2003 and 2007—a relative increase of
5.3% among CSHCN and 11.8% among their
counterparts without such needs (Table 3).

The significant increase in the proportion of
children without SHCN who had a personal
health care provider drove a 4.9 percentage
point decline in the disparity between CSHCN

and those without SHCN, corresponding to
a 6.4 percentage point reduction in disparity
between these groups (Table 4).

DISCUSSION

Using the HP 2010 LHIs, we found signifi-
cant disparities for key health-related measures

between children with and without SHCN.
Disparities were observed for CSHCN in 5 of
the 7 indicators at each time point and per-
sisted over the decade. Among CSHCN, prog-
ress was observed for 2 measures, whereas the
relative disparity between children with and
without SHCN remained static for all but 1
indicator. Our results were consistent with

TABLE 3—Absolute and Relative Change Over Time in Prevalence of Selected Health Indicators, by Special Health Care

Need Status: National Survey of Children’s Health, 2003 and 2007

Children With Special Health Care Needs Children Without Special Health Care Needs

Healthy People 2010 LHI (Age Range)

Absolute Change

2007 – 2003a
Relative Change

2007 – 2003b
Absolute Change

2007 – 2003a
Relative Change

2007 – 2003b

Vigorous physical activity ‡ 3 d/wk for 20 min (14–17 y) 5.8* 9.9* 3.1* 4.5*

Obese; BMI at or above the gender- and age-specific 95th percentile (10–17 y) 1.3 7.0 1.5* 10.9*

Usually/always unhappy, sad, or depressed during the past mo (6–17 y) –0.8 –14.9 –0.2 –14.2

ED visits for nonfatal injuries (0–5 y) 3.8 25.9 0.6 7.1

Anyone in household uses cigarettes, cigars, or pipe tobacco (0–6 y) –3.2 –9.4 –0.2 –0.8

Currently insured (0–17 y) –0.9 –0.9 –0.3 –0.3

Personal doctor or nurse (0–17 y) 4.8* 5.3* 9.7* 11.8*

Note. BMI = body mass index; ED = emergency department; LHI = leading health indicators.
aPercentage point difference.
bPercent difference.
*P < .05; Z-statistic > 1.96.

TABLE 4—Absolute and Relative Disparities Over Time in Prevalence of Selected Health Indicators Between Children

With and Without Special Health Care Needs: National Survey of Children’s Health, 2003 and 2007

Absolute Disparity Relative Disparity

Healthy People 2010 LHI (Age Range)

Absolute

Disparity 2003a
Absolute

Disparity 2007a
Change in Absolute

Disparity 2007–2003b
Relative

Disparity 2003c
Relative

Disparity 2007c
Change in Relative

Disparity 2007–2003d

Vigorous physical activity ‡ 3 d/wk for 20 min (14–17 y) –9.8 –7.1 –2.7 –14.4 –10.0 –4.4

Obese; BMI at or above the gender- and age-specific 95th

percentile (10–17 y)

4.3 4.1 –0.2 31.3 26.7 –4.6

Usually/always unhappy, sad, or depressed during the

past mo (6–17 y)

4.1 3.5 –0.6 350.2 346.3 –3.8

ED visits for nonfatal injuries during the past 12 mo (0–5 y) 5.8 8.9 3.1 65.6 94.7 29.1

Anyone in household use of cigarettes, cigars, or pipe

tobacco (0–6 y)

8.7 5.7 –3.0 34.7 23.1 –11.6

Current insurance (0–17 y) 4.3 3.8 –0.6 4.8 4.2 –0.6

Personal doctor or nurse (0–17 y) 8.0 3.2 -4.9* 9.8 3.4 -6.4*

Note. BMI = body mass index; ED = emergency department; LHI = leading health indicators.
aPercentage point difference between children with and without special health care needs.
bChange in percentage point difference between children with and without special health care needs between 2003 and 2007. Negative values indicate a reduction in absolute disparity; positive
values indicate an increase in absolute disparity.
cPercent difference between children with and without special health care needs.
dChange in percent difference between children with and without special health care needs between 2003 and 2007 (measured in percentage points). Negative values indicate a reduction in
relative disparity; positive values indicate an increase in relative disparity.
*P < .05; Z-statistic > 1.96.
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previous research on individual indica-
tors,17,31,32 which illustrated important differ-
ences between children by the presence of
SHCNs. Our analyses extended this body of
knowledge in 2 ways. First, we provided an
aggregated picture of these differences across
2 time periods using generally congruent data
sources. Second, we illustrated how population-
based initiatives to assess and monitor the
health and well-being of all Americans can be
used to better understand the specific health
challenges of vulnerable populations within the
contexts in which they live.

The ability to track and report on CSHCN in
the context of national health policy platforms
is an important tool for public health profes-
sionals accountable for the health and well-
being of children with chronic illnesses and
disabilities. Such capability is particularly crit-
ical amid growing demands for governmental
accountability33 and an increasing focus on use
of data for quality improvement and cost
reductions.34 The HP framework is widely
used to support core public health functions
(assessment, policy development, and assur-
ance) and 10 related essential services. Forty-
eight states had a HP 2010 Plan online, and
according to a 2010 report by the National
Opinion Research Center, more than 81% of
surveyed state, local, and tribal health organi-
zations and agencies reported using HP 2010
for planning, goal-setting, and agenda-building,
as well as for preparing funding applications.19

At the national level, the Office of the Surgeon
General, the White House, and agencies within
the Department of Health and Human Services
draw on HP to engage the general public in
public health problem recognition and to gen-
erate support for policy responses. These
analyses illustrate new methods that commu-
nities, states, the federal government, and
national advocacy organizations can use to
position CSHCN within the broader population
of children and increase their visibility in the
public policy discourse. More concretely, they
provide state Title V programs for CSHCN with
new reporting capabilities with respect to Title
V Block Grant requirements and opportunities
to contextualize issues and program impact in
future funding applications.

This study had 3 primary limitations. First,
HP objectives were tracked using a variety of
data sources that relied on different reporters.

For some indicators (e.g., those related to
adolescent health risk behaviors), youths
themselves are often the preferred data pro-
viders whereas clinical and biomarker mea-
sures are preferred for other indicators. Be-
cause the goal of our analysis was to provide
comparable estimates for children by SHCN
status, the use of a single data source with a
consistent definition of SHCN was deemed
most appropriate. However, given that NSCH
data are parent-reported, it is possible that
estimates for some of the selected indicators
might be differentially biased. The limitations
of relying on parent report also extend to the
identification of CSHCN. Children with chronic
conditions who did not experience any of the
5 qualifying health or functional consequences
captured by the screener would not be re-
flected in our results. Second, our analyses
reflected only a sample of the possible health-
related indicators for which children with and
without SHCN could be compared. We chose
to use the priorities for health and well-being
codified by the nation’s LHIs to highlight
disparities among children by SHCN status.
Third, our analyses did not account for differ-
ences among children that may be expected
based on the presence or absence of a SHCN.
For example, we might expect children living
with certain physical conditions to be limited in
their ability to engage in vigorous physical
activity or to be regularly weighed and mea-
sured for the purposes of tracking weight
status; for these children, the goal might not
be parity with nonaffected children. Further-
more, SHCN presence might complicate con-
sistent assessment via preventative screenings,
such as the measurement and tracking of
weight status, when office visits were more
often for the management of the child’s unique
acute and chronic health issues than well-child
checks.35,36 However, our analyses demon-
strated how within-group progress for such
indicators could be tracked over time. Our
analysis extended recent work in this area37

and provided 1 example of how such compar-
isons could be analytically approached. The
release of LHIs for 2020 provide new oppor-
tunities to compare progress among children
with and without SHCN on these and other
indicators, including oral health care utilization
and academic achievement, which are new for
HP 2020.38 Additional limitations included

those associated with the use of a landline
telephone survey mechanism, including cover-
age and nonresponse bias.39,40

We found that throughout the previous
decade, CSHCN fared consistently worse than
their typically developing peers with respect
to measures related to the nation’s 10 LHIs,
with the exception of access to a personal
health care provider. These analyses suggested
that continued monitoring of and program-
matic focus on CSHCN both as a population
with unique needs and, perhaps more impor-
tantly, as a sizable and growing proportion of
our nation’s overall pediatric population is
warranted. Public policy tools like HP and the
LHIs can provide a useful framework for such
investigations and the translation of such re-
search into policy and programs. j
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