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Abstract
Most patients are easily liberated from mechanical ventilation (MV) following resolution of
respiratory failure and a successful trial of spontaneous breathing, but about 25% of patients
experience difficult weaning. MV use leads to cellular changes and weakness, which has been
linked to weaning difficulties and has been labeled ventilator induced diaphragm dysfunction
(VIDD). Aggravating factors in human studies with prolonged weaning include malnutrition,
chronic electrolyte abnormalities, hyperglycemia, excessive resistive and elastic loads,
corticosteroids, muscle relaxant exposure, sepsis and compromised cardiac function. Numerous
animal studies have investigated the effects of MV on diaphragm function. Virtually all of these
studies have concluded that MV use rapidly leads to VIDD and have identified cellular and
molecular mechanisms of VIDD. Molecular and functional studies on the effects of MV on the
human diaphragm have largely confirmed the animal results and identified potential treatment
strategies. Only recently have potential VIDD treatments been tested in humans, including
pharmacologic interventions and diaphragm “training”. A limited number of human studies have
found that specific diaphragm training can increase respiratory muscle strength in FTW patients
and facilitate weaning, but larger, multicenter trials are needed.
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1. Introduction
Our goals are to: 1) Describe the epidemiology of failure to wean (FTW) from mechanical
ventilation (MV) in terms of the number of patients impacted and the economic burden on
our healthcare system, 2) succinctly review the relationship between ventilator induced
diaphragm dysfunction (VIDD), FTW and the measurement of inspiratory muscle strength
in humans, 3) briefly summarize the animal literature addressing VIDD and potential
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prevention and treatment strategies, 4) review selected VIDD human studies, and finally 5)
review the effects of respiratory muscle training/rehabilitation on diaphragm function and
weaning outcome.

2. Epidemiology of failure to wean
Since its introduction in the early 1950s, positive pressure MV has become one of the
hallmark treatment modalities of intensive care. Most patients are readily liberated following
surgery or resolution of respiratory failure, but some patients experience difficulty and have
been labeled FTW patients. FTW patients are a significant clinical and economic problem
facing the American healthcare system. Many patients who experience prolonged MV have
a poor one-year functional outcome and survival. Reported one-year mortality rates after
prolonged MV range from 20–50% (Unroe 2010). A recent survey (Unroe et al., 2010) of
126 patients receiving long-term MV revealed that of the patients that survived for one year
after MV, only 9% were able to perform activities of daily living (ADL) independently, 26%
were moderately independnt with ADL and 65% were completely dependent on help with
ADL. The mean 12 month medical cost per prolonged MV patient was $306,000. The
number of patients requiring prolonged MV (>96 hours) in the USA is growing at about
5.5% per annum; in contrast total hospital admissions are growing at a rate of 1.1% per year
(Zilberberg et al., 2008). It has been estimated that by the year 2020, approximately 605,000
patients will require MV for more than 96 hours in the United States annually and many of
these patients will experience FTW. The annual cost of these hospitalizations is predicted to
be $64 billion (Zilberberg and Shorr, 2008) Accordingly, identifying effective prevention
and treatments strategies for FTW from MV should be considered a high priority.

The etiology of FTW is usually multifactorial and can include underlying severe respiratory
disease (COPD or severe restrictive disease), heart failure, ICU complications such as
sepsis, critical illness neuropathy, and pulmonary mechanical (resistance, compliance and
intrinsic PEEP) or infectious complications and respiratory muscle weakness, among others
(De Jonghe et al., 2007; Karakurt et al., 2011, 2012; Vassilakopoulos et al., 1998). MV
sustains alveolar ventilation by inflating the lungs via positive pressure, thus functioning as
“artificial breathing muscles.” MV impose variable degrees of muscular inactivity on the
diaphragm (Fauroux et al., 1998), rapidly leading to atrophy and weakness. Diaphragm
weakness is recognized as a major contributing factor to FTW (Purro et al., 2000;
Vassilakopoulos et al., 1998). Collectively, the deleterious effects of MV on the diaphragm
have been termed ventilator induced diaphragm dysfunction (VIDD), a term first coined by
Vassilakopoulos and Petrof (Vassilakopoulos and Petrof, 2004).

3. Relationship between diaphragm strength and FTW in human patients
The diaphragm is the primary generator of inspiratory pressure, and its strength has been the
subject of numerous studies designed to predict weaning success. Clinically, diaphragm
strength is often assessed by measuring the inspiratory pressure at the endotracheal or
tracheal tube with the unidirectional valve method (Caruso et al., 1999). This method is
clinically practical but has low specificity, and because it is a voluntary activity, can
underestimate maximal inspiratory pressure in poorly cooperative, critically ill patients
(Multz et al., 1990). Furthermore, it is not specific for the diaphragm, but measures
inspiratory pressure generated by all of the inspiratory muscles. More complex integrative
indexes of weaning failure have not substantially improved the prediction sensitivity.

A more direct measurement of diaphragm strength uses esophageal and gastric pressure
sensors to capture maximal transdiaphragmatic pressure (Pdimax), either during voluntary
inspiratory efforts or with bilateral stimulation of the phrenic nerves. Although Pdimax is not
practical for regular clinical use, it provides a specific measure of diaphragm strength and
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when coupled with phrenic stimulation, does not require active patient participation. Several
authors who have studied diaphragm strength invasively have reported that patients with
greater Pdimax are more likely to successfully wean than patients with weaker diaphragms
(Karakurt et al., 2012) (Laghi et al., 1998; Watson et al., 2001). Additionally, FTW patients
typically have elevated diaphragm EMG activity during spontaneous breathing trials, but are
less efficient at converting the phrenic motor drive into inspiratory pressure or tidal volume
(Liu et al., 2012; Purro et al., 2000).

4.0 Effects of MV on diaphragm function: Animal studies
Since the seminal work of Le Bourdelles (Le Bourdelles et al., 1994), approximately 57
studies have examined the effect of MV on the diaphragm in animal models. These studies
have documented that controlled MV leads to VIDD in healthy young animals in remarkably
short periods of time (e.g., 6–24 hours)(Gayan-Ramirez et al., 2003) (Powers et al., 2011a;
Sassoon et al., 2004; Smuder et al., 2011; Supinski and Callahan, 2010). The animal studies
have identified three major cellular pathways leading to VIDD: 1) ubiquitin- proteasome, 2)
caspase and calpain pathways and 3) lysosomal autophagy. A thorough review of the
cellular and molecular pathways contributing to VIDD is beyond the scope of this review
and the reader is referred to excellent recent reviews on molecular and cellular mechanisms
of VIDD for more details (Jaber et al., 2011a; Powers et al., 2011b).

Some limitations on the translation of the animal studies to human FTW patients must be
acknowledged. With few exceptions, the animal work studied young animals (Criswell et
al., 2003). The animals also had normal cardiopulmonary and neuromuscular function prior
to MV support and were free of comorbidities during periods of MV support. Human FTW
patients are usually more than 60 years of age. They often have reduced cardiopulmonary
and functional capacity prior to receiving MV and frequently have serious comorbidities
such as heart disease, obesity, diabetes, sarcopenia, sepsis and lung disease, which can
exacerbate weaning difficulties. Because of the technical difficulty of maintaining animals
on MV, few studies have extended MV support beyond 24 hours (Anzueto et al., 1997;
Jaber et al., 2005), while human patients frequently receive MV support for weeks or even
months. While the elegant, tightly controlled experimental animal work documents that
controlled MV can rapidly induce VIDD, the discrepancies between the animals’ and human
patients’ functional and health status may lead to an underestimation of the detrimental
effects of MV on the human diaphragm.

4.1 Prevention Strategies: Pharmacological
Anti-oxidants have been shown to attenuate VIDD in animal models (Agten et al., 2011)
(Betters et al., 2004; McClung et al., 2007; Ochala et al., 2010; Powers et al., 2011a). Long-
term administration of corticosteroids has been associated with skeletal muscle and
diaphragm atrophy, (Dekhuijzen et al., 1993) but some investigators have shown that short-
term use of high-dose corticosteroids may offer some protection against VIDD (Maes et al.,
2010; Sassoon et al., 2011). As a more comprehensive understanding of the cellular and
molecular mechanisms contributing to VIDD is achieved, the prospect of developing
pharmaceutical agents that can prevent or treat VIDD is promising.

4.2 Prevention Strategies: training and activity during MV support
Limited data exists examining the effects of diaphragm strength training in animals.
Bisschop and coworkers examined the effects of four weeks of resistive training on
diaphragm muscle fiber cross sectional area (CSA) in rats and found a 19% increase in type
IIa muscle fibers with training (Bisschop et al., 1997). Smith and coworkers examined the
effects of two weeks of intermittent tracheal occlusions on diaphragm muscle fiber CSA in
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rats and reported a 25% increase in fast, glycolytic fibers (Smith et al., 2012). Neither of
these studies examined the diaphragms of trained animals after a period of MV support, but
collectively the results suggest that the diaphragm muscle fibers can undergo classical
strength training (hypertrophy) and presumably increased strength. Increasing diaphragm
strength prior to a bout of MV support will theoretically increase the diaphragm’s functional
reserve and may offer some protection against VIDD. More work examining the effects of
strength training on the diaphragm is needed.

A small number of studies have examined the effects of increased diaphragm activity or
training prior to and during periods of MV. Smuder and coworkers trained rats with a 10 day
endurance program prior to a bout of MV support and found that training increased the
antioxidant capacity in the diaphragm (Smuder et al., 2011). Endurance training protected
diaphragm mitochondria against MV-induced oxidative damage and oxidative
phosphorylation uncoupling. The clinical translation of this finding would require patients to
be trained before undergoing MV support. It is possible to predict which patients are likely
to require prolonged MV following cardiac surgery (Reddy et al., 2007). Patients at high-
risk for post-operative pulmonary complications (PPC) have been shown to benefit from
pre-surgical respiratory muscle training. We discuss uses of pre-operative training in Section
6.1.

Limited work has examined the effect of increased diaphragm activity during periods of MV
support. Intermittent hypoxia has been used by some investigators to induce respiratory
neuromuscular plasticity (Baker-Herman et al., 2004; Golder and Mitchell, 2005; Mitchell et
al., 2001). While intermittent hypoxia can increase the pressure load on the diaphragm and
induce neuromuscular plasticity, it is unlikely to be a useful treatment modality for human
patients. Most human patients maintained on MV require hyperoxic mixtures (30–50%) to
maintain arterial oxygen saturation due to the inefficiency of positive pressure ventilation
and compromised cardiopulmonary function. Sassoon and coworkers used a rabbit model to
examine the effect of assist-control MV on diaphragm function versus controlled MV
(Sassoon et al., 2004). Controlled MV can impose a complete cessation of diaphragm
electrical activity and is thought to be the most potent ventilation mode to induce VIDD
(Hudson et al., 2012). Assist-control MV is more commonly used with human patients and
requires the patients to generate an inspiratory effort to trigger a MV supported breath.
Sassoon found that assist-control MV attenuated the loss in diaphragm contractile function
compared to controlled MV. While prolonged controlled MV is rarely used in humans who
will attempt weaning, this study highlighted the potential of spontaneous ventilation as a
means of attenuating VIDD. Gayan-Ramirez studied the effect of intermittent spontaneous
breathing activity on diaphragm force production in rats subjected to controlled MV (Gayan-
Ramirez et al., 2005). In this study, 2 groups of animals received 24 hours of controlled MV;
one group breathed spontaneously without MV support for five minutes every six hours. A
third, control group remained sedated, but unventilated. The intermittent spontaneous
breathing group maintained more diaphragm strength than the continuously ventilated
group, but had reduced diaphragm strength compared to the control group (see Fig 1).

These results have possible clinical implications: VIDD in patients could be potentially
attenuated with assist modes of MV that require the patient to trigger the ventilator and with
brief bouts of partial support or unsupported breathing as tolerated. The use of partially
assisting modes of spontaneous ventilation, such as pressure support, makes the ventilation
more acceptable to the patients and improves patient ventilator synchronicity (Tokioka et al.,
1989). However patients stable on minimal ventilator settings may nevertheless develop
failure when inspiratory work increases 30–60% following extubation from minimal settings
(Tobin, 2012). It can be difficult to predict which patients will fail extubation from minimal
MV settings, and thus short bouts of unassisted t-piece or flow-by trials may serve both to
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train the respiratory muscles and to identify patients who cannot maintain sufficient
inspiratory motor output to breathe unassisted (Tobin, 2012). In further support of unassisted
breathing trials, a recent study examining the effect of pressure support ventilation versus
trach collar (fully unsupported breathing) during weaning trials in FTW patients revealed
that patients weaned faster when they were required to do all of the muscular work of
breathing during breathing trials (Jubran et al., 2013), compared to low levels of pressure
support MV.

Collectively, numerous animal studies have unequivocally shown that short (6–24 hrs)
periods of MV leads to a complex cellular/biochemical response in the diaphragm
culminating in oxidative stress, increased muscle fiber proteolysis and decreased contractile
force. Promising, but limited data suggest that the pathways leading to VIDD can be blocked
with selected antioxidant drugs, and acute high dose corticosteroids may also be beneficial
in the short term. Limited data suggest that the rat diaphragm can undergo muscle fiber CSA
hypertrophy in response to short term strength training, which may infer some protection
against VIDD. The data also suggest that increased diaphragm activity prior to and during
periods of MV may offer some protection against VIDD.

5. Effects of MV on diaphragm function: Human studies
To date, approximately 19 studies have examined the impact of MV on the structure and
function of the human diaphragm, including dependent measures such as gene expression
(Huang et al., 2011; Welvaart et al., 2011a), diaphragm thickness and pressure generation
(Grosu et al., 2012; Hermans et al., 2010; Jaber et al., 2011b), muscle fiber CSA (Levine et
al., 2008) or cellular and molecular mechanisms of VIDD (Hussain et al., 2010; Picard et al.,
2012; Tang et al., 2011). The human studies have generally corroborated the animal study
findings.

The rapid development of VIDD in animals and humans implies rapid changes in diaphragm
gene expression. We, and others have shown that cardio-thoracic surgeries lasting 2 to 6
hours lead to gene expression changes compatible with the early stages of VIDD
development (Huang et al., 2011; Welvaart et al., 2011a).

The first study examining the effects of MV on the human diaphragm muscle fiber CSA was
published in 1988 (Knisely et al., 1988). Diaphragm samples from infants who were
ventilated for 12 or more days before death were contrasted with samples from infants
ventilated for less than 8 days before death. The results demonstrated reductions diaphragm
muscle fiber CSA in the children ventilated for longer periods of time. Curiously, 20 years
would pass before another study examining the effects of MV on human diaphragm muscle
fiber CSA was published.

Interest in the effects of MV on the human diaphragm was reawakened in 2008 by Levine’s
study documenting the rapid development of profound atrophy. In this study diaphragm
muscle fiber CSA in a group of healthy subjects undergoing resection of lung tumors
requiring only a few hours of MV during surgery was contrasted to a group of brain dead
organ donors who had received controlled MV for an average of approximately 39 hours
(Levine et al., 2008) before tissue sampling. The slow and fast fiber CSA was approximately
55% smaller in the organ donor cases compared with the control cases. The rapidity of the
diaphragm CSA losses was predicted by the work completed in rodents by DeRuisseau et al,
who reported that diaphragm muscle fibers atrophied approximately eight times faster than
limb muscle during periods of MV support (DeRuisseau et al., 2005). A possible
explanation for the different rates of atrophy in the diaphragm and limb skeletal muscle may
be found in their duty cycles. Controlled MV imposes a complete cessation of activity in the
diaphragm, while it is accustomed to continuous activity with a duty cycle of ~30% and
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rapid atrophy ensues after MV support is started. Limb muscle may be more resistant to
inactivity-induced atrophy because of its intermittent activity pattern and lower duty (~5%).

Some investigators have examined the effect of MV support on human diaphragm
physiological function with single muscle fiber and transdiaphragmatic pressure techniques.
Welvaart measured single fiber contractile properties in the human diaphragm following two
hours of surgery with MV support and reported a 35% reduction in diaphragm fiber force
production (Welvaart et al., 2011b). Using repeated bilateral magnetic stimulation of the
phrenic nerves and transdiaphragmatic pressure measurements, Hermans studied the natural
history of diaphragmatic strength changes in 7 long-term respiratory failure patients
receiving MV (Hermans et al., 2010). (Fig 2) This novel work demonstrated that the
diaphragm pressure generating capacity decreased rapidly in the first 5 – 7 days of MV
support, and then the rate of pressure loss slowly decreased. Jaber et al recorded serial
measures of twitch tracheal airway pressure in a group of patients receiving MV (Jaber et
al., 2011b). Over the course of one week of MV support, a 32% reduction in twitch tracheal
airway pressure was observed. Further evidence of the rapidity with which MV can induce
atrophy in the human diaphragm was presented by Grosu who studied the effects of 1 week
of MV support on diaphragm thickness with sonography and reported a decrease in
diaphragm thickness of 6% per day (Grosu et al., 2012). From a clinical viewpoint, the rapid
decline in diaphragm strength observed in the first seven days of MV support is important,
because medical lability often initially renders ICU patients unable to participate in
volitional training or rehabilitation activities that might maintain diaphragm strength.

5.1 Prevention Strategies: Pharmacological
A single large randomized control trial showed that antioxidant supplementation (alpha-
tocopherol and ascorbic acid) in the peri-operative period reduced the incidence of PPC and
MV and ICU days in trauma surgery patients (Nathens et al., 2002). More work examining
pharmacological means of preventing or treating VIDD in humans is needed.

6. Effects of respiratory muscle activity/rehabilitation on diaphragm
function and weaning outcome in humans
6.1 Respiratory Muscle training prior to MV

Pre-operative specific inspiratory muscle training (IMT) has been shown to reduce post-
operative diaphragm weakness and enhance clinical outcomes. Hulzebos et al examined the
effect of pre-operative IMT on PPC in a randomized control trial (Hulzebos et al., 2006a).
279 patients at high risk for PPC following coronary artery bypass surgery were randomly
allocated to control and IMT groups. Patients performed IMT for 2 weeks prior to surgery
(30% of maximal inspiratory pressure for 20 minutes daily) and the incidence of PPC and
duration of hospitalization were examined. The IMT group had a lower incidence of PPC
and shorter hospital stays. Pre-operative IMT has also been effective for patients with
pulmonary co-morbidities who undergo cardiac, vascular and abdominal surgeries. Training
was associated with gains in pre-operative inspiratory strength up to 25% (Hulzebos et al.,
2006a; Nomori et al., 1994; Weiner et al., 1998), significant decreases in the rate of PPCs,
and faster post-operative weaning (Hulzebos et al., 2006b; Weiner et al., 1998). While
thoraco-abdominal surgeries can acutely reduce maximal inspiratory pressure generation up
to 50% (Chetta et al., 2006), pre-operative IMT appears to attenuate this loss of strength
(Kulkarni et al., 2010). Notably, pre-operative relaxation exercises or incentive spirometry
alone do not significantly improve strength and length-of-stay (Hulzebos et al., 2006a;
Kulkarni et al., 2010), suggesting specific IMT may induce direct neuromuscular
remodeling. More work is needed to characterize the potential benefits of pre-surgical
conditioning on the remodeling of the respiratory muscles.
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6.2 Inspiratory muscle training during MV
Several authors have examined functional changes in the human diaphragm following MV.
Ayas published a case study on the effect of hemidiaphragm stimulation in a patient with a
high cervical spinal cord injury who was ventilated with bilateral phrenic pacemakers, and
one of the pacing wire sites became infected requiring resumption of full time MV support
(Ayas et al., 1999). Pacing was stopped and the patient was maintained on standard MV for
eight months before resuming bilateral phrenic pacing. The remaining functional phrenic
nerve pacer was used 30 minutes/day and before resumption of bilateral, full-time phrenic
pacing, the thickness (via ultrasound) and inspiratory function of both hemidiaphragms were
studied. The hemidiaphragm that was paced daily over eight months did not atrophy and was
able to generate the same tidal volume observed before initiating fulltime MV support. After
eight months of inactivity, the un-paced hemidiaphragm’s thickness decreased by
approximately 50% and it could generate only 35% of the inspired tidal volume it did before
stopping routine pacing.

Since the diaphragm and accessory respiratory muscles appear susceptible to atrophy and
hypertrophy with changes in activation and loading, IMT is a biologically plausible
treatment for FTW patients. Several authors have published case studies documenting the
use of various IMT activities to improve muscle performance and reported weaning
outcomes. One of the first studies to successfully use IMT in FTW patients used isocapnic
hypernea as a training mode (Belman, 1981). The regime was impractical for clinical use,
due to the complex equipment required to maintain a stable end tidal CO2 pressure, but these
results helped to establish that FTW patients could tolerate short bouts of IMT. Other
investigators followed the rationale for specific, voluntary exercises with uncontrolled case
reports. They found that patients tolerated IMT, and many patients who had previously
failed to wean were liberated from MV (Aldrich and Karpel, 1985; Aldrich and Uhrlass,
1987; Tan et al., 1992). Some of these studies used inspiratory resistance devices placed on
the end of the endotracheal or tracheal tubes to provide the training stimulus and training
was typically conducted for 10 – 15 minutes, twice a day with uncontrolled airflows and
breathing frequencies (Aldrich and Karpel, 1985; Aldrich et al., 1989).

From a muscle rehabilitation standpoint, the use of a resistive device with uncontrolled flow
rates to impose a strength training load on the inspiratory muscles has several problems
(Reid and Samrai, 1995). First, the pressure generated across a resistive load is proportional
to the inspiratory airflow. Inspiring with a slower flow therefore requires less pressure
generation by the inspiratory muscles. In practice, some patients learn to adopt low
inspiratory flow rates to reduce the inspiratory work associated with resistive-loading and
reduce their perceived effort (Jederlinic et al., 1984). While the patients may feel more
comfortable with reduced inspiratory airflows and pressure, the lowered muscle tension
needed to generate low flow reduces the muscle strength-training stimulus. Additionally, the
use of two 15-minute training bouts with uncontrolled breathing frequencies means that the
patients were completing endurance training bouts rather than strength training bouts.

Many of the problems with using resistive training devices were alleviated with the
introduction of spring-loaded threshold devices adapted for IMT. An inspiratory threshold
valve requires the patient to generate sufficient inspiratory pressure to compress a spring,
open a poppet valve and allow inspiratory airflow. Threshold valves can be set to open at a
specific, repeatable pressures and generally do not present any resistive loading over the
inspiratory flow rates typically achieved by FTW patients (Gosselink et al., 1996).
Threshold inspiratory trainers provide a quantified, repeatable pressure overload to the
inspiratory muscles that is not dependent upon the inspiratory flow. In the last 10 years,
several investigators have used inspiratory threshold devices to train FTW patients and have
reported good results, which included improved inspiratory pressure generation and weaning
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from MV. Although the majority of these studies were uncontrolled case reports (Bissett et
al., 2012; Chang et al., 2005; Martin et al., 2002) (Sprague and Hopkins, 2003), they offered
proof-of-concept that specific inspiratory muscle strength training (IMST) is feasible, safe
and could improve the inspiratory muscle strength.

In a recent controlled trial, our group examined the effectiveness of IMST on weaning
outcome in long-term FTW patients (Martin et al., 2011). In this study, patients had been
supported by MV for an average of 6.5 weeks and had failed multiple weaning attempts with
usual clinical care. Patients were randomly allocated to Usual care/SHAM training and an
IMST group used threshold-training devices with a high pressure, low repetition training
program (4 sets of 6–10 inspiratory efforts daily, 5 days/week at the maximal pressure
tolerated). After approximately 2 weeks of treatment, the IMST group improved maximal
inspiratory pressure measured at the tracheal tube by approximately 35%, and 71% of the
IMST patients were weaned. The Usual care group’s maximal inspiratory pressure increased
6% and 47% of the usual care subjects were weaned. The differences in maximal inspiratory
pressure and weaning outcome between the IMST and Usual care groups were significant, P
<0.05.

In a randomized trial, Cader and coworkers examined the effects of IMST on elderly FTW
patients and found that training increased maximal inspiratory pressure, led to a slower,
larger tidal volume breathing pattern during unsupported breathing trials and significantly
reduced the time to weaning (Cader et al., 2010).

While these randomized IMST trials are encouraging that a clinically practical IMST
program can improve inspiratory muscle strength and weaning outcome, the sample sizes
were small, and they were conducted at a single sites. Larger, multicenter trials are needed.

Not all researchers found training to be effective at improving maximal inspiratory pressure.
Caruso examined the effect of increasing the inspiratory pressure trigger on a ventilator as a
means of imposing a threshold pressure overload on the inspiratory muscles in ventilated
patients (Caruso et al., 2005). Training was conducted in a progressive manner for 5–30
minutes each day, with the ventilator pressure trigger set to 10–40% of the patient’s
maximal inspiratory pressure. The duration of the weaning period was contrasted with usual
care patients. The training regimen did not increase maximal inspiratory pressure or
decrease the duration of MV support. Since the patients received full MV assistance after
reaching the ventilator’s trigger pressure, it is possible that a more sustained muscle
contraction is required to induce diaphragm plasticity.

An additional consideration for the clinical use of IMST in FTW patients is the potential for
inducing damage in muscle that may have undergone ultrastructural damage due to MV
support. Time-dependent myofibrillar damage has been reported in the diaphragms of brain-
dead organ donors who had received controlled MV for 24 – 249 hours (Jaber et al., 2011b).
Some patients may be at higher risk, such as patients with pre-existing diaphragm
dysfunction due to COPD and dynamic hyperinflation (Ottenheijm et al., 2007). Orozco-
Levi showed that patients with COPD were more susceptible to diaphragm muscle damage
when they underwent high intensity inspiratory loads to task failure, but limited damage was
seen in age-matched control subjects (Orozco-Levi et al., 2001). These findings suggest that
patients who chronically operate with a diaphragm at a mechanical disadvantage may be
more susceptible to injury. Because of the risk of damaging already fragile muscle, good
clinical practice dictates that any rehabilitation effort to improve diaphragm strength in FTW
patients should start at low pressures and gradually increase as the muscle adapts to training.
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7. Summary
MV is one of the most important treatment modalities in intensive care, and recent advances
have improved the interaction between patient and the ventilator but MV support can lead to
VIDD and FTW in some patients. The number of patients experiencing FTW is rapidly
growing; these patients account for enormous medical costs and they have poor clinical
outcomes. Numerous animal studies have clearly shown the MV use rapidly leads to VIDD.
Animal studies have found that anti-oxidants and physical activity can block or attenuate
VIDD induced by short-term MV use. Limited human work examining VIDD has largely
corroborated the animal results, but more work investigating cellular and functional changes
in the human diaphragm following MV support and IMST are needed. Limited data
indicates that FTW patients benefit from specific IMST, leading to reduced MV time and
improved weaning rate, but these studies have used small sample sizes and were conducted
at single sites. Large, multicenter trials examining IMST against a routine protocolized
approach to weaning are needed.
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Highlights

Mechanical ventilation rapidly leads to diaphragm dysfunction in animals and
humans.

Failure to wean patients accumulate enormous healthcare costs.

The number of failure to wean patients is growing rapidly.

Diaphragm strength training may facilitate weaning from mechanical ventilation.
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Figure 1.
Effects of intermittent spontaneous breathing during controlled MV on diaphragm force –
frequency relationship. This figure demonstrates the effects of allowing spontaneous
breathing for five minutes out of every six hours on animals receiving controlled MV for 24
hours. The Control animals received no MV. The intermittent spontaneous breathing (ISB)
group maintained more diaphragm force than the animals receiving continuous MV, but
generated less force than the Control animals. Adapted with permission from Gayan-
Ramirez, 2005.
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Fig 2.
Relationship between duration of pressure support mechanical ventilation (PSV) and twitch
trans diaphragmatic pressure (Pdi) generation in ventilated patients. The greatest loss in Pdi
occurs in the first 5–7 days of MV and the rate of Pdi loss slows after about 7 days. Adapted
from Hermans, 2010.
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