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Abstract
Objective—This study examined the relationship between violence exposure and sexual risk-
taking among low-income, urban African American (AA) adolescent girls, considering overlap
among different types and characteristics of violence.

Methods—AA adolescent girls were originally recruited from outpatient mental health clinics
serving urban, mostly low-SES communities in Chicago, IL as part of a two-year longitudinal
investigation of HIV-risk behavior. A subsequent follow-up was completed to assess lifetime
history of trauma and violence exposure. The current study (N=177) included violence exposure
and sexual risk behavior reported at the most recent interview (ages 14-22). Multiple regression
was used to examine combined and unique contributions of different types, ages, settings, and
perpetrators or victims of violence to variance in sexual risk.

Results—More extensive violence exposure and cumulative exposure to different kinds of
violence were associated with overall unsafe sex, more partners, and inconsistent condom use. The
most significant unique predictors, accounting for overlap among different forms of violence,
were physical victimization, adolescent exposure, neighborhood violence, and violence involving
dating partners.

Conclusions—These findings put sexual risk in the context of broad traumatic experiences but
also suggest that the type and characteristics of violence exposure matter in terms of sexual health
outcomes. Violence exposure should be addressed in efforts to reduce STIs among low-income,
urban African American girls.

Keywords
violence exposure; sexual risk behavior; adolescents; African American girls

Correspondence concerning this article should be addressed to Helen W. Wilson, PhD, Department of Psychology, Rosalind Franklin
University of Medicine and Science, 3333 Green Bay Road, North Chicago, IL 60064; helen.wilson@rosalindfranklin.edu.

NIH Public Access
Author Manuscript
Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.

Published in final edited form as:
Psychol Violence. 2012 April ; 2(2): 194–207. doi:10.1037/a0027265.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Introduction
Violence exposure is a major public health concern that affects numerous children and
adolescents in the United States (Finkelhor, Turner, Ormrod, & Hamby, 2009) and
encompasses a range of experiences from physical or sexual assault to witnessed violence.
Violence can occur in homes, schools, and neighborhoods and can involve family, peers, or
other members of the community. African American (AA) youths growing up in low-
income, urban neighborhoods are at disproportionate risk for violence exposure (Foster et
al., 2007; Voisin, 2007) since these communities have the highest rates of crime and
violence (Berman, Silverman, & Kurtines, 2002; Osofsky, 1999). Violence exposure likely
affects girls and boys in different ways (Voisin & Neilands, 2010), but less attention has
been directed to the effects of violence on girls growing up in low-income, urban
communities despite converging rates of violent victimization among males and females
(Truman, 2011). This study examines the combined and unique contributions of different
types, ages, settings, and perpetrators or victims of violence exposure to sexual risk among
low-income, urban AA girls.

Sexual health may be one important way in which girls' development is impacted by
violence. Understanding this relationship among low-income AA girls is particularly crucial
since this population endures the greatest burden of sexual health consequences. Currently,
15-24 year-old AA females have the highest rates of Chlamydia and Gonorrhea reported in
the US (CDC, 2011), and a recent Centers for Disease Control and Prevention study found
that 44% of AA girls, compared to 20% of White and Mexican American girls, were
infected with a sexually transmitted infection (STI) (Forhan et al., 2009). AA girls are also
more likely than their White and Hispanic peers to report having sex and report earlier
sexual debut (Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, 2010). Like other health
disparities that affect minority women, disproportionate risk for STIs is likely rooted in
poverty and social disadvantage (LaVeist, Pollack, Thorpe, Feshahazion, & Gaskin, 2011;
Pearlin, Schieman, Fazio, & Meersman, 2005). However, greater elucidation of the context
and potential causes of sexual risk among young AA women is critical for addressing these
problems (Wingood & DiClemente, 1998).

Exposure to violence may be an important contextual factor related to unsafe sexual
behavior in low-income, urban AA adolescent girls. Numerous studies have found
relationships between sexual victimization and risky sexual behavior or STIs (Senn, Carey,
& Vanable, 2008). A growing body of research now links sexual risk to other forms of
violence exposure including childhood physical abuse and neglect, other kinds of physical
victimization, and violence witnessed in the community (e.g., Brady & Donenberg, 2006;
Voisin & Neilands, 2010; Wilson & Widom, 2008; Wyatt et al., 2002). However, most
research has focused on specific forms of violence, with sexual violence most often studied
in connection with sexual risk behavior.

Despite considerable evidence that different forms of violence often coexist and overlap,
little is known about their combined and unique effects or the characteristics of violence
most related to sexual risk (Margolin, Vickerman, Oliver, & Gordis, 2010). In the child
maltreatment literature, a few studies have investigated relationships between sexual risk
and different forms of abuse or neglect considering overlap among them, but findings have
been inconsistent. A study with a large sample of urban teens found that the combination of
childhood physical abuse, sexual abuse, and neglect (but not any specific form of
maltreatment) was associated with a greater number of sexual partners (Arata,
Langhinrichsen-Rohling, Bowers, & O'Brien, 2007). In another study, physical abuse, but
not sexual abuse, reported by Native American women was associated with riskier sexual
partners (i.e., partners who used intravenous drugs, had other sexual partners, had been in
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prison, or had sex with men) and STIs (Hobfoll et al., 2002). By contrast, Senn and Carey
(2010) reported that only sexual abuse (not physical abuse, psychological abuse, or neglect)
was uniquely related to sexual risk among women recruited from a public STI clinic. Thus,
findings appear to differ greatly depending on the design, sample, and measures used. Some
research suggests that the cumulative effects of different forms of violence or adversity are
more important than any particular kind of experience in predicting psychosocial or health
outcomes (Felitti et al., 1998; Finkelhor, Ormrod, & Turner, 2009; Margolin et al., 2010).

Theoretically, exposure to violence of different forms could have similar developmental
consequences, such as sexual risk behavior. Within an ecological, developmental framework
(Cicchetti & Aber, 1998; Perrino, Gonzalez-Soldevilla, Pantin, & Szapocznik, 2000),
exposure to violence of any kind may result in a cascade of negative effects across multiple
domains of physiological, psychological, and social development. These broad
developmental effects may increase vulnerability to risky sexual behavior in adolescence.
Biologically, repetitive activation of the physiological stress response system appears to
have a broad adverse impact on neurological development (De Bellis, 2001; Ulrich-Lai &
Herman, 2009), impeding capacities related to stress response and coping, managing
emotional arousal, planning, and decision-making. On the one hand, exposure during early
childhood may have the most profound impact considering the vast brain development that
occurs before age 6 (De Bellis, 2001). However, adolescence appears to be a period of
particular sensitivity to stress and to the effects of earlier stressors (Lupien, McEwen,
Gunnar, & Heim, 2009). Exposure to violence in any form, particularly if it is chronic or
repetitive, may be experienced similarly in regard to physiological response and lasting
neurobiological effects, since similar processes are activated in response to diverse kinds of
environmental threats and stressors (De Bellis, 2001; Ulrich-Lai & Herman, 2009).

Likewise, various forms of violence exposure can have similar psychosocial effects due to
their disruption of basic developmental processes (Margolin & Gordis, 2000). Voisin (2011)
describes an ecological conceptual framework through which community violence exposure
disrupts development in school, peer, and mental health contexts, leading to sexual risk.
Violence exposure is associated with numerous mental health problems in youths, including
internalizing symptoms such as depression and anxiety and externalizing symptoms such as
delinquency (Berman et al., 2002; Margolin & Gordis, 2000; Osofsky, 1999). These same
kinds of mental health problems increase sexual risk behavior (Brown, 1997; Donenberg &
Pao, 2004). Given the emotionally charged nature of sexual situations, risky behaviors may
result from impaired emotional regulation (Ehrensaft et al., 2003; Kim, Pears, Capaldi, &
Owen, 2009), or they may develop as part of a general pattern of delinquent behavior
(Capaldi, 2002; Wolfe, Jaffe, & Crooks, 2006). Violence can also impact parenting and
family relationships, since a primary caretaker may be the abuser, may not be able to protect
the child from the perpetrator, or may also be affected by domestic or community violence
(Osofsky, 1999; Voisin et al., 2011). Furthermore, exposure to violence may exacerbate the
power inequity already experienced by girls in romantic and sexual relationships (Wingood
& DiClemente, 1998, 2000) because of its impact on self-efficacy and sense of control
(Margolin & Gordis, 2000), as well as the direct connection between partner violence and
unwanted or unprotected sex (Wingood & DiClemente, 1998). Outcomes of violence
exposure may differ depending on the setting or relationship of the person involved
(Margolin et al., 2010). Theoretically, violence that is more proximal (e.g., in a child's
home) and that involves parents or other close individuals may have the greatest impact
(Margolin & Gordis, 2000; Osofsky, 1999). However, it is unclear how characteristics such
as the setting or relationship to the perpetrator or victim relate to sexual risk. Because of its
profound impact across multiple aspects of development, violence exposure of various
forms may place girls at a significant disadvantage in negotiating sexual situations and
practicing healthy sexual behavior.
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The goal of the current study was to examine the contribution of different types, ages,
settings, and perpetrators or victims of violence exposure to sexual risk among low-income,
urban AA girls. Our primary hypotheses were that (1) violence exposure in general would be
associated with greater sexual risk; (2) this relationship would persist across different types
(physical victimization, sexual victimization, and witnessing violence), ages (child or
adolescent), settings (home, neighborhood, and school), and perpetrators or victims (parents,
other family members, peers, dating partners, or other community members) of violence;
and (3) cumulative exposure to specific types of violence would be associated with
increased sexual risk. We examined both unique and combined contributions of different
types and characteristics of violence as correlates of three different indicators of sexual risk.

Methods
Design and Participants

Participants (N=177) were adolescent girls drawn from the sample of a previous longitudinal
study of HIV-risk behavior. AA girls ages 12-16 years old were originally recruited from
eight outpatient mental health clinics, serving urban, mostly low-SES communities in
Chicago. Clinic staff invited eligible families to participate in the study when they initially
contacted the clinic for treatment. A total of 266 participants completed the baseline
interview, and at each of five waves of data collection, between 75% and 82% of the
baseline sample was retained. Participants varied greatly in the in type and severity of
mental health problems and extent of treatment received at baseline. Based on self reports on
the Computerized NIMH Diagnostic Interview Schedule for children (CDISC 4.0) at
baseline (Shaffer, Fisher, Lucas, Dulcan, & Schwabstone, 2000), 5% met DSM-IV criteria
for PTSD in the past year, 4% for major depressive disorder (MDD), and 11% for conduct
disorder (CD). Caregiver report on the CDISC 4.0 indicated 3% PTSD, 8% MDD, 13% CD,
and 10% ADHD.

During 2009-2010, participants who completed the baseline and at least one follow-up were
asked to return for a new study. Of eligible participants, 178 (74%) were enrolled, but one
case was dropped due to lack of comprehension and inconsistent responding. Eligible
participants who were not enrolled either refused (3%) or were lost because they could not
be located, did not respond to contact attempts, or moved out of the state (23%). On average,
3.27 years passed since baseline and 1.14 years since Wave 5 of the initial study. Mean age
was 17.72 years (SD = 1.65; range = 14.25 – 22.67). At this follow-up, girls completed a
comprehensive assessment of lifetime trauma and victimization history and reported sexual
risk behavior over the past 6 months. The analyses reported here included data from these
most recent interviews with the adolescent girls, which were completed in private with
trained interviewers. All procedures were approved by the Institutional Review Boards at the
University of Illinois at Chicago and Rosalind Franklin University of Medicine and Science.
Written, informed parental consent and adolescent assent or consent (ages 18 or over) was
obtained for all participants.

Measures
Lifetime Victimization and Trauma History (LTVH)—Adolescent girls completed the
LTVH (Widom, Dutton, Czaja, & Dumont, 2005), a 30-item gated instrument that assesses
lifetime trauma and victimization history through a structured in-person interview.
Questions refer to “scary and upsetting things” that happen to people “at home, in their
neighborhood, or someplace else” and cover seven categories of experiences (general
traumas, physical assault/abuse, sexual assault/abuse, family/friend murdered or suicide,
witnessed trauma to someone else, crime victimization, and kidnapped or stalked). For each
item, participants are first asked if they ever had the experience (e.g., “Has anyone ever shot
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at you, stabbed you, hit you, kicked you, beaten you, punched you, slapped you around, or
hurt your body in some other way?”). For positively endorsed items, follow-up questions
include the ages at which the event first and last occurred, the number of times it happened,
and relationship of the perpetrator or victim. In the current study, an additional question was
added to indicate whether the event occurred at home, in the neighborhood, or at school.
Participants can report up to four events corresponding to each item. The interview lasts
approximately 30-45 minutes depending on how many items and events are endorsed. The
LTVH was originally developed with a diverse sample of adults (49% female; 35% Black)
who tended toward lower income and education levels, and the measure demonstrated
validity related to other self-reports and documented cases of child abuse (Widom et al.,
2005). The youth version was modified by the author of the measure for youth ages 10 to 17
through pilot testing and language modifications.

Data from this measure were used to calculate the total number of violent events reported,
and separate variables reflecting the type of violence (physical victimizations, sexual
victimizations, witnessed violence); age of violence (childhood events, adolescent events);
setting of violence (home, school, neighborhood); and perpetrator of physical or sexual
victimization or victim of witnessed violence (parents, other family members, peers, dating
partners, other community members including strangers). Sexual victimizations included
attempted assaults and unwanted touching as well as forced sex. The variables for sexual
victimization and home violence exposure were coded as no exposure (0), single event (1),
and multiple events (2) due to few reports of more than 2 events. For violence involving
parents and dating partners, dichotomized variables reflecting presence (1) or absence (0)
were used since base rates of these experiences were relatively low. Other variables
reflected a total count of the number of events reported. Following the procedures used by
Widom et al. (2005), an event could refer to multiple incidents with the same perpetrator (in
the case of victimization) or victim (in the case of witnessed violence). The total number of
incidents could not be reliably calculated since in cases of ongoing or chronic experiences,
participants often could not give a number or reported “too many to count.” These variables,
therefore, represent the extent of violence experienced but not a count of all instances of
victimization. To examine cumulative violence exposure, events were categorized into 15
specific kinds of violence exposure, reflecting the type (physical, sexual, or witnessed) and
perpetrator or victim (parent or parental figure, other family member, peer, dating partner, or
other community member). One point was given for each specific category of violence
reported, and points were summed into a cumulative score.

AIDS-Risk Behavior Assessment (ARBA)—Risky sexual behavior was assessed with
the ARBA, a computer-assisted structured interview designed specifically for use with teens
to assess sexual behavior, drug use, and needle use (Donenberg, Emerson, Bryant, Wilson,
& Weber-Shifrin, 2001). The ARBA was derived from several well-established measures
(see Donenberg et al, 2001) and assesses alcohol and drug use (e.g., lifetime use, method of
use, frequency), needle use (e.g., sharing, tattooing, piercing), and sexual behavior (e.g.,
lifetime sexual intercourse, frequency, contraceptive use, high-risk sexual behavior).
Separate sets of questions are asked about oral, anal, and vaginal sex with clear definitions
of these behaviors (e.g., “by vaginal sex, we mean has anyone put his penis into your
vagina/private part?”). The ARBA takes 10-20 minutes to complete and assesses behavior
over the past 6 months.

Information from the ARBA was used to create three separate variables reflecting sexual
risk. Based on an index created by CDC researchers from rankings of sexual practices by
experts in sexual behavior (Kotchick, Dorsey, Miller, & Forehand, 1999), we computed an
unsafe sex scale reflecting no sexual activity (0); sex with one partner and always used
condoms (1); sex with multiple partners and always used condoms (2); sex with one partner
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and inconsistent condom use (3); or sex with multiple partners and inconsistent condom use
(4). Number of partners was calculated from two items asking about male and female
partners in the past 6 months (“How many male/female sex partners have you had in the past
6 months?”) considering vaginal, oral, and anal sex. Condom use inconsistency during
vaginal sex in the past 6 months (0 = no vaginal sex; 1 = always used condoms; 2 = more
than half the time; 3 = half the time; 4 = some of the time; 5 = never used condoms) was
derived from responses to the question, “Of the times you had vaginal sex in the past 6
months, how often did you or your partner use condoms/latex protection?” rated on a 5-point
likert-type scale. Only condom use during vaginal sex was included since vaginal sex was
most commonly reported, and separate items asked about condom use during oral or anal
sex. Due to a technical instrumentation error, ARBA data for 6 participants was lost, and
thus analyses with sexual risk outcomes include only 171 participants.

Results
Descriptive characteristics and bivariate relationships—Descriptive statistics for
age and violence exposure variables and their bivariate correlations with the sexual risk
variables (Pearson product-moment in the case of continuous variables and point-biserial in
cases involving binary variables) are reported in Table 1. The majority of the sample
(91.0%) reported exposure to at least one violent event (56.5% physical; 21.5% sexual;
84.2% witnessed), and participants reported an average of four violent events (each of which
could include multiple instances involving a given perpetrator or victim). Of the 161
participants reporting exposure to violence, 65 (40.4%) reported exposure to only one form
of violence (11 physical only, 1 sexual only, and 53 witnessed only), and 96 (59.6%)
reported exposure to multiple forms (59 physical and witnessed, 7 sexual and witnessed, and
30 all three forms). Notably, all but one participant reporting sexual violence also reported
witnessed violence. A larger percentage of participants reported experiencing violence
during adolescence (88.1%) than during childhood (43.5%), and a greater percentage
reported experiencing violence in their neighborhood (67.8%) than in their school (41.2%)
or at home (23.2%). Peers were most often reported as the victim or perpetrator involved in
violence (74.0%), and parents were least commonly reported (14.1%). Adolescent age was
significantly associated with unsafe sex, number of partners, and inconsistent condom use
and therefore was statistically controlled in subsequent analyses. As predicted, violence in
general and nearly all types and characteristics of violence exposure were significantly and
positively correlated with the unsafe sex scale, number of partners, and inconsistent condom
use. As the only exceptions, violence exposure at school was not significantly correlated
with any of sexual risk behavior outcomes, childhood violence exposure was not
significantly correlated with number of partners, and violence involving parents was not
significantly correlated with inconsistent condom use.

To investigate the possibility that some sexual experiences reported by the adolescents were
sexual victimizations, we reviewed cases in which girls reported sexual victimization within
a year of their current age (greater than the past 6 month time frame for reporting sexual
experiences). Two participants reported forced sex at their current age, and two reported
forced sex at their last age. By contrast, 93 (54%) reported sexual activity in the past six
months. Of the four women reporting sexual assaults, two reported 6 or 7 sexual partners
(and sexual assault from one individual), one reported a single partner, and one reported no
sexual activity.

Table 2 reports bivariate correlations among the violence exposure variables (Pearson
product-moment for continuous variables and point-biserial in cases involving binary
variables). In general, the different forms and contexts of violence were significantly
correlated, indicating that adolescents exposed to violence of one type were at risk for other

Wilson et al. Page 6

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



kinds of violence exposure. However, correlations among variables included in each
multiple regression model were low to moderate, suggesting some overlap but not excessive
multicollinearity. Thus, inclusion of these variables together in multiple regression models
was deemed appropriate. Correlations suggested that childhood violence was most strongly
associated with exposure in the home and involving parents or other family members, and
adolescent exposure was most strongly linked to violence in the community (school or
neighborhood) involving peers or other community members. Not surprisingly, home
violence was strongly associated with violence involving parents and other family members,
school violence was strongly associated with violence involving peers, and neighborhood
violence was strongly associated with violence involving other community members.

Overall relationship between violence exposure and sexual risk—Controlling for
age, the relationship between general violence and unsafe sex remained significant (β = .37,
p <.001). Greater extent of violence was also associated with number of partners (β = .22, p
<.01) and inconsistent condom use (β = .37, p <.001) when controlling for age.

Type of violence exposure—Hierarchical multiple regression analysis was conducted to
evaluate the combined and unique effects of physical violence, sexual violence, and
witnessed violence as independent variables, controlling for age. Separate models were
examined with the unsafe sex scale, number of partners, and inconsistent condom use as
dependent variables (see Table 3). Physical violence and witnessed violence demonstrated
unique statistically significant associations with unsafe sex; however, the contribution of
sexual violence was not significant. Physical violence was also uniquely significantly related
to number of partners; however, sexual violence and witnessed violence were not
significantly related to number of partners. Physical violence and sexual violence
demonstrated unique statistically significant associations with inconsistent condom use;
however, the contribution of witnessed violence was not significant. Including physical
violence, sexual violence, and witnessed violence in the models accounted for an additional
7.7% (number of partners) to 14.6% (condom use) of the variance in sexual risk outcomes
compared to models with age alone. Combined, the variables in the final model accounted
for 12.8% to 17.9% of the variance in sexual risk. Because a number of participants who
reported sexual abuse at a previous interview did not report sexual victimization here (8 of
18 girls who previously reported sexual abuse), we created a variable reflecting any sexual
victimization reported at either interview (a binary variable since the previous questions did
not ask about the number of events or perpetrators) and ran an additional multiple regression
model with this variable in place of the original sexual victimization variable. Results were
consistent with those reported above, except that the relationship between sexual
victimization and condom use inconsistency dropped in magnitude and to marginal
significance (β = .13, p <.10).

Age of violence exposure—As shown in Table 3, both childhood violence exposure and
adolescent violence exposure were significantly associated with unsafe sex in the
multivariate model. In the model with number of partners as the dependent variable, the
relationship with adolescent violence exposure, but not childhood violence exposure, was
significant. In the model for inconsistent condom use, the relationship with adolescent
violence exposure was significant, but the association with childhood violence exposure was
not. Including childhood violence exposure and adolescent violence exposure in the models
accounted for an additional 5.6% (number of partners) to 14.6% (condom use) of the
variance in sexual risk outcomes compared to models with age alone. Combined, the
variables in the final models accounted for 10.7% to 17.7% of the variance in sexual risk.
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Setting of violence exposure—In the multivariate model, neighborhood violence
exposure was significantly associated with unsafe sex; however, home violence exposure
and school violence exposure were not (see Table 3). Similarly, neighborhood violence
exposure was significantly associated with number of partners; however, home violence
exposure and school violence exposure were not. Neighborhood violence exposure and
school violence exposure were significantly associated with inconsistent condom use, while
home violence exposure was not. Including home violence exposure, neighborhood violence
exposure, and school violence exposure in the models accounted for an additional 5.8% to
15.7% of the variance in sexual risk compared to models with age alone. Combined, the
variables in the final models accounted for 10.9% to 20.3% of the variance in sexual risk.

Perpetrator or victim of violence exposure—In the multivariate analysis for overall
unsafe sex (see Table 3), violence involving dating partners was the strongest correlate. The
relationship with violence involving other community members was also statistically
significant, but no other perpetrator/victim variables were associated with unsafe sex. In the
model with number of partners, violence involving dating partners was the only significant
correlate. Similar to the model for unsafe sex, violence involving dating partners was most
strongly associated with condom use inconsistency, and violence involving other community
members demonstrated a small but statistically significant relationship. Including the
violence exposure variables in the models accounted for an additional 8.2% to 24.0% of the
variance in sexual risk compared to models with age alone. Combined, the variables in the
final models accounted for 13.3% to 28.5% of the variance in sexual risk.

Cumulative violence exposure—The number of specific kinds of violence reported by
participants ranged from 0 to 8, with witnessed violence against peers most frequently
reported (61.6%) and sexual violence from parents least frequently reported (3.4%).
Cumulative violence exposure was positively associated with the unsafe sex scale (r = .44, p
< .001), condom use inconsistency (r = . 42, p < .001), and number of partners (r = .30, p < .
001). As expected, sexual risk increased as the number of specific categories of violence
exposure increased. These relationships held when age was controlled in hierarchical linear
regression models with dependent variables of unsafe sex (β = .43, p < .001), number of
partners (β = .28, p < .001), and condom use inconsistency (β = .40, p < .001).

Discussion
Findings from this study demonstrate a connection between violence exposure and sexual
risk in a vulnerable population of AA girls from low-income urban neighborhoods.
Although nearly all of the girls in this sample reported some exposure to violence, more
extensive violence exposure and exposure to more kinds of violence were associated with
greater sexual risk. Whereas most research linking early trauma to sexual risk has focused
on sexual abuse, this study adds to a growing body of literature linking broader forms of
child and adolescent trauma to sexual risk. Cumulative exposure to a greater diversity of
violent events predicted sexual risk, consistent with other studies emphasizing the
significance of poly-victimization (Finkelhor, Ormrod et al., 2009) or the cumulative effects
of adversity (Felitti et al., 1998). These findings also support the concept of “stress
proliferation” whereby exposure to trauma in one form increases risk for later experience of
stress and trauma, contributing to health disparities observed in disadvantaged and minority
populations (Pearlin et al., 2005). That older girls reported more sexual risk was not
surprising given the age range of 14-22 in this sample and consistent evidence that age is not
only associated with greater likelihood of sexual activity but also with riskier sexual
behavior (Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, 2010; Kotchick, Shaffer, Miller, &
Forehand, 2001). However, violence was associated with sexual risk over and beyond the
effects of age and was in most case more strongly related.
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Our findings also suggest that the type and characteristics of violence exposure matter.
Although nearly all forms of violence were correlated with all indicators of sexual risk,
different patterns emerged when overlap among the different kinds of violence was taken
into account. Our findings are consistent with previous research indicating a stronger
connection between victimization and sexual risk among adolescent girls relative to
witnessing violence alone (Berenson, Wiemann, & McCombs, 2001). The one significant
connection between sexual victimization and sexual risk – related to inconsistent condom
use -- may be due to gender inequities in sexual relationships since in general girls have
limited control over condom use, and this power differential may be exacerbated for girls
with histories of sexual victimization (Wingood & DiClemente, 1998, 2000).

Results also emphasize neighborhood violence as an important predictor of sexual risk,
relative to exposure at home or at school. This finding may reflect the pervasive threat and
chronic stress associated with neighborhood violence, resulting in a greater impact on both
neurophysiological (De Bellis, 2001; Ulrich-Lai & Herman, 2009) and psychosocial
(Margolin & Gordis, 2000) aspects of development. Indeed, 35% of girls in the sample said
their neighborhood was like a war zone, and it is likely that reports of specific events
underestimate the actual extent of exposure or perceived threat considering that only the
most salient and memorable events would have been reported. Voisin (2011) describes the
far-reaching impact of community violence across developmental domains including school
success and engagement, psychological symptoms, and peer relationships, all of which bear
on sexual risk. Exposure to neighborhood violence may also reflect greater disadvantages in
other areas, such as poverty, neighborhood social capital, and limited access to health care
(Voisin et al., 2011).

By contrast, school violence was not strongly related to sexual risk and was even negatively
correlated with inconsistent condom use when overlap with other contexts of violence was
controlled. Less is known about the effects of school violence on health risk behaviors since
research that differentiates between family and community violence (Voisin, 2007) tends to
combine neighborhood and school exposure together. However, our findings are consistent
with other evidence that home, school, and neighborhood violence have unique patterns of
relationships with different mental health outcomes (Mrug & Windle, 2010). In our study,
participants reporting school violence included girls who were bullied and victimized by
peers, girls who were involved in fighting and violence themselves, and those who
witnessed violence between peers. Thus, null findings may have resulted because our
analyses could not tease apart the effects of these very different experiences.

The stronger link found between adolescent violence exposure, relative to childhood
exposure, and sexual risk may reflect particular vulnerabilities of adolescent development.
In general, childhood trauma has received greater attention in regard to developmental
outcomes and might be expected to have a greater impact on such outcomes. However, other
research examining the timing of trauma has found a stronger connection between
adolescent exposure and antisocial behavior (Thornberry, Ireland, & Smith, 2001) relative to
childhood exposure. The prefrontal cortex, an area of the brain impacted by exposure to
stress (De Bellis, 2001), is undergoing its most critical development and appears to be
particularly vulnerable to the effects of stress during adolescence (Lupien et al., 2009).
Prefrontal functions relate to effective response to stress, management of affective
stimulation, behavioral modulation and self-control, evaluating long-term consequences,
making decisions, and solving problems (De Bellis, 2001; Lupien et al., 2009). Deficits in
this aspect of neuropsychological development may, therefore, place girls at a significant
disadvantage in negotiating sexual situations.
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Another central focus of adolescent development involves the formation of romantic
relationships. Exposure to trauma during this period may interfere with healthy development
in these early relationships, thereby increasing risk for unsafe sex. That violence involving
dating partners was the strongest and most consistent predictor of sexual risk, relative to
other relational contexts, provides further support that these relationships play a key role in
linking violence to sexual risk. Low-income AA girls already face an inherent power
disadvantage in heterosexual relationships due to factors such as a sex-ratio imbalance, older
partners, and economic dependence on partners (Wingood & DiClemente, 2000). This
imbalance may be exacerbated by exposure to violence, which can make girls feel even
more powerless or increase the importance of romantic relationships for attaining status,
security, or material objects. Moreover, intimate partner violence is associated with
unprotected sex since women risk abuse if they refuse sex or insist upon condom use
(Wingood & DiClemente, 1998). Greater research attention is needed to examine
connections between violence and sexual risk in the context of romantic relationships.

As discussed in the introduction, a number of other mechanisms may help to explain the
links between violence exposure and sexual risk found here. Particularly given that the girls
in this sample were originally identified when they sought treatment at mental health clinics,
mental health symptoms associated with violence exposure may help to explain these
relationships (Margolin & Gordis, 2000; Voisin et al., 2011). In addition, although the
family context of violence exposure was not as a strongly correlated with sexual risk as
violence in the context of romantic relationships, the effects of violence on family
relationships may play an important indirect role by setting the stage for unhealthy peer and
romantic relationships (Wolfe et al., 2006). It is also possible that positive family
relationships serve a protective function against the effects of violence exposure (Margolin
& Gordis, 2000). These possible risk mechanisms and protective factors should be invested
in future research.

That sexual violence was not more strongly or consistently linked to sexual risk was a
surprising finding in this study. It is possible that the relationship between sexual abuse and
sexual risk is inflated when other overlapping experiences with violence are not taken into
consideration (Briere, 1992). In this sample, all but one of the girls who reported sexual
violence reported witnessed violence, and many also reported physical violence exposure.
Thus, the linkage with sexual risk may be largely accounted for by exposure to these other
forms of violence. In the context of other forms of violence, which are more prevalent and
may be more chronic and persistent in this group of girls, sexual victimization may convey
little unique risk. These findings put sexual risk behavior in the context of broader traumatic
effects on development (Margolin & Gordis, 2000; Voisin et al., 2011), rather than the
effects of abusive sexual experiences per se. However, the relationship between sexual
victimization and sexual risk in this population may be more complicated than captured by
the present cross-sectional analyses since a longitudinal pattern may exist. In addition, this
study did not evaluate a nonlinear relationship that may exist since sexual abuse can result in
avoidance of sexual interactions, rather than greater sexual risk, for some individuals (Noll,
Trickett, & Putnam, 2003). It does not appear that lack of significance for these relationships
was due to inadequate power since the magnitude of effects was very small. However, it is
important to consider that our results could be due to inconsistent or unreliable reports,
which may have obscured relationships that actually exist. Other research suggests that self
reports of childhood abuse are not always consistent across different time points or with
documented evidence (Widom & Czaja, in press).

A number of other important limitations must be considered in drawing conclusions from
this study. First, as noted above, the relatively small number of girls reporting some forms of
violence exposure limited our ability to examine more specific types of violence (e.g.,
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physical abuse from parents) as predictors. Examination of sensitive topics such as violence
exposure is always complicated and subject to numerous biases and recall errors,
particularly when self-reports are used (Widom & Czaja, in press). It is possible that in some
cases, reports of violence in this study are underestimates. For example, violence at home or
involving parents may have been underreported since girls were told during the consent
process that concerns about safety would be reported to authorities. Second, the cross-
sectional nature of this study precludes any assumptions of causality. The stronger findings
for adolescent, rather than childhood, exposure to violence may simply reflect the
correlational nature of the study design and reliance on retrospective self-reports. More
recent adolescent experiences may be more salient and memorable to respondents, and the
less robust association with childhood exposure could reflect underreporting or less reliable
reports. Girls who are engaged in more risky sexual behavior may also be more likely to be
in situations involving violence. Third, it is important to consider that some of the risky
sexual experiences reported may reflect abusive experiences themselves. Although the vast
majority of the girls reporting sexual experience did not report sexual violence during this
time period, this possibility cannot be entirely ruled out. Finally, unique characteristics of
this sample limit generalizability to other populations of teens. AA girls from low-income,
urban communities represent a population at disproportionate risk for both violence
exposure and the consequences of sexual risk, and therefore research is needed to
understand connections between these factors in this population of girls. However, it is
important to consider that research samples may not generalize to typical individuals in the
community. In this study, it is possible that the families who chose to participate and return
over six waves and approximately three years of data collection were less likely to be
affected by violence in their homes.

Clearly, violence exposure plays an important role in the development of sexual risk
behavior among urban AA girls, but the mechanisms underlying this relationship remain to
be clarified. Future studies are needed to examine potential moderators and mediators of the
relationship between various forms of violence exposure and sexual risk behavior among
AA girls. In addition, the temporal order of this relationship cannot be determined from the
present study. That childhood violence was associated with the overall risk scale provides
some evidence that violence exposure may precede the development of sexual risk, but
longitudinal research is needed to understand the nature of this relationship and how
violence exposure and sexual risk may relate over time. The overall pattern of findings in
this study suggests that in examining relationships between violence and sexual risk in low-
income, urban AA girls, it is important to use a multi-faceted assessment to account for the
complexity of relationships and overlap among different forms of violence. Moreover, our
findings highlight the importance of addressing violence exposure – particularly physical
victimization and particularly violence that occurs in the neighborhood and in the context of
romantic relationships – in efforts to prevent or reduce sexual risk among low-income, urban
African American girls.

Acknowledgments
This research was supported by funding from the National Institute of Mental Health (R03MH086361;
R01MH065155). We thank the mothers and daughters who participated in the study and gratefully acknowledge the
administrators and clinical staff at the outpatient mental health clinics who worked with us to identify eligible
families. We also thank Gloria Coleman, Bola Animashaun, Tiffany Brakefield, Neha Darji, Laura Pettineo, Paige
Saltzberg, and Mary Beth Tull for their invaluable assistance in recruiting families, conducting interviews, and
entering data. These data reflect self-reported behaviors that place girls at risk for sexually transmitted infections,
including HIV/AIDS, and may not represent girls' willingness to engage in the behavior.

Wilson et al. Page 11

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



References
Arata CM, Langhinrichsen-Rohling J, Bowers D, O'Brien N. Differential correlates of multi-type

maltreatment among urban youth. Child Abuse & Neglect. 2007; 31:393–415. [PubMed: 17412420]

Berenson AB, Wiemann CM, McCombs S. Exposure to violence and associated health-risk behaviors
among adolescent girls. Archives of Pediatric and Adolescent Medicine. 2001; 155:1238–1242.

Berman, SL.; Silverman, WK.; Kurtines, WM. The effects of community violence on children and
adolescents: Intervention and social policy. In: Bottoms, BL.; Kovera, MB.; McAuliff, BD., editors.
Children, social science, and the law. Cambridge, UK: Cambridge University Press; 2002. p.
301-321.

Brady SS, Donenberg GR. Mechanisms linking violence exposure to health risk behavior in
adolescence: Motivation to cope and sensation seeking. Journal of the American Academy of Child
and Adolescent Psychiatry. 2006; 45:673–680. [PubMed: 16721317]

Briere J. Methodological issues in the study of sexual abuse effects. Journal of Consulting and Clinical
Psychology. 1992; 60:196–203. [PubMed: 1592948]

Brown L. Adolescents with psychiatric disorders and the risk of HIV. Journal of the American
Academy of Child and Adolescent Psychiatry. 1997; 36:1609–1617. [PubMed: 9394948]

Capaldi DM. Heterosexual risk behaviors in at-risk young men from early adolescence to young
adulthood: Prevalence, prediction, and association with STD contraception. Developmental
Psychology. 2002; 38:394–406. [PubMed: 12005382]

Centers for Disease Control and Prevention. Youth Risk Behavior Surveillance -- United States, 2009.
MMWR. 2010; 59(SS-5)

Cicchetti D, Aber JL. Contextualism and developmental psychopathology. Development and
Psychopathology. 1998; 10:137–141. [PubMed: 9635218]

De Bellis MD. Developmental traumatology: The psychobiological development of maltreated
children and its implications for research, treatment, and policy. Development and
Psychopathology. 2001; 13:539–564. [PubMed: 11523847]

Donenberg GR, Emerson E, Bryant FB, Wilson H, Weber-Shifrin E. Understanding AIDS-risk
behavior among adolescents in psychiatric care: Links to psychopathology and peer relationships.
Journal of the American Academy of Child and Adolescent Psychiatry. 2001; 40:642–653.
[PubMed: 11392341]

Donenberg GR, Pao M. HIV/AIDS prevention and intervention: Youths and psychiatric illness.
Contemporary Psychiatry. 2004; 2:1–8.

Ehrensaft MK, Cohen P, Brown J, Smailes E, Chen H, Johnson JG. Intergenerational transmission of
partner violence: A 20-year prospective study. Journal of Consulting and Clinical Psychology.
2003; 71:741–753. [PubMed: 12924679]

Felitti VJ, Anda RF, Nordenberg D, Williamson DF, Spitz AM, Edwards V. Relationship of childhood
abuse and household dysfunction to many of the leading causes of death in adults: The adverse
childhood experiences (ACE) study. American Journal of Preventive Medicine. 1998; 14(4):245–
258. [PubMed: 9635069]

Finkelhor D, Ormrod RK, Turner HA. Lifetime assessment of poly-victimization in a national sample
of children and youth. Child Abuse & Neglect. 2009; 33:403–411. [PubMed: 19589596]

Finkelhor D, Turner HA, Ormrod RK, Hamby SL. Violence, abuse, and crime exposure in a national
sample of children and youth. Pediatrics. 2009; 124:1411–1423. [PubMed: 19805459]

Forhan SE, Gottlieb SL, Sternberg MR, Xu F, Datta SD, McQuillan GM. Prevalence of sexually
transmitted infections among female adolescents aged 14 to 19 in the United States. Pediatrics.
2009; 124:1505–1512. [PubMed: 19933728]

Foster, H.; Brooks-Gunn, J.; Martin, A.; Flannery, DJ.; Vazsonyi, AT.; Waldman, ID. The Cambridge
handbook of violent behavior and aggression. New York, NY, US: Cambridge University Press;
2007. Poverty/socioeconomic status and exposure to violence in the lives of children and
adolescents; p. 664-687.

Hobfoll S, Bansal A, Schurg R, Young S, Pierce CA, Hobfoll I. The impact of perceived child physical
and sexual abuse history on Native American women's psychological well-being and AIDS risk.
Journal of Consulting and Clinical Psychology. 2002; 70:252–257. [PubMed: 11860052]

Wilson et al. Page 12

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Kim HK, Pears KC, Capaldi DM, Owen LD. Emotional dysregulation in the intergenerational
transmission of romantic relationship conflict. Journal of Family Psychology. 2009; 23:585–595.
[PubMed: 19685993]

Kotchick BA, Dorsey S, Miller KS, Forehand R. Adolescent sexual risk-taking behavior in single-
parent ethnic minority families. Journal of Family Psychology. 1999; 13:92–102.

Kotchick BA, Shaffer A, Miller K, Forehand R. Adolescent sexual risk behavior: A multisystem
perspective. Clinical Psychology Review. 2001; 21:493–519. [PubMed: 11413865]

LaVeist T, Pollack K, Thorpe R, Feshahazion R, Gaskin D. Place, not race: Disparities dissipate In
Southwest Baltimore when Blacks And Whites live under similar conditions. Health Affairs. 2011;
30:1880–1887. [PubMed: 21976330]

Lupien SJ, McEwen BS, Gunnar MR, Heim C. Effects of stress throughout the lifespan on the brain,
behavior, and cognition. Nature. 2009; 10:434–445.

Margolin G, Gordis EB. The effects of family and community violence on children. Annual Review of
Psychology. 2000; 51:445–479.

Margolin G, Vickerman KA, Oliver PH, Gordis EB. Violence exposure in multiple interpersonal
domains: Cumulative and differential effects. Journal of Adolescent Health. 2010; 47:198–205.
[PubMed: 20638013]

Mrug S, Windle M. Prospective effects of violence exposure across multiple contexts on early
adolescents' internalizing and externalizing problems. Journal of Child Psychology and Psychiatry.
2010; 51:953–961. [PubMed: 20331489]

Noll JG, Trickett PK, Putnam FW. A prospective investigation of the impact of childhood sexual abuse
on the development of sexuality. Journal of Consulting and Clinical Psychology. 2003; 71:575–
586. [PubMed: 12795580]

Osofsky JD. The impact of violence on children. Domestic Violence and Children. 1999; 9(3):33–49.

Pearlin L, Schieman S, Fazio EM, Meersman SC. Stress, health, and the life course: Some conceptual
perspectives. Journal of Health and Social Behavior. 2005; 46:205–219. [PubMed: 16028458]

Perrino T, Gonzalez-Soldevilla A, Pantin H, Szapocznik J. The role of families in adolescent HIV
prevention: A review. Clinical Child and Family Psychology Review. 2000; 3:81–96. [PubMed:
11227063]

Senn TE, Carey MP. Child maltreatment and women's adult sexual risk behavior: Childhood sexual
abuse as a unique risk factor. Child Maltreatment. 2010; 15:324–335. [PubMed: 20930181]

Senn TE, Carey MP, Vanable PA. Childhood and adolescent sexual abuse and subsequent sexual risk
behavior: Evidence from controlled studies, methodological critique, and suggestions for research.
Clinical Psychology Review. 2008; 28:711–735. [PubMed: 18045760]

Shaffer D, Fisher P, Lucas CP, Dulcan MK, Schwabstone ME. NIMH Diagnostic Interview Schedule
for Children Version IV (NIMH DISC-IV): Description, difference from previous versions and
reliability of some common diagnoses. Journal of the American Academy of Child and Adolescent
Psychiatry. 2000; 39:28–38. [PubMed: 10638065]

Thornberry TP, Ireland TO, Smith CA. The importance of timing: The varying impact of childhood
and adolescent maltreatment on multiple problem outcomes. Development and Psychopathology.
2001; 13:957–979. [PubMed: 11771916]

Truman, JL. Criminal Victimization, 2010. Washington: Bureau of Justice Statistics, U.S. Department
of Justice; 2011.

Ulrich-Lai YM, Herman J. Neural regulation of endocrine and autonomic stress responses. Nature
Reviews Neuroscience. 2009; 10:397–409.

Voisin DR. The effects of family and community violence exposure among youth: Recommendations
for practice and policy. Journal of Social Work Education. 2007; 43:51–66.

Voisin DR, Jenkins EJ, Takahashi L. Toward a conceptual model linking community violence
exposure to HIV-related risk behaviors among adolescents: Directions for research. Journal of
Adolescent Health. 2011; 49:230–236. [PubMed: 21856513]

Voisin DR, Neilands TB. Community violence and health risk factors among adolescents among
adolescents on Chicago's Southside: Does gender matter? Journal of Adolescent Health. 2010;
46:600–602. [PubMed: 20472218]

Wilson et al. Page 13

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Widom, CS.; Czaja, SJ. Childhood trauma, psychopathology, and violence: Disentangling causes,
consequences, and correlates. In: Widom, CS., editor. Trauma, psychopathology, and violence:
Causes, correlates, or consequences?. New York: Oxford University Press; in press

Widom CS, Dutton MA, Czaja SJ, Dumont KA. Development and validation of a new instrument to
assess lifetime trauma and victimization history. Journal of Traumatic Stress. 2005; 18(5):519–
531. [PubMed: 16281250]

Wilson HW, Widom CS. An examination of risky sexual behavior and HIV among victims of child
abuse and neglect: A thirty-year follow-up. Health Psychology. 2008; 27:49–158.

Wingood GM, DiClemente RJ. Partner influences and gender-related factors associated with
noncondom use among young adult African American women. American Journal of Community
Psychology. 1998; 26:29–51. [PubMed: 9574497]

Wingood GM, DiClemente RJ. Application of the theory of gender and power to examine HIV-related
exposures, risk factors, and effective interventions for women. Health Education and Behavior.
2000; 27:539–565. [PubMed: 11009126]

Wolfe, DA.; Jaffe, PG.; Crooks, CV. Adolescent Risk Behaviors: Why Teens Experiment and
Strategies to Keep Them Safe. New Haven, CT: Yale University Press; 2006.

Wyatt GE, Myers HF, Williams JK, Kitchen CR, Loeb T, Carmona JV. Does a history of trauma
contribute to HIV risk for women of color? Implications for prevention and policy. American
Journal of Public Health. 2002; 92:660–665. [PubMed: 11919068]

Wilson et al. Page 14

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

Wilson et al. Page 15

Ta
bl

e 
1

D
es

cr
ip

ti
ve

 I
nf

or
m

at
io

n 
an

d 
C

or
re

la
ti

on
s 

be
tw

ee
n 

V
io

le
nc

e 
E

xp
os

ur
e 

an
d 

Se
xu

al
 R

is
k 

V
ar

ia
bl

es

C
or

re
la

ti
on

s 
w

it
h 

R
is

ky
 S

ex
 (

r)
 b

R
an

ge
M

 (
SD

) 
a

N
 (

%
)a

U
ns

af
e 

Se
x 

Sc
al

e
N

um
be

r 
of

 P
ar

tn
er

s
In

co
ns

is
te

nt
 C

on
do

m
 U

se

A
ge

14
-2

2
17

.7
2 

(1
.6

5)
.1

8*
*

.2
3*

*
.2

2*
*

A
ny

 V
io

le
nc

e 
E

xp
os

ur
e

0-
24

4.
03

 (
3.

68
)

16
1 

(9
1.

0)
.3

8*
**

.3
9*

**
.2

4*
*

T
yp

e 
of

 V
io

le
nc

e 
E

xp
os

ur
e

Ph
ys

ic
al

 v
io

le
nc

e
0-

7
1.

15
 (

1.
44

)
10

0 
(5

6.
5)

.3
3*

**
.2

6*
**

.3
2*

**

Se
xu

al
 v

io
le

nc
e

0-
2

0.
29

 (
0.

60
)

38
 (

21
.5

)
.2

0*
*

.1
8*

.1
8*

W
itn

es
se

d 
vi

ol
en

ce
0-

16
2.

55
 (

2.
56

)
14

9 
(8

4.
2)

.3
1*

**
.1

6*
.3

3*
**

A
ge

 o
f V

io
le

nc
e 

E
xp

os
ur

e

C
hi

ld
ho

od
0-

5
0.

72
 (

1.
03

)
77

 (
43

.5
)

.2
6*

**
.1

4
.2

2*
*

A
do

le
sc

en
t

0-
21

3.
18

 (
3.

05
)

15
6 

(8
8.

1)
.3

5*
**

.2
4*

**
.3

8*
**

Se
tt

in
g 

of
 V

io
le

nc
e 

E
xp

os
ur

e

H
om

e 
vi

ol
en

ce
0-

2
0.

33
 (

0.
64

)
41

 (
23

.2
)

.2
0*

*
.1

8*
.1

8*

N
ei

gh
bo

rh
oo

d 
vi

ol
en

ce
0-

11
1.

89
 (

2.
16

)
12

0 
(6

7.
8)

.3
3*

**
.2

1*
*

.3
7*

**

Sc
ho

ol
 v

io
le

nc
e

0-
6

0.
73

 (
1.

12
)

73
 (

41
.2

)
-.

05
-.

02
-.

06

P
er

pe
tr

at
or

 o
r 

V
ic

ti
m

Pa
re

nt
s

0-
1

0.
21

 (
0.

61
)

25
 (

14
.1

)
.2

0*
*

.2
0*

*
.0

9

O
th

er
 f

am
ily

 m
em

be
rs

0-
2

0.
44

 (
0.

61
)

66
 (

37
.3

)
.2

2*
*

.2
2*

*
.1

6*

Pe
er

s
0-

13
1.

80
 (

1.
97

)
13

1 
(7

4.
0)

.2
2*

*
.2

3*
*

.1
6*

D
at

in
g 

pa
rt

ne
rs

0-
1

0.
24

 (
0.

72
)

27
 (

15
.3

)
.4

2*
**

.4
1*

**
.2

5*
**

O
th

er
 c

om
m

un
ity

 m
em

be
rs

0-
8

1.
20

 (
1.

58
)

96
 (

54
.2

)
.3

1*
**

.3
2*

**
.1

6*

a B
as

ed
 o

n 
to

ta
l s

am
pl

e 
(n

 =
 1

77
).

b B
as

ed
 o

n 
pa

rt
ic

ip
an

ts
 w

ith
 d

at
a 

av
ai

la
bl

e 
on

 u
ns

af
e 

se
x,

 n
um

be
r 

of
 p

ar
tn

er
s,

 a
nd

 in
co

ns
is

te
nt

 c
on

do
m

 u
se

 (
n 

=
 1

71
).

* p 
≤ 

.0
5.

**
p 

≤ 
.0

1.

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.



N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

Wilson et al. Page 16
**

* p 
≤ 

.0
01

.

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.



N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

Wilson et al. Page 17

Ta
bl

e 
2

C
or

re
la

ti
on

s 
am

on
g 

D
if

fe
re

nt
 F

or
m

s 
of

 V
io

le
nc

e

P
hy

si
ca

l
Se

xu
al

W
it

ne
ss

ed
C

hi
ld

ho
od

A
do

le
sc

en
t

H
om

e
N

ei
gh

bo
rh

oo
d

Sc
ho

ol
P

ar
en

ts
O

th
er

 F
am

ily
P

ee
rs

D
at

in
g 

P
ar

tn
er

s

Ph
ys

ic
al

Se
xu

al
.2

8*
**

W
itn

es
se

d
.4

1*
**

.2
7*

**

C
hi

ld
ho

od
.4

7*
**

.4
3*

**
.4

3*
**

A
do

le
sc

en
t

.6
8*

**
.4

1*
**

.8
6*

**
.3

0*
**

H
om

e
.2

8*
**

.4
5*

**
.2

1*
*

.5
5*

**
.1

9*

N
ei

gh
bo

rh
oo

d
.5

7*
**

.4
1*

**
.6

9*
**

.4
4*

**
.7

8*
**

.2
2*

*

Sc
ho

ol
.4

5*
**

.1
9*

*
.4

7*
**

.2
5*

*
.5

2*
**

.0
7

.2
5*

*

Pa
re

nt
s

.2
2*

*
.2

7*
**

.2
4*

*
.4

1*
**

.1
6*

.6
0*

**
.1

3
.1

3

O
th

er
 f

am
ily

.3
3*

**
.3

3*
**

.3
4*

**
.5

0*
**

.3
3*

**
.5

3*
**

.3
2*

**
.1

3
.3

0*
**

Pe
er

s
.6

1*
**

.2
5*

**
.7

5*
**

.2
9*

**
.8

3*
**

.0
0

.5
6*

**
.6

1*
**

-.
02

.1
3

D
at

in
g 

pa
rt

ne
rs

.3
0*

**
.3

2*
**

.2
5*

*
.1

8*
.3

5*
**

.1
5*

.2
8*

**
.0

0
.0

5
.1

6*
.1

8*

O
th

er
 c

om
m

un
ity

.5
2*

**
.4

1*
**

.6
8*

**
.4

1*
**

.7
7*

**
.1

7*
.7

9*
**

.3
3*

**
.1

8*
.2

1*
*

.4
4*

**
.1

9*
*

* p 
≤ 

.0
5.

**
p 

≤ 
.0

1.

**
* p 

≤ 
.0

01
.

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.



N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

Wilson et al. Page 18

Ta
bl

e 
3

H
ie

ra
rc

hi
ca

l L
in

ea
r 

R
eg

re
ss

io
ns

 o
f 

V
io

le
nc

e 
E

xp
os

ur
e 

V
ar

ia
bl

es
 P

re
di

ct
in

g 
Se

xu
al

 R
is

k

U
ns

af
e 

Se
x 

Sc
al

e
N

um
be

r 
of

 P
ar

tn
er

s
In

co
ns

is
te

nt
 C

on
do

m
 U

se

F
Δ

 R
2

β
F

Δ
 R

2
β

F
Δ

 R
2

B

B
lo

ck
 1

5.
91

*
.0

3
9.

07
**

.0
5

8.
23

**
.0

5

 
A

ge
.1

8*
.2

3*
*

.2
2*

*

T
yp

e 
of

 V
io

le
nc

e 
E

xp
os

ur
e

B
lo

ck
 2

9.
04

**
*

.1
5

6.
10

**
*

.0
8

9.
84

**
*

.1
5

 
Ph

ys
ic

al
 V

io
le

nc
e

.2
4*

*
.2

3*
*

.2
2*

*

 
Se

xu
al

 V
io

le
nc

e
.0

7
.0

1
.2

1*
*

 
W

itn
es

se
d 

V
io

le
nc

e
.1

8*
.1

0
.0

5

A
ge

 o
f 

V
io

le
nc

e 
E

xp
os

ur
e

B
lo

ck
 2

11
.9

7*
**

.1
4

6.
69

**
*

.0
6

13
.1

9*
**

.1
5

 
C

hi
ld

ho
od

 E
xp

os
ur

e
.1

7*
.0

8
.1

2

 
A

do
le

sc
en

t E
xp

os
ur

e
.2

9*
**

.2
0*

*
.3

3*
**

Se
tt

in
g 

of
 V

io
le

nc
e 

E
xp

os
ur

e

B
lo

ck
 2

8.
24

**
*

.1
3

5.
07

**
.0

6
10

.5
7*

**
.1

6

 
H

om
e 

V
io

le
nc

e
.1

2
.1

1
.0

8

 
N

ei
gh

bo
rh

oo
d 

V
io

le
nc

e
.3

3*
**

.2
0*

.3
8*

**

 
Sc

ho
ol

 V
io

le
nc

e
-.

14
-.

08
-.

16
*

P
er

pe
tr

at
or

 o
r 

V
ic

ti
m

 o
f 

V
io

le
nc

e 
E

xp
os

ur
e

B
lo

ck
 2

10
.3

0*
**

.2
4

4.
19

**
*

.0
8

10
.8

7*
**

.2
4

V
io

le
nc

e 
in

vo
lv

in
g 

pa
re

nt
s

.1
1

.0
1

.1
0

V
io

le
nc

e 
in

vo
lv

in
g 

ot
he

r 
fa

m
ily

 m
em

be
rs

.0
8

.1
1

.0
9

V
io

le
nc

e 
in

vo
lv

in
g 

pe
er

s
.0

6
.0

8
.0

7

V
io

le
nc

e 
in

vo
lv

in
g 

da
tin

g 
pa

rt
ne

rs
.3

4*
**

.1
9*

*
.3

3*
**

V
io

le
nc

e 
in

vo
lv

in
g 

ot
he

r 
co

m
m

un
ity

 m
em

be
rs

.1
7*

.0
5

.1
8*

N
ot

e.
 N

 =
 1

71
. E

ac
h 

B
lo

ck
 2

 w
as

 te
st

ed
 in

 a
 s

ep
ar

at
e 

hi
er

ar
ch

ic
al

 li
ne

ar
 r

eg
re

ss
io

n.

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.



N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

Wilson et al. Page 19
* p 

<
 .0

5.

**
p 

<
 .0

1.

**
* p 

<
 .0

01
.

Psychol Violence. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2014 February 20.


