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Abstract
Background—U.S. Child Welfare systems are involved in the lives of millions of children, and
total spending exceeds $26 billion annually. Out-of-home foster care is a critical and expensive
Child Welfare service, a major component of which is the maintenance rate paid to support
housing and caring for a foster child. Maintenance rates vary widely across states and over time,
but reasons for this variation are not well understood. As evidence-based programs are
disseminated to state Child Welfare systems, it is important to understand what may be the
important drivers in the uptake of these practices including state spending on core system areas.

Data and methods—We assembled a unique, longitudinal, state-level panel dataset (1990–
2008) for all 50 states with annual data on foster care maintenance rates and measures of child
population in need, poverty, employment, urbanicity, proportion minority, political party control
of the state legislature and governorship, federal funding, and lawsuits involving state foster care
systems. All monetary values were expressed in per-capita terms and inflation adjusted to 2008
dollars. We used longitudinal panel regressions with robust standard errors and state and year
fixed effects to estimate the relationship between state foster care maintenance rates and the other
factors in our dataset, lagging all factors by one year to mitigate the possibility that maintenance
rates influenced their predictors. Exploratory analyses related maintenance rates to Child Welfare
outcomes.

Findings—State foster care maintenance rates have increased in nominal terms, but in many
states, have not kept pace with inflation, leading to lower real rates in 2008 compared to those in
1991 for 54% of states for 2 year-olds, 58% for 9 year-olds, and 65% for 16 year-olds. In
multivariate analyses including socioeconomic, demographic, and political factors, monthly foster
care maintenance rates declined $15 for each 1% increase in state unemployment and declined $40
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if a state's governorship and legislature became Republican, though significance was marginal. In
analyses also examining state revenue, federal funding, and legal challenges, maintenance rates
increased as the federal share of maximum TANF payments increased. However, >50% of
variation in foster care maintenance rates was explained by unobserved state-level factors as
measured by state fixed effects. These factors did not appear to be strongly related to 2008 Child
Welfare outcomes like foster care placement stability and maltreatment which were also not
correlated with foster care maintenance rates.

Conclusions—Despite being part of a social safety net, foster care maintenance rates have
declined in real terms since 1991 in many states, and there is no strong evidence that they increase
in response to harsher economic climates or to federal programs or legal reviews. State variation
in maintenance rates was not related to Child Welfare outcomes, though further analysis of this
important relationship is needed. Variability in state foster care maintenance rates appears highly
idiosyncratic, an important contextual factor to consider when designing and disseminating
evidence-based services.
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1. Introduction
U.S. Child Welfare systems serve millions of children with costs exceeding $26 billion
annually. Out-of-home care is one of the most important and expensive services provided. A
major component of the cost of this care is the maintenance rate paid to support housing and
caring for a child. Maintenance rates vary substantially across states and over time. Given
limited budgets, maintenance rate variation is likely to affect state Child Welfare agencies'
ability to recruit and retain foster parents and to implement efficacious programs to serve
these children. Factors affecting sustained funding for existing services like foster care
maintenance rates are also likely important contextual factors for sustaining the
implementation of new evidence-based programs (Aarons, Hurlburt, & Horwitz, 2011).

Why states differ so greatly in the foster care maintenance rates that they pay is unknown
and may depend on multiple factors suggested by economic and political theory. For
example, during economic downturns, reduced tax revenues may necessitate reductions in
spending (Alt & Lowry, 1994; Bohn & Inman, 1996; Poterba, 1994), including reductions in
foster care maintenance rates. Similarly, payment rates may fluctuate depending on the
political party in control in a state (Kousser, 2002). Targeted federal funding could increase
maintenance rates as could federal or judicial reviews that make future funding contingent
on target outcomes (Baicker, 2001; The Lewin Group, 2004). Past studies considering
Medicaid and Temporary Assistance for Needy Families (TANF) show that state social
service spending decisions are driven by a host of political and economic factors with more
generous spending linked to liberal political ideology or interest group pressure (Barrilleaux
& Miller, 1988; Grogan, 1994; Hanson, 1984; Jacoby & Schneider, 2001; Plotnick &
Winters, 1985). Research also shows that state spending is related to state capacity and
demand (Grannemann, 1980; Jacoby & Schneider, 2001; Plotnick & Winters, 1985). Given
that the same or similar institutions and actors are involved in setting policy for Child
Welfare programs, we hypothesize that many of the same mechanisms operate for Child
Welfare decisions. To our knowledge, this is the first study that examines what factors
influence Child Welfare spending nationally over time.

Understanding factors that drive changes in the maintenance rates that support housing and
care for these very vulnerable children is valuable for a number of reasons. First, it sheds
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light on how the systems respond to economic downturns such as the one beginning in 2008.
Second, given the importance of contextual factors in implementation theory, it is critical for
planning implementation of new evidence based programs within the existing foster care
system that require sustained state funding over multiple years (Goldhaber-Fiebert, Bailey,
et al., 2011; Goldhaber-Fiebert, Snowden, Wulczyn, Landsverk, & Horwitz, 2011).

This study was designed to examine three questions: 1) How have state foster care
maintenance rates changed over time? 2) Do sociodemographic, economic, political, state
revenue, federal funding, federal program, and legal challenges explain changes in foster
care maintenance rates from 1991 to 2008? 3) Given that differences in maintenance rates
may also represent differences in other state-level investments in Child Welfare that may
improve system quality, what is the relationship between higher foster care maintenance
rates and Child Welfare outcomes like greater foster care placement stability?
Understanding the factors that drive state spending is critical when considering major
investments in implementing evidence-based Child Welfare programs.

2. Materials and methods
We assessed key drivers of state foster care maintenance rates. We examined the extent to
which foster care spending increased counter-cyclically with indicators of economic
prosperity. Given that spending decisions occur in state political and budgetary climates, we
also assessed the influence of these factors on state foster care spending. Federal
governmental oversight as well as judicial recourse for foster care programs that do not
comply with regulatory and legal requirements can influence spending. While these factors
span a large range of reasons why state foster care maintenance rates might rise or fall over
time, we examined whether other, unmeasured factors were likely influential. Finally,
because service delivery across states is not standardized and because states may respond to
changes in these factors in ways other than increasing or decreasing foster care maintenance
rates, we assessed whether spending was correlated with Child Welfare outcomes measures
often related to system quality assessments.

2.1. Outcomes
The main outcomes were state-level monthly foster care maintenance rates for children ages
2, 9, and 16 for years between 1991 and 2008. The maintenance rates represent payments
from the state to a foster parent to cover the costs of food, clothing, shelter, daily
supervision, school supplies, a child's personal incidentals, and other similar expenses for a
month in accordance with Title IV-E of the Social Security Act. While mandated by federal
law, states have a great deal of discretion in administering foster care programs and in
augmenting set rates. Maintenance rates were derived from reports compiled by the federal
government that standardized data across states and over time (US House of Representatives
Ways & Means Committee [HWM], 1996, 1998, 2000, 2004, 2008), which we
supplemented with information from multi-state studies (National Association of Public
Child Welfare Administrators, 2007) to increase the number of state-years of observation.

In exploratory analyses examining the relationship of Child Welfare outcomes and state
foster care maintenance rates, we used metrics compiled by the U.S. Department of Health
and Human Services' Administration for Children and Families (Administration for Children
& Families [ACF], 2010a). Specifically the 2008 values for: 1) Rate of maltreatment
investigations per 1000 children under age 18; 2) percentage of children maltreated while in
foster care; 3) a composite measure of foster care placement stability (ACF, 2007) which
includes having <3 placements while in care for children who spend different total durations
in foster care; and 4) a composite measure of timeliness of reunification and exit from foster
care time from entry in the foster system until discharge and reunification with blood
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relatives for children who spend different total durations in foster care as well as the rate of
reentry into the foster care system for those children previously reunified. It is possible that
while not changing foster care maintenance rates, a state could augment funding to increase
its investigational capacity, provide additional supportive and oversight services that could
reduce maltreatment while in care and decrease the rates at which children move between
foster placements, or accelerate services designed to successfully reunify children with
blood relatives in more permanent non-foster care homes.

2.2. Predictors
2.2.1. State socioeconomic and demographic factors—The unemployment rate
represented the seasonally-adjusted percentage of working age adults seeking but unable to
find employment at the beginning of the year and was derived from state-year information
from the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics (Bureau of Labor Statistics [BLS], 2012a). The
percentage of children who were minority was defined as the number of non-white children
under the age of 18 in a given state-year divided by the total number of children under the
age of 18 in that state-year with information derived from the U.S. Bureau of the Census
(ProQuest Statistical Datasets [ProQuest], 2012). The poverty rate was defined as the
percentage of state population living below the poverty threshold as reported by the U.S.
Bureau of the Census based on its Current Population Survey's Annual Social and Economic
Supplement (United States Census Bureau [USCB], 2011a). The percentage of population
living in urban areas was interpolated from decennial estimates from the U.S. Bureau of the
Census (1980–2010) (USCB, 2012a), which largely matched yearly trends from the Current
Population Survey (USCB, 2011b) but yielded more stable estimates for smaller states due
to the larger sample size.

Theoretically, the state socioeconomic and demographic factors included in the analysis
have ambiguous net effects on state foster case maintenance rates. Indicators reflecting
greater poverty and higher unemployment represent periods that are often accompanied by
drops in tax revenues used to fund social services. Conversely, these same time periods also
represent larger demand for state services even as lower state tax revenues constrain the
price the state can or is willing to pay for services. Populations with higher degrees of
urbanicity again have ambiguous theoretical net effects on state foster care maintenance
rates. While, in cities, there may be a larger supply of foster beds within a reasonable
geographic area (i.e., lowering the foster care maintenance rate), the cost of living in cities
can be higher than in rural settings (i.e., increasing the foster care maintenance rate) (Kurre,
2003; McHugh, 1990). Finally, we hypothesized that having a higher percentage of minority
children could lower state foster care maintenance rates, even though minority children are
more likely to qualify for and receive foster services (ACF, 1994; Wulczyn & Lery, 2007),
because the services received may be of differentially lower quality (i.e., lowering foster
care maintenance rates) as observed in a variety of domains (e.g., public education, housing
and welfare spending) (Soss, Schram, Vartanian, & O'Brien, 2001).

2.2.2. State political climate—Republican controlled legislature indicated that all houses
of the state legislature had >50% of representatives who were Republican based on election-
year data derived from the U.S. Census Statistical Abstract and Book of the States (USCB,
2012a, 2012b). We included an indicator of whether a state's governor was Republican. In
election years, the indicator was coded according to the political party of the governor in
office at the beginning of the year (United States Council of State Governments, 2011). The
indicator of Republican control was defined as having both a Republican controlled
legislature and a Republican governor. In sensitivity analyses, we also explored the share of
total legislators who were Republican.
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We hypothesized that Republican legislatures, governors, and political control in a state
would lead to reduced state foster care maintenance rates. Since the 1970s, the Republican
Party has advocated smaller government, lower taxes, and reductions in public program
spending (Republican Party Platforms, 1972, 1980, 1992, 2000; Republican National
Committee, 2008). In exploratory analyses, we considered the extent of legislative control,
hypothesizing that legislatures with very high percentages of legislators from a single party
would perceive a greater public mandate for their party's positions and could afford to avoid
compromise with the other party, especially when governors were of the same party and
would be less likely to veto legislation.

2.2.3. State budgetary factors—State budgetary factors focus on three areas: 1) state
tax revenue; 2) state spending on programs to support poor families with children; 3) federal
subsidies for state spending on poor children with a focus on subsidies for state foster care
programs, expressing all monetary predictors in inflation-adjusted 2008 dollars (BLS,
2012b). Per-capita total state tax revenues represented all taxes the state collected in a given
year divided by the state's total population and were derived from the U.S. Census Annual
Survey of State Government Tax Collections and the US Census Bureau (USCB, 2012b).
We used measures that describe state spending on support for poor families with children
living with them involving the Temporary Assistance for Needy Families (TANF) program
and the Aid to Families with Dependent Children (AFDC) program which TANF replaced in
1996 (HR 3734, 1996). We include the average percentage of individuals in a state receiving
these payments in a calendar year derived from reports compiled by the U.S. Department of
Health and Human Services' Administration for Children and Families (HWM, 1996, 1998,
2000, 2004, 2008). We also included a state's Federal Medical Assistance Percentage
(FMAP) which determines the federal government's contributed proportion for state
spending on TANF benefits and other programs such as Medicaid and State Children's
Health Insurance Program (SCHIP) that focus on poorer children (United States Department
of Health & Services [HHS], 2012a). Specifically, we use the interaction of the FMAP with
the maximum TANF payment to assess the differential effect of federal subsidies for other
programs for poor families with children. We also included federal subsidies to state child
welfare programs under Title IV-B and IV-E of the Social Security Act, expressed in
inflation adjusted dollars per child in the state foster care system (ACF, 2010b; HWM, 2008;
OMB, 2002–2009). Of note, compared to Title IV-E, Title IV-B allocations represents a
smaller amount of money and specifically focuses on spending for services targeting family
preservation and reunification of foster children with their biological families.

We hypothesize that when states have more tax revenue per individual, spending on foster
care maintenance rates will increase. When programs are subsidized by the federal
government, spending on them will differentially increase, suggesting that higher per-capita
Title IV-B and Title IV-E levels should increase state foster care maintenance rates. Higher
TANF rates and higher FMAP rates may be linked to increased spending on foster care
maintenance rates as they may also indicate a greater emphasis on poor families and
children within the state's policy agenda which can be funded in years when budgets are less
tight. Recent reports also suggest that states may reallocate federal TANF funding to foster
care programs in years with budget deficits (DeParle, 2012).

2.2.4. Risks of federal or legal penalties—We included three main measures of audits
carrying penalties for states whose foster care systems did not meet federal mandates and
other legal requirements: 1)undergoing a Child and Family Services Review (CFSR); 2)
undergoing 1st and 2nd rounds of Title IV-E eligibility reviews; and 3) being subject to a
foster care class action lawsuit and resulting settlements. For each type of federal program
review, an indicator of whether a given review type had occurred in that state was used
(ACF, 2004; HHS, 2012b). For example, in Tennessee, the CFSR occurred in 2002 and the
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first and second Title IV-E reviews occurred in 2004 and 2006 respectively. Indicators for
each of these three reviews would be 0 prior to 2002, 2004, and 2006 and 1 for 3 years
thereafter, on the hypothesis that when the action occurred it had its biggest effect which
persisted for several years before declining; other lengths of time were explored in
sensitivity analyses. We included two indicators relating to class action lawsuits for non-
compliance with foster care regulatory and legislative requirements, whether a state had
experienced a class action lawsuit and whether that lawsuit had led to a judgment,
settlement, or consent decree in the court mandated payments, policy changes, or monitored
the state's foster care system (Child Welfare League of America, 2005; National Center for
Youth Law, 2010). Again, indicators of the year on and 3 years after which such lawsuits
and settlements occurred were used.

Because non-conformity with standards and quality measured by the CFSR reviews results
in states needing to implement Program Improvement Plans (PIP), we hypothesize that
CFSR reviews would lead to increased spending on state foster care maintenance rates.
Similarly, as repeated failures to achieve compliance with outcomes included in the Title
IV-E eligibility reviews can lead to reductions in federal monies received for the state's
program (i.e., larger disallowances), we hypothesized that repeated reviews would lead to
increased spending on state foster care maintenance rates to attract more and higher quality
foster homes (ACF, 2012). Alternatively, being audited to ensure that a state is claiming
only children who truly qualify for Title IV-E funds might force some share of foster
children off of the Title IV-E federal subsidy list, raising the burden on state funds for foster
care and reducing maintenance rates. Because class action lawsuits can be both expensive
and embarrassing to states, we hypothesize that both their existence as well as resulting
judgments against the state should increase state foster care maintenance rates in efforts to
improve the availability and quality of foster care placements.

2.3. Analytic methods
We characterized trends in state foster care maintenance rates and whether states increased
or decreased these rates over time, examining these trends in nominal and inflation adjusted
terms. We then estimated linear panel models, separately regressing state foster care
maintenance rates at age 2, 9, and 16 on the predictors listed above. We estimated univariate
and multivariate models. To examine the robustness of parameter estimates, we estimated
multivariate models in which categories of variables were added sequentially as blocks. For
example, first, we regressed our outcomes on all state socioeconomic and demographic
factors. Then, we regressed them on all state socioeconomic and demographic factors and
political climate variables. We continued in this way until the model included all state
socioeconomic and demographic factors, political climate variables, budgetary factors, and
risks of federal or legal penalties variables.

All models included state fixed effects to account for non-time-varying, unmeasured
differences between states that influenced state foster care maintenance rates. All models
also included year fixed effects to account for non-state varying, unmeasured differences
between years that influenced state foster care maintenance rates. After estimating the
models, we examined the extent to which the predictors explained variability in state foster
care maintenance rates and also the extent to which state and year fixed effects alone (i.e.,
unmeasured factors) explained the variability.

In exploratory analyses, we examined the correlation between Child Welfare outcomes and
state foster care maintenance rates as well as the correlation with estimated state fixed
effects. All models included robust standard errors clustered by state. Models did not weight
by state population since the level of decision-making that we considered was at the state
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government level, but variables were expressed in per-capita terms to ensure that values
from states with larger populations were comparable to those from smaller states.

We assessed the robustness of our findings in a number of ways. We examined alternate
specifications for political variables that captured not only whether a single political party
was in control of state government but also the extent of that control. We estimated models
with various lag lengths for predictors. We compared changes in coefficient estimates across
specifications, examining whether the same sign, magnitude, and statistical significance
were maintained. We assessed estimate instability due to multicollinearity by assessing the
condition index (Hendrickx, 2004). Even without substantial multicollinearity, to improve
the potential efficiency of regression estimates, we compared using year fixed effects versus
year trends and year quadratic terms, and also considered the appropriateness of employing
a random effects specification versus a state fixed effects specification based on the Sargan–
Hansen test of over-identifying restrictions (Hansen, 1982; Sargan, 1958). All analyses used
Stata version 11.2 (StataCorp, 2009).

3. Results
3.1. Trends in state foster care spending

Between 1991 and 2008, state maintenance rates increased, but these increases did not keep
pace with inflation in many states, leaving foster parents to provide care for foster children
with less real resources (Table 1 and Appendix Fig. 1). In unadjusted terms, over this period,
the national average foster care maintenance rate increased 50–60%. For example, the
average rate paid to support a 2 year-old in foster care was $293 in 1991 and $471 by 2008.
These large apparent increases occurred for all states (Fig. 1, Upper Panels). However, after
adjusting for inflation, the national average rate increased by only 1.6% for 2 year-olds and
actually declined by 0.3–3.7% for 9 and 16 year-olds. On a state-by-state basis, 54% of
states saw decreases in their inflation-adjusted foster care maintenance rates for 2 year-olds,
58% for 9 year-olds, and 65% for 16 year-olds (Fig. 1, lower panels).

Importantly, the magnitude of changes in foster care maintenance rates differed by state. The
following analyses examine how changes in state maintenance rates relate to trends in state-
level demographic, socioeconomic, and political factors and to trends in more state
budgetary, federal policy, and legal factors. All subsequent results are reported for inflation-
adjusted state foster care maintenance rates.

3.2. Trends in state demographic, socioeconomic, and political factors and their
relationship to foster care maintenance rates

Between 1991 and 2008, substantial changes occurred in terms of state demographic
profiles, economic climate, and political environment (Table 1 and Appendix Figs. 2–7).
States' socioeconomic indicators improved on average. State unemployment declined from
6.2% to 4.5%. Poverty rates declined from 13.7% to 12.5%. While these economic
indicators showed net improvement over this period, the lowest rates of unemployment and
poverty occurred in 2000 and have worsened since. Demographically, states have also
changed in important ways. The average proportion of states' populations living in urban
areas increased from 69% to 72%. The average proportion of states' children who were
minorities increased from 26% to 36%. With respect to both socioeconomic and
demographic indicators, states differ substantially from one another. For example, real
median household income declined in Arizona by 3.4% between 1991 and 2008 while it rose
by 41% in Utah and ranged from $30,785 in Mississippi in 1991 to over $72,423 in Alaska
in 1996. While the share of minority children remained nearly the same in Mississippi,
during the same period, it more than doubled in Maine, Vermont and New Hampshire. The
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state political landscape has also shifted dramatically. In 1991, 6% of states had both
Republican governors and legislatures and 41% had either a Republican governor or a
Republican legislature. With a rapid increase in total Republican control of state government
in the early 1990s, by 1997, partial or total Republican control of state governments had
increased to 77%. Though recently declining, in 2008 partial and total Republican control of
state government was still 33% and 18%, respectively, higher than 1991.

Univariate analyses show that foster care maintenance rates decreased in harsher economic
climates and increased in more favorable climates. State foster care maintenance rates for 2,
9, and 16 year-olds were consistently lower after years with higher unemployment, greater
proportions of children who were minorities, higher rates of poverty, and greater proportions
of the population living in urban areas. The relationship between foster care maintenance
rates and unemployment had a p-value below 0.05 for all ages, and the relationship with
poverty had a p-value below 0.05 for 16 year-olds and below 0.1 for 2 and 9 year-olds.
Foster care maintenance rates decreased when state governments were under Republican
control, though this effect was not present when Democrats and Republicans shared control
of state governments. Compared to years in which Democrats controlled the governorship
and state legislature, state foster care maintenance rates for 2, 9, and 16 year-olds were
consistently lower following years when state governments had both Republican governors
and Republican-controlled legislatures or years when state governments either had
Republican governors and Democrat-controlled legislatures or had Democratic governors
and Republican-controlled legislatures, though the p-value was above 0.1 for all ages.

Much remains to be learned about the drivers of state foster care spending. While the
relationship between state foster care maintenance rates and harsher economic climates and
Republican political control of state government persisted for 2, 9, and 16 year-olds in
multivariate analyses, much of the between-state differences in foster care maintenance rates
appear to be due to other factors. In particular, higher unemployment remained significantly
related to lower state foster care maintenance rates, as did Republican total control or partial
control of state government. Notably, changes in state foster care maintenance rates are not
strongly linked to sociodemographic, economic, and political factors, as evidenced by the
explanatory role of state fixed effects (i.e., measures of other state-specific factors not
included in the regression explicitly). In multivariate regressions without state fixed effects
and year fixed effects approximately 15% of the variation in maintenance rates was
explained (data not shown) compared to 67–74% in the same regressions when these fixed
effects were included. Analyses presented in the next section seek to decompose some of the
other state-level factors represented by the state fixed effects. Other factors we examined
include state budgetary climate, federal budgetary support as well as foster care-specific
regulatory and legal reviews. When we repeated these analyses with nominal state foster
care maintenance rates, the results were similar (Appendix Table 1).

3.3. Trends in budgetary, policy, and legal climates and their relationship to foster care
maintenance rates

Data available between 1994 and 2008 show that substantial changes occurred in terms of
state budgetary realities and federal budgetary support and in terms of foster care-specific
regulatory and legal reviews (Table 2 and Appendix Figs. 8–17). Funding from federal
sources for state Child Welfare programs declined. Per-foster child Title IV-B funding
declined from $116 in 1991 to $51 in 2008. Per-foster child Title IV-E funding increased to
a high of nearly $720 in 2002 before declining to $650 in 2008. The federal share of state
programs directed to poorer families and children (FMAP) declined from 62% to 60%. The
average proportion of state population receiving TANF declined from 4.5% to 1.1% over the
period. States' real per-capita tax revenues increased from $1974 to $2814. Federal
governmental and legal review and associated pressures and requirements to modify the
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child welfare system have also occurred with increasing frequency over the period. By 2004,
all states had undergone a CFSR review. Similarly, by 2004, all had undergone their first
Title IV-E eligibility review, and by 2007, all had undergone a second Title IV-E eligibility
review. The proportion of states that had been subject to a class action lawsuit concerning
their child welfare systems rose from 29% to 51% between 1994 and 2008. Many of these
resulted in consent decrees or other settlements and judgments requiring states to modify
their child welfare systems (31% in 1994 rising to 65% in 2008).

In univariate analyses examining 1994–2008, we find again that harsher economic climates
are related to declines in state foster care maintenance rates, though only urbanicity has a p-
value below 0.10 for 2 and 9 year-olds. Likewise, Republican political control of state
governments is related to lower foster care maintenance rates, though again the significance
of this relationship is attenuated. State per-capita tax revenue is related to higher foster care
maintenance rates, though not significantly. Federal Title IV funding has an ambiguous and
non-significant relationship, but higher levels of federal TANF dollars are related to
increases in state foster care maintenance rates (p< 0.10) as are greater shares of the state's
population receiving TANF. Federal reviews and law suits and consent decrees have an
ambiguous and non-significant relationship to state foster care maintenance rates (Table 3).

In multivariate analyses, these findings remained largely the same, with the effect of
Republic state government control having a p-value below 0.10 and the effect a higher
federal share of TANF payments having a p-value below 0.05. Importantly, the proportion
of variation explained by budgetary and federal policy variables is low (approximately 25%,
data not shown) and likely related to state-level factors not included explicitly in the models,
as evidenced by the 68–78% of the variation in state foster care maintenance rates explained
by state and year fixed effects and the only 3% increase in explanatory power of adding all
variables included in the multivariate regressions. When we repeated these analyses with
nominal state foster care maintenance rates, the results were similar (Appendix Table 2). In
general, the year fixed effects show a general trend towards lower inflation-adjusted foster
care maintenance rates (Appendix Fig. 18), but the state fixed effects do not show strong
regional patterns (Appendix Fig. 19).

3.4. The relationship of state foster care maintenance rates and measures of state Child
system outcomes

The relationship between state foster care maintenance rates and Child Welfare outcomes is
not necessarily causal (i.e., that more spending on foster care maintenance rates causes
improvements in measures of state Child Welfare system outcomes) but rather could simply
indicate that states who spend more on foster care maintenance rates also invest in other
ways in their Child Welfare systems. We compared both the unadjusted state foster care
maintenance rates and estimated state fixed effects, which represent state–level differences
not accounted for by the other factors explicitly included in the multivariate models, with a
range of measures reported in the 2008 Child Welfare Outcomes Report of the Department
of Health and Human Services (Fig. 2). We find no strong relationship between state fixed
effects representing foster care maintenance rates after adjustment and the following
outcomes measures: 1) rates of maltreatment investigation that may result in foster care
placements; 2) rates of maltreatment while in foster care; 3) foster care placement stability;
and 4) timeliness and stability of reunification of children who leave foster care. Because
these Child Welfare Outcomes Reports have only become available in recent years, we used
cross-sectional regressions without state fixed-effects to examine each outcome's
relationship to the same set of state characteristics used to predict state foster care
maintenance rates above. We find some limited evidence that federal funding and reviews
may influence maltreatment investigations or the rate and stability of reunification out of
foster care, though the explained variance is a small proportion of the overall variance
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(Appendix Table 3). This underscores the idiosyncratic nature maintenance rate setting at
the state level and the link between spending and systems outcomes which are relevant when
considering the cost-effectiveness of dissemination and implementation interventions
regarding evidence-based practices.

3.5. Robustness of findings
The main results of the analysis remained the same when we used 2, 3 or 4 year lags instead
of 1 year lags for predictors (Appendix Table 4). Likewise, results remained the same when
we used alternative multivariate specifications such as different windows of time for when
policy changes (e.g., CFSR reviews) and legal challenges could impact outcomes (Appendix
Table 5) or when we considered which political party had control of the state government
and also the strength of that political majority (Appendix Table 6). We assessed the potential
for issues of multicollinearity given that the regressions we estimated examined between
213 and 492 state-year observations and included 1–15 regressors which themselves may be
correlated in addition to fixed effects for each 50 states and for each year included the
regressions. We estimated the correlation matrices for all predictors, and computed the
condition indices for each regression specification. Condition indices ranged from 29.91 to
57.92, below the threshold of 100.00 typically deemed to be an indicator of a severe
multicollinearity problem. We explored reducing the number of covariates to increase the
degrees of freedom in the regression, for example using year and year-squared instead year
fixed effects (Appendix Table 7) which showed that the main results remained unchanged.
Further, we explored using a random effects model instead of a fixed effects model again to
increase our available degrees of freedom. Specifically, we used a Sargan–Hansen test
statistic to determine whether we can gain estimation efficiency by using a random effects
specification (Appendix Table 8). However, we could not use a random effects model
because our tests rejected the null hypothesis (p < 0.001) that the state fixed effects are
sufficiently orthogonal.

3.6. Overall findings
Our analyses suggest that state foster care maintenance rates do not function as part of a
social safety net that increases its support in harsher economic times. We also do not find
strong evidence that federal policies and programs designed to improve the quality and
responsiveness of the child welfare systems influence state foster care maintenance rates.
Finally, lawsuits and consent decrees also do not appear to have this effect. Rather, state
foster care maintenance rates differ markedly by state, and changes in these rates appear
largely idiosyncratic. These findings differ from studies of drivers of spending in other child
serving areas like Medicaid and argue for further research to develop a grounded theory of
what drives and influences Child Welfare spending.

4. Discussion
State Child Welfare systems provide foster care maintenance rates to meet the needs of
hundreds of thousands of foster children annually. After adjusting for inflation, in many
states the real amount of resources provided for the care a foster child via the maintenance
rates has actually declined from 1991 to 2008. Our study finds wide variation between states
in the rates with little of the variation explained by demographic, economic, political,
revenue, federal review, or legal variables, leading to the conclusion that states are highly
idiosyncratic in how their foster care maintenance rates are determined. Higher foster care
maintenance rates do not appear strongly related to Child Welfare outcomes which many
interpret as measures of quality, though further study of outcomes is warranted. Policy
designs that can encourage and incentivize the successful implementation of evidence-based
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interventions will be challenging given that the drivers of state foster care spending appear
highly state-specific, justifying additional study.

The large share of variation in foster care maintenance rates unexplained by a variety of
demographic, economic, and political theory is significant from a public policy perspective
as well as from a dissemination and implementation perspective. From a public policy
perspective, foster care maintenance rates appear detached from a countercyclical social
safety net that responds with increasing support for vulnerable populations of foster children
whose needs may be more acute in harsher economic climates. Some may interpret the lack
of relationship between maintenance rates and economic cycles as evidence that the
maintenance rates form part of a social safety net. However, this lack of relationship cuts
both ways, as states with low foster care maintenance rates may not lower rates further but
also do not appear likely to raise them during harsher economic times (See Appendix Table
9). From a dissemination and implementation perspective, launching and scaling-up
evidence-based programs require a multi-year funding commitment, and their success may
depend on the quality of the Child Welfare system in which they are implemented. Child
Welfare spending on maintenance rates form a large part of foster care budgets. However,
they do not appear to be linked to a variety of drivers that influence the demand for and
quality of services, raising concern about the lack of predictability of changes in them or in
other areas of spending that may modulate the effectiveness of newly implemented evidence
based programs.

The very large between-state fixed effect indicates that much about how these rates are set
arises from currently unknown sources. Key informant interviews may reveal systematic
interstate differences which are presently unmeasured but which should be incorporated in
future studies. Key informant interviews also may reveal a predominance of idiosyncratic
factors, which lend themselves to a “path dependence” approach revealing how states arrive
at the decisions they make through a series of historical contingencies (e.g. a powerful state
senator who was a foster parent and advocated based on his/her experience). Given the
public policy and dissemination and implementation implications, future studies of this type
are warranted. Such research could build a foundation of knowledge on differential Child
Welfare spending rates and their impact and on the wider economic concerns in Child
Welfare, as influential factors in this area currently appear distinct from other child-serving
areas like Medicaid.

This study has a number of limitations. First, the number of years for which comparable
state-level data on foster care maintenance rates is relatively small. Ideally, regressions with
greater sample sizes would be used to guard against potentially not detecting significant
relationships due to lack of power. Similarly, information on key federal funding variables
in all states is not available for all years. Somewhat reassuringly, relationships are largely
the same in univariate analyses, multivariate analyses including subsets of variables, and full
multivariate analyses. Furthermore, the portion of the variance explained by variables in any
specification is small compared to state-level fixed effects. Second, decision making
regarding Child Welfare systems is not entirely at the state level with both federal oversight
and counties playing important roles. Furthermore, states and counties contract for services
with contracts not necessarily starting and ending each annual state budget cycle. Both these
reasons would lead to a lack of relationship between maintenance rates and state-year
variables, even rates at a different level or timescale may be related to these outcomes. If
this were the case, an alternative interpretation of our results would be that the amount of
control that states exert over important Child Welfare service spending and delivery is less
than one might have otherwise expected which is an important dimension to consider when
planning statewide implementation of evidence-based programs within these systems. Third,
state-level foster maintenance rates do not capture within-state variation at the county level
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and different structures of control and budgetary authority. It is possible that the high
proportion of variation explained by state fixed effects is due to this effect, though we are
aware of no nationally comparable longitudinal data at the county level to test this
hypothesis. Fourth, the study does not have the ability to draw causal inference and only
measures an association or rather lack of a strong association within states over time. We
believe that without interpretation of the results causally, the wide variation in foster care
maintenance rates and inability to explain or predict maintenance rates with a wide range of
variables that should be theoretically related to the rates is important in and of itself.

The reason for the lack of relationship between changes in foster care maintenance rates and
changes demographic, economic, political, and policy drivers may very well indicate
differences in the system quality and outcomes achieved. In other words, while all states
have “foster care maintenance rates”, what is embodied by foster care and surrounded by
Child Welfare services may differ between states. Higher rates may indicate spending to
increase quality. Initial cross-sectional analyses reported in our study do not find evidence of
this, but just as researchers at Dartmouth have carefully examined variation in spending and
variation in quality and outcomes of medical services, so too does this issue merit further
study in the context of Child Welfare systems.

5. Conclusions
Foster care maintenance rates do not increase in response to challenging economic times, do
not appear to be strongly influenced by social or political factors and are not strongly related
to Child Welfare quality indicators. Thus, these data suggest that Child Welfare systems,
unlike other systems serving children, may not be responsive to financial incentives to
encourage the adoption of evidence-based practices, unless those incentives were specially
designed and targeted. This important finding makes understanding the barriers and
facilitators to the adoption of such practices critical and should prompt the development of a
rigorous research agenda to identify facilitators/barriers so that interventions to change
practice can be optimally structured.

Appendix A

“What explains variation in state foster care maintenance rates across
states and over time?”

The Appendix A reports additional results for the main analysis such as additional
descriptions of the variables used and alternative specifications of the regression models
used for assessment of robustness. Appendix Figs. 1–17 show the means and confidence
intervals of the main outcomes and predictors based on local polynomial smoothing. These
show general time trends in each of the variables; for example, in Appendix Fig. 1, state
foster care maintenance rates are generally rising through the 1990s before beginning to fall
with larger and earlier declines in 16 year-olds relative to those of 2 or 9 year-olds.
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Fig. 1.
Changes in the distribution of state foster care maintenance rates over time by age and
inflation-adjustment. Shown in the figure panels are the distributions of foster care
maintenance rates across states in 1991 (blue lines), 1998 (red lines), and 2008 (green lines)
expressed in nominal terms (upper panels) and inflation-adjusted terms to 2008 dollars
(lower panels) for children age 2 years, 9 years, and 16 years of age.
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Fig. 2.
Relationship of Child Welfare outcomes and state foster care maintenance rates and state
fixed effects in 2008. Shown in the figure panels are scatter plots of state Child Welfare
outcomes in 2008 (blue circles) versus state foster care maintenance rates for 2 year-olds
(upper panels) and state fixed effects estimated from the full multivariate models for 2 year-
olds (lower panels). From left to right, the panels show Child Welfare outcomes including
maltreatment investigation rates, rates of maltreatment while in care, an index of placement
stability while in care, and an index of the timeliness and stability of reunification for those
who had been in care. Red lines show simple linear regressions between Child Welfare
outcomes and the state foster care maintenance rates or state fixed effects, and R-squared
measures of the strength of correlation are shown in the bottom left corner of each panel.
(For interpretation of the references to color in this figure legend, the reader is referred to the
web version of this article.)
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Appendix Fig. 1.
Average state maintenance rates for foster children (nominal and real values).

Goldhaber-Fiebert et al. Page 18

Child Youth Serv Rev. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2015 April 01.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Appendix Fig. 2.
Average state unemployment rates.
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Appendix Fig. 3.
Share of children who are members of a minority group.
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Appendix Fig. 4.
Average state poverty rates.

Goldhaber-Fiebert et al. Page 21

Child Youth Serv Rev. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2015 April 01.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Appendix Fig. 5.
Average state urbanicity levels.
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Appendix Fig. 6.
Share of states with a Republican controlled state legislature or Republican governor (but
not both).
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Appendix Fig. 7.
Share of states with a Republican controlled state legislature and a Republican governor.
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Appendix Fig. 8.
Average annual funding per foster child under Title IV B.
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Appendix Fig. 9.
Average annual funding per foster child under Title IV E.
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Appendix Fig. 10.
Average monthly TANF benefit for a family of 3 reimbursed by the federal government
(FMAP).

Goldhaber-Fiebert et al. Page 27

Child Youth Serv Rev. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2015 April 01.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Appendix Fig. 11.
Average share of state population receiving TANF benefits.
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Appendix Fig. 12.
Average per-capita state tax revenue.

Goldhaber-Fiebert et al. Page 29

Child Youth Serv Rev. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2015 April 01.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Appendix Fig. 13.
Share of states that have undergone Child and Family Services Review within the previous 3
years.
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Appendix Fig. 14.
Share of states that have undergone a first Title IV E Eligibility Review within the previous
3 years.
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Appendix Fig. 15.
Share of states that have undergone a second Title IV E Eligibility Review within the
previous 3 years.

Goldhaber-Fiebert et al. Page 32

Child Youth Serv Rev. Author manuscript; available in PMC 2015 April 01.

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript

N
IH

-PA Author M
anuscript



Appendix Fig. 16.
Share of states in which lawsuits have been filed on behalf of foster children within the
previous 3 years.
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Appendix Fig. 17.
Share of states in which settlements or consent decrees have been reached in lawsuits filed
on behalf of foster children within the previous 3 years.
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Appendix Fig. 18.
Year fixed effects from multivariate regression including socio demographic, economic, and
political variables with and without policy variables for 2 year-olds. Shown in the figure
above are the year fixed effects for the multivariate regressions examining inflation adjusted
fixed with and without policy variables. Other than in early years, there is not a substantial
year trend and, given the wide confidence interval, none that is statistically distinct from
zero. This suggests that, after adjusting for other predictors in the model and state fixed
effects, inflation adjustment actually accounts explains most of the time trend in state foster
care maintenance rates observed when they are examined in nominal terms.
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Appendix Fig. 19.
State fixed effects from multivariate regression including socio-demographic, economic,
political, policy variables of 2 year-olds. Shown in the figure are the state fixed effects
categorized into quartiles above and below the median state. Darker blue denotes higher
state fixed effects and lighter blue and white denote lower state fixed effect values. While it
appears that the north east and some of the West and Southwest have higher state fixed
effects and that the South has lower state fixed effects, there are notable exceptions in all of
these regions. To make the map more readable, Hawaii and Alaska are not shown. The
values of the state fixed effects for Hawaii is $217 and for Alaska is $219.
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