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Abstract
Background—Although increasing numbers of reproductive-age U.S. women with chronic
physical disabilities (CPD) are becoming pregnant, little is known about their general health or
comorbid health conditions.

Objectives—To explore general health and comorbid health conditions among women with and
without CPD by current pregnancy status.

Methods—We analyzed responses of 47,629 civilian, noninstitutionalized women ages 18–49
from the 2006–2011 National Health Interview Surveys. The survey asks about: various
movement difficulties; selected adult health conditions; self-reported general health; and current
pregnancy. We identified women with CPD using responses from 8 movement difficulty
questions.

Results—6,043 (12.7%) women report CPD. Among nondisabled women, 3.8% report current
pregnancy, as do 2.0% of women with CPD. Among currently pregnant women with CPD, 29.1%
report fair or poor health, compared with only 3.2% of nondisabled pregnant women. Currently
pregnant women both with and without CPD are significantly less likely to report coexisting
health conditions than nonpregnant women. Nonetheless, among currently pregnant women with
CPD, only 24.5% report no coexisting conditions, while 28.7% report 1, 22.8% report 2, 13.2%
report 3, and 10.8% report 4–6 health conditions. In a multivariable regression controlling for age
category, health status, and health conditions, CPD is not statistically significantly associated with
current pregnancy.

Conclusions—According to national survey data, it appears that pregnant women with CPD
may have a complex mix of health problems and often experience fair or poor health. Better
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understanding the obstetrical and subspecialty needs of these women with multimorbidities
requires additional investigation.
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disability; pregnancy; mobility; comorbidities; National Health Interview Survey

Introduction
Increasing numbers of American women with chronic physical disabilities (CPD) are
becoming pregnant.1 Our recent analyses of National Health Interview Survey (NHIS) data
found that approximately 163,700 U.S. women with CPD – defined here as mobility
difficulties involving upper or lower extremities – become pregnant at some point each
year.2 With expanding populations of reproductive-age women with CPD,3–6 the numbers of
pregnancies will likely continue rising. Learning more about the health of women with CPD
who become pregnant is critical to anticipating their prenatal care and obstetrical needs and
the full range of services required to optimize maternal health during pregnancies, safely
deliver healthy babies, and maximize post-partum outcomes.

Our previous analyses focused on comparing demographic characteristics and current
pregnancy rates of women with and without CPD.2 We have also identified the conditions
underlying women’s CPD and the associations of different causal conditions with current
pregnancy.7 Here, we compare women’s self-reported general overall health status and
common health conditions, again examining women by pregnancy status and CPD. Others
have found that persons with disabilities have worse self-reported general health than do
other individuals.8–11 In particular, Chevarley and colleagues found that women who report
at least one functional limitation are much more likely than other women to report fair or
poor health.12 However, no prior research has considered this issue in pregnancy. NHIS is
one of few data sets containing nationally-representative information on current pregnancy
and various health conditions. We took advantage of these data to explore the hypotheses
that: differences in the burden of illness – nature and extent of health conditions – contribute
to differences in self-perceived general overall health between women with and without
CPD; and these factors (general health, health conditions) contribute to differences in
pregnancy rates between women with and without CPD.

This study therefore has three goals: (1) To compare the self-reported general overall health
status of women with and without CPD by whether the women are currently pregnant; (2)
Regardless of pregnancy status, to examine how self-reported health conditions contribute to
the general overall health differences observed between women with and without CPD; and
(3) To examine the associations of general overall health status, health conditions, and CPD
with current pregnancy. While NHIS data do not provide the in-depth clinical insights and
the detailed data that will ultimately be required to determine the clinical services needed by
pregnant women with CPD, these data provide useful preliminary evidence on this topic.

Methods
Data

Another publication describes our data and CPD measure in detail.2 Briefly, we downloaded
the 2006–2011 NHIS Public Release data from the National Center for Health Statistics
(NCHS) Web site (http://www.cdc.gov/nchs/surveys.htm). NHIS surveys U.S. civilian,
noninstitutionalized, community residents, oversampling black, Hispanic, and Asian
populations; all survey instruments and details about the sampling approach are available on
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the NCHS Web site. Sophisticated sampling methods yield sampling weights that allow
calculation of nationally representative figures.

Since 1997, the Basic Module or Core NHIS questionnaire has contained three components:
Family Core, Sample Adult Core, and Sample Child Core. The Family Core gathers
information on all family members. The analysis reported here uses data from the Sample
Adult Core, which asks detailed health and functional status questions of one randomly
selected family member who is 18 years of age or older; women ages 18–49 are asked
whether they are “currently pregnant.” A knowledgeable adult family member provides
proxy responses when sampled adults are physically or mentally unable to respond. The
2011 Sample Adult Core, for example, had 33,014 individual respondents (response rate =
81.6%), with 465 proxy responses.13

The 2006–2011 Sample Adult Core data contained 157,351 individuals. As detailed
elsewhere,2 we first selected the 47,886 women ages 18–49 from these 2006–2011 surveys
and then eliminated women with: missing responses to the pregnancy question (0.2%); no
responses to the 8 functional status questions for determining CPD (0.3%); and reported
Alzheimer’s disease (7 women). Our final sample of 47,629 women had 263 (0.6%) proxy
respondents.

Chronic Physical Disability Indicator
To identify women with CPD, we started with the algorithm created by NCHS analysts
using NHIS data to determine “movement difficulty severity” for Disability and Health in
the United States, 2001–2005.14 The NCHS algorithm uses responses from the “Adult
Health Status and Limitations” section in the Sample Adult Core questionnaire, which
inquires about various types of functional limitations using the following question stem:

The next questions ask about difficulties you may have doing certain activities
because of a HEALTH PROBLEM. By “health problem” we mean any physical,
mental, or emotional problem or illness (not including pregnancy). By yourself, and
without using any special equipment, how difficult is it for you to …

Response categories are: “not at all difficult” (score = 0); “only a little difficult” (score = 1);
“somewhat difficult” (score = 2); “very difficult” (score = 3); “can’t do at all” (score = 4);
“do not do this activity” (score = 6); and “refused” and “don’t know.” The NCHS algorithm
considers only movement difficulties with reported scores of 2, 3, or 4.

The movement difficulty severity algorithm uses responses to questions about health-related
difficulties performing the following 8 actions:

• Walking a quarter mile (reported by 39.0% of our final sample of 6,043 women
with CPD, see below);

• Walking up 10 steps without resting (27.9%);

• Standing for about 2 hours (52.3%);

• Sitting for about 2 hours (35.9%);

• Stooping, bending, or kneeling (62.1%);

• Reaching up over their head (19.7%);

• Using fingers to grasp or handle small objects (17.1%); and

• Lifting or carrying something as heavy at 10 pounds (28.4%).
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Interviewees can report as many difficulties as they wish. In our final sample of women with
CPD, 34.9% reported 4 or more types of difficulties.2

As described in detail elsewhere,2 applying the NCHS “movement difficulty severity
method” algorithm to the 47,629 women in our sample initially identified 6,766 women with
movement difficulties. Given our research goals, we then refined our CPD indicator through
three steps. First, although the functional limitations question stem explicitly asks
respondents not to mention difficulties caused by pregnancy, a follow-up question about
what caused the limitation(s) found that 138 (2.0% of the 6,766 women) reported that
pregnancy had caused their difficulties. Given the goals of our study, we eliminated from the
CPD group these 138 women. Second, we eliminated women (n = 280, 4.1%) who reported
that conditions (e.g., intellectual disabilities, psychiatric or mental health problems,
substance abuse) other than physical health problems caused their movement difficulties.
Finally, we removed women (n = 305, 4.8%) who reported that the causes of their
impairments were not “chronic.” After modifying NCHS’s algorithm with these three
exclusions, the 47,629 women in our final sample split into 6,043 (12.7%) with CPD and
41,586 (40,863 + 138 pregnancy cause + 280 non-physical cause + 305 not chronic, 87.3%)
without CPD.

Self-Reported Health and Health Conditions
The Sample Adult Core asks respondents about their “health in general.” Response
categories are “excellent,” “very good,” “good,” “fair,” and “poor.” In its “Adult
Conditions” section, the questionnaire asks whether respondents have “ever been told by a
doctor or other health professional that [they] had” various health conditions. These Adult
Condition questions are separate from queries about health problems that caused self-
reported functional impairments. Questions about diabetes specifically exclude gestational
diabetes. Certain Adult Conditions are time-limited and unlikely to have significant
consequences on pregnancies (e.g., “hay fever,” sinusitis, “head cold or chest cold in last
two weeks”); we did not consider these generally short-term conditions. We included only
those Adult Conditions that might affect obstetrical risks because of their underlying
pathophysiology (e.g., asthma limiting gas exchange), complications of treating those
conditions (e.g., fetal effects of medications for rheumatoid arthritis), or other medical
issues.15–21

Analysis
All analyses used SAS Version 9.2 (Cary, NC). We employed NHIS sampling weights,
including for calculating percentages. Our descriptive analyses use χ2 tests to assess
bivariable associations. We produced adjusted odds ratios (AOR) and 95% confidence
intervals (CI) for having each of 13 health conditions and 2 or more of these health
conditions using age category and CPD as predictor variables in 14 multivariable logistic
regression analyses. In addition, we conducted two series of multivariable logistic regression
analyses, in each series producing one to four models by stepping in additional predictor
variables. First, we predicted self-reported fair or poor health with three models: (1) age
category; (2) age category + dummy variables for each health condition; and (3) age
category + health conditions + CPD. Second, we predicted current pregnancy with four
models: (1) age category; (2) age category + general health level; (3) age category + general
health + dummy variables for each health condition; and (4) age category + general health +
health conditions + CPD. Because of strong relationships between age and disability level
and between age and pregnancy,2 we use age as our key sociodemographic control variable.
The small number of pregnancies complicates the inclusion of other demographic predictor
variables. Details about the sociodemographic characteristics of the population are available
elsewhere.2
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Results
Across all women, regardless of pregnancy, women with CPD are significantly more likely
to report fair or poor general health than are other women: 35.0% versus 4.6%. After
adjusting for age category, the AOR (95% CI) of reporting fair or poor health for women
with CPD compared to women without CPD is 10.3 (9.5, 11.3).

As shown in Table 1, these global patterns persist when looking separately at women by
pregnancy status. Among all women regardless of CPD, those who are pregnant report
significantly better general health than do nonpregnant women. However, even among
pregnant women, women with CPD have much higher self-reported fair or poor health
(28.1%) compared with women without CPD (3.2%).

Health Conditions and Fair or Poor General Health Regardless of Pregnancy
To examine our hypothesis about the contribution of health problems to differences in self-
reported fair or poor health between women with and without CPD, we first conducted
analyses disregarding pregnancy status (i.e., combining all women regardless of pregnancy).
Table 2 shows the percentages of women with and without CPD who report various health
conditions and the AOR (95% CI) of reporting the health condition for women with CPD.
Women with CPD are substantially more likely to report each health condition than women
without CPD: while 59.8% of nondisabled women report no health conditions, only 13.4%
of women with CPD report no health conditions. Women with CPD also are substantially
more likely to report more than one health problem (AOR = 9.0).

We then performed three multivariable logistics regressions to predict fair or poor health
across all women, regardless of pregnancy. As shown on Table 3, increasing age is
significantly associated with the likelihood (AOR, 95% CI) of reporting fair or poor health.
Not surprisingly, each health condition is also significantly associated with reporting fair or
poor health, with especially high AORs for kidney and liver conditions (AOR = 3.8),
diabetes (3.7), stroke (3.2), and coronary heart disease (2.7). The third model stepped in
CPD: even controlling for age category and health conditions, CPD is significantly
associated with reporting fair or poor health, with a larger AOR (5.1) than for any other
predictor variable.

Pregnancy and Health Conditions
For all women, those who report current pregnancy are significantly (p ≤ 0.0001) less likely
to report health conditions (Table 4). For women without CPD, currently pregnant women
report on average (mean [standard deviation]) only 0.4 (0.02) of the 13 health conditions,
while nonpregnant women report 0.6 (0.01, p ≤ 0.0001) conditions. In contrast, for women
with CPD, currently pregnant women report 1.6 (0.15) of the 13 health conditions, compared
with 2.4 (0.03, p ≤ 0.0001) for nonpregnant women. These mean numbers of conditions
mask the wide prevalence of health conditions among women with CPD who are currently
pregnant: among these women, only 24.5% report no health conditions, while 28.7% report
one, 22.8% report two, 13.2% report three, and 10.8% report four to six health conditions.
Within each type of health condition, women with CPD are generally less likely to be
pregnant than are women without CPD (Table 4); the one exception is angina pectoris,
where women with CPD have higher pregnancy rates than women without CPD (1.6%
compared with 0.9%), but this difference is not significant. Many of these differences are
not statistically significant, perhaps because of small sample size.

Finally, we ran four multivariable logistic regressions predicting current pregnancy, adding
sequentially to the models age category, self-reported general health, the 13 health
conditions, and CPD (Table 5). After controlling for age, fair or poor general health is
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associated with a lower adjusted odds of pregnancy, but with marginal statistical
significance. Among the health conditions, arthritis, joint symptoms, and ulcers are
significantly associated with lower adjusted odds of pregnancy. In the complete model, CPD
is not statistically significantly associated with current pregnancy (i.e., after controlling for
the other covariates, CPD does not significantly predict current pregnancy).

Discussion
While women with CPD are less likely to be currently pregnant than nondisabled women,
those women with CPD who are pregnant seem healthier than their nonpregnant peers.
Nonetheless, compared with nondisabled pregnant women, women with CPD who are
currently pregnant report being in fair or poor general health roughly nine times more often.
In addition, almost half of pregnant women with CPD report two or more health conditions.

Thus, women with CPD who are currently pregnant appear to carry a more complex burden
of health conditions than do nondisabled pregnant women. Although multimorbidity is
typically viewed as affecting older adults,22, 23 reproductive-age women with CPD –
including those who are currently pregnant – appear to have high rates of multiple health
conditions. This finding suggests the importance of maximizing women’s health before and
throughout pregnancy to ensure the highest likelihood of successful outcomes.

The prevalence of chronic health conditions highlights the need for preconception care,
counseling, and planning, so that women are as healthy as they can be when they starting
trying to conceive. For instance, if women are taking medications to treat a coexisting health
condition, considering how the drugs might affect pregnancy will be critical and should be
addressed before women conceive. Prenatal care clinicians will need to address complex
health concerns and collaborate with other health care practitioners, perhaps representing
multiple specialties and disciplines (e.g., medicine, nursing midwifery), caring for these
women. This will require coordinating care and communicating effectively among clinicians
and possibly across clinical disciplines to ensure that all practitioners are thoroughly
informed about the status of women’s various health conditions, especially as delivery
approaches. Despite these compelling preconception and prenatal care needs, a strong body
of evidence suggests that women with CPD confront a range of barriers to obtaining this
care. High levels of poverty and unemployment, low levels of education, and other
socioeconomic stressors can reduce their access to care, including not only direct services
but also medications and other treatments.

Some of the 13 health conditions considered here could represent the cause of women’s
CPD rather than coexisting or comorbid conditions. As noted above, elsewhere we explore
the underlying conditions reported by interviewees as causing their CPD and associations of
these conditions with current pregnancy.7 In an appendix to this article, we cross-tabulate
the reported causal conditions with the 13 health conditions for women with CPD.
Substantial – but not complete – overlap exists between conditions reported as causing CPD
and clinically similar (or identical) health conditions. For example, 86.3% of women who
indicated that arthritis caused their CPD also report arthritis in the separate health condition
questions; this gap could represent women’s perceptions of their role of their arthritis or be
an artifact caused by phrasing of the different survey questions. Most importantly, however,
large percentages of women with CPD report other health conditions beyond those causing
their disabilities. For example, among women who reported that arthritis has caused their
CPD, 41.3% also report hypertension, 31.4% asthma, 21.3% chronic obstructive pulmonary
disease (COPD), and 14.7% diabetes, among other health conditions. This argues that
clinicians and obstetrical centers caring for these women must be prepared to address
concerns beyond mobility-related issues.
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This research has important limitations related to its data source. The cross-sectional nature
of the data only allows us to look at statistical associations, not to make causal inferences.
Proxies rather than the woman herself provided a small percentage of the responses. The
quality of the pregnancy indicator, data about self-reported health conditions, and functional
difficulties (source of CPD information) is unknown. Although women were told not to
report functional impairments related to pregnancy, it is possible that reports of “general
health” among pregnant women could reflect pregnancy experiences. However, the
persistent differences in perceptions of general health between pregnant women with and
without CPD argue that pregnancy is not alone responsible. Respondents may either over- or
underreport health concerns for a variety of reasons, including cultural factors and gender
role expectations.

While NHIS contains fairly extensive lists of questions about both functional difficulties and
specific health conditions, it nonetheless does not address some important issues. Especially
pertinent when examining CPD, it does not ask about use of specific mobility assistive
technologies, such as wheelchairs or walkers. The Sample Adult Core questionnaire does
ask about whether a health problem causes interviewees to use “special equipment, such as a
cane, a wheelchair, a special bed, or a special telephone.” But the variety of assistive
technologies encompassed by this question makes it too vague for our purposes. In addition,
although NHIS asks about common health conditions, it does not inquire about all comorbid
conditions interviewees might have. Finally, although we used multiple years of data, the
numbers of women with CPD is relatively small, as is that subset who report current
pregnancy. Small numbers precluded more in-depth analyses.

Conclusions
Despite these limitations, these data offer new insights into the general health and specific
health conditions of U.S. women with CPD who are currently pregnant. Most striking is the
high prevalence of multiple health conditions among women with CPD – many diagnoses
unrelated to the women’s CPD – including women who are currently pregnant. As noted
above, pre-conception counseling and maximizing women’s health across all conditions
before pregnancy would likely heighten the likelihood of good outcomes. Obstetricians will
likely need to collaborate with other medical specialists, in addition to practitioners from
nursing and midwifery, while providing obstetrical care to women with CPD. Coordinating
this care across clinical disciplines could be challenging, requiring open and frequent
communication and sharing of health records. Ensuring that all their clinical practitioners are
fully informed is an important issue for pregnant women with CPD and multiple health
conditions, with the patient-centered goal of maximizing their likelihood of having safe
pregnancies, healthy babies, and optimal post-partum outcomes.
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Refer to Web version on PubMed Central for supplementary material.
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Table 2

Self-Reported Health Conditions and Adjusted Odds Ratios of Reporting Health Condition by Chronic
Physical Disability
Total n = 47,629

Health conditionsa
No CPDb
n = 41,586

CPDb
n = 6,043

AORc
(95% CI)

Arthritis 2,622 (6.7%) 2,524 (42.5%) 8.4 (7.8,9.2)

Symptoms of joint pain/aching/stiffness past 30 days 6,251 (15.4) 3,825 (63.3) 8.4 (7.8,9.0)

Hypertension 4,774 (10.9) 1,934 (30.8) 2.9 (2.7,3.2)

Coronary heart disease 203 (0.5) 257 (3.9) 6.6 (5.2,8.4)

Angina pectoris 135 (0.3) 129 (2.1) 5.9 (4.3,8.1)

Other heart condition/disease 1,332 (3.5) 639 (10.3) 2.9 (2.5,3.3)

Stroke 189 (0.4) 214 (3.5) 6.0 (4.6,7.9)

Asthma 4,912 (12.1) 1,591 (26.4) 2.8 (2.6,3.1)

Chronic obstructive pulmonary disease 1,267 (3.0) 847 (14.3) 5.1 (4.5,5.8)

Diabetes 1,059 (2.3) 628 (10.1) 3.6 (3.2,4.1)

Ulcer 1,736 (4.2) 862 (14.4) 3.4 (3.0,3.7)

Cancer 1,192 (3.0) 488 (8.2) 2.2 (2.0,2.5)

Kidney and liver conditions 503 (1.1) 442 (7.4) 6.5 (5.4,7.7)

2 or more health conditions 6,277 (15.2) 3,928 (65.0) 9.0 (8.3,9.7)

a
Ever told by doctor or other health care professional that has the condition (except for joint symptoms, which are respondents’ self-report)

b
Percentages are adjusted for age category and use number in the header row as the denominator

c
Adjusted odds ratio (AOR) for CPD (reference = no CPD) from multivariable logistic regression predicting specific health condition; predictor

variables = age category, CDP (yes/no). Women without CPD = reference group.
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Table 3

Associations of Age Category, Health Conditions, and CPD with Self-Reports of Fair or Poor Health
Total n = 47,618

Characteristic
Age category only

Age category + health
condition

Age category + health
condition + CPD

adjusted odds ratio (95% confidence interval)

Age category

 18–24 (reference) 1.00 1.00 1.00

 25–29 1.4 (1.1,1.6) 1.2 (1.0,1.4) 1.2 (1.0,1.4)

 30–34 1.7 (1.4,1.9) 1.2 (1.1,1.5) 1.2 (1.0,1.4)

 35–39 2.2 (1.9, 2.6) 1.4 (1.2,1.7) 1.3 (1.1,1.6)

 40–44 2.6 (2.3, 3.1) 1.4 (1.2,1.6) 1.2 (1.0,1.5)

 45–49 3.3 (2.8, 3.9) 1.3 (1.1,1.5) 1.1 (0.9,1.3)

Health condition

Arthritis 2.2 (1.9, 2.4) 1.5 (1.3, 1.7)

Symptoms of joint pain/aching/stiffness past 30
days

2.1 (1.9, 2.3) 1.4 (1.2,1.5)

Hypertension 2.1 (1.9, 2.4) 1.9 (1.7, 2.1)

Coronary heart disease 2.7 (1.9, 3.8) 2.2 (1.5, 3.2)

Angina pectoris 1.8 (1.1, 2.7) 1.7 (1.1, 2.5)

Other heart condition/disease 1.4 (1.2, 1.6) 1.3 (1.1,1.5)

Stroke 3.2 (2.2, 4.5) 2.7 (1.8, 3.9)

Asthma 1.5 (1.4, 1.7) 1.4 (1.2, 1.5)

Chronic obstructive pulmonary disease 2.1 (1.8, 2.5) 1.8 (1.5, 2.1)

Diabetes 3.7 (3.1, 4.4) 3.3 (2.8, 4.0)

Ulcer 1.7 (1.5, 2.0) 1.6 (1.4,1.8)

Cancer 1.8 (1.4, 2.1) 1.7 (1.4, 2.1)

Kidney and liver conditions 3.8 (3.1, 4.7) 3.1 (2.5, 3.8)

Chronic physical disability

 No (reference) 1.00

 Yes 5.1 (4.6, 5.7)
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Table 5

Associations of Age Category, Self-Reported General Health, Health Conditions, and CPD with Current
Pregnancy
Total n = 47,618

Characteristic
Age category only Age category +

general health

Age category + general
health + health

condition

Age category + general
health + health

condition + CPD

adjusted odds ratio (95% confidence interval)

Age category

 18–24 (reference) 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

 25–29 1.5 (1.3,1.8) 1.5 (1.3,1.8) 1.5 (1.3,1.8) 1.5 (1.3,1.8)

 30–34 1.1 (0.9,1.3) 1.1 (0.9,1.3) 1.1 (1.0,1.4) 1.1 (1.0,1.4)

 35–39 0.5 (0.4, 0.6) 0.5 (0.4, 0.6) 0.5 (0.4, 0.6) 0.5 (0.4, 0.6)

 40–44 0.1 (0.1, 0.2) 0.1 (0.1, 0.2) 0.1 (0.1, 0.2) 0.1 (0.1, 0.2)

 45–49 0.02 (0.01, 0.04) 0.02 (0.01, 0.04) 0.02 (0.01, 0.05) 0.02 (0.01, 0.05)

Self-reported general health

Excellent (reference) 1.00 1.00 1.00

Very good 1.0 (0.8, 1.1) 1 (0.9,1.2) 1.0 (0.9,1.2)

Good 1.0 (0.8, 1.1) 1 (0.9,1.2) 1.0 (0.9,1.2)

Fair or poor 0.8 (0.6, 1.0) 0.9 (0.7, 1.2) 0.9 (0.7,1.2)

Health condition

Arthritis 0.7 (0.5, 0.9) 0.7 (0.5, 0.9)

Symptoms of joint pain/aching/
stiffness past 30 days

0.7 (0.6, 0.9) 0.7 (0.6, 0.9)

Hypertension 0.9 (0.7, 1.1) 0.9 (0.7, 1.1)

Coronary heart disease 0.5 (0.2,1.4) 0.5 (0.2, 1.4)

Angina pectoris 0.8 (0.2, 3.3) 0.8 (0.2, 3.3)

Other heart condition/disease 1.3 (0.9, 1.7) 1.3 (0.9, 1.7)

Stroke 1.3 (0.6, 2.8) 1.3 (0.6, 2.8)

Asthma 1.0 (0.9, 1.2) 1.0 (0.9, 1.2)

Chronic obstructive pulmonary
disease

0.8 (0.6, 1.2) 0.8 (0.6,1.2)

Diabetes 1.1 (0.5, 2.2) 1.1 (0.5, 2.2)

Ulcer 0.6 (0.4, 0.9) 0.6 (0.4, 0.9)

Cancer 1.0 (0.6, 1.5) 1.0 (0.6,1.5)

Kidney and liver conditions 0.9 (0.6, 1.6) 0.9 (0.6, 1.6)

Chronic physical disability

 No (reference) 1.00

 Yes 1.0 (0.8, 1.3)
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