
pants followed over a period of 22 years reinforces the previ-
ous evidence.5 In this large prospective cohort study, lower 
endoscopy, including colonoscopy and sigmoidoscopy, was 
associated with reduced CRC incidence and mortality.5

In Korea, colonoscopy is extensively used at multiple 
levels of the health care system, from community gastroen-
terology practice to academic referral hospitals. Given the 
widespread and increasing use of colonoscopy as a screen-
ing examination for CRC, it is important for clinicians to 
recognize the key clinical features of patients with newly di-
agnosed CRC and, more importantly, to recognize their en-
doscopic and pathologic characteristics of newly diagnosed 
CRC in community-level practice. This would enhance the 
strategy for care of patients with CRC and potentially im-
prove the use of national colonoscopy resources.

In this issue of Intestinal Research, Park et al. report the 
clinicopathological characteristics of 579 newly diagnosed 
CRCs detected through elective colonoscopies performed 
by 60 community gastroenterologists at 19 primary health 
care institutions in Korea from January 2011 through De-
cember 2012.6 The main findings of their study follow. First, 
they reported the age-specific proportion of patients with 
newly diagnosed CRCs in community-level practice. Pa-
tients in their 50s were the largest group at 32.5%, followed 
by those in their 60s at 31.6% and those in their 70s at 20.7%. 
Patients older than age 50 accounted for 87.2% of all CRCs 
detected in this study, and the elderly (defined by the World 
Health Organization as ≥65 years of age) accounted for 
39.4% of all CRCs. Based on these results, the authors stated 
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EDITORIAL

Colorectal cancer (CRC) is a major health problem in 
most industrialized countries, with an annual incidence of 1 
million cases, and an annual mortality of more than 550,000 
cases.1 The incidence of CRC has been steadily increasing 
and, to date, the lifetime risk for CRC for an average-risk 
population is about 5% in industrialized countries.1 In Korea, 
recent nationwide cancer statistics data (the Korea National 
Incidence Database) show that the incidence of CRC steadi-
ly increased in both sexes from 1999 to 2010, and CRC was 
the third most commonly diagnosed cancer during 2010.2 
Therefore, there is no doubt that CRC screening is an essen-
tial requirement for improvement of public health. 

There are many screening tools for early detection of 
CRC, but cancer prevention is more likely to be achieved by 
procedures that are designed to both detect precancerous 
lesions and early cancer and to remove them concomitantly. 
To achieve this goal, there is no better option than colonos-
copy. The National Polyp Study data clearly show that early 
detection and removal of adenomatous polyps through 
colonoscopy can reduce the incidence of CRC and prevent 
death from CRC.3,4 A recent trial involving 88,902 partici-
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that “Our study indicates a novel trend of increase in occur-
rences of CRCs amongst younger demographics in recent 
years.”6 I agree with the authors that the current results might 
partly reflect the identification of previously undetected dis-
ease with increased screening rates in the specific age group 
(50−59 years of age). Why is that? One of possible explana-
tions is that the people 50−59 years of age are more likely to 
be economically active, so that they are more likely to have 
opportunistic screening by self-prompted request than older 
age groups. 

The results by Park et al., however, do not indicate a true 
increase in the occurrence of CRCs in specific age groups, 
because this study is not a case-control or population-based 
study but a kind of case series. Much evidence indicates 
that the incidence of rate of CRC increases steadily with age. 
Surveillance, Epidemiology and End Results registry data 
indicate that CRC incidence was 74.5/100,000 in persons 
50−64 years of age, 186.0/100,000 in persons 65−74 years of 
age, and 290.1/100,000 in persons ≥75 years of age.7 Another 
large prospective cohort study of average-risk patients (age 
50 to 75) undergoing colonoscopy also confirmed the trend 
of increasing incidence of advanced neoplasia including in-
vasive cancer in elderly people: the prevalence of advanced 
neoplasia increased from 5.7% in persons 50−59 years of age 
to 13% in persons 70−75 years of age.8 According to recent 
nationwide cancer statistics data, the incidence of CRC also 
increased gradually with age in our country.2

Another major finding of the article by Park et al. is that 
one of three patients with CRC (28.2%) had no symptoms re-
lated to CRC. Patients with right-sided colon cancer tended 
to have no or nonspecific symptom related to CRC, com-
pared to patients with left-sided colon cancer who tended 
to have more specific symptoms related to CRC such as 
hematochezia (P<0.001). Clinical symptoms related to CRC 
usually develop late in the course of the disease, which is 
why screening is so important. Undoubtedly, early detection 
and treatment are of more benefit than treatment at a later 
stage. The proportion of asymptomatic patients with CRC 
in the current study is much higher than those in several 
Korean studies, ranging from 2.1% to 10.6%, but it is compa-
rable to that of a study published in 2010 (in which 33.5% of 
patients were asymptomatic).6 Additionally, the CRCs in as-
ymptomatic patients had some interesting features, such as 
“protruded” endoscopic appearance (58.3%) and well-differ-
entiated histology (57.1%), as compared to CRCs detected in 
symptomatic patients (P<0.05). The authors suggested that 
colonoscopy would provide a higher chance of endoscopic 
treatment and better prognosis in asymptomatic patients, 

as compared to symptomatic patients, who had more de-
pressed lesions with undifferentiated histology. These data 
reinforce the current rationale of population-based CRC 
screening in average-risk asymptomatic persons. Moreover, 
these data provide important estimates that can be used in 
clinical practice with regard to the treatment strategy and 
prognosis of newly detected CRC.

However, several limitations of the study by Park et al. 
should be highlighted. The macroscopic classification of 
CRCs evaluated in their study was very arbitrary. Irrespec-
tive of the disease stage, the authors classified all eligible 
lesions with pathological diagnosis of adenocarcinoma into 
one of three macroscopic categories: “protruded”, “flat” or 
“depressed”, through their review of colonoscopic images. 
The endoscopic reviews in the current study were made 
by all participating gastroenterologists independently, not 
by central review. The authors arbitrarily incorporated two 
different macroscopic classifications that were developed 
for different stages of cancer (Kudo’s classification for early 
CRC confined to the mucosal and submucosal layers, which 
includes type I [protruded], type II [flat], and type III [de-
pressed],9 and Borrmann’s classification, proposed in 1926 
for “advanced” gastric tumors, which includes types 1 to 4, for 
advanced or CRCs that invades through the proper muscle 
layer) into one new classification. Early CRC is, however, 
basically different from advanced CRC in terms of depth of 
invasion. A major reason why endoscopic classification for 
early gastrointestinal cancers exists separately is that only 
these lesions are the main targets for endoscopic treatment. 
A “protruded” early CRC is not the same as a “protruded” ad-
vanced CRC. Therefore, early CRC should be clearly distin-
guished from invasive CRC in a macroscopic classification, 
such as the “type 0” lesion in the Japanese classification or 
the recent Paris classification.10

In summary, colonoscopy is the best, or at least, the pre-
ferred, method for screening for CRC. Although there has 
been widespread and increasing use of colonoscopy screen-
ing in community-level practice, little has been reported 
about community gastroenterologists’ experience in Korea. 
With respect to this, the study by Park et al. in this issue of In-
testinal Research is particularly interesting, in spite of several 
critical weaknesses, and I applaud their work in this field.
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