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Background. In the United States, people of color face

disparities in access to health care, the quality of care

received, and health outcomes. The attitudes and behaviors

of health care providers have been identified as one of many

factors that contribute to health disparities. Implicit attitudes

are thoughts and feelings that often exist outside of con-

scious awareness, and thus are difficult to consciously

acknowledge and control. These attitudes are often automat-

ically activated and can influence human behavior without

conscious volition.

Objectives.Weinvestigated theextent towhich implicit racial/

ethnic bias exists among health care professionals and examined

the relationships between health care professionals’ implicit

attitudes about racial/ethnic groups and health care outcomes.

SearchMethods. To identify relevant studies,we searched 10

computerized bibliographic databases and used a reference

harvesting technique.

Selection Criteria. We assessed eligibility using double in-

dependent screening based on a priori inclusion criteria. We

included studies if they sampled existing health care providers

or those in training to become health care providers, measured

and reported results on implicit racial/ethnic bias, and were

written in English.

Data Collection and Analysis.We included a total of 15 studies

for review and then subjected them to double independent data

extraction. Informationextractedincludedthecitation,purpose

of thestudy,useof theory,studydesign,studysiteandlocation,

sampling strategy, response rate, sample size and characteristics,

measurement of relevant variables, analyses performed,

and results and findings. We summarized study design charac-

teristics, and categorized and then synthesized substantive

findings.

MainResults.Almostall studiesusedcross-sectionaldesigns,

convenience sampling, USparticipants, and the Implicit Associ-

ation Test to assess implicit bias. Low to moderate levels of

implicit racial/ethnic bias were found among health care pro-

fessionals in all but 1 study. These implicit bias scores are similar

tothoseinthegeneralpopulation.Levelsof implicitbiasagainst

Black, Hispanic/Latino/Latina, and dark-skinned people were

relatively similar across these groups. Although someassocia-

tions between implicit bias and health care outcomes were

nonsignificant, results also showed that implicit bias was

significantly related topatient–provider interactions, treatment

decisions, treatment adherence, and patient health outcomes.

Implicit attitudesweremoreoftensignificantly related topatient–

provider interactions and health outcomes than treatment

processes.

Conclusions. Most health care providers appear to have

implicit bias in terms of positive attitudes toward Whites and

negative attitudes towardpeopleof color. Future studiesneed

to employ more rigorous methods to examine the relation-

ships between implicit bias and health care outcomes. In-

terventions targeting implicit attitudes among health care

professionalsareneededbecauseimplicitbiasmaycontribute

to health disparities for people of color. (Am J Public Health.

2015;105:2588. doi:10.2105/AJPH.2015.302903)

PLAIN-LANGUAGE SUMMARY:

Implicit attitudes are thoughts and
feelings that often exist outside of
conscious awareness, and thus are
difficult to consciously acknowl-
edge and control. Negative implicit
attitudes about people of color
may contribute to racial/ethnic
disparities in health and health
care. We systematically reviewed

evidence on implicit racial/ethnic
bias among health care profes-
sionals and on the relationships
between health care professionals’
implicit attitudes about racial/eth-
nic groups and health care out-
comes. Fifteen relevant studies
were identified through searches
of bibliographic databases and
reference lists of studies that met

inclusion criteria. Low to moder-
ate levels of implicit racial/ethnic
bias were found among health
care professionals in all but 1
study. These implicit bias scores
are similar to those in the general
population. Levels of implicit
bias against Black, Hispanic/
Latino/Latina, and dark-skinned
people were relatively similar

across these groups. Although
some associations between im-
plicit bias and health care out-
comes were nonsignificant,
results also showed that implicit
bias was significantly related to
patient---provider interactions,
treatment decisions, treatment
adherence, and patient health
outcomes. j
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