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Background

Critical (or intensive) care involves the
management of acutely ill patients who
have or are at risk of organ failure.1 It is a
specialty of acuity, not of organ or appa-
ratus, dealing with heterogeneous patients
and complex pathology.2 Critical care ser-
vices are now an essential part of care
pathways in most hospitals providing both
emergency and elective care.

The demand for critical care is soaring
for several reasons:

• the ageing of the world’s population

• an increasing prevalence of comor-
bidities

• advances in medical therapy creating
‘riskier’ treatments with more com-
plications

• the prolongation of life in those with
chronic or previously terminal con-
ditions.

All these have created a cohort of
patients who need, and increasingly
expect to receive, higher levels of care
(Table 1).1,3,4 Hospitals now contain an
increasingly complex and unwell patient
set, with ‘standard’ wards working in
partnership with critical care outreach
teams to manage patients at risk of or
recovering from critical illness.

Critical care provision

The number of critical care beds in the
UK has risen steadily over the last
decade, but investment in critical care
services remains behind that of many
European countries.3 Statistics from the
Department of Health situation report
indicate approximately 3,700 adult and
about 400 paediatric critical care beds in
England, with approximately 85% of
available capacity occupied at any one
time.5 Local shortages can lead to
reduced access, enforced transfer of crit-
ically unwell patients between institu-
tions and the cancellation of urgent
treatments or procedures (estimated at
ca 10–15% of scheduled procedures).6

Morbidity and mortality are higher in
those not admitted to intensive care.7

The cost of critical care is determined by
the number of organs requiring sup-
port, ranging from £900/day for
patients requiring single-organ support
to over £1,700/day for patients requiring
multi-organ support.8 As the opposing

forces of supply and demand become
stronger, the need for objective and eth-
ical decisions about who is allowed
access to this costly and limited resource
is increasingly crucial.1

The ethics of admission

Critical care is not the panacea of
common perception. Mortality remains
high, especially for conditions such as
acute lung injury and septic shock.
Whilst technological advances allow
increased intervention and prolonga-
tion of life, this may not always be ben-
eficial or right.1 Long-term physical and
psychological sequelae are common
after critical illness and may persist for
months to years (see accompanying
article: Sequelae and rehabilitation after
critical illness pp xxx–xxx). This makes
determining who should receive inten-
sive care a complex issue. Decisions sur-
rounding admission are normally
driven by individual need, but may be
tempered by societal responsibility.
They must take into account religious,
legislative, cultural and personal factors,
together with the opinion of different
members of the multidisciplinary team.
Above all, decisions must be objective,
ethical and transparent. This represents
a significant challenge when time for
reflective and collaborative decision
making is limited.
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Advance care planning with patients
suffering chronic progressive diseases,
ideally when stable and led by teams
known and trusted by the individual,
may maximise the effectiveness of critical
care resources and minimise the burden
of end-of-life care on patients and fami-
lies.9 Early establishment of treatment
ceilings in acute admission is preferable,
as opposed to after deterioration.
Interdisciplinary algorithms for
common problems and close interface
between medical specialties, intensivists
and often palliative care may optimise
treatment practice  (Table 2).10

Principles of admission

The General Medical Council’s guidance
documents provide helpful guidance on
the ethical and legal aspects of decision
making in this setting.11,12 The increasing
complexity of the patient population and
perpetual modification of disease trajec-
tories via novel therapies have ensured it is
rare for the decision to be clear-cut.
Diseases previously considered incurable
are evolving into chronic conditions, with
critical care being a necessary bridge to
achieving therapeutic targets.

In this environment, questions
regarding ceilings of treatment and value
judgements of which life-sustaining
treatments are justified are increasingly
difficult.9,10 Prognostication without,
and even with, expert input is often diffi-
cult, especially in the setting of acute
brain injury. Decisions either to com-
mence or, more frequently, withhold life-
sustaining therapy in this situation are
inherently more complex.

The first step in the decision-making
process is for the referring physician and
critical care team to consider the treat-
ment options and potential risks, bene-
fits and burdens of each available option.
Information about the current illness,
underlying diseases/comorbidities,
response to treatment so far and patient’s
general health status may be helpful in
determining which options may poten-
tially be of benefit. These treatment
options, their risks, benefits and burdens
should then be discussed with the patient
if the patient has capacity, so they can

make an informed treatment choice.
Clinicians should be honest and realistic
during discussions and respect the
patient’s right to choice. Doctors cannot
be forced to provide treatment that is not
clinically appropriate. Where there is dis-
agreement about whether a particular
treatment for an individual patient will
provide overall benefit a second opinion
can be helpful in reaching consensus, if
time permits.

Decisions for patients who lack

capacity

Making decisions about treatment and
care for patients who lack capacity is gov-
erned in England and Wales by the
Mental Capacity Act 2005 and in
Scotland by the Adults with Incapacity
(Scotland) Act 2000. Enquiries should be
made to establish if the patient has a
valid advanced directive or has nomi-
nated a legal proxy with authority to
make decisions about medical treat-

ments.13,14 In their absence, the clinician
responsible for the patient’s care must
decide which treatment will provide
overall benefit to the patient. The clini-
cian is required to consult with members
of the healthcare team and those close to
the patient to inform their decision
making. In doing this, the clinician
should seek to establish what would have
been the patient’s wishes, preferences,
feelings, beliefs and values if they had
capacity. All this information must be
weighed up by the clinician to determine
which treatment pathway would provide
overall benefit to the patient.

Balancing individual needs with

resource limitation

The availability of critical care resources
varies significantly with location, and this
variation is known to alter the indications
and threshold for admission to critical
care.9 Despite this, the availability or lack
of beds should not alter the ethical 
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principles that guide the distribution of
existing resources or, in other words, the
process through which a decision is made.

The American Thoracic Society has
attempted to outline the principles gov-
erning allocation of critical care
resources.15 These principles state that:

• critical care, if ‘medically appro-
priate’, is an essential component of
basic healthcare and should be pro-
vided

• there is a limitation in the duty to
any given individual if it unfairly
compromises care to others.

Critical care unit structure and
function

In the UK, in common with Europe and
Australasia, a ‘closed’ model of critical
care is most frequently utilised.
Specialised intensive care physicians act
as the consultant in charge of care for the
period the patient is in the intensive care
unit (ICU). Admission and discharge
decisions to/from ICU are the responsi-
bility of the critical care team. However,
best practice involves a collaborative
approach between the critical care team
and referring physician.

The American College of Critical Care
Medicine describes different models of
admission selection (Table 3),16 of which
the ‘prioritisation’ model is almost uni-
versally employed by intensive care
physicians. This relies on clinician syn-
thesis of all available information on
patients referred to intensive care, and
their relative weighting in terms of need
for critical care admission, urgency of
intervention and presence of therapeutic
limits. Those with the greatest and most

urgent need and no pre-established
treatment limitation will be admitted in
advance of others.

Intensive care admission is often
refused to those either ‘too well’ to
require critical care input or ‘too sick’ to
benefit.17 The central problem, however,
is the absence of definitive, objective, evi-
dence-based metrics to evaluate into
which category a patient falls. The popu-
lation eligible for admission is not
homogeneous. Comparison at the indi-
vidual level between those with different
demographics, comorbidities and disease
is challenging.2 Critical care units are
recommended to have explicit and
written criteria for admission18 but, even
when in place, there remain issues sur-
rounding their interpretation and appli-
cation. Experienced clinicians should be
the final arbiters of admission decisions.
It is, however, well recognised that this
system is not perfect.

The literature demonstrates that bias
and chance play a large role in the process.
This may arise from bed availability, inci-
dence of admission requests, season, local
organisational factors and physician per-
ception of prognosis, amongst
others.10,17,19 Further important factors
are from where a patient is referred and
the stage in their disease course.

Early detection of critical illness and
the timely institution of appropriate care
can reduce morbidity, mortality and
length of stay.20 Identification of at-risk
patients and referral to relevant senior
specialists or the critical care service is
often delayed, especially on general
wards.21 This reduces the opportunities
to prevent further deterioration and
improve outcomes, and may bias the

decision whether or not to admit the
patient.

Role of scoring systems

Scoring systems have been developed to
measure the severity of illness and pre-
dict patient outcome. Examples include
the acute physiology and chronic health
evaluation (APACHE II and III) mor-
tality prediction models and simplified
acute physiology (SAPS) prognostic sys-
tems. These tools are useful for com-
paring outcomes in populations of
patients receiving intensive care, but
none has sufficient precision to be used
reliably to determine whether to admit
an individual patient to intensive care.22

Early warning scoring systems facili-
tate the early detection of critical illness.
These are based on derangements of
physiological variables such as heart rate,
blood pressure and respiratory rate.
Examples include:

• Early warning score (EWS).

• Modified early warning systems
(MEWS).

• Medical emergency team (MET) sys-
tems.17,23

Whilst some studies have shown
improved health outcomes, the optimal
system is yet to be established.24

Conclusions

There are no concrete rules about who
should or should not be admitted to crit-
ical care. Decisions are multifactorial and
often ethically challenging but frame-
works exist to help guide this process
(Table 3). Medical teams should engage
in discussions with the critical care team
regarding appropriate levels of care at the
earliest possible opportunity. The default
position should be admission where
there is clinical and prognostic uncer-
tainty about whether admission will pro-
vide overall benefit to the patient.
Resource limitation may impinge on, but
should not determine admission.
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