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greater prevalence of perianal disease and infectious com-
plications in CD, as well as a lower prevalence of extrain-
testinal manifestations and positive family history of IBD 
 [1] . IBD natural history, response to biologic therapy, and 
disease evolution over time appear similar to those re-
ported in the West. By contrast, in their article, Kedia and 
Ahuja  [2]  stress some of the striking similarities between 
IBD in India and IBD in the Western world, including 
microbial and (mostly) genetic profiles, disease location, 
disease phenotype, and incidence of colorectal cancer. In-
terestingly, most studies  [3] , including the authors’ own, 
do not confirm the well-known deleterious effect of 
smoking on CD development and natural history in Asia.

  So, does IBD in Asia truly differ from IBD in the West-
ern world? An obvious limitation of general comparisons 
is that Asia is a much more heterogeneous, large and pop-
ulated continent than Europe, the USA, and Canada. The 
local environment, the health-care standards, the preva-
lence of confounding infectious diseases, the socioeco-
nomic status, and many other factors may vary greatly 
among individual Asian countries. Hence, it might be 
more appropriate to compare the West with individual 
Asian countries. Nevertheless, immigration studies show 
that the offspring of first-generation immigrants from 
low-IBD-prevalence Asian countries to high-prevalence 

 Inflammatory bowel diseases (IBD), including Crohn 
disease (CD) and ulcerative colitis, have traditionally 
been considered diseases of the Western world (North 
America, Australia, and Europe), since in other parts of 
the world, their incidence and prevalence appeared to be 
much lower in the past several decades. Part of the West-
East gradient has been attributed to the scarcity of reliable 
epidemiological data in developing countries and to the 
concomitant prevalence of confounding factors for IBD 
diagnosis (e.g., intestinal tuberculosis). However, epide-
miological differences between East and West have al-
ways emerged when taking into account only the most 
developed Asian countries. In recent years, the rapid eco-
nomic growth and medical progress in large Asian coun-
tries, such as India and China, has made such compari-
sons even more timely and interesting. What has emerged 
is that in many parts of Asia – as in Western countries – 
the incidence of IBD is increasing exponentially, while 
still being lower than in Europe or North America. 

  In the present issue of the journal, Yang  [1]  and Kedia 
and Ahuja  [2]  revisit this subject in light of recent acqui-
sitions in the field and their own outstanding contribu-
tions. Yang  [1]  highlights a number of differences in Ko-
rean patients compared to their Western counterparts, 
including the greater prevalence of CD in males, the 
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Western countries acquire the risk of the baseline popula-
tion  [4] . In general, current data, including those present-
ed by Yang  [1]  and Kedia and Ahuja  [2] , do suggest a close 
similarity between patients diagnosed with IBD in Asia 
and those diagnosed in the Western world, with few no-
table differences. A final answer might take a long time to 
come. What seems clear for the moment is that the rising 
incidence and prevalence of IBD in Asia mirrors that of 
the Western world – which suggests that improved living 
conditions (the “hygiene hypothesis”) might contribute 
to disease etiology and pathogenesis in both continents. 
If that is the case, is it truly worth to continue to contrast 
(with the due limitations outlined above) IBD in Asia and 
IBD in Europe and North America? Will these studies 
clarify disease aspects that will one day lead to better 
treatments or perhaps a cure of IBD? We do not have an 
answer to the latter question. What we know – as stressed 
by both Yang  [1]  and Kedia and Ahuja  [2]  – is that the 
total IBD burden in Asia will likely surpass in the near 
future that in Western countries, which are already strug-
gling to deal with these life-long, debilitating and ex-
tremely expensive diseases. Hence, Asian countries 
should leverage on the Western experience and be pre-
pared to handle an epidemic of massive proportions in a 

very short time. As in the West, IBD diagnosis in Asia will 
remain difficult and often delayed with a negative impact 
on treatment outcomes  [5] . As in the West, IBD costs in 
Asia will be very high and possibly prohibitive for the 
lower social classes. As in the West, health-care directives 
and clinical research in Asia should put a strong emphasis 
on early diagnosis and possible prevention of these dis-
eases in the near future  [6, 7] .
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