
Policy Lessons From Early Reactions to the
COVID-19 Virus in China

The World Health Organization

(WHO) declared the COVID-19

virus outbreak to be a Public

Health Emergency of Interna-

tional Concern on January 30,

2020. Although the Chinese cen-

tral government implemented

significant measures to control

the epidemic from January 20

within China, the crisis had already

escalated dramatically.

Between December 1, 2019,

and January 20, 2020, a total of

51 days passed before the Chi-

nese central government took

full control. Severalmajor factors

combined to cause what had

been in retrospect a clear break

in the governmental information

chain between December 1 and

January 20. The management of

this epidemic also illustrated key

organizational limitations of the

current Chinese health system, in

particular provincial-level senior

officials’ lack of knowledge and

awareness of potential public

health risks and insufficient

emergency medical material stor-

age and logistics arrangements.

We review the specific disease

control actions that the Chinese

central government took be-

tweenJanuary20andJanuary27,

the major reasons why the gov-

ernmental information chain had

broken before January 20, and key

structural health system limita-

tions highlighted as the epidemic

expanded. (Am J Public Health.

2020;110:1145–1148.doi:10.2105/

AJPH.2020.305732)

Yu Liu, MPH, and Richard B. Saltman, PhD

See also Morabia, p. 1111, and the AJPH COVID-19 section, pp. 1123–1172.

The COVID-19 epidemic
began in the city of Wuhan

in Hubei Province, China. Bio-
medical researchers immediately
sought to establish the disease’s
origins and potential infectious
paths.1,2 Several factors about this
particular infectious agent and its
timing are important to under-
stand subsequent control efforts.
First, clinically, the COVID-19
virus and its disease progression
have unique features that present
particular challenges for disease
prevention and control. Current
biological and epidemiological
research suggest that COVID-19
can be infectious among humans
without symptoms and through
aerosol transmission paths3 and
that the incubation period can be
as long as 24 days3 with a pre-
liminary estimated infectious
rate of 1.4 to 2.5 according to
the World Health Organization
(WHO).4 However, there
remains much that is still clinically
unknown about COVID-19.

Second, socially, the rapid
expansion of the epidemic oc-
curred just before the Chinese
Lunar New Year (January 25,
2020), during which period ap-
proximately 3 billion holiday
trips normally take place in
China.5 Much like Thanksgiving
and Christmas Eve in the United
States, the Chinese Lunar New
Year is a time for reunions with
families and friends. This Lunar
New Year celebration break
was originally scheduled to be
from January 24 to January 30.
Wuhan’s mayor ZhouXianwang
stated in an interview on January

26, 2020, with China Central
Television (CCTV) that some 5
million people had left Wuhan
before the city’s lockdown.6

Third, economically, Wuhan
has the nickname of “China’s
thoroughfare”—it has a pop-
ulation of 11 million and serves
as the commercial and trans-
portation center of Central
China.7 It also has a substantial
number of manufacturing sites,
including western automobile
companies.

These 3 structural factors
combined highlight why it was
difficult for local, regional, and
central government to success-
fully control the COVID-19
virus from spreading to other
parts of China as well as inter-
nationally, despite many Lunar
New Year celebration events
being cancelled in Wuhan
after the city’s lockdown on
January 23.

Given this set of early events,
scrutiny of China’s central gov-
ernment’s response and the lim-
itations of the current Chinese
health care system as illustrated
by the development of the epi-
demic thus far may be helpful to
other countries as they in turn
fight the epidemic’s ongoing
spread.

THREE PHASES OF
COVID-19 DISEASE
CONTROL IN CHINA

The disease outbreak and the
Chinese government’s emer-
gency response can be roughly
divided into 3 phases. Phase 1
took place between December 1,
2019, with the first case of a
patient with pneumonia symp-
toms (later confirmed as
COVID-19 based on a retro-
spective study published in Lan-
cet8) and January 19, 2020.
During phase 1, the main re-
sponsibility for disease control
responsibilities continued, as was
standard in the Chinese govern-
mental system, with officials of
the Wuhan municipal govern-
ment and of Hubei Province.
Once the situation began to turn
bleak, in late December, this
system of local responsibility was
then supplemented by 3 different
expert team visits sent by the
central government to investigate
progress in suppressing the disease
outbreak. These expert teams’
members included the director
of the Chinese Center for Dis-
ease Control and Prevention
(CCDC), the director of the
National Institute for Commu-
nicable Disease Control and
Prevention, and other top sci-
entists in the field of infectious
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and respiratory diseases, with the
major role of the expert teams
being to investigate and assess the
potential epidemic situation.9

Phase 2 took place between
January 20 and 27, 2020, during
which period the Chinese central
government rapidly centralized
disease control strategies and
tasks including political, disease
management, financial, and
information-reporting activities.
Phase 3 dated from January 28,
2020, when the national govern-
ment stepped in forcefully with
centralized direction, and each
provincial government was re-
quired to contain the disease out-
break through a series of restrictive
measures following the strategies
designed in phase 2, including
mandatory quarantine of individ-
uals and the prevention of human
movement between communities,
cities, and provinces.

PHASE 2: IMPOSING
A CENTRALIZED
APPROACH

Starting with the strong mea-
sures taken during the brief period
between January 20 and 27, the
Chinese government suddenly and
dramatically shifted gears to im-
plement strict central control
measures to contain the spread of
the virus. These centralizing policy
actions and their results to date
(March 19, 2020) illustrate the
Chinese national government’s
capabilities in mobilizing resources
and centralizing mass media and
propaganda information in a short
period of time, even during
China’s traditional holiday season.
Table A (available as a supplement
to the online version of this article
at http://www.ajph.org) summa-
rizes the national government’s
major actions on these different
dimensions between January 20
and 27.

Several additional features of
the national government’s actions
deserve mention. First, the central
government emphasized real-time
information delivery, as illustrated
by CCTV’s real-time report and
daily press release. In addition, the
State Council also opened a direct
online channel that allowed local
citizens to report to the central
government potential misreport-
ing of information from the mu-
nicipal or provincial
government.10 This activity dem-
onstrated that the central govern-
ment wanted to avoid the
“cover-up”behavior that hadbeen
attributed by some to the munic-
ipal and provincial governments.

Second, State media run by
the central government, such as
People’s Daily (an official news-
paper of the Central Committee
of the Communist Party of
China) and CCTV, began using
social media (e.g., Weibo [like
Twitter and Facebook in the
United States]), as a major tool to
disseminate disease prevention
guidelines, central governmental
policy statements, and scientific
breakthrough announcements.
For example, in addition to
regular updates of confirmed
disease cases and central gov-
ernment policies related to
COVID-19, on January 28,
People’s Daily started to use
Weibo to refute rumors regard-
ing certain disease treatment
methods (e.g., that white vinegar
and liquor can cure the virus).

Third, several cities and edu-
cation agencies, including Bei-
jing Normal University, started a
psychiatric information hotline
within a week from January 20.11

Although an epidemic emer-
gency may not be as catastrophic
as a natural disaster (e.g., an
earthquake), the opening of a
psychiatric hotline represented an
awareness by the central gov-
ernment of the importance of
mental health.

WHERE DID THE
INFORMATION
CHAIN BREAK?

On January 30, 2020, the
WHO declared the outbreak of
COVID-19 to be a PublicHealth
Emergency of International
Concern.12 This decision re-
flected the reality that the epi-
demic had escalated rapidly
around the globe, despite emer-
gency efforts by the Chinese
central government since January
20 to mobilize and centralize
sufficient resources to control the
epidemic’s spread.12

Looking backward, it is in-
structive to review what hap-
pened between December 1,
2019, the first case (later con-
firmed as COVID-19)8 and
January 20, 2020, which was the
first day that a Chinese national
health expert officially stated that
the COVID-19 had a human-to-
human transmission mecha-
nism.13,14 There had been at least
3 previous opportunities for the
central government to recognize
the urgency of the situation and
to begin strong centralized re-
sponses earlier than January 20.
Figure A (available as a supple-
ment to the online version of this
article at http://www.ajph.org)
lists the timeline for key events
between December 1, 2019, and
January 20, 2020.

First, on December 30, 8
physicians used a Chinese social
media tool to warn peer doctors
and friends that “seven people
had contracted what [is] believed
to be SARS.”13 On January 1 and
January 2, rather than responding
factually to these online claims,
the Wuhan municipal govern-
ment and CCTV announced that
these 8 medical personnel were
spreading rumors and had been
admonished by local police.13

Second, on January 8, the
National Health Commission in
Beijing sent the second expert

mission to Wuhan to locally in-
spect the situation (by January 9
there were at least 59 confirmed
cases).13 On January 8, the CCDC
announced that scientists had suc-
cessfully separated the genomic
sequenceof the virus and stated that
this unknown virus was a novel
coronavirus.15 However, the vice–
group leader of the second expert
group stated on January 10 that
“the epidemic can be controlled
and preventable”16 and Wuhan’s
municipal government health
commission stated that it had “not
found newly infected patients”
between January 11 and 16.15

The third chance to act earlier
was on January 15, 2020,when the
director of the National Health
Commission went to Wuhan to
inspect the situation. The Wuhan
Municipal Health Commission
stated on January 15 that they had

not found evidence of human-to-
human transmission, and while we
cannot rule out the possibility of
human-to-human transmission,
the risk of continuous human-to-
human transmission is relatively
low.17

As these 3 instances demon-
strate, the information channels
within China that should have
delivered the crucial message to
the central government and to
the public that human-to-human
transmission was occurring to
stimulate immediate measures to
control the epidemic sooner had
3 successive failures.

The Wuhan municipal and
Hubei provincial governments
(i.e., the local governments)
normally would have been im-
portant stakeholders in this in-
formation chain. It seems that
they had reported earlier cases.
However, an even more im-
portant task of local government
in China is economic develop-
ment and the preservation of
social stability. Thus, the Lunar
New Year celebration activities
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between January 24 and 30 were
considered essential to show local
economic growth, especially for
the service industry.

Furthermore, between Janu-
ary 12 and 17, the prestigious
provincial-level meeting of the
All-China People’s Congresses
and Political Consultative Con-
ferences was scheduled to be held
in Wuhan, which required the
social stability theChinese central
government tried to maintain.18

Beyond these national political
requirements, concerns about
economic development and
social stability traditionally
determine local governmental
officials’ political future.19

Hence, local officials in Wuhan
and Hubei had strong profes-
sional and personal incentives to
minimize any potential negative
news or events during mid-
January 2020, extending even to
the severe “human-to-human
transmission” infectious disease
outbreak within their region.

Looking back at this early
stage communication process, it
is likely that the Wuhan and
Hubei officials were incentivized
primarily by economic develop-
ment and social stability, leading
them to underestimate the po-
tential hazard of the emerging
epidemic. Even with this con-
sideration, there were at least 3
groups of national-level health
experts and officials who went to
Wuhan between December 31,
2019, and January 15, 2020.
These health experts and officials
should have sensed the potential
danger of human-to-human
transmission given their years of
experience and expertise. Indeed,
all confirmed patients by De-
cember 30 were isolated.20

However, these health officials
understood that they were only
technical supports intended to
provide necessary guidance for
higher governmental officials’
decisions. The CCDC Web site

described its role and function as
“Under the leadership of Na-
tional Health Commission,
China CDC exerts its function in
technical guidance and support of
public health.”21 Expert team
member Guang Zeng also said
the following in an interview on
January 29:

However, government officials’
consideration of these issues
are not purely from a scientific
perspective. This is only part of
their decision-making basis. They
have to consider the political
factor, consider the issue of
maintaining stability, the
economic issues. . . .22

Under these circumstances,
with the health experts’ guid-
ance, local government officials
designed their initial strategy in
response to the epidemic as “in-
ternally closely inspection and
monitoring, and externally
loosely report the severity.”23

The technical supporting role
of the health care professionals
limited their ability to deliver
urgent information to higher-
level government and to react in a
faster manner, which otherwise
could have better controlled the
disease’s spread at an earlier stage.

Lastly, it is reasonable to ex-
pect that frontline medical staff
should have noticed that this
disease had a human-to-human
transmission path, given that at
least 7 medical staff contracted
the disease between January 1 and
11.2 Normally these medical
personnel would have raised their
voice to the media or publicly
disseminated their concerns.
However, they knew that the
earlier 8 physicians who expressed
concerns about SARS were si-
lenced.13 In addition, in China,
zero infected medical staff during
any epidemic is an important
nationally imposed performance
measure for all hospitals.24

Clearly, such a performance

evaluation method created a
strongly negative incentive for
Wuhan’s hospitals to report any
infected medical staff member.

RELATED LIMITATIONS
OF CHINA’S HEALTH
SYSTEM

The outbreak of the
COVID-19 virus and the early
governmental responses to contain
the disease illustrated several addi-
tional limitations of the current
Chinese health system. First, better
public health emergency response
education may be necessary for
municipal and provincial-level
governmental officials. None of
the top governmental officials of
Wuhan and Hubei Province
(mayor, governor, and party sec-
retaries) had a medical or public
health background. This lack of
public health awareness may have
contributed to their underestima-
tion of the urgency of early action.
By comparison, Sichuan Province
(which had a later onset of
COVID-19) started disease pre-
vention and control activities as
early as January 21. Sichuan
Province’s current governor for-
merly was vice-director of the
National Health Commission and
has a medical background. His
knowledge and consciousness of
public health issues may have
helped him make decisions when
the epidemic had just broken
out.25 Sichuan, one of the prov-
inces with the largest population in
China (approximately 81 million
people) situated close to Hubei
province, had in total 539 officially
confirmed cases as of March 14,
2020.26 (Anhui, a province close to
Hubei Province with approxi-
mately 62 million population, had
a total of 990 officially confirmed
cases as of March 14, 2020.26)

The second system-level
limitation revealed by the
COVID-19 epidemic concerns

the inventory and management
of emergency response supplies.
On January 22, Hubei Province
intended to request emergency
support of medical supplies from
the central government.27 On
January 24, many hospitals in
Wuhan nearly ran out of essential
inventory and sought to raise
hospital supplies from the
broader society directly, includ-
ingmedical gloves and protection
gowns, N95 face masks, and
medical goggles.28 The lack of
appropriate protection for health
care workers may have contrib-
uted to the high number of
hospital-acquired infections for
health care workers during the
early epidemic control period.29

Subsequently, the supply man-
agement arm of the Wuhan Red
Cross Society that had sought
these donated supplies to support
Wuhan’s local hospitals was
strongly condemned online by
many in the citizenry.30 The
full-time deputy director and
other 2 officials of the Hubei
branch of the Red Cross Society
of China were fired for derelic-
tion of duty on February 4.31

Given that China is a large
country with a massive pop-
ulation, the inventory and co-
ordination of critical medical
supplies for emergencies ought
to be better organized.

CONCLUSION
Between January 20 and

January 27, 2020, the central
government in China reacted
rapidly to contain the epidemic.
However, based on the subse-
quent development of the disease
outbreak, these centralized efforts
were not instituted as early as they
should have been. Looking
backward at events from early
December 2019, it appears that 3
factors were the main contribu-
tors to the breakdown of the
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central government’s response
before the disease broke out from
its initial stage: an economic- and
stability-driven local govern-
ment, an exclusively technical
supporting role for health-
monitoring agencies, and a group
of silenced frontline doctors. The
subsequent results of this sup-
pression of the public-sector
reporting chain helped create a
much larger and more serious
national and international medi-
cal emergency. The outbreak and
early governmental response also
reflected other limitations of the
current Chinese health system, in
particular provincial-level offi-
cials’ lack of training concerning
potential public health risks and
inadequately coordinated emer-
gency medical material storage
and logistics.

Looking backward, it can be
argued that the previous SARS
epidemic in 2003 ultimately had
a positive impact on the structure
of China’s health system, encour-
aging the central government to
recentralize CCDC and to invest
more resources in primary care.32

The early centralized responses to
COVID-19, once initiated, also
demonstrated faster responses by
the Chinese central government
than at the time of SARS.33 Al-
though this new epidemic is not
over, hopefully the experience of
dealing with it will spur further
positive developments in the
Chinese health sector and in other
public agencies as well.
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