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individuals living in an urban environment, with signifi-
cant baseline disease burden, and who predominately
identify as Black and Hispanic. Finally, the sample size
was relatively small with 50 participants, which may
have left us underpowered to detect statistically significant
differences.

The COVID-19 pandemic continues to be an evolving sit-
uation with recurrent surges, emerging mutant strains, and
varying public health responses world-wide. The effect of
these factors on healthcare delivery to patients seeking bar-
iatric surgery and care are difficult to anticipate. While these
times prove challenging, more work is needed to assess and
maintain the quality of the bariatric process in spite of the
difficulties imposed by the pandemic.

Conclusion

Patients pursuing bariatric surgery have had their care
postponed and rescheduled due to the risks and constraints
presented by the COVID-19 pandemic. Those subject to
lockdown restrictions during the pre-operative period have
been challenged by difficulty in maintaining healthy nutri-
tional habits as well as physical activity goals, resulting in
weight gain – though not to pre-consultation levels. Despite
the additional risks posed by the on-going COVID-19
pandemic, patients remain in favor of undergoing bariatric
surgery during this period. To enable continued care for
this population willing to undergo surgery, communication
of risks as well as procedures that will be enacted to mini-
mize their risk with respect to COVID-19 are critical.
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Editorial comment

Comment on: Life during “lockdown”: a cautionary tale of the impact of
environment on access to bariatric surgery
The COVID-19 pandemic placed a unique spotlight on
the many challenges that are encountered when caring for
patients suffering from obesity. The preoperative process
for bariatric surgery can be resource intensive as it requires
numerous visits with health care providers. Given its high
barrier to entry, bariatric surgery is not only underutilized,

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.soard.2021.05.026
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.soard.2021.05.026
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref1
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref1
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref1
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref2
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref2
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref2
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref2
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref2
https://tuljournals.temple.edu/index.php/commonhealth/article/view/422
https://tuljournals.temple.edu/index.php/commonhealth/article/view/422
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref4
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref4
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref4
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref4
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref5
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref5
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref5
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref6
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref6
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref7
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref7
https://www.R-project.org
https://www.R-project.org
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref9
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref9
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref9
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref9
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref10
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref10
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref11
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref11
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref11
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref11
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref12
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref12
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref12
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref13
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref13
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref13
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref13
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref14
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref14
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref14
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref15
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref15
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref15
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref16
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref16
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref16
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref17
http://refhub.elsevier.com/S1550-7289(21)00304-X/sref17


Vineet Naran et al. / Surgery for Obesity and Related Diseases 17 (2021) 1714–1721 1721
but also has a high dropout rate despite being the most effec-
tive treatment for obesity and associated co-morbidities [1].
During the pandemic, the complexity of navigating the pre-
operative bariatric surgery process was further exacerbated
by 2 major changes in health care delivery. First, health
care systems stopped performing nonessential elective pro-
cedures such as bariatric surgery, and second, local govern-
ments imposed lockdown measures to promote physical
distancing and thus prevent further spread of the virus. Pa-
tients with obesity were also considered an “at-risk” popu-
lation, given the potential increase in morbidity and
mortality when contracting COVID-19 [2]. As a result, pa-
tients were also more likely to avoid in-person interactions
with health care providers for fear of being exposed to the
virus. To make matters worse, the compounded effect of so-
cial and physical isolation increased the risk for maladaptive
behaviors, which can result in weight gain [3,4]. While the
risks, benefits, and merits of offering bariatric surgery dur-
ing the pandemic were being debated among providers,
health care systems, local governments, and payers, an
important perspective was missing: the patient’s.
As such, the authors are to be commended for exploring

the opinions of patients who were pursuing bariatric surgery
during the COVID-19 pandemic. The questionnaire was
uniquely insightful for a number of reasons. First, it pro-
vided valuable information about how bariatric surgery pro-
grams can adapt to their patients’ needs. Second, it provided
data on a patient’s ability to self-reflect on their own behav-
iors. Third, it offered a glimpse into a patient’s commitment
to pursuing surgery, even in the face of uncertainty or hypo-
thetically increased risk. Based on their survey questions,
the authors found that social and physical isolation can
result in significant changes in health behaviors, as patients
reported that they were exercising less and snacking more
during the lockdown period, despite making appropriate
changes after their initial evaluation. Not surprisingly, this
resulted in weight gain in 62% of patients. The authors
cite that that confinement, decreased psychological well-
being, lack of access to a gym, and easier access to shelf-
stable or potentially unhealthy foods are potential reasons
for their findings and that behavioral maladaptation was
more apparent during the lockdown. With this in mind, it
is important to recognize, that low-income patients who
live with limited resources face the exact same challenges
even when there is no pandemic or lockdown mandates in
place. Consequently, it comes as no surprise that patients
with limited resources are also less likely to progress to sur-
gery [5]. Interestingly, the COVID-19 pandemic provided an
opportunity for an entire population to experience a forced
environment that can negatively impact health, well-being,
and achieving one’s weight loss goals. It also serves as a
reminder of the importance of recognizing social determi-
nants of health and that discriminatory practices may be dis-
proportionally affecting access to care for bariatric surgery.
Another intriguing finding of this study is that despite po-
tential risks of being exposed to COVID-19, 90% of patients
indicated that they preferred to undergo surgery as soon as
possible. This indicates a striking level of commitment,
which is a quality that is often questioned by payers and pro-
viders alike. Although a commitment to lifelong behavioral
changes is beneficial to maximizing weight loss outcomes
and decreasing recidivism, there is no standardized scienti-
fic approach to measuring commitment among bariatric sur-
gery patients. Instead, programs are confined to assessing
compliance via monthly in-person visits to discuss weight
loss strategies for an arbitrary number of months, often
based on insurance coverage. Once again, the COVID-19
pandemic highlighted the difficulty of demonstrating
commitment when patients live in an environment with
limited access to health care providers, healthy food, or a
safe environment for physical activity.

In the future, more studies would benefit from integrating
patients’ perspectives as they are vital to delivering effective
and equitable health care. Patient-reported outcomes can be
valuable trustworthy data that are more accessible because
they do not rely on in-person clinic visits. Furthermore, by
capitalizing on the expansion of telehealth during the
pandemic, there is a new opportunity to capture long-term
outcomes for bariatric surgery without placing the burden
on a patient’s ability to visit a clinic.
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