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Fc g receptor IIB (FcgRIIB) is an inhibitorymolecule capable of reducing antibody

immunotherapy efficacy.We hypothesized its expression could confer resistance in

patients with diffuse large B-cell lymphoma (DLBCL) treatedwith anti-CD20monoclonal

antibody (mAb) chemoimmunotherapy, with outcomes varying depending onmAb

(rituximab [R]/obinutuzumab [G]) because of differentmechanisms of action.We evaluated

correlates between FCGR2Bmessenger RNA and/or FcgRIIB protein expression and

outcomes in 3 de novo DLBCL discovery cohorts treatedwith R plus cyclophosphamide,

doxorubicin, vincristine, and prednisone (R-CHOP) reported by Arthur, Schmitz, and

Reddy, and R-CHOP/G-CHOP-treated patients in the GOYA trial (NCT01287741). In the

discovery cohorts, higher FCGR2B expressionwas associatedwith significantly shorter

progression-free survival (PFS; Arthur: hazard ratio [HR], 1.09; 95% confidence interval

[CI], 1.01-1.19; P5 .0360; Schmitz: HR, 1.13; 95% CI, 1.02-1.26; P5 .0243). Similar results

were observed in GOYAwith R-CHOP (HR, 1.26; 95% CI, 1.00-1.58; P5 .0455), but not G-

CHOP (HR, 0.91; 95% CI, 0.69-1.20; P5 .50). A nonsignificant trend that high FCGR2B

expression favored G-CHOP over R-CHOPwas observed (HR, 0.67; 95% CI, 0.44-1.02; P5

.0622); however, low FCGR2B expression favored R-CHOP (HR, 1.58; 95% CI, 1.00-2.50; P5

.0503). In Arthur andGOYA, FCGR2B expressionwas associatedwith tumor FcgRIIB

expression; correlatingwith shorter PFS for R-CHOP (HR, 2.17; 95% CI, 1.04-4.50; P5 .0378),

but not G-CHOP (HR, 1.37; 95% CI, 0.66-2.87; P5 .3997). This effect was independent of

established prognostic biomarkers. High FcgRIIB/FCGR2B expression has prognostic value
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Key Points

� High FCGR2B
expression is
associated with
shorter survival in
patients with DLBCL
receiving rituxumab
(R)-CHOP but not
obinutuzumab-CHOP.

� The inferior outcomes
seen with R-CHOP
are independent of
established prognos-
tic biomarkers, and
associated with
tumor-expressed
FcgRIIB.
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in R-treated patients with DLBCL and may confer differential responsiveness to

R-CHOP/G-CHOP.

Introduction

The anti-CD20 monoclonal antibody (mAb) rituximab (R) has
been used for the treatment of relapsed/refractory non-Hodgkin
lymphomafor .20 years, becoming ubiquitous in the treatment of
B-cell disorders spanning malignant and autoimmune patholo-
gies.1-3 This success highlights the utility of mAbs for disease
treatment and CD20 as a therapeutic target. Despite the clinical
benefits of R plus chemotherapy, a sizable proportion of patients
are refractory to/relapse following treatment, inviting the next gen-
eration of mAb therapeutics for non-Hodgkin lymphoma.2,4 The
study of anti-CD20 mAbs has also identified important determi-
nants of cell-surface antigens that are optimal for target cell dele-
tion and has enabled key mechanisms of action of direct-
targeting antibodies to be defined.4

Anti-CD20 mAbs affect target cells in vivo by 4 separate mecha-
nisms: direct cell death, complement-dependent cytotoxicity (CDC),
antibody-dependent cellular cytotoxicity (ADCC), and antibody-de-
pendent cellular phagocytosis (ADCP).4 Although the importance of
each is debated, current evidence suggests that effector mecha-
nisms mediated by Fc g receptors (FcgR) are critical. Preclinical
studies in mouse models strongly favor myeloid cells as the key ef-
fectors, operating through ADCP5-9; macrophages become activat-
ed by mAb-opsonized target cells through their activatory FcgR,
resulting in target cell engulfment and destruction. Previous studies
have shown that macrophages are a key determinant of antitumor
treatment response,10 indicating that macrophages (in some pa-
tients) can be harnessed for antitumor effects.11,12 This was previ-
ously confirmed in the GOYA trial, which reported a correlation
between high programmed death-ligand 1 expression, a marker of
macrophage activation, and improved response after anti-CD20
chemoimmunotherapy in a subset of patients.13 FcgR IIB (FcgRIIB),
the sole inhibitory FcgR, is thought to limit ADCP by reducing acti-
vatory FcgR signaling in a Src homology 2 domain-containing inosi-
tol phosphatase- and Src homology 2-containing tyrosine
phosphatase-1-dependent manner.14 In primary cultures of chronic
lymphocytic leukemia (CLL) cells, FcgR-dependent macrophage
ADCP was shown to correlate with clinical response, with resis-
tance to ADCP resulting from reduced signaling activity through the
activating FcgRs, and attributed to dominance of FcgRIIB.15 It
should be recognized that natural killer (NK) cells (presumably
through ADCC) may also represent important effectors in humans
because recent studies have indicated a prognostic impact of NK
cell numbers in chemoimmunotherapy-treated patients with follicular
lymphoma (FL) and diffuse large B-cell lymphoma (DLBCL).16

In part, these hypotheses regarding critical effector mechanisms have
been informed by clinical experience with second generation anti-
CD20 mAbs, such as ofatumumab and obinutuzumab (GA101 [G]).
Ofatumumab is a fully human mAb with enhanced CDC activity, but
has not demonstrated clinical improvement over R.17-19 In contrast,
the humanized mAb, G, has shown improved activity over R in CLL20

and FL,21,22 but not DLBCL.23,24 The augmented activity of G has
several possible explanations. First, G is a type II anti-CD20 mAb,

which, unlike ofatumumab, does not cluster CD20, precipitate com-
plement component 1q binding, or cause efficient CDC. Rather,
such type II mAbs elicit nonapoptotic, lysosomal cell death, at least in
some cell types.25-28 Second, G possesses a glycoengineered afu-
cosylated Fc region with higher affinity binding to FcgRIII, resulting in
an increased capacity to elicit both NK-mediated ADCC and mye-
loid-mediated ADCP.29,30 Finally, type II mAbs do not rapidly internal-
ize from the cell surface, unlike their type I counterparts, such as R;
this rapid internalization experienced by type I mAbs limits all of their
Fc-mediated effector functions.7,31 Recently, it was shown that re-
duced FcgRIIB-mediated internalization of G relative to R on CLL
cells leads to increased phagocytosis by primary macrophages in an
FcgRI-dependent manner.32 It remains unclear which of these phe-
nomena elicits the improvement in efficacy; however, in preclinical
models in which lysosomal cell death is absent and afucosylation is
lacking, type II mAbs significantly outperform R, presumably because
of lack of internalization.7,8 We previously showed that this internaliza-
tion is augmented by the coexpression of FcgRIIB on the B-cell sur-
face, resulting in degradation of the mAb in lysosomes.31 This effect
was greatly reduced with G (fucosylated and afucosylated) com-
pared with R or ofatumumab, and was confirmed in primary clinical
samples, including DLBCL.31,33

Through whole-genome sequencing of DLBCL, we recently de-
scribed recurrent focal amplifications of FCGR2B in a subset of
germinal center B-cell (GCB) DLBCLs, which drive elevated mes-
senger RNA and protein expression. These mutations and high
FCGR2B expression were associated with inferior outcomes in pa-
tients treated with R plus cyclophosphamide, doxorubicin, vincris-
tine, and prednisone (CHOP).34 Owing to the variable expression of
FCGR2B in DLBCL, contributed in part by genetic alterations, we
hypothesized that high FcgRIIB expression on malignant cells could
confer resistance to anti-CD20 mAbs in DLBCL, with a differential
impact on the efficacy of R and G. In this retrospectively designed
analysis, we evaluated the gene and protein expression of FcgRIIB
in a series of large clinical cohorts of DLBCL, and examined associ-
ations with response in R-CHOP- and G-CHOP-treated patients.

Methods

Data sets

We assessed the prognostic effect of FcgRIIB in DLBCL in 3 dis-
covery cohorts of de novo DLBCL uniformly treated with R-
CHOP34-36 and in the GOYA trial, which compared R-CHOP with
G-CHOP.23,24

We analyzed data from 404 patients from the Arthur cohort,34 554/
574 patients from the Schmitz cohort (20 omitted patients were bi-
opsied at relapse and treated with ibrutinib),35 and 1001 patients
from the Reddy cohort.36

A Study of Obinutuzumab in Combination With CHOP Chemother-
apy Versus Rituximab With CHOP in Participants With CD20-Posi-
tive Diffuse Large B-Cell Lymphoma (GOYA) (NCT01287741) was
a phase 3, multicenter, open-label, randomized trial. Full details of its
design and primary end points were published previously.23,24 In
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brief, previously untreated patients with DLBCL were randomized to
receive 8 21-day cycles of G or R plus 6 or 8 cycles of CHOP. The
number of CHOP cycles for both arms was agreed in advance with
each study site. If 6 CHOP cycles were administered, the mAb was
administered as monotherapy during cycles 7 and 8. The primary
end point was investigator-assessed progression-free survival (PFS).
The trial protocol was approved by local or national ethics commit-
tees according to the laws of each country, and the trial was under-
taken in accordance with the Declaration of Helsinki. Written
informed consent was provided by all patients. We used data from
the final analysis of GOYA (clinical cutoff date: 31 January 2018),
which were available for 1414 patients.24

Available and analyzed biomarker and outcome data from these clin-
ical cohorts are summarized in supplemental Table 1. Median
duration of follow-up and patient demographic and baseline charac-
teristics are presented in Table 1.

RNA sequencing

RNA from the Arthur and Schmitz cohorts was extracted from frozen
tumors. In the Reddy cohort, RNA was extracted from formalin-fixed
paraffin-embedded (FFPE) samples. Details of sample processing
were described previously.34-36 In GOYA, RNA was extracted from
pretreatment FFPE tissue using the RNeasy FFPE kit (Qiagen,

Table 1. Demographic and baseline characteristics of DLBCL patients (all patients [ITT population] and BEP population) in the 3

discovery cohorts and the GOYA study

Arthur Schmitz Reddy GOYA

Characteristic�
All

(N 5 404)

BEP RNA-seq

(n 5 372)

All

(N 5 554)

BEP RNA-seq

(n 5 234)

All

(N 5 1001)

BEP RNA-seq

(n 5 455)

All

(N 5 1414)

BEP RNA-seq

(n 5 552)

Median follow-up, y 11.7 11.5 10.5 10.5 10.4 8.9 4.0 4.1

Age, n 404 372 546 234 950 448 1414 552

Median (range), y 64 (16-92) 64 (16-92) 62 (14-92) 61 (16-92) 62 (3.1-93.4) 63 (3.1-93.4) 62 (18-86) 63 (18-85)

Female 153 (37.9) 143 (38.4) 241 (43.5) 95 (40.6) 434 (43.5)† 196 (43.1) 664 (47.0) 264 (47.8)

IPI, n 385 354 339 189 761 388 1414 552

Low 128 (33.3) 118 (33.3) 103 (30.4) 77 (40.7) 244 (32.1) 120 (30.9) 282 (19.9) 107 (19.4)

Low-intermediate 105 (27.3) 97 (27.4) 87 (25.7) 45 (23.8) 180 (23.7) 94 (24.2) 500 (35.4) 194 (35.1)

High-intermediate 71 (18.4) 64 (18.1) 84 (24.8) 44 (23.3) 192 (25.2) 101 (26.0) 412 (29.1) 161 (29.2)

High 81 (21.0) 75 (21.2) 65 (19.2) 23 (12.2) 145 (19.1) 73 (18.8) 220 (15.6) 90 (16.3)

Ann Arbor stage at diagnosis, n 404 372 458 231 974 448 1413 552

I/II 180 (44.6) 165 (44.3) 200 (43.7) 109 (47.2) 384 (39.4) 176 (39.3) 340 (24.1) 134 (24.3)

III/IV 224 (55.4) 207 (55.7) 258 (56.3) 122 (52.8) 590 (60.6) 272 (60.7) 1073 (75.9) 418 (75.7)

COO, n 388 364 554 234 775 455 933 538

GCB 217 (55.9) 204 (56.0) 164 (29.6) 110 (47.0) 331 (42.7) 197 (43.3) 540 (57.9) 298 (55.4)

ABC 129 (33.3) 120 (33.0) 279 (50.4) 82 (35.0) 313 (40.4) 187 (41.1) 243 (26.1) 151 (28.1)

Unclassified 42 (10.8) 40 (11.0) 111 (20.0) 42 (18.0) 131 (16.9) 71 (15.6) 150 (16.1) 89 (16.5)

DHITsig, n 204 204 134 107 207 197 298 298

Positive 60 (29.4) 60 (29.4) 24 (17.9) 21 (19.6) 57 (27.5) 53 (26.9) 32 (10.7) 32 (10.7)

Negative 144 (70.6) 144 (70.6) 110 (82.1) 86 (80.4) 150 (72.5) 144 (73.1) 266 (89.3) 266 (89.26)

BCL2 by IHC, n 364 343 0 0 462 230 755 433

Positive 245 (67.3) 235 (68.5) – – 323 (69.9) 172 (74.8) 363 (48.1) 206 (47.6)

Negative 119 (32.7) 108 (31.5) – – 139 (30.1) 58 (25.2) 392 (51.9) 227 (52.4)

Number of chemotherapy cycles, n – – – – – – 1414 552

6 – – – – – – 1045 (73.9) 402 (72.8)

8 – – – – – – 369 (26.1) 150 (27.2)

Geographic region, n 1414 552

Asia – – – – – – 514 (36.4) 89 (16.1)

Eastern Europe – – – – – – 196 (13.9) 122 (22.1)

Western Europe – – – – – – 426 (30.1) 216 (39.1)

North America – – – – – – 216 (15.3) 93 (16.9)

Other – – – – – – 62 (4.4) 32 (5.8)

�
All data are n (%) unless otherwise stated.

† Data missing for n 5 3.
DHITsig, double-hit gene expression signature; ITT, intent-to-treat.
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Hilden, Germany). Whole transcriptome gene expression was as-
sayed using Illumina TruSeq RNA Access.

For the Reddy, Arthur, and GOYA cohorts, reads were aligned with
Spliced Transcripts Alignment to a Reference,37 duplicate reads re-
moved, and gene expression quantified with featureCounts38 using
only uniquely mapping reads. For the Reddy cohort, additional filter-
ing was required to remove abnormally low-coverage samples. Raw
count data were normalized with variance stabilizing transformation
using DESeq2.39 For the Schmitz cohort, the gene expression ma-
trix was used in its unmodified form as previously described.35

NanoString assay

A subset of tumors in the Arthur cohort were analyzed with the
DLBCL90 NanoString assay, as described by Ennishi et al 2019.40

This CodeSet includes a probe complementary to the exon 7-8 junc-
tion in FCGR2B, a region that does not share significant sequence
similarity with either of its paralogs. RNA was extracted from FFPE
biopsies using the Qiagen AllPrep DNA/RNA FFPE kit, and 200 ng
was hybridized at 65�C overnight to the DLBCL90 CodeSet
probes. Data were normalized for loading and RNA integrity by di-
viding by the geometric mean of 13 housekeeping genes and multi-
plying by 1000, followed by log2 transformation.

FCGR2B qPCR

Oligo(dT)-primed RNA (500 ng) was converted to complementary
DNA using the SuperScript III First-Strand Synthesis kit (Life Tech-
nologies, Paisley, UK). Quantitative polymerase chain reaction
(qPCR) was performed using complementary DNA (24 ng), Super-
Mix UDG (Life Technologies), and TaqMan probe sets (Life Technol-
ogies) targeting FCGR2B (Assay ID: Hs01634996_S1) and
HPRT1 (Assay ID: Hs02800695_m1). Thermal cycling was per-
formed using a CFX96 real-time PCR detection system C1000TM
(Bio-Rad, Watford, UK). Data were expressed as a ratio of the
threshold values for FCGR2B:HPRT1 and stratified into the follow-
ing groups based on a cumulative frequency graph: low, cycle quan-
tification value (Cq) # .94; medium, Cq .94 to 1.05; and high,
Cq $ 1.05.

Immunohistochemistry staining

FcgRIIB (CD32B) immunohistochemistry (IHC) staining in GOYA
was performed using heat-mediated and enzyme antigen retrieval
techniques on 4-mm tissue sections cut from paraffin-embedded tis-
sue blocks. Samples were stained with commercially available
mAbs using a Bond-Max automated immunostainer with Bond re-
agents (Leica Microsystems, Milton Keynes, UK). Slides were dew-
axed, pretreated with the Bond ER2 protocol, stained with
commercially available antibodies, and counterstained with hematox-
ylin using the standard Bond protocol, according to the manufac-
turer's instructions. The slides were mounted with Pertex (Histolab
products, Germany) and coverslipped with glass coverslips (Surgi-
path Europe Limited, Cambridge, UK) using a Leica CV5330 (Leica
Biosystems, UK). Staining antibodies were diluted in BOND Primary
Antibody Diluent (Leica Biosystems) and used at the indicated con-
centrations: FcgRIIB, clone EP888Y (Abcam, Cambridgeshire, UK),
1/2000 dilution and CD68, clone PG-M1 (DAKO, Agilent Technolo-
gies, Cheshire, UK) 1/250 dilution. Images were collected using the
Olympus dotSlide microscope system (Olympus, Southend-on-Sea,
UK).

IHC staining for the Arthur cohort was as described previously.34

Tissue microarrays (TMAs) were constructed using duplicate 0.6-
mm cores from diagnostic pretreatment FFPE tissue. Staining was
performed on the Ventana platform (F. Hoffmann-La Roche, Basel,
Switzerland) using routine staining protocols.

IHC expression scoring

In GOYA, tumor expression of FcgRIIB was assessed by light mi-
croscopy by 2 individuals, including a pathologist, using a double-
headed microscope, with a consensus recorded for each sample.
Pathologists and other investigators were blinded to the treatment
group when performing the analyses. Scoring thresholds were de-
fined retrospectively while blinded to clinical data. Expression was
scored semiquantitatively in comparison with normal mantle cells in
reactive tonsil that showed strong membrane staining. Tumors were
assessed as negative or positive for membrane staining; the positive
staining was graded as strong, moderate, or weak depending on
the intensity. The proportion of positive tumor cells was estimated
as a percentage of total tumor cells. The staining intensity and per-
centage of positive tumor cells were amalgamated to give 3 scores,
high, low, and negative, defined as follows: membrane staining of at
least medium intensity and with $50% positive cells (high); mem-
brane positive, low intensity or ,50% positive (low); and cytoplas-
mic staining or negative membrane staining (negative).

Scoring of FcgRIIB staining of the Arthur cohort TMA was per-
formed as described previously by 2 independent hematopatholo-
gists.34 Intensity and proportion of positive tumor cells were
amalgamated into a single score following the same criteria de-
scribed for GOYA, after taking the average of the scores given by
each pathologist.

The numbers of macrophages present within the tumors and their
expression of FcgRIIB was assessed in GOYA by double staining
TMA sections with CD68 together with FcgRIIB. The total number
of CD681 macrophages and total double-stained macrophages
were counted in a standard area for each TMA core. For each core,
a single representative field containing predominantly tumor was se-
lected for counting. The macrophages showed granular cytoplasmic
staining of CD68 and were only counted if a nucleus was associat-
ed with the staining. Double staining was assessed as present if
there was identifiable red and brown staining associated with the
same nucleus. The percentage of double staining was calculated as
the ratio of total double-stained macrophages and total CD681

macrophages and subsequently split into 3 scores: high (double
staining $50%), low (double-staining ,50%), and negative (no
double-stained macrophages present).

Statistical analysis

The association between FCGR2B expression and PFS and overall
survival (OS) was assessed separately for each cohort using Ka-
plan-Meier (KM) plots and Cox regression analysis. For GOYA, the
association was evaluated per treatment arm. The predictive analysis
in GOYA was performed by assessing treatment effect in patients
with low (#median) and high (.median) FCGR2B expression and
by fitting a model with treatment, FCGR2B expression, and an inter-
action term between treatment and FCGR2B expression.

In Cox regression analyses, gene expression was represented as
continuous values or dichotomized by the median. KM plots for
gene expression were generated using the dichotomized values and
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Figure 1. Association of FCGR2B expression with PFS in DLBCL patients treated with R-CHOP. Kaplan-Meier curves for PFS in DLBCL based on FCGR2B

expression measured by (A-B) RNA-seq in the Arthur and Schmitz cohorts and (C-F) according to stratification by COO. Cox regression results based on FCGR2B

expression dichotomized by median.
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the corresponding Cox regression statistics (hazard ratio [HR] and
P values) are displayed.

The prognostic and predictive effect of FCGR2B was assessed us-
ing univariate and multivariate models. The multivariate model was
adjusted for International Prognostic Index (IPI), cell-of-origin (COO),
and BCL2 protein expression, which have previously demonstrated
prognostic significance in DLBCL.23,41 P values , .05 were consid-
ered significant.

High-throughput studies

The GOYA RNA sequencing (RNA-seq) data are available at the
Gene Expression Omnibus (accession number: GSE125966;
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/geo/query/acc.cgi?acc=GSE125966).

Results

Association of PFS and OS with expression of

FCGR2B in patients treated with R-CHOP

RNA-Seq PFS data were available for 372 cases from the Arthur
cohort and 229 cases from the Schmitz cohort; RNA-Seq OS data
were available for 372 and 234 cases, respectively. RNA-Seq data
were available for 454 cases from the Reddy cohort, along with OS
but not PFS data. Results from similar analyses using OS are in-
cluded for all cohorts in the data supplement. Increased FCGR2B
expression was associated with significantly shorter PFS in the uni-
variate model in both the Arthur and Schmitz cohorts using expres-
sion as a dichotomized (Figure 1A-B) and continuous variable
(Arthur: HR, 1.09; 95% confidence interval [CI], 1.01-1.19; P 5
.0360; Schmitz: HR, 1.13; 95% CI, 1.02-1.26; P 5 .0243), and
was independent of IPI, COO, and BCL2 protein expression in the
multivariate model (supplemental Table 2). The KM curves separat-
ing according to quartiles of FCGR2B expression, and robust effect
observed when dichotomizing across a range of thresholds, with re-
spect to the prognostic association with FCGR2B expression
across the Arthur and Schmitz cohorts, support that this result is in-
dependent of the RNA-Seq analysis and quantification methods
used (supplemental Figure 1).

Following stratification by COO, the effect of FCGR2B expression
on PFS was more apparent for the GCB subtype than the activated
B-cell (ABC) subtype in the Arthur cohort (univariate analysis [con-
tinuous]: GCB: HR, 1.14; 95% CI, 1.03-1.26; P 5 .0150; ABC:
HR, 1.09; 95% CI, 0.91-1.31; P 5 .36) (supplemental Table 2; Fig-
ure 1C-D). However, in the Schmitz cohort the effect of FCGR2B
expression was no longer apparent for either the GCB or ABC sub-
types (univariate analysis [continuous]: GCB: HR, 1.04; 95% CI,
0.87-1.23; P 5 .68; ABC: HR, 1.14; 95% CI, 0.91-1.43; P 5 .25)
(supplemental Table 2; Figure 1E-F).

High FCGR2B expression was significantly associated with inferior
OS in the Reddy cohort in the continuous univariate model (HR,
1.21; 95% CI, 1.04-1.42; P 5 .0167), although the effect became

nonsignificant when adjusting for IPI, COO, and BCL2 by IHC.
Weaker OS trends were observed with the Arthur and Schmitz co-
horts (supplemental Figure 2; supplemental Table 3).

Validation of the prognostic effect of FCGR2B
expression by NanoString

NanoString expression data for FCGR2B was generated for 325 tu-
mors from the Arthur cohort. Increased FCGR2B expression mea-
sured by NanoString correlated strongly with FCGR2B expression
by RNA-seq (Spearman’s r 5 .87, P , .0001) (Figure 2A). The as-
sociations of PFS and OS with FCGR2B expression by NanoString
confirmed those observed by RNA-seq, with high FCGR2B expres-
sion significantly associated with shorter PFS (univariate analysis
[continuous]: HR, 1.13, 95% CI, 1.04-1.23; P 5 .0048) (supple-
mental Table 4; Figure 2B) but not OS (supplemental Table 4; sup-
plemental Figure 3). These findings were comparable for univariate
and multivariate analyses (supplemental Table 4).

Prognostic effect of FcgRIIB protein expression on

DLBCL tumors

IHC data on FcgRIIB protein expression were available for 331 pa-
tients in the Arthur cohort. Of these, 100 (30%), 188 (58%), and
43 (12%) tumors were FcgRIIB negative, low, and high, respective-
ly. FcgRIIB expression on tumors, measured by IHC, correlated with
FCGR2B expression observed by RNA-seq with FcgRIIB negative
and low samples showing similar FCGR2B expression and FcgRIIB
high showing significantly higher FCGR2B expression (Figure 2C).
KM curves of the association of FcgRIIB staining with PFS showed
distinct responses corresponding to low and negative FcgRIIB sam-
ples (supplemental Figure 4A). The difference in PFS for the high vs
the combined negative and low FcgRIIB samples was statistically
significant in the overall analysis, with high FcgRIIB samples associ-
ated with shorter PFS compared with negative and low FcgRIIB
samples (HR, 1.56; 95% CI 1.05-2.31; P 5 .0270; Figure 2D), and
when stratified according to COO, remained significant within the
GCB (HR, 1.95; 95% CI 1.17-3.27; P 5 .0110) but not ABC
DLBCL (Figure 2E-F; supplemental Table 5). Similar trends were
observed between OS and FcgRIIB expression but these were not
significant (supplemental Figure 4; supplemental Table 6).

Effects of FCGR2B expression on prognosis with

R-CHOP vs G-CHOP

RNA-seq data were available for 552 patients in the GOYA study.
The biomarker-evaluable population (BEP) was comparable with the
intent-to-treat population (Table 1) and balanced across treatment
arms (supplemental Table 7). Demographic and baseline character-
istics for the BEP were similar in the discovery cohorts and GOYA
with the exception of the percentage of patients expressing the dou-
ble-hit signature, which was lower in GOYA than the other cohorts
(4.8% vs 19.6%-29.4%). This is consistent with the observation
that patients with a greater number of risk factors, including double-

Figure 2. Validation of the FCGR2B prognostic effect by NanoString and prognostic effect of FcgRIIB protein expression measured by IHC in the Arthur

cohort. (A) Correlation between FCGR2B expression measured by NanoString and RNA-Seq. (B) Kaplan-Meier curve for PFS based on FCGR2B expression measured by

NanoString. Cox regression results based on FCGR2B expression dichotomized by median. (C) Correlation of FCGR2B expression by RNA-Seq with FcgRIIB protein

expression. (D) Kaplan-Meier curves for PFS according to high, low and negative FcgRIIB tumor expression. (E-F) according to stratification by COO. Tumor membrane

staining for FcgRIIB was defined as high (at least medium intensity staining with $50% positive cells); low (membrane positive, low intensity staining or ,50% positive

cells) or negative (cytoplasmic staining or negative membrane staining).
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hit lymphomas (ie, with MYC and BCL2 rearrangements) were un-
derrepresented in GOYA (Table 1).

For confirmation, we assayed FCGR2B gene expression in 81 of
these samples using qPCR and showed good correlation with the
RNA-seq measurements (P 5 .0465) (supplemental Figure 5). Im-
portantly, this correlation did not hold with the paralogous
FCGR2C, as measured by qPCR (P 5 .92), demonstrating that
RNA-seq is accurately capturing the expression of FCGR2B with lit-
tle/no contamination from paralogs such as FCGR2C.

High FCGR2B expression was associated with shorter PFS in R-
CHOP-treated (continuous HR, 1.26; 95% CI, 1.00-1.58; P 5

.0455) but not G-CHOP-treated patients (continuous HR, 0.91;
95% CI, 0.69-1.20; P 5 .50) in the univariate analysis (supplemen-
tal Table 8; Figure 3A). The effect in R-CHOP-treated patients was
supported across various cutoffs and by clear separation between
the lowest and highest quartile curves (supplemental Figure 6).
A consistent trend was observed after adjustment for IPI, COO, and
BCL2 IHC status, but this did not achieve significance (multivariate
analysis [continuous]: HR, 1.32; 95% CI, 0.98-1.79; P 5 .0695;
supplemental Table 8). Of note, the multivariate analysis had a small-
er sample size because of incomplete data for BCL2, which could
lead to more variance in the estimated effect size. The effect of
FCGR2B in R-CHOP-treated patients was similar within the GCB
and ABC cohorts and was not significantly different for G-CHOP-
treated patients in this stratified analysis (supplemental Table 8; Fig-
ure 3B-C).

Patients with higher FCGR2B expression appeared to benefit more
from G-CHOP than R-CHOP (HR, 0.67; 95% CI, 0.44-1.02; P 5

.0622) vs patients with lower FCGR2B expression (HR, 1.58; 95%
CI, 1.00-2.50; P 5 .0503), but this did not achieve statistical signifi-
cance. This trend was supported by the significant treatment:bio-
marker interaction term (P 5 .0064) in the univariate analysis.
A similar effect was observed in the multivariate analysis (interaction
term P 5 .0249) (supplemental Table 9). There was also no signifi-
cant association between FCGR2B expression and OS for R-
CHOP- or G-CHOP-treated patients in GOYA (supplemental Figure
7; supplemental Table 10).

Prognostic effect of FcgRIIB protein expression in

R-CHOP and G-CHOP

FcgRIIB expression data on tumor and macrophages were available
for 261 and 249 patients, respectively, in GOYA. Examples of
FcgRIIB staining are presented in Figure 4A-B. There was a strong
correlation between FCGR2B expression by RNA-seq and FcgRIIB
expression on tumor cells (Figure 4C). Because of the low frequen-
cy of samples expressing low and high tumor FcgRIIB (n 5 16
[6.1%] and n 5 34 [13.0%], respectively), these samples were
merged as FcgRIIB1 (as opposed to FcgRIIB2, n 5 211 [80.8%])
to enhance power for the subsequent survival analysis. Similarly, for
FcgRIIB expression on macrophages, negative (n 5 9 [3.6%]) and
low (n 5 24 [9.6%]) samples were merged into one group for
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Figure 3. Association of FCGR2B expression by RNA-Seq with PFS for

DLBCL patients treated with R-CHOP or G-CHOP in GOYA. Kaplan-Meier

curves for PFS based on FCGR2B expression measured by (A) RNA-seq in the

GOYA cohort and (B-C) according to stratification by COO. Cox regression results

based on FCGR2B expression dichotomized by median.
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comparison with FcgRIIB-high samples (n 5 216 [86.8%]). FcgRIIB
protein expression on tumor cells correlated with shorter PFS, with
a much stronger effect for R-CHOP-treated (HR, 2.17; 95% CI,
1.04-4.50; P 5 .0378) than G-CHOP-treated patients (HR, 1.37;
95% CI, 0.66-2.87; P 5 .40) (Figure 4D; supplemental Table 11).
FcgRIIB expression on macrophages did not have a significant ef-
fect on PFS in R-CHOP-treated patients; however, among G-
CHOP-treated patients, those with high FcgRIIB expression had
longer PFS than those with negative/low expression (HR, 0.44;
95% CI, 0.22-0.91; P 5 .0258) (Figure 4E; supplemental
Table 11).

There was no significant differential treatment effect for tumors cate-
gorized as either FcgRIIB positive or negative (supplemental Table
12), most likely because of low sample size of the FcgRIIB-positive
tumor population (n 5 50). Analysis of FcgRIIB protein expression
stratified by COO was not evaluated because of the small sample
size. There was no significant association between FcgRIIB expres-
sion on tumors or macrophages and OS (supplemental Figure 8;
supplemental Table 13).

Discussion

In the current retrospective analysis, we sought to clarify whether
FCGR2B messenger RNA and FcgRIIB protein expression were as-
sociated with inferior clinical response in large cohorts of patients
with DLBCL treated with anti-CD20 mAb-based chemoimmunother-
apy. In addition, we determined whether the effects of FcgRIIB were
dependent on the anti-CD20 mAb used (R or G).

Using RNA-seq, we determined that FCGR2B expression was
prognostic for R-CHOP, with high expression associated with short-
er PFS in four different cohorts by univariate analysis. This result
was robust and independent of the established prognostic bio-
markers, IPI, COO, and BCL2 by IHC. In the Arthur cohort, but not
the Schmitz or GOYA cohorts, the effect on PFS was more specific
to the GCB than to the ABC subtype. This may be explained by the
influence of several GCB tumors with high-level amplifications of
FCGR2B in the Arthur cohort.34 In part, because of these amplifica-
tions, there is a larger dynamic range of FCGR2B expression
among GCB tumors in the Arthur cohort; the exclusivity of
FCGR2B amplifications to GCB is likely driven by the different biol-
ogy of the COO subgroups. Without whole-genome sequencing,
we are unable to accurately determine the extent of FCGR2B ampli-
fications in the Schmitz cohort. Moreover, high FCGR2B expression
is only partially explained by genetic alterations, even among cases
previously analyzed by whole-genome sequencing.

In the GOYA trial, FCGR2B expression was prognostic for R-
CHOP but not G-CHOP, providing evidence of a differential effect
of FcgRIIB on the impact of different anti-CD20 mAbs. Although no
significant association between OS and FCGR2B expression was
observed in any cohort, OS differences are less commonly

observed in such analyses. This lack of association could be attrib-
uted to the effect of variable salvage therapies and treatment, and
disease-independent deaths, which add noise to OS data. In validat-
ing our RNA-seq data, we used qPCR (GOYA) and NanoString (Ar-
thur) to measure FCGR2B expression; both methods demonstrated
a clear correlation. It is noteworthy that patients with double-hit lym-
phomas were underrepresented in GOYA because of difficulties in
recruiting because these high-risk patients typically require urgent
treatment not amenable to the delay between screening and treat-
ment initiation required for trial enrolment.

To understand the basis for this effect, we assessed FcgRIIB protein
expression in TMAs from the 2 evaluable cohorts where samples were
available (Arthur, n 5 297; GOYA, n 5 261). In both cohorts, TMA
FcgRIIB expression mirrored FCGR2B expression by RNA-seq, spe-
cifically with regard to expression on the tumor, rather than on tumor-
associated macrophages. As such, the prognostic effect observed
correlated with FcgRIIB expression levels on the tumor but not on
macrophages. These important clinical associations provide further ev-
idence that R is downregulated from the tumor cell surface in the pres-
ence of cis-mediated FcgRIIB engagement, leading to the loss of R-
mediated effector functions. These observations are supported by re-
ports that the lack of FcgRIIb-mediated internalization of G provides
for increased phagocytosis ofCLL cells.32 Although previously indicat-
ed in small clinical trials of R-chemoimmunotherapy in mantle cell lym-
phoma,31 and R monotherapy and maintenance therapy in FL,42 and
supported by extensive preclinical studies,8,31,33,43 this is the first de-
finitive large clinical trial to show that R, but not G, is negatively affect-
ed by FcgRIIB expression on DLBCL tumors. In addition to the small
sample size of previous studies, the observation that high FcgRIIB
staining is relatively rare (13.0% in both the Arthur cohort andGOYA),
may explain why this effect has evaded detection previously. Accord-
ingly, because of validation in several independent cohorts, we pro-
pose that FcgRIIB expression could represent a primary predictive
biomarker in first-line DLBCL with likely meaningful clinical value.
Moreover, although no significant difference was observed between
arms when directly compared, our study suggests that simple clinical
IHC, qPCR, and/or NanoString analysis could be used, in the absence
of RNA-seq, to measure FcgRIIB expression, and help define those
patients who are most likely to have impaired clinical response to R
and potentially gain more benefit from G. Furthermore, the incorpora-
tion of IHC staining of the FcgRIIB protein to establish the tumor spe-
cificity of FCGR2B expression in this analysis precludes the possibility
that FCGR2B/FcgRIIB expression is simply a surrogate for the num-
ber of immune cells infiltrating the tumor.

In summary, our retrospective analysis demonstrated a clear relation-
ship between FCGR2B expression and PFS among patients
treated with R-CHOP, providing evidence for this as a potential pre-
dictive biomarker in the context of R treatment. No prognostic effect
for patients treated with G-CHOP was observed. Higher FCGR2B
expression was associated with high protein expression on the

Figure 4. Representative IHC staining of tumor TMA and association of FcgRIIB protein expression with PFS for DLBCL patients treated with R-CHOP or

G-CHOP in GOYA. TMA sections were stained by IHC for FcgRIIB (brown) and CD68 (red) and assessed by light microscopy. (A) Representative images show 340

magnification of varying levels of tumor FcgRIIB illustrating negative, weak, medium, and high staining (representative IHC for the Arthur cohort is presented in Arthur et al34).

(B) Examples of FcgRIIB on macrophages and corresponding 363 magnification showing low and high expression. (C) Correlation of FCGR2B expression by RNA-seq with

FcgRIIB protein expression on tumor and macrophages. Kaplan-Meier curves for PFS based on FcgRIIB protein expression on (D) tumors� and (E) macrophages.� �Because
of the low number of samples expressing high tumor FcgRIIB, samples expressing high and low FcgRIIB were merged as FcgRIIB1 (as opposed to FcgRIIB2) to gain greater

power for the survival analysis. Similarly, for FcgRIIB expression on macrophages, negative and low samples were merged into 1 group.

2954 NOWICKA et al 10 AUGUST 2021 • VOLUME 5, NUMBER 15



tumor cells, supporting the previously observed effect of tumor
FcgRIIB on R.8,31 In the future, new therapies such as FcgRIIB-
blocking antibodies41 may be used to target FcgRIIB, and FCGR2B
expression may be used to facilitate early stratification of patients
who would most benefit from treatment with G; however, validation
in prospectively designed studies is required to confirm this finding
and would be necessary before application to the clinical setting.
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