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Figure S1. LC-MS chromatogram of 16 nucleotide products from extension of 6-oxo-M1dG 
template-primer duplex by hPol h. HPol h (200 nM) was incubated for 40 min. with 5 µM DNA 
duplex and a 500 µM mix of all four dNTPs in a 10 µl reaction volume. The FAM-labeled 
complementary primer (5’-FAM-CGC TCG TAA GGA TTC-3’) extended by a dCMP on the 3’ end 
was detected by SRM in positive ion mode with the following transition: 673.1®656.5 (A). 
Extension by a dAMP (transition 676.1®330.2), dGMP (transition 678.1®346.1), or dTMP 
(transition 599.9®321.1) on the 3’ end is shown in panels B-D, respectively. 
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Figure S2. Steady state kinetics data for dATP (A) and dTTP (B) incorporation opposite dG or 
6-oxo-M1dG by hPol h. Control (●) and 6-oxo-M1dG (▲) oligonucleotide duplexes (5 µM) were 
incubated with 25 nM or 100 nM hPol h, respectively, and increasing concentrations of dATP for 
5 min. (A). Control (●) and 6-oxo-M1dG (▲) oligonucleotide duplexes (5 µM) were incubated 
with 40 nM hPol h and increasing concentrations of dTTP for 5 min. Each point represents the 
mean and standard deviation of triplicate determinations. Data were analyzed using the 
Substrate Inhibition model in GraphPad Prism. 

  



 
 
Figure S3. Incorporation of dATP opposite dG (control template, A) and 6-oxo-M1dG (B). hPol h 
(25 nM for control duplex or 100 nM for 6-oxo-M1dG duplex) was incubated with 5 µM DNA 
duplex and increasing concentrations of nucleotides. The reaction was stopped at 5 min. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  



 

 

 
 

Figure S4. Incorporation of dCTP opposite dG (control template, A) and 6-oxo-M1dG (B). hPol h 
(10 nM for control duplex or 200 nM for 6-oxo-M1dG duplex) was incubated with 5 µM DNA 
duplex and increasing concentrations of nucleotides. The reaction was stopped at 6 min for 
control duplex or 10 min for 6-oxo-M1dG duplex. 

 

  



 

Figure S5. Incorporation of dGTP opposite dG (control template, A) and 6-oxo-M1dG (B). hPol h 
(50 nM for control duplex or 200 nM for 6-oxo-M1dG duplex) was incubated with 5 µM DNA 
duplex and increasing concentrations of nucleotides. The reaction was stopped at 10 min. 

  



 

 

Figure S6 Incorporation of dTTP opposite dG (control template, A) and 6-oxo-M1dG (B). hPol h 
(40 nM) was incubated with 5 µM DNA duplex and increasing concentrations of nucleotides. 
The reaction was stopped at 5 min. 

 
 
  



 
 

 
 
 
 
Figure S7. Steady state kinetics for dCTP, analyzed using gel electrophoresis. A, incorporation 
of dCTP opposite dG (control template). HPol h (1.6 nM) was incubated with 80 nM DNA duplex 
and increasing concentrations of nucleotides. The reaction was stopped at 1 min. B, each point 
represents the mean and standard deviation of triplicate determinations. Data was analyzed 
using the Substrate Inhibition model in GraphPad Prism. C, dCTP concentrations from 0-6.6 µM 
from panel B are shown. Data was analyzed using the Michaelis-Menten model in GraphPad 
Prism. 

 
  



 
 

 
Figure S8. Steady state kinetics for dCTP, analyzed using LC-MS/MS analysis. A, standard 
curve of 16-mer oligonucleotide product using concentrations of 1.25 nM, 2.5 nM, 5 nM, and 10 
nM. HPol h (1.6 nM) was incubated with 80 nM DNA duplex and increasing concentrations of 
nucleotides. The reaction was stopped at 1 min. B, each point represents the mean and 
standard deviation of triplicate determinations. Data was analyzed using the Substrate Inhibition 
model in GraphPad Prism. C, dCTP concentrations from 0-20 µM from panel B are shown. Data 
was analyzed using the Michaelis-Menten model in GraphPad Prism. 

 
 
 


