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Infrodudion Results

The US Black-White difference in
the infant mortality rate has persisted.
Lower rates have been reported for
Blacks in the West than in the other three
US census regions.' This report examines
the Black-White difference in infant mor-
tality rate in 38 large standard metropoli-
tan statistical areas (SMSAs), including
several in California, in relation to socio-
economic status indicators and an index of
residential segregation. Residential segre-
gation may be associated with such fac-
tors as the availability and quality of pre-
natal and postnatal medical care, which
may influence infant mortality indepen-
dent of differences in socioeconomic sta-
tus.

Metlods
For each of 38 SMSAs with a total

population of more than 1 million in 1980,
1980 census reports were used to obtain
Black-White differences in poverty prev-
alence, median family income, and the
percentage of families with a "female
householder, no husband present."2 One
segregation index (an index of residential
dissimilarity between Blacks and Whites
in the SMSAs based on 1980 census data)
measures the unevenness of residential
distribution of a specific minority popula-
tion across census tracts within an urban
area. The formula is as follows:

Infant mortality rates were higher for
Blacks than for Whites in all of the 38
SMSAs. The mean Black-White differ-
ence was 8.63 per 1000 live births
(SD = 3.27), ranging from 2.14 (95% con-
fidence limits [CL] = -0.90 and 5.06) for
Anaheim, Calif, to 14.63 (95%
CL = 12.31 and 16.95) for Pittsburgh, Pa
(see Appendix for detailed data).

The segregation index and the Black-
White difference in poverty prevalence for
the 38 SMSAs were significantly corre-
lated (r = .573, P < .001), but this corre-
lation does not indicate strong collinear-
ity, and both variables were included in
multiple regression analysis (Table 1). The
segregation index was the only statisti-
cally significant independent predictor of
the Black-White difference in infant mor-
tality rate among the SMSAs, and the only
independent variable selected in stepwise
regression (not shown). Only for Blacks
was the segregation index a statistically
significant independent predictor of infant
mortality rate in multiple regression anal-
ysis (data not shown).

Chicago had the highest segregation
index (i.e., .878) and, a Black-White dif-
ference in povertyprevalence (i.e., 28.8%)
that was higher than the average (i.e.,
18.3%), the Black-White difference in in-
fant mortality was also large (i.e., 13.38
per 1000; 95% CL = 12.39 and 14.17). The
seven California SMSAs differed consid-
erably in segregation index. Black-White
differences in poverty prevalence ranged
from 7.8% for San Jose to 16.6% for Sac-
ramento and 17.4% for Riverside; all were

0.5 x ) I (t/X) - (Yi/Y I,
i= 1

where x and y are the numbers of each
race with a tract (i) and X and Y are the
total populations of each race in the
SMSA.3 Numbers of deaths at less than 1
year of age for Blacks and Whites in each
SMSA for 1982 through 1986 were used,4
along with total live births in these years,5
to obtain an average annual infant death
rate (per 1000 live births) for Blacks and
Whites in each of the 38 SMSAs.
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below the average for all 38 SMSAs. Ana-
heim had the lowest segregation index and
the smallest Black-White difference in in-
fant mortality, whereas Los Angeles had
the highest segregation index and the larg-
est Black-White difference in infant mor-
tality (Figure 1), despite the similarity in
the Black-White difference in poverty
prevalence in the two areas (i.e., 9.9% and
8.7%, respectively).

Dwussion
The almost sevenfold variation

among the 38 SMSAs in the Black-White
difference in infant mortality rate and the
associationwith the segregation index (ap-
parently independent of variation in the
Black-White difference in poverty preva-
lence) require explanation. Socioeco-
nomic status may not have been ade-
quately controlled for in the analysis ofthe
effect of the segregation index on the
Black-White difference in infant mortal-
ity; areas with high segregation indexes
may include subareas (in inner cities) of
extreme poverty and high cost of living.
Potential inaccuracies in infant death rates
by SMSA due to differential rates (among
the SMSAs) of migration ofmothers (with
their infants) after birth should be exam-
ined by separate analysis of neonatal and
postneonatal death rates (both of which
are higher in US Blacks than Whites).
Neonatal death rates would be little af-
fected by migration, because migration
during this period is unlikely. Linked live
birth-infant death files also would be use-
ful.

Despite considerable Black-White
differences in poverty prevalence, two
SMSAs in California (i.e., Riverside and
Sacramento) with low indexes of segre-
gation had small Black-White differences
in infant mortality (Figure 1). The expla-
nation for low Black infant mortality
rates in Anaheim, with both a small
Black-White difference in poverty prev-
alence and a low segregation index, also
should be explored. Birth weight distri-
butions, birth weight-specific death
rates, and both neonatal and postneona-
tal death rates should be examined.
Binkin et al.6 suggested that the smaller
difference in Black-White neonatal death
rates within normal weight births in Cal-
ifornia than in Georgia could reflect bet-
ter quality and availability of prenatal, in-
trapartum, and postnatal care in
California Blacks. The need for studies of
the quality vs the quantity of prenatal
care in Blacks has been recognized,7 and
the same holds for postnatal care. SM-
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FIGURE 1-Inant mortality diffeence in Cailifomna standard metropolian statistical

areas (SMSAs). (A = Anaheim; L = Los Angeles; R = Riverside;
S Sacramento;.SD...San.Diego; SF...San.Francisco;... =.SanJose.

SAs with high levels of segregation are
mainly large, older industrial cities with
Black ghettos.3 Among the many poten-
tial explanations for higher infant mortal-
ity rates in these segregated areas, avail-
ability (or accessibility) and use of
diagnostic/treatment procedures, level of
training and attitudes or recommenda-
tions of providers, and patient (i.e., ma-
ternal) decision making should be exam-
ined, as suggested for explaining racial
inequalities in use ofdiagnostic/treatment
procedures for cardiovascular dis-
ease.8 [
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