
ble prerequisite. This includes
modelling, figure skating and
gymnastics.

Parents are urged to always
be on guard against obesity in
their preadolescent children.
Girls become preoccupied with
their weight. Clothes are de-
signed for very skinny figures
and are modelled by girls who
look almost cachectic.

We do not know all of the
antecedents of eating disorders
such as anorexia nervosa and bu-
limia, but societal pressure to re-
main slender is a powerful force
driving our young to desperation.

Our dancers and skaters
should be able to compete and to
be admired without starving or
purging themselves to illness.

Martin G. Wolfish, MD, FRCPC
Chief
Department of Paediatrics
North York General Hospital
North York, Ont.

Physicians
of the future
I n his Editor's Page of Sept.

15, 1989 (141: 505) Dr. Bruce
P. Squires, suffused in his

annual "autumnal exuberance",
proclaims that a hitherto unsus-
pected New Deal in Medical Edu-
cation, proudly proselytized by
the crusaders at McMaster Uni-
versity, will sweep away "tradi-
tional concepts" and transform
medical students and the very
essence of clinical practice. I
doubt it.

When Squires talks of a great
leap forward in medical educa-
tion, from a "teacher-centred,
subject-based" system to "stu-
dent-centred, problem-based
learning", I am genuinely dis-
turbed. In the excellent hospital
that provided me with my basic
clinical skills (after fundamental
"masses of facts" in anatomy,
physiology and pathology had
been mastered) medical educa-
tion was primarily acquired at the
bedside or in the outpatient de-
partment, under the guidance of
experienced and compassionate
"'uperts". The philosophy un-
derlying this process and the

clinical practice it was prepara-
tion for was a patient-centred,
disease-based learning system.

Certainly communication
and understanding will remain
vital attributes for any good phy-
sician, but no more so than the
ability to elicit signs and symp-
toms, a wide knowledge of the
biopsychosocial etiology of dis-
ease and a mastery of effective
therapies.

For some years now there
has appeared a hoard of comput-
er-driven soothsayers, cost-effi-
cient bureaucrats and erudite au-
thorities, not to mention a plague
of pseudophysicians, who. seem
quite willing to take control over
medical practice when they have
neither the aptitude nor the qual-
ifications. I suggest that the
greatest challenge facing our
medical educators is to help fu-
ture physicians restore the undig-
nified corpse of a once justly
proud and able profession to its
rightful, self-confident and re-
spected place in our society. We
are experts in medical care, al-
though I am not aware of any
doctor who ever claimed the in-
fallibility alleged by Squires.

Peter F. Kelly, MD
797 Princess St.
Kingston, Ont.

Third World aid

I support the letter of Dr. John
V. Fowles and Kathleen M.
LePoer Fowles (Can Med

Assoc J 1989; 141: 767-768) and
that of Dr. Timothy Bood (ibid:
768) in response to Dr. W. Har-
ding le Riche's article "Third
World aid: A road to disaster,
paved with good intentions" (ib-
id: 58-60).

Certainly we should be con-
cerned about the world's popula-
tion and try to limit it, but this
will do little good if we continue
to destroy Earth. The greatest
polluters and users of energy, of
course, are the Western countries,
and many of them are approach-
ing or are below zero population
growth. If these countries do not
stop their destruction of the envi-
ronment, there will be little pur-

pose in trying to limit the popula-
tion in Third World countries.

L.L. de Veber, MD
Professor of pediatrics
University of Western Ontario
London, Ont.

It is 25 000
operations
and counting
for Dr. Howard
Gimbel [correction]

his article (Can Med Assoc
J 1989; 141: 710-711), by
Terry Moran, stated incor-

rectly that six members of Dr.
Howard Gimbel's family em-
ployed at the Gimbel Eye Centre,
in Calgary, are encouraged to
observe the surgical procedures
performed there. Gimbel says
that the article should have stat-
ed that members of patients' fam-
ilies are encouraged to do this in
order to "educate and involve the
family in the patient's surgical
procedure". He also says that the
article may have left the incorrect
impression that phacoemulsifica-
tion is performed only at his
clinic and one operated by Dr.
Don Johnson, of Vancouver,
when in fact it is performed at
hospitals across the country. We
apologize to Gimbel for the er-
rors. - Ed.

Correlates of
certification
in family medicine
in the billing
patterns of Ontario
general practitioners
[correction]
I n this article (Can Med Assoc

1 1989; 141: 897-904), by Dr.
Christel A. Woodward and

colleagues, the headings for the
two columns of data in Table I
were accidentally switched. We
apologize to the authors for the
error. - Ed.

CMAJ, VOL. 141, DECEMBER 15, 1989 1225


