
lar, the excellent editorial in the
News England Journal of Medicine
suggests, after reviewing the other
articles to which he refers, that we
should not rely on the possibility
of false-positive results as an argu-
ment against mandatory HIV an-
tibody testing, because even if the
rate were acceptably low such test-
ing is not justified. The editorial
concludes: "At present . . . volun-
tary testing, accompanied by
counselling . . . is the approach
most consistent with the informa-
tion at hand". Parker has either
not read or misconstrued the ar-
guments in this editorial - and,
indeed, in my article. One can
only hazard a guess as to why this
would occur, and I do not wish to
attribute motives to Parker. How-
ever, it is not uncommon for us to
allow personal values, attitudes
and beliefs to colour our re-
sponses to AIDS and, for exam-
ple, to read an article as stating
what we would like it to state
rather than what it does state. It is
not enough that we act in "good
faith" in entering the debate sur-
rounding AIDS: we must also act
non-negligently. But, most impor-
tantly, we must enter with open-
mindedness and a spirit and ap-
proach of active tolerance.

Parker is correct that some of
my propositions (for example, the
suggestion that HIV-antibody-
positive immigrants could con-
tribute more to the economy than
they would cost in terms of health
care) cannot be ascertained with
any accuracy. But neither can
propositions to the contrary.
When faced with such uncertainty
we must choose which of the two
alternative propositions should
form the basic presumption from
which we work. This proposition
will then govern until displaced by
proof that it is not accurate. Par-
ker proposes a presumption
against allowing the entry of HIV-
antibody-positive people. I pro-
pose the opposite presumption, on
the basis that it does not appear to
involve undue harms, risks or

costs and, most importantly, best
promotes a position of humanity
and respect for human rights.

Margaret A. Somerville, AM,
AuA (Pharm), LLB, DCL

Director
McGill Centre for Medicine.
Ethics and Law

Montreal. PQ
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Resuscitation
of the terminally ill

I n her recent article' Dr. Fran-
coise E. Baylis takes issue
with Drs. Robert Buckman

and John Senn's recommenda-
tions on eligibility for cardiopul-
monary resuscitation (CPR).2

Buckman and Senn argued
that if no benefit is expected from
therapies such as CPR in a specif-
ic group of patients, such as those
with terminal irreversible illness-
es, then the treatment should not
be provided or offered. They sug-
gested that patients suffering from
irreversible, fatal conditions who
are receiving palliative care and in
whom no curative intervention is
being carried out or planned fit
into this category. Baylis chal-
lenges this concept and argues
that even if the chance of CPR's
being successful is infinitesimally
small, and even if death may be
postponed only for a very short
period, the decision to have CPR
belongs to the competent patient,
regardless of whether the patient
is receiving palliative care.

Although Baylis raises the
issue of allocation of scarce re-
sources, she appears to feel that
physicians should have no say in
this but must blindly follow the
wishes of the patient. It is of
interest that she agrees that a
physician is not required to pro-
vide therapy contraindicated on

medical grounds. However, the
only contraindications she ap-
pears to accept for CPR are "a
seriously ruptured myocardium, a
pulmonary artery completely
filled by embolic material or a
seriously ruptured abdominal or
thoracic aortic aneurysm". She ig-
nores the fact that CPR was intro-
duced as an emergency treatment
for acute cardiac insults, and she
does not seem to accept the very
real distinction between a cardiac
arrest that can respond to CPR
and death occurring in terminal
progressive illnesses with multior-
gan failure.

Of most concern is her lack of
understanding of palliative care.
Palliative care consists of a mul-
tidisciplinary approach to the pro-
vision of care, with comfort and
support provided through excel-
lent symptom control. It avoids
injudicious invasive investiga-
tions or treatments that will have
no measurable benefit for the pa-
tient. In discussion of the progno-
sis of a terminal illness with pa-
tients and families the goals of
such palliative treatment can be
clearly outlined and acceptance of
these goals obtained. However,
Baylis insists on discussion of in-
appropriate treatment in all cases,
which, as Buckman and Senn
rightly said, is both inhumane and
unconscionable.

Baylis seems to feel that phy-
sicians, nurses and other health
care professionals have no rights
in these matters but must perform
interventions at a patient's re-
quest even when they regard these
as inappropriate both medically
and ethically. She also does not
seem to understand that phys-
icians have to make decisions re-
garding allocation of resources on
a daily basis. If these resources are
used inappropriately, patients
with reversible and remedial con-
ditions will die.

The real issue is the appropri-
ateness of "Do not resuscitate"
(DNR) orders, which are as much
for the medicolegal protection of
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staff as for the benefit of patients.
I have argued that these are not
applicable to institutions provid-
ing long-term care, and in view of
this current discussion their role
in acute care hospitals requires
careful re-examination.3

The management of terminal-
ly ill patients can be much im-
proved. Such improvement will be
hampered if credence is given to
Baylis's recommendations.

Rory H. Fisher, MB, FRCP (Edin),
FRCPC
Head
Department of Extended Care
Sunnybrook Medical Centre
Toronto, Ont.

Dr. Baylis seems to suggest that
DNR orders be discussed with
terminally ill patients such as the
one described by Buckman and
Senn. She states that if there is
any chance that CPR may be ef-
fective, even if that chance is in-
finitesimally small, the decision
about resuscitation rightly belongs
to the patient or a legal guardian.
One could take this argument to
its logical extreme and ask wheth-
er one should discuss with a
90-year-old patient who has end-
stage heart disease whether he or
she would like to have a cardiac
transplant. Another example
would be discussing liver trans-
plantation with someone who has
malignant disease metastatic to
the liver only. In both cases the
chances of survival would be very
small, but as death may be post-
poned for a little while should
transplantation therefore be of-
fered? My feeling is that most
physicians would not discuss
those particular options with such
patients.

My other concern is that
there is now a widespread feeling
that patients who die in hospital
do not die but have cardiac ar-
rests. If the patient described by
Buckman and Senn were in a
nursing home or other treatment
facility he would have been al-
lowed to die without any such

discussion. Many patients with
terminal illnesses are admitted to
hospital because the family or the
patient cannot cope at home;
management in these cases is de-
signed to ease suffering. If it were
possible to manage these patients
at home should CPR be dis-
cussed? If our answer is Yes and
the patient would like to have
CPR, should we then abandon
home care and have the patient
admitted to hospital so that this
form of therapy could be applied?

For those few patients Baylis
has described who may want to
live a little longer so that, for
example, they might attend a
daughter's wedding, my experi-
ence is that they would discuss
this with their primary care physi-
cian, and that is the time I think it
appropriate to have a frank dis-
cussion about the benefit, if any,
of CPR.

Although I agree with Buck-
man and Senn, I do feel that if a
DNR order is written without dis-
cussion with the patient it should
only be done by a physician hav-
ing some relationship with the
patient and after treatment op-
tions have been discussed. If these
discussions are held periodically
with the patient during the preter-
minal phase it is my experience
that the issue of resuscitation is
never raised by patients or rela-
tives.

Wycliffe S. Lofters, MB, FRCPC
Hematologist-oncologist
Kingston Regional Cancer Centre
Ontario Cancer Treatment
and Research Foundation

Kingston, Ont.

[Dr. Baylis responds.]

Dr. Fisher objects to the idea that
physicians "must blindly follow
the wishes of the patient". I object
to the idea that patients must
blindly follow the wishes of the
physician. The compromise I sug-
gest is that physicians discuss with
'competent patients, or the legal
guardians of incompetent pa-

tients, the benefits and harms of
all available therapeutic options
(including CPR) that are not med-
ically contraindicated and that
physicians obtain informed con-
sent for the patient's or guardian's
treatment of choice. I am con-
cerned that this option seems un-
palatable to some.

As to the specific criticisms
Fisher raises, I do not, as he
suggests, maintain that the only
contraindications for CPR are "a
seriously ruptured myocardium, a
pulmonary artery completely
filled by embolic material or a
seriously ruptured abdominal or
thoracic aortic aneurysm". This is
a serious misreading of my article:
these instances were listed as ex-
amples of situations in which
CPR would be medically contra-
indicated.

Fisher also expresses some
concern regarding my lack of un-
derstanding of palliative care. I
well understand that the overrid-
ing objectives of palliative care
are the enhancement of the last
days of living and the provision of
a good death. Pursuit of these
objectives could, of course, mean
no resuscitation. My concern is
that some patients in palliative
care may not understand this.
Fisher writes that "in discussion
of the prognosis of a terminal
illness with patients and families
the goals of such palliative treat-
ment can be clearly outlined and
acceptance of these goals ob-
tained". I maintain that if pallia-
tive care precludes CPR, then the
informing process for palliative
care must include a discussion of,
and consent to, a DNR order.

Finally, contrary to what
Fisher implies, I am very aware of
the problem of resource alloca-
tion. I do not believe, however,
that physicians "have to" or even
should be deciding which lives to
save on economic, as opposed to
medical, grounds.- These are de-
cisions for society to make. On
this point, I repeat that "until and
unless society . . . decides that
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