
LETTERS

Dietary fat and risk of coronary
heart disease in men

Studies quoted showed opposite ofwhat is
claimed

EDITOR,-Alberto Ascherio and colleagues were
unable to show a significant association between
intake of saturated fatty acids (as percentage of
energy) or of cholesterol and total myocardial
infarction and coronary heart disease after
appropriate adjustments.' With saturated fatty
acids they found a positive trend for fatal
coronary heart disease but an inverse trend for
all cases of myocardial infarction (fatal plus non-
fatal). Thus these data indicate a clear inverse
relation between saturated fatty acids and
non-fatal myocardial infarction. The authors fail
to comment on this surprising divergence.
From the numerous studies in the literature

they quote "the evidence" for a direct association
between intake of saturated fatty acids and risk of
coronary heart disease-namely, four inter-
national comparisons and four prospective stud-
ies. But in fact these studies tend to show the
opposite. In Scrimshaw and Guzman's study
animal fat was not related to the degree of
atherosclerosis. The two papers on Japanese
emigrants reported no data on the relation
between saturated fatty acids and coronary heart
disease, although another analysis found that the
cultural upbringing of the emigrants was far
more important than their diet.2 In the seven
countries study the association was seen in cross
cultural analysis but not within the cohorts. In
two of the four prospective studies, the Framing-
ham study and the Ireland-Boston diet-heart
study, the associations did not reach significance.
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In Goldbourt et ars study there was an inverse
trend between intake of saturated fatty acids (in
g/day) and coronary heart disease, and data on
intake of saturated fat as a percentage of energy
were not reported. This leaves just one prospec-
tive study in the literature that directly related
intake of saturated fatty acids to risk of coronary
heart disease.3
Thus Ascherio and colleagues' results are in

good agreement with the vast majority of data in
the literature in showing no risk of coronary
heart disease related to consumption ofsaturated
fatty acids. It is time to realise that the diet-heart
hypothesis as it relates to intake of saturated fatty
acids and cholesterol can be upheld only if most
observations are ignored and quotation bias is
used.4

Finally, Ascherio and colleagues do not
present any data on oleic acid, nor do they give
their reason for withholding these data. This is
all the more surprising since one of the authors
(Willett) has claimed health benefits from
consumption of olive oil-so far without
sufficient evidence.5
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Study gives clear message about diet

EDITOR,-Alberto Ascherio and colleagues stud-
ied over 40 000 health professionals to examine
the association between fat intake and the
incidence of coronary heart disease in men of
middle age and older.' Investigation into the
influence of dietary fats on risk of heart disease
has long been a contentious field, and the litera-
ture shows a quick response to the publication of
new work. For example, after the publication of
the paper by Law et al on cholesterol reduction
and risk of ischaemic heart disease in 19942 the
BMY published 10 letters commenting on the
study.

If discussion of the minutiae of study design,
results, analysis, etc is put aside then the message
from Ascherio and colleagues' study is clear and
simple: all middle aged and older men who want
to reduce their risk of death from coronary heart
disease must lower their intake of saturated fat
and cholesterol while increasing the amount of
n-3 fatty acids and fibre in their diets.
Interestingly, these conclusions are similar to the
information coming from intervention studies of
Mediterranean diets, which have concluded that

to reduce the risk of heart disease we must eat
less meat (a major dietary source of saturated fat
and cholesterol) and more fruit, cereals, and veg-
etables (sources of fibre).3 We could probably
improve our risk profiles even further ifwe drank
a glass of red wine with our meals.4
This excellent and easily available dietary

treatment is unlikely to become common
practice among the general public, because we
now live in the age of the soft option. The west of
Scotland coronary prevention study indicates
that similar or perhaps even better results can be
obtained by giving 3-hydroxy-3-methylglutaryl
coenzyme A reductase inhibitors prophylac-
tically.5 The pharmaceutical industry would have
us believe that these drugs are the only way to
combat cardiovascular disease, although this is
clearly not the case.
Although a lower incidence of heart disease in

the population would, in the long term, result in
reduced costs to health services, an important
issue to consider is that prescribing these drugs
takes responsibility for maintaining health away
from the individual and lays it at the door of
health professionals. Should already strained
health services shoulder the burden of prescrib-
ing drugs prophylactically to those people who
would rather take a pill than observe a healthier
diet?
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Population studied was peculiarly healthy
and preoccupied with health

EDrrOR,-According to Alberto Ascherio and
colleagues, saturated fat may not be as dangerous
with respect to coronary heart disease as
commonly supposed, some of the risk being
counteracted by consumption of fibre.' As might
have been expected from the data in their table 1,
consumption of saturated fat was positively cor-
related with cigarette smoking (r = 0.981) and
mean body mass index (r = 0.986) and nega-
tively correlated with exercise (r = -0.983), con-
sumption of carotene (r = -0.986) and vitamin E
(r = -0.950), and, curiously, alcohol consump-
tion (r = -0.984).
Could it be that the population of male health

professionals in the United States is peculiarly
healthy and preoccupied with health? As has
been noted elsewhere, this could mislead the
unwary.2 When figures from the study are
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