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Supplemental figures S1, S2 and S3 (in order of apparition)
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Supplemental figure legends

• Figure S1. Summary of telomere replication timing in the control cell TP. Telomeres are classified 
according to their mrt as described above. Only two telomeres are replicated on average at both 
ends of S-phase: 19q in very early S and 15p in very late S. Replication of the 46 other telomeres is 
distributed throughout the other four categories.

• Figure S2. After transfection, SV40 was integrated into chromosome 6. SV40 plasmid hybridization 
was carried out in TP as a negative control cell and in the three PD studied in TP15.5 (i.e. PD64, 263 
and 523) (top panels). The plasmid was revealed using antibodies labeled with TexasRed. 
Chromosomes which have integrated the SV40 plasmid are indicated by the dotted arrows. Multi-
FISH was then carried out in SV40-positive cells to identify the chromosomes into which the 
plasmid integrated (bottom panels). Chromosome 6 was the only chromosome integrated by SV40 
after transfection. All copies of chromosome 6 of each metaphase are indicated by full arrows. Just 
after crisis (PD64) SV40 is integrated into one of the two copies of chromosome 6. Later, after 
replication (PD263 and 523), when polyploidy is established, two copies of chromosome 6 out of 
the three chromosomes is integrated by SV40, indicating that one out of the two SV40-integrated 
chromosomes is the duplicate of the other. One of these chromosomes is rearranged in a clonal 
translocation t(6;13).

• Figure S3. Single telomere replication timing does not appear to correlate with their length. No 
correlation between the mrt and telomere length in the studied PD (TP in blue, TP15.5 PD64 in red, 
TP15.5 PD263 in green and TP15.5 PD523 in purple). The correlation coefficients are too weak to 
suggest any correlation even if the p-value of TP and TP15.5 PD523 is significant. Indeed, telomere 
length varies during immortalization whereas telomere replication does not (Spearman’s rank 
correlation coefficient was used).


