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Figure 7. Differential aggregation of α-Syn is not responsible for the differential 
accumulation of α-Syn∆C.  (A) Huα-Syn expressing SH-SY5Y cell lines (WT and 
A53T) were differentially extracted for the triton soluble oligomers and the triton insoluble 
polymers and subjected to immunoblot analysis.  Shown are longer and shorter exposures to 
detect potential high MW α-Syn oligomers and α-Syn monomers, respectively.  The lanes are 
total (lane 1), triton-soluble (lane 2), triton-insoluble (lane 3), and 3 times higher amount of 
triton-insoluble (lane 4) fractions.  Similar results were obtained with 3 independent 
extractions.  (B) The Size Exclusion Chromatography (SEC) analysis of PBS-soluble human 
brain extracts.  A column packed with Saphacryl S-200 HR (Amersham, Piscataway, NJ) and 
equilibrated with PBS, pH7.4, was used.  The PBS-soluble brain homogenates were loaded 
on to the column and the proteins were eluted with PBS at 0.8 ml/min. 1.5 ml fractions were 
collected and the elution of α-Syn was monitored by dot blot and immunoblot analysis.  α-
Syn∆Cs elute with α-SynFL as monomers.  The elution profile of α-Syn was determined from 
dot-blot and immunoblot analyses (Inset) of the fractions.  The mass standards (Arrows) for 
the calibration of the SEC column are cytochrome C (12.4 kDa), β-lactoglobin (35 kDa), 
BSA (67 kDa), and IgG (160 kDa).  The SEC analysis of extracts from Tg mouse brain yields 
identical results (not shown). 

 
These results, combined with the presence of α-Syn∆C in absence of α-Syn pathology 

in brains and in cells, indicate that α-Syn∆C can be generated in absence of pathological α-
Syn aggregation.  If α-Syn∆C is exclusively generated as a result of α-Syn aggregation, α-
Syn∆C must be released from the aggregates and stably accumulate as monomers in cells.  
Thus, regardless of the origin, α-Syn∆C could alter the biology of α-Syn monomers in 
neurons.           
 
 


