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Supplementary Figure S1. 2i treatment inhibits HCT116 proliferation. (a)
HCT116 cell were treated with or without 2i for the indicated time and the
relative level of viable cells was measured by Cell Counting Kit-8 (CCK-8).
(b) HCT116 cells were treated with PD0325901 for 12 hours before
harvested for analysis of the cell cycle by FACS.
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Supplementary Figure S2. The effect of 2i treatment on DNMT3A
transcription in various cancer cells. All the cells were treated with or
without 2i for 2 days before harvested for RT-qPCR analysis.
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Supplementary Figure S3. The effect of MEK inhibitor PD0325901 on
UHRF1 and DNMT1 mRNA stability and the effect of cell cycle on UHRF1
and DNMT1 expression. (a) Effective and rapid inhibition of ERK activity
by PD0325901. HCT116 cells were treated with PD0325901 for the
indicated time before harvested for western blotting analysis. (b,c)
Treatment with PD0325901 had no effect on UHRF1 and DNMT1 mRNA
stability. HCT116 cells were treated with DMSO and actinomycin D (Ac.D)
in the absence or presence of PD0325901 for various times as indicated
and subjected for RT-qPCR analysis. (d,e) The levels of UHRF1 and
DNMT1 mRNAs were not significantly changed with cell cycle. HCT116
cells were synchronized to G1/S boundary by aphidicolin (1 μg/mL)
treatment for 18 hours and then released into S phase by culturing in
fresh medium for 4 hours. For G2/M phase enrichment, the cells were
treated with Nocodazole (50 ng/mL) for 18 hours. Finally, the cells were
subjected for analysis of mRNA level by RT-qPCR (d) and cell cycle by
FACS (e).
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Supplementary Figure S4. A subset of cell lines are insensitive to
PD0325901-induced reduction of UHRF1 and DNMT1 proteins. (a,b)
LNCaP, BEL7402, HepG2, C33A and SiHa cells were treated with
PD0325901 for 2 days before harvested for analysis of the levels of
various proteins by western blotting using antibodies as indicated (a) and
the levels of mRNAs by qRT-PCR (b). Note that PD0325901 inhibited
ERK1/2 phosphorylation in all but LNCaP cells.
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Supplementary Figure S5. Co-expression analysis of Uhrf1, Dnmt1 and
Dnmt3a in mouse tissues. (a-c)The COXPRESdb was used for analyzing
the co-expression status between mouse Uhrf1 and Ddnmt1 (a), Dnmt3a
and Uhrf1 (b) and Dnmt3a and Dnmt1 (c) in Mus musculus.
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Supplementary Figure S6. The list of common putative transcription
factor-binding sites within +5 kb upstream and -3kb downstream of the
transcription start sites of the UHRF1 (a) and DNMT1 (b) genes. The
analysis was performed using SABiosciences proprietary database
(http://www.sabiosciences.com/chipqpcrsearch.php).
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Supplementary Figure S7. Multiple MEK/ERK downstream transcription
factors are involved in transcriptional activation of UHRF1 and DNMT1 in
A549 cells. (a) qRT-PCR analysis showing efficient knockdown of
corresponding transcription factors in A549 cells by specific siRNA against
AML1a, E2F1, SP1, STAT3 and YY1, respectively. (b) qRT-PCR analysis
showing the effect on UHRF1 and DNMT1 expression in A549 cells upon
knockdown of each of the transcription factors.



Supplementary Figure S8. Uncropped blots used for this study.
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