
Supporting Information S3 — Mammalian phylogenetic relation-
ships

Details on the phylogenetic relationships between species analyzed in the main text.

Order Carnivora

Phylogenetic relationships for the Carnivora were taken from a consensus phylogeny (Agnarsson
et al., 2010). Agnarsson et al. (2010) did not include the Bengal fox (Vulpes bengalensis), nor the
crab-eating fox (Cerdocyon thous) in their comparison. Consequently, for the Canidae, we took
relationships from Lindblad-Toh et al. (2005), due to its inclusion of all of the canid species for
which we had tracking data. The resulting phylogeny is depicted in figure S3.1.

Figure S3.1: Phylogenetic relationships among the Carnivora species analyzed in the main text.

Order Perissodactyla

Phylogenetic relationships for the Perissodactyla were taken from Steiner & Ryder (2011). The
relationships between the three species for which we had tracking data are depicted in figure S3.2.
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Figure S3.2: Phylogenetic relationships among the Perissodactyla species analyzed in the main
text.

Order Primates

Phylogenetic relationships between the Primates were taken from (Perelman et al., 2011). The
relationships between those species for which we had tracking data are depicted in figure S3.3.

Figure S3.3: Phylogenetic relationships among the Primates species analyzed in the main text.

Order Artiodactyla

Phylogenetic relationships for the Artiodactyla were taken from Price et al. (2005). The relation-
ships between those species for which we had tracking data are depicted in figure S3.4.

Order Lagomorpha

Phylogenetic relationships for the Lagomorpha were taken from Matthee et al. (2004). The rela-
tionships between the three species for which we had tracking data are depicted in figure S3.5.
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Figure S3.4: Phylogenetic relationships among the Artiodactyla species analyzed in the main text.

Figure S3.5: Phylogenetic relationships among the Lagomorpha species analyzed in the main text.

Order Proboscidea

Phylogenetic relationships for the Proboscidea were taken from Barriel et al. (1999). The relation-
ships between the three species for which we had tracking data are depicted in figure S3.6.

Order Eulipotyphla

We only had tracking data from one species from the order Eulipotyphla, the European hedgehog
(Erinaceus europaeus). Consequently, no intra Order relationships were necessary.
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Figure S3.6: Phylogenetic relationships among the Proboscidea species analyzed in the main text.

Order Cingulata

We only had tracking data from two species from the order Cingulata, the six-banded armadillo
(Euphractus sexcinctus) and the Southern three-banded armadillo (Tolypeutes matacus). As such,
no intra Order relationships were necessary here.

Order Rodentia

We only had tracking data from one species from the order Rodentia, the Central American agouti
(Dasyprocta punctata). Consequently, no intra Order relationships were necessary.

Order Marsupialia

We only had tracking data from one species from the order Marsupialia, the Virginia opossum
(Didelphis virginiana), and so no intra Order relationships were necessary.

Class Mammalia

After generating the order specific trees, we used the phylogenetic relationships between eutherian
mammalian orders from Liu et al. (2001) to assemble the complete phylogenetic tree. The complete
phylogenetic tree for the 61 Mammalian species for which we had tracking data is depicted in figure
S3.7.
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Figure S3.7: Phylogenetic relationships among the Mammalian species analyzed in the main text.
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