
Appendix A1

Figure A1. Risk of bias summary: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian countries. Risk of bias
graph: C) Asian countries; D) Non-Asian countries.
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Appendix A2
2.1 Upper-extremity strength

Figure A2.1.1. Sensitivity analysis of upper-extremity strength (Asian and Non-Asian
countries)

Figure A2.1.2. Funnel plot of upper-extremity strength (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.1.3. Egger’s regression plots of upper-extremity strength (Asian and Non-Asian
countries)



Figure A2.1.4. Egger’s test of upper-extremity strength (Asian and Non-Asian countries)



2.2 Upper-extremity strength

Figure A2.2.1. Forest plots of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. study (Asian
and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.2.2. Sensitivity analysis of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. study
(Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.2.3. Funnel plot of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. Study (Asian
and Non-Asian countries)



Figure A2.2.4. Egger’s regression plots of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al.
study (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.2.5. Egger’s test of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. study (Asian
and Non-Asian countries)



2.3 Lower-extremity strength

Figure A2.3.1. Sensitivity analysis of lower-extremitystrength (Asian and Non-Asian
countries)

Figure A2.3.2. Funnel plot of lower-extremity strength (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.3.3. Egger’s regression plots of lower-extremitystrength (Asian and Non-Asian
countries)



Figure A2.3.4. Egger’s test of lower-extremity strength (Asian and Non-Asian countries)



2.4 Muscle mass

Figure A2.4.1. Sensitivity analysis of muscle mass (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.4.2. Funnel plot of muscle mass (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.4.3. Egger’s regression plots of muscle mass (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.4.4. Egger’s test of muscle mass (Asian and Non-Asian countries)



2.5 Gait speed

Figure A2.5.1. Sensitivity analysis of gait speed (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.5.2. Funnel plot of gait speed (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.5.3. Egger’s regression plots of gait speed (Asian and Non-Asian countries)

Figure A2.5.4. Egger’s test of gait speed (Asian and Non-Asian countries)



Appendix A3

Figure A3.1. Forest plots of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. study:
Non-Asian countries.

Figure A3.2. Sensitivity analysis of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. study:
Non-Asian countries.

Figure A3.3. Funnel plot of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. study:
Non-Asian countries.



Figure A3.4. Egger’s regression plots of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al.
study: Non-Asian countries.

Figure A3.5. Egger’s test of upper-extremity strength without Rondanelli et al. study:
Non-Asian countries.



Appendix A4

Figure A4.1. Sensitivity analysis of upper-extremity strength: A) Asian countries; B)
Non-Asian countries.

Figure A4.2. Funnel plot of upper-extremity strength: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian
countries.

Figure A4.3. Egger’s regression plots of upper-extremity strength A) Asian countries; B)
Non-Asian countries.

Figure A4.4. Egger’s test of upper-extremity strength: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian
countries.
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Appendix A5

Figure A5.1. Sensitivity analysis of lower-extremity strength: A) Asian countries; B)
Non-Asian countries.

Figure A5.2. Funnel plot of lower-extremity strength: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian
countries.

Figure A5.3. Egger’s regression plots of lower-extremity strength: A) Asian countries; B)
Non-Asian countries.

Figure A5.4. Egger’s test of lower-extremity strength: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian
countries.
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Appendix A6

Figure A6.1. Sensitivity analysis of muscle mass: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian countries.

Figure A6.2. Funnel plot of muscle mass: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian countries.

Figure A6.3. Egger’s regression plots of muscle mass: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian
countries.

Figure A6.4. Egger’s test of muscle mass: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian countries.
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Appendix A7

Figure A7.1. Sensitivity analysis of gait speed: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian countries.

Figure A7.2. Funnel plot of gait speed: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian countries.

Figure A7.3. Egger’s regression plots of gait speed: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian
countries.

Figure A7.4. Egger’s test of gait speed: A) Asian countries; B) Non-Asian countries.
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