
Supplementary Note 1. Diet and lifestyle of the semi-isolated human groups studied

Yanomami

The Yanomami, a hunter-gatherer group that occasionally cultivates plantains and cassava,
inhabits a huge region in Amazon, encompassing the Brazil and Venezuela border. Their
villages can be located at sea level as well as on high mountains, and therefore, their diets
mainly depend on the resources of the niche inhabited and seasons. In general, they rely on the
variety of foods seasonally available in the rainforest, which includes snakes, wild pigs,
monkeys, deer, and jaguars, but also insects, larvae, fish, crabs, wild honey, roots, and various
fruits and vegetables. Their diet is low in fat and salt and high in fiber. The drinking water is
collected directly from unprotected wells and river streams 1.

Matses

The Matses, a remote hunter-gatherer group from the Peruvian Amazon, has been
geographically, historically, and socially, isolated until recently. They live at an elevation of 150 m
above sea level. The Matses diet primarily consists of varieties of manioc and plantain/banana,
which are rudimentarily cultivated around their settlement. But their diet also includes other
crops like sweet potato, maize, rice, cacao, and various fruits, and any other crop brought from
outside the community. Fish is their primary protein source, but they sporadically consume meat
from mammals (such as monkeys, sloths, and peccary), reptiles, and birds. And they also have
turtle and alligator eggs with an irregular frequency 2.

Tunapuco

The Tunapuco is a traditional agricultural community from the Andean highlands, situated in the
central Andes, at an elevation between 2,500 and 3,100 m above sea level. Their diet is based
on local agriculture and homegrown small animals. The Tunapuco staple food includes
potatoes, Andean tubers, artisan bread, hominy, rice, garlic, carrots, cabbages, and faba beans.
But depending on the season, they also have access to various fruits, such as apples, oranges,
melon pears, and bananas. Their meat sources are mammals (such as guinea pigs, beef, pork,
and sheep), birds, and fish. The intake of chicken eggs and dairy, such as natural fresh milk,
and fresh white cheese is limited. Store-bought products are also part of their weekly diet,
including oatmeal, pasta, sugar, black pepper, cumin, canned condensed milk, and cooking oil 2.



Hadza

The Hadza maintain a hunter-gatherer subsistence lifestyle, relying on the wild foods they find in
their region, situated in the Rift Valley ecosystem around the shores of Lake Eyasi in
northwestern Tanzania. The Hadza gut microbiome data analyzed here comes from fecal
samples collected during the rainy season. During the rainy season, their diet mostly consists of
plant foods (such as species of tuber, small and large game, honey from stinging and stingless
bees, leafy green foliage, baobab fruit, and one species of berry), whereas during the dry
season, more meat is consumed. Tough insoluble fibers are largely and frequently consumed by
the Hadza. They chew on the fibers for a short period of time (one to three minutes), wadge it to
remove all moisture and pulp, and then expectorate as a “quid” 3,4.
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