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Five datasets of quantitative experimental studies are reported in the current manuscript and one dataset in the supplementary
materials. In all experiments, participants had to make perceptual decisions about random dot movements (Experiment 1 and 1S),
about which of two circles contained more dots (Experiment 2A and 2C), about which array of gabor patches contained a pop-out
element (Experiment 2B) or whether the average color of eight colored elements was red or blue (Experiment 2D). In all studies,
participants made a binary response indicating their choice, followed by a rating of their confidence.

Experiment 1: Forty-three healthy paticipants (16 males) took part in return for course credit (meange age = 19.2). Experiment 1S:
Forty healthy participants (18 males) took part in return for course credit (mean age = 19.82, between 18 and 30). Experiment 2A
was an existing dataset comprising 64 participants (50 female, mean age = 18.7, range 17-24), taking part in in return for course
credit. Experiment 2B: ninety-nine healthy participants (10 males) took part in return for course credit (mean age = 18.5, between 18
and 21). Experiment 2C was an existing dataset comprising 204 participants (all female, age range 17-24). Experiment 2D was an
existing dataset comprising 67 participants taking part in return for monetary compensation. Participants in Experiment 1, 1S and 2B
were all 1st Bachelor students at KU Leuven.

For Experiment 1 and 1S, we used convenience sampling. No power analyses was performed, but we decided a prior to test 40
participants for Exp1S as this is common in the literature (e.g. Desender et al., 2021, Cognition), and aimed for the same number in
Exp1. For Experiment 2B, we aimed for hundred participants in order to have sufficient power to detect small correlations (i.e., we
had power of .8 to detect a correlation of .27 at an alpha level of .05).

Because of COVID-19 data for Experiment 1, Experiment 1S, and Experiment 2B were collected online, using the jsPsysch library.
Participants were blind to the study hypothesis.

Data for Experiment 1S were collected in April-May 2020, data for Experiment 1 were collected May 2021, data for Experiment 2B
were collected February 2022. Data from the other experiments were reanalyses of previously published data, for which the timing of
data collection is unknown.

In experiment 1, one participant was excluded because they required more than 10 practice blocks in one of the training blocks and
eight participants were excluded because their choice accuracy was not different from chance level performance in at least one of
both instruction conditions, as assessed using a chi square test. Finally, two participants were excluded because they use the same
confidence button in more than 95% of trials.

In experiment 1S, two participants were excluded because they required more than 10 practice blocks in one of the training blocks
and six participants were excluded because their choice accuracy was not different from chance level performance in at least one of
both instruction conditions, as assessed by a chi square test.

In experiment 2B, three participants were excluded because they used the same confidence button in more then 95% of trials. IN
Experiment 2A,C-D no participants were excluded

No participants dropped out of the experiment or declined participation.

Experiment 1 and 1S was fully within-subjects, so each participant took part in each condition (order counterbalanced across
participants). Experiments 2A-D did not had any manipulations, so there was no allocation into experimental groups..




